(0-99-121).

' ORDINANCE NUMBER O- 18656 (NEW SERIES)
~ apopTEDON  JUL 191999

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 1II, ARTICLE 3, -
DIVISION 33 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY'
AMENDING SECTION 33.3313; AMENDING CHAPTER III,
ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 35 BY AMENDING SECTION 33.3540;
AMENDING CHAPTER V, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 3 BY
AMENDING SECTION 54.0309; AMENDING CHAPTER VI,
ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 22 BY AMENDING SECTION 61.2202;
AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 1, BY-
AMENDING SECTIONS 91.0101, 91.0104, 91.0106, 91.0107,
'AND 91.0108; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING SECTION 91:1503; AMENDING
CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 18 BY AMENDING
SECTION 91.1804; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1
DIVISION 29 BY AMENDING SECTION 91.2902; AMENDING
CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 34 BY AMENDING
SECTION 91.3404; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 84 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 91.8402 AND
91.8403; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 1
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 95.0112 AND 95.0113;
AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 4 BY
AMENDING SECTION 96.0403; AMENDING CHAPTER IX,
ARTICLE 8, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 98.0101
AND 98.0103; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 8,
DIVISION 2 BY AMENDING SECTION 98.0202; AMENDING
CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING
SECTION 101.0410; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 11 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 101.1101 AND
101.1122;; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 5
BY AMENDING SECTION 101.0570; AMENDING CHAPTER
X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTION '
101.0620; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 7
BY AMENDING SECTION 101.0702; AMENDING CHAPTER
X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 14 BY AMENDING SECTION
103.1424; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION
16 BY AMENDING SECTION 103.1606; AMENDING
CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 17 BY AMENDING
SECTION 103.1704; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3,
DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 103.0403; AMENDING -

_PAGE 1 OF 30-



CHAP-TER X, ARTlICLE 3, DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING
SECTION 103.0959; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3, -
DIVISION 20 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 103.2002 AND
103.2012; AND AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 13 BY AMENDING SECTION 111.1305, ALL
RELATING TO THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE.

WHEREAS, the California Building Code, 1998 Edition, has been published by the
California Building Staﬁdards Commission, and amehded By the State Department of Housing
and Community Development, the Division of the State AICHitect/Access Compliance,(th‘e S;(ate
Ofﬁée of Statewide Health Planning and Déyelopmeﬁt and the State Fire Marshal.

WHEREAS, Section 17958 of the California Health and Safety Code provides that the
governing body of every city or county shall adopt ordinanceg or regulations imposing tiqe séme _
requirements as thqse contained in said California Building Code; and

WHEREAS, Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code
providé that a city of county may make suéh changes or modifications to the requirements
contéined in the California Building Code as it determines .are reasonably necessary because of
local conditions; and | |

WHEREAS, ce_rtain amendments have beén recommended by The City of San Diego
Board of Appeals and Advisors as changes or modiﬁéations in the requirements of thé California
Building Code which are reasonably necessary to prévide for uniformity in The City of San
Diego ‘a.nd to provide for local conditions and needs; and

WHEREAS, the Council of The City of San Diggo f"mds and declares in accordance with

- California Health and Safety Code section 17958.5 that the recommended amendments,

. additions, or deletions incorporate changes and modifications which are reasonably necessary

-PAGE 2 OF 30-

[)- 18656



because of local conditions; and
WHEREAS, the Council of The City of San Diego expressly ﬁnds and declares that each
section of the California Building Code, 1998 Editipn; which has not been ad'opted by The City
of San Diego, and éach additjon or amendment to the San Diego Municipal Code contained in
this ordinance is needed to provide for local conditions; NOW, THEREFORE,
BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of The City of San Diego, as follows:”
Section 1. That Chapter III, Article 3, Division 33, of the San Diégo Mﬁnicipal Code is
amended by amending Section 33.3313 to read as follows:"
SEC. '33.3313 - Peep Booth Construction |
No person shall operate a peep show establishment unless peep booths are
constructed of material whiéh has é flame spread rating of Class 111 when‘tested in
accordance with Standard 42- 1, California Buiiding Code (1998 Edition), adopted and
incorporated by reference herein. | |
Section 2. That Chapter III, Article 3, Division 35, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by.amending Section 33.3540 to read as follows: |
-~SEC. 33.3540 -'Massa.ge Establishments-; I()pér‘ating Reqﬁireinents
. [No change in first paragraph.]
(a) through (l)v [No change.]
(m) All plumbing and electrical installations shall be installed under permit and
inspection by the Development Ser\:/ices Dé:pértment and such ir{stallations shall be
installed in accordance with the California Building Code and‘ thé California Piurﬁbi‘ng

‘Code as adopted in Chapter IX of the Municipal Code.

-PAGE 30F30- Q — 18656



(n) through (t} [No change.]
Section 3. Thaf Chapter V, Article 4, Division 3, of the San Diego Municipal' Code 1s
amended by amending Section 54.0309 to read as flollo_ws;

| SEC. 54.0309 - Entry or Interference with Notice Prohibited

(a) [No change.]

(b) It is unlawful for any person to remove or deface any notice posted i)ursuant to
Section 54.03.08(a)(8) of this Code unti_l the reqpireci repairs or demo"lition have been
completed or a Certificate of O}ccupanc.y has been issued in accordance.with ‘appropr‘iatle
provisions of the C.alifomia Bu'ilding Code as adqpted in Chapter IX of tﬁe quicipal
Code. | |
Section 4. That Chapter VI, Article 1, Division 22, of thé San Diego Municipai'Code is

amended by amending Section 61.2202 to read as follows: |
SEC. 61.2202 - Definitions |
Unless the context rgquires btherwise, tﬁé definitions set forth in this section -
apply to the folléwing termé as uséd in this Division:
- ~(a) and:(b) [No change.]

, (c) "Building Permit" means the permit issued of required for the coﬁstmction of
any structure in connection with the develoﬁment of land pursuant to and as. defined by |
the California Building Codé, as adopted in Cha};)fer IX ofthe Municipal Code;

(d) through (j) [No <.:hange.v], |
Section 5. That Chapter IX, Article 1, Division 1, of the San Diego Municipal

Code is amended by amending Sections 91.0101, 91.0104, 91.0106, 91.0107, and

-PAGE 4 OF 30-

/| — 18656

\



91.0108 to read as follows:

- SEC.91.0101 TITLE AND AD_OPTION

101.1.1 Title and Adoption. Subject to the exceptions listed in Sections. 101.1.2
througﬁ 101.1.4, the “California Building Code, 1998 Edition,” published by the
California Building Standards Commiss\ion, as ar;lended by the State Depértment of
Housing & Community Development [HCD]; the Division of the State Architect/Access
& Compliance [DSA/AC]; the State Office of Statewide Health Planning & Development
[OSHPD3]; and the State Fire Marshal [SFM], and, taken'together with the provisions of
Chapter [X, Article 1 of the San Diego Municipgl Code; shall be known aé the Building
Code of The City of San Diego, California (f[he “Building Code” ér this “Article”).‘The
Buildiﬁg Code together with any applicaBle‘ provisions of the éan Diego Municipal Code
éhall: regulate the eréction, construction, enlargement, alteration, repéir,.moving, ’ |
removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area and
maintenance of all privately owned buildings or structures in The City of San Diegb,

-- California; provide for the issuance of permits and collevction of fees therefor; and provide .
pénalties for violations of this Article. Each of the regulations, provisioﬁs, periélties,
conditions and terms of thé Califomia Building Code, 1998-Ediﬁon published by the
California Building Standards Commission, as amended, is on file in the office of the
City Clerk, ars Document No. OO- 74 7? V 0, and is.adopted by reference and made a part
of this Article as if fully set forth in this Article. -

“The adoption pf the California Building Code, 1998 Edition, shall in no way limit,

prohibit, impede or prevent the City Council from adopting ordinances limiting or pre-

-PAGE 5 OF 30-

()- 18656



venting the issuance of any type, number, or geographical distribution of permits for

construction or demolition of any facility for which a permit is required.

Numbering of subsections in this Article is designed to be consistent with

numbers of sections in the California Building Code, 1998 Edition.

101.1.2 Sections not Adoﬁted. The following Sections or Subsections of the

{

California Building Code, 1998 Edition, are not adopted:

SECTION 101

SECTION 102
SECTION 103
SECTION 104

- SECTION 105

SECTION 106

. SECTION 107
SECTION 108
TABLE 1-A

'SECTION 1503
SECTION 1804

“SECTION 3301

SECTION 3403 -

'TITLE, PURPOSE AND SCOPE

101.1 Title

101.3 Scope

UNSAFE BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES
VIOLATIONS

ORGANIZATION AND_ENFORCEMENT
104.1 Creation of Enforcement Agency
104.2.1 General

104.2.2 Deputies

10423 Right of Entry

BOARD OF APPEALS

PERMITS
106.2 Work Exempt from Permit
106.4 Permits Issuance

FEES
INSPECTIONS
108.4 Approval Required

BUILDING PERMIT FEES
ROOFING REQUIREMENTS
FOUNDATION INVESTIGATION
1804.2 Iﬁvestigation

' EXCAVATION AND FILLS

3301.1 General

ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS OR REPAIRS
3403.5 Historic Buildings

101.1. Appendix Chapters Adopted. The followihg Appendix Chapters of the

-PAGE 6 OF 30-

[) - 18656



California Building Code, 1998 Edition, are adopted by The City of San Diego. The re-

maining Appendix Chaptefs are not adopfed.

CHAPTER 3, Division II AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS
CHAPTER 9 BASEMENT PIPE INLETS
CHAPTER 18 :  WATERPROOFING AND

DAMPPROOFING FOUNDATIONS
CHAPTER 31, Divisionll - =~ MEMBRANE STRUCTURES
CHAPTER 31, Division Il PATIO COVERS

101.2 Purpose. Section 101.2 of the California Building Code, 1998 Edition has been
| adopted without change pursuant to Section 91 .0101.1.1. ' | ”
101.3 Scope. [No change .in first two paragraphs.]'

Wherever in the California Building Code, 1998 Edition, referenqe is made to the

: Appéndix, the pfovisions in the Appendix shall not apply unless specifically adopted as
shown in Section 91.0101.1.3. | |

SEC. 91.0104 Organization and Enforcement

104.1 [No change.]

104.2 Enfofcement Powers and Dﬁtiés. of Building-Ofﬁcial aﬁd Néighborhéod Code
Compliance iDirector. |

‘ .104.2.1 through 104.2.3 [No.change.]

104.2.4 Stop Orders through 104.2.10 Copperati_on of Other Officials and Ofﬁce‘:rs.‘
Sections 104.2.4 through 104.2.10 of the California Building Code, 1998 Edition have
been adopted without change pursuath to Section 91.0101.1.1.

[No change to remainder of section.]

SEC. 91.0106 Permits

-PAGE 7 OF 30-

) - 18656



106.1 Permits Required. Section 106.1 of the California Building Code, 1998
Edition has been adopted without change pursuant to Section 91 .0101.1 1.

106.2 [No change.] |

106.3 Application for Permit. Section 106.3 of the California Building Code, 1998

“Edition has been adopted without change pursuant td Section 91.0101.1.1.

106.4 [No change.] | |
SEC. 91.0107 Fee§

107.1 Gene_ral. Pursuant to Sectioh 91.0101.1.2, Section 107.1 ofthh California
Building Code, 1998 Edition has.not been adopted. |

107.2 through 107.5 [No change.]

107.6 Other Inspections. In additioh to the inspections specified above, the Buildihg
Official may make or require any other inspections of any construction work to determine
compliance with the Building Code and other applicable laws which are enforced by the
City Manager.

For purpose of determining compliance with Sections 3103, 3402, 3404 and 3405 of

“ the California Building Code, 1998 Edition, the Bui.lding'.Qfﬁcial may inspect any
structure. | |
. 107.8 and 107.9 [No change.]
. SEC. 91.01Q8 Inspections
| 108.1 General. through 108.3 Inspect‘ioln Requests. Sections 108.'1 through 108.3 of

the California Building Code, 1998 Edition have been adopted without change pursuant

to Section 91.0101.1.1.

-PAGE 8 OF 30-

Aé 18656



108.4 [No change.]

108.5 Required Inspections. through 108.8 Reinspections; Sections 108.5 through
.108.8 of the California Building Code, i998 Edition have been adopted wit‘hout.change,
pursdant to Section 91.0101.1.1. |
Section 6. Tﬁat Chapter IX, Article 1, Division 15, of the ‘San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending Section 91.0503, to read as follows:

DIVISION 15
Roofing and Roof Structures

SEC. 91.1503 Rootfin‘g-Requirements

1503. The roof covering or roofing assembly on any s'tructurer regulated by the
Muniéipal Code sﬁall be as specified in Table 15-A of the Caiifomia Building Code,
1998 Edition, and as cla;siﬁed in Section 1504 of the California Building Code, 1998
Edition. Noncombustible roof co&ering'as deﬁned lin Section 1504.2 of the Califorr;ia
Building Code, 1998 Edition, may be applied in accordance with the manufacturer's
requirements in lieu of a fire-retardant rooﬁng agsembly.

‘Single-farﬁily residences (Grc;up R, -Division 3 Occupanéies) and accessory |

‘ ‘structureé (Group U, Division 1 'Occﬁpancies) shiall have a minimum Class B roofing

assembly for all new roofs and complete reroofs. - Roofing shall be secured or fastened’

to the supporting roof construction and shall'provide weather protection for the building
at the roof.
Section 7. That Chapter IX, Article 1, Division 18, of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending Section 91.1804, to read as follows:

-PAGE 9 OF 30-

- 18655



DIVISION 18

Fbundatibns and Retaining Walls

SEC. 91.1804 Foundation Investigétion

1804.1 General. Sebction_ 1804.1 of the Califdmia Building Code, 1998 Edition has
been adopted without change pursuant fo Section 91.0101.1.1.

1804.2 Investigation. [No change.] |

1804.3. Reports. through 1804.9 Geotechnical and Supplemental Ground-.response
Reports. Sections 1804.3 -through 1804.9 of the Califorﬁia Building Codé, 1998 Edition
have been adopted without change pursuant to Section 91 .0101 A.1.

1804.10 Required Geolbgic Investigation.

1804.10.1 A geologic investigation shall be submitted when reqliired by Table 18-
I-E or the Building Official, for all new structures, ﬁon-exe’mpt additions to existing
‘structures or whenéver the occupancy classification of a building changes to a ﬁigher
relative hazard category (refer to Table 5-E of the current edition of the Uniform Code for
Building Conse.rvation) as a result of the proppsed work, unless exempted by Section

1804.8.3.
- 1804.10.2 [No change.]

1804.10.3 Additions to detached one-and two-family dwellings are exempt from
geologic investigation requirements for building permits, except when the site is located
 within Geologic Hazard Category 11 or 21, or when required by discretionary action. All

| new additions of less than five hundred (500) square feet of floor area, remodels and non-

_PAGE100F30- / - .18656



structural tenant improvements (T1’s) to existing structures are exémpt from geologic
investigati_ofl requirements. Cénsecutive additions to the same structure which total five
hundred (500) squaré feet of more in any twelve-month period may require a geologic '
investigation.

1804.10.4 The Building Official may require that a “NOTICE OF GEOLOGIC
AND GEOTECHN»ICA‘L CONDITIONS” be executed by the property owner as a
condition to the issuance of a building permit for any structure to be lpcated over ;1

suspécted fault or other geologic hazard. A “NOTICE OF GEOLOGIC AND

" GEOTECHNICAL CONDITIONS” may also be required when a geologic investigation

caﬁnot conclusively establi‘sh that buildings or struétures located on the site. would either

be safe or unsafe. The form of notice shall be ’_as p_rbvided by the Building O_fﬁcial, and_be‘

executed by the owner of the property, recorded with the San Diego County Recorder and

filed with the City of San Diego as a condition to issuance of the pefmit.
TABLE 18-I-E

REQUIRED GEOLOGIC INVESTIGATION®

Hazard Category ¥ | Geologic Geologic
: -Reconnaissan .Investigation
ce
11, 139,21, 314, 4] B A2, B®, C, DO
12, 22, 42, - C, D ‘A, B '
43 '
23-27, 321W, 54 - B, C - A
44-48, 52, 53 B
51, 55 -

-PAGE 11 OF 30- | ﬂ’ - 48656 .



FOOTNOTES TO TABLE 18-1-E
1. [No change.]
2. Building, Structure and Fz;cility Classes A, B, C and D.
A. Class A includes the following:
Ny 1) and 2) [No changé.] :
3) All buildings over three storieé in height.

4)  All buildings containing the following}occupancies (Refer to California
Building Code, 1998 Edition, Table 3-A):

a. Group A, Divisions 1, 2, and 2.1. (
b. Group E, Division 1.

C. Group H, Divisions 1,2,3,6 and 7.

d. Group [, Divisions 1 and 3.

5) All buildings with an océupant load of more than three hundred (300)
persons as determined by Table 10-A of the California Building Code,
- 1998 Edition.

6), 7), 8) and 9) [No change.]

C. Class C includes the following occupancy groups and structures provided they
are not included in Classes A or B: '

- 1) All buildings containing the following occupancies (Refer to California
‘Building Code, 1998 Edition, Table 3-A):. ‘

a., b. and c. [No change.]

d Group F, Divisions 1 and 2.

e. Group H, Divisions 4 and 5.

f. Group I, Division 2.

g Group M. -

h Group R, Division 1.

1 Group S, Divisions 1,2,3,4, and 5.

2),3), 4) and 5) [No change.]

D. Class D includes the following occupancy group and structures prov1ded they
are not included in Classes A, B, or C:

-PAGE 12 OF 30-

ﬂ 18555



1) = All buildings containing the following occupancies (refer to Cahforma
Building Code, 1998 Edition, Table 3-A):
a.  Group R, Division 3.

Note: . No geologic 1nvest1gat10ns are required for occupancy
Group U, Division 1, or any other structures of a
" similar minor nature.

3. | [No change.]
4. Liquefaction Potential - Hazard Category 31 and 32. When an investigation is

required, adhere to Section 1804.5 of the Cahforma Building Code, 1998 Edition
for minimum requirements.

5. [No change.]

END OF FOOTNOTES TO TABLE 18-I-E

Section 8. That Chapter IX, Article 1, Division 29, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending Section 91.2902, to read as follows:
DIVISION 29
Plumbing SYSTEMS
SEC. 91.2902 Number of Fixtures |
2902.1 General. through 2902.6 Group R Occupanc1es Sections 2902.1 through
2902.6 of the California Building Code, 1998 Edltlon have been adopted without change
pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1 . |
2902.7 [No change.]
Se.ction 9. That Chapter IX,.Artic'le 1, Division 34, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending Section 91.3403, to read as follows:
DIVISION 34

Existing Structures

-PAGE 13 OF 30- - ~ / - 18656



| SEC. 91.3403 Additions, Alteratioﬁs or Repaifs |

3403.1 General through 3403.4 Glass Replacemént. Sections 3403.1 through

" 3403.4 of the California Building Code, 1998 Edition have been adopted without chénge,

pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1.

3403.5 Historic Bﬁildings. Pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.2, Section 3403.5
of the California Building Code, 1998 Edition has. not been adopte(i. Title 24, Paﬁ 8,
California Code of Regulations governs r¢storatioﬁ of historic buildings.

| 3403.6 .[No change.] |
Section 10. That Chaéte'r IX, Article 1, Division 84, .of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending S-ec‘tion 91 .8402, to read as.follows: » o |
DIVISION 84
Swimming Pools, Spas aﬁd ‘Hot Tubs
SEC. 91.8402 Definitions |

For the purpose of this Section, certain terms, words and phrases are defined as follows:

“Aboveground pool, In-ground pool and On-ground pool” each mean the same thing as
“Swimming Pool”.

“Barrier” means a fence, wall, building wall or 2 combination thereof, which completely
surrounds the swimming pool and obstructs access to the swimming pool.

“Grade” means the underlying surface, such as earth or a walking surface.”

“Hot Tub” means the same thing as “Swimming Pool”. «[,q00r Swimming Pool” means a

swimming pool which is totally contained within a residential structure and surrounded on all

-PAGE 14 OF 30-

| /) -18656



i

four sides by walls of said structure.
“Outdoor Swimming Pool” means any swimming pbol which is not an indoor pool.
“Spa” means the same thing as “Swimming Pool”.

“Swimming Pool” means any structure intended for Swinﬁming or recreational bathing that
’ can contain water over eighteen (18) inches in depth. This includes in-ground, abovegrounci
and on-ground swirhming pools, hot tubs and spas.
SEC. 91.8403 Barrier Requirements
* [No change in first paragraph.]

1. through 6. [No change.]

7. Where the barrier is composed of diagonal members, the maximum opening.'
formed by the diagonal members shall be no more than two (2) inches.

8. Access gates shall comply with the requirements of Section 91.8403, items 1.
through 7., and shall be equ_ippcd to accommodate a locking device no less than 60 inches abévé
gréde. Pédestrian—access gates shall open outward away from the pool and shall be self-cloéing
and have é self-latching device. Ga'tes. otfler than pedestrian access gates shall comply with the
requirement.s of Section 91.8403, items 1. through 7., and shali be equipped with a locking
device. |

9. [No change.]

10.Hot tubs and spas located outdoors ahd not exceeding 64 squére feet of water
surface may have rigid locking safety covers that comply with American Society for T_estiné and

Materials (ASTM) Standard F1346-91) in lieu of the barrier required by this Division.

-PAG.E.IS OF 30- N 0, - iBGSG



11. Outdoor swimming pools may have a manually or power-operated safety pool
co;/er tﬁat c.omplies with all of the performance standards of ASTM F1346-91 in lieu of the
barrier rqu‘Jired by this division.

12. When the house forms part of the swimming pool barrier and the house wall has
door openings that lead directly intb the pool yard area, one of the follbwing child safety features
must be provided:

a. The pdol area must be isolated from the home by an additional barrier as
described in this section,
b. The pool must be equipped with an approvéd safefy cov;:r‘as described in.
Seétion 91.8403.10 above,
c. The residence musf have exit alarms on all doors leading Afrom the house
directly to the pool yérd area, |
d. All doors lgading‘to the pool yard area must have self-closing, self-
latching door hardware with a release mechanism located n}o less than 54 inches | above
the floor.

13. Where unusual circumstances exist that make strict enforcement of this Division
impractical, the Building official may grant modifications for individual cases per Section
104.2.7 of the California Building Code, 1998 Edition.

Section 11. That Chapter IX, Article 5, Division 1, of the San Diego Municipal

.Code is amended by ameﬁdiﬁg Sections 95.01 12 and 95.01 13, to read as followé:

SEC. 95.0112 - Structural Design -

(a) [No change.]

~ -PAGE 16 OF 30-

/) - 18656



(b) Wind loads. Signs and sign structures shall be designed and constructed to resist
wind forces as speciﬁéd in the California Building Code as adoptéd .by the City.
. (c) and (d) [No change.] |
(e) Allowable stresses. The design of wood, concrete, alﬁminum, or steel members shall
conform to the requirements of the Célifomia Building Code as adopted by the City.
Vertical and horizontal loads exerted on thé soil shall not produce stresses excéeding
those specified in the California Building Code as adopted by the City.'The ‘working
stresses of wire ropes and its fastenings shall not exceed 25 pérceﬁt of the ultimate
strength' of the‘rope or fastenérs.
Working sfresses for wind or seismic loads combined with dead loads may be
inéreased as specified in the California Building Code as adopted by the City.
(f) [No change.] | |
SEC. 95.0113 - Construction Material and Installation Standards
| (a) [No change.]
| (b) Materials. Materials or construction for signs and sign structures shall be of a
. .quality and grade allowed for buildings in the California Building Code as adopted by -
The CAity. :
If the frame or cabinet of a sign is to be fabricated of steel, the steel shall be
galvanized or painted with rust- inhibiting paint. |
Anchors and supports of wood, when embedded in the soil or within six inches of the
soil, shall be pressure-treated with an approvéd preservative. Such treated wood members

shall be marked or branded by an approved agency.

-PAGE 17 OF 30-

[ - 18656



13-

Ground signs may be constructed of any materiél meeting the requirements of this
Code.
(c) through (g) [No change.]
Section 12. That Chapter IX, Aﬁicle 6, Division 4,.(‘)f the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending Section 96.0403, to read as follows:
SEC. 96.0403 - Payment of Fees |

PriQf to the issuance of any building permit, the Building Official shall aésﬁre thét_ fees
are paid to the City for park and recreatioﬁal facilities in accordance with the following
schedule:

-1'. andv2. [No change.]

Fees cbllected shall be refunded to the individual mékirig péymen‘t inﬂ event the
building permit expires, within the meaning of Section 302(d) of the California Building
Code. Requests fobr a refund of fees shall be in writing and shall set forth in full the facts
shéwing that such pérmit has expired.

- Se;ction 13. ThatA Chapter IX, Article 8, Division 1, of the San Diego Municipal

Code is amended by .amending Section 98.0101, to read as follows: |
SEC. 98.0101 - Desi;gnation, Scope and Definitions of the San Diego Housing Code
(a) and (b) [No change.]
(c) Definitions. The definitions contained in the California Bﬁiiding Code as adopted in _
Section 91.0101, the Unifom Housing Code as adopted in Section 98.0103, the
definitions contained in Chapters 1, IX and X of the Municipal Code, and the following

- definitions apply to the administration and enforcement of this Division:

-PAGE 18 OF 30-

[) - 18656



[No change in definitions.]
‘SEC. 98.0103 State Housing Law Regulations Adopted
The provisions of Article 5, Diyision 1, Chapfer 1, Subchapter 1, Title 25,

éalifomia Codé of Regulations, on file in the office of the City Clerk 'as_ Document No.
769796, together with the provisioﬁs of Chapter 8 and Section 201.3 of the Uniform
Housing Code, 1997 Edition; a copy of which is o‘n:ﬁle in the ofﬁé§ of the City Clerk as
‘Document No. 769794 are hereby adopted and rﬁade a part of this Division as if fully set
forth. |

Section 14. Thét Chapter IX, Article 8, Division 2, of the San Diego Municivpal‘

~ Code is amended by amending Section 98.0202, to fead as follows:

SEC. 98.0202 - Mobilehomes; Recreational Vehicles and Commercial Coaches

- Located Outside Licensed Mobilhome and Special Occupancy Parks - Special
Permit - Fee .

a) No person shall use or océupy any mobilehdme, commercial coach or'reéreational
vehicle on private property not licensed as a mobilehome park or special occupancy park
except as follows: |

1) and 2) [No change.]

3) For a'busiriess e‘stablishment, provided (1A) the ﬁse is permitted by the zoning
regulations applicable to the site on which the commercial éoach is to be located; (2) the
comn.lercial‘coach bears a California Insignia of Appfoval (issued pursuant to Section
18025 et seq., California Health and Saféty Code) for the type of use involved; (3) the.

commercial coach is located from site property lines the distances specified in the

California Building Code, as adopted by the City, for buildings based upon type of use,

-PAGE 19 OF 30-

/) - 18656



fire resistance of exterior walls, and openings in exterior wé_llls.' '
4)‘ through 6) [No change.]
| Section 15. That Chapter X, Article 1‘, bivision 4, of tﬁe San Diego Municipal Code
is amcnded by amending Sections 101.0410 and 101.0451, to read as followé:
SEC. 101.0410 - R Zones tMultiple F:i.mily Residential)
A. through H. [No change.] |

I. MAXIMUM BUILDING HEIGHTS, LOT COVERAGES, AND FLOOR AREA
RATIOS (FAR) '

1. through 5. [No cﬁange.]
6. Exception procedure for maximum lot covérages.

a. through c. [No change.]

d. Any exterior usable area described in this paragraph may be sited atop the roof or
covering of a building or garage, and, further, that the portion of the roof or éover sérvirig
as an éxterior usable area shall‘ not have a slope exceeding five percént and must comply
‘with all applicable requirements for exit 'and entrance. Further, any rooftop exterior

—-usable area shall include a guardrail, as specified in the Califomié Building Code, as
adopted b& the City, alo.ng the perimeter of all exterior waII; and vértical drops. All
ro‘of-mouﬁted heating, venfilating, air-conditioning, solar energy collecting or other
mechanicgl or electrical equipment shall be. completely and safely fenced and visually
screened from the rooftop exterior usable aréa, and further, all standpipeé, vents, drains or
similar other rooftop appurtenances shall be either:

1) and 2) [No change.]

e. [No change.]

-PAGE 20 OF 30-

() - 18656



7. [No change.]
J. through Q. [No change.]
_SEC_TION 101.0570 - Live Work Quarters (quts)
A. thfough D. [No change.] |
E. ADMINISTRATION
1. and 2. [No change.]
3. Building Permit Required
Prior to the use of any building, or portion therebf, for live/work quarters, a
| building permit shall be obtained from the Development Services Department. A copy of
the application for a live/work quarters permit, approved by the Development Services
Director, shall accompany the building permit application. The prevailing California
Building Code Regulations shall apply except as provided by Code interprététions as
shown in a Develbpment Servi'ces Department Newsletter. e
F. [No change.] |
Section 17. That Chapter X, Article 1, Division 6, of the San Diego Municipal Code
-is amended by amenciing Section 101.0620, to read as follows: |
SEC. 101.0620 Fences
A. through F. [No change.]
G. FENCES- MAINTENANCES AND REPAIR
All fences (including _retaining walls) shall be constructed of new or ’good used
material and in accordancé §vith the methods of construétion which conform to the

requirements of the California Building Code, as adopted in Chapter IX of the Municipal .

-PAGE 21 OF 30-

: ) - 18656



Code. Additionally, they shall be maintained in a'state of geod repair. Arly dilapidated,
dangerous or unsightvly fences or retaining walls shall be repaired or removed. |
Section 18. That. Char)ter X, Atrticle 1, Division 7, of‘the San Diego Municipal Code
is amended by amending Section 101.0702, to read as follows: -
SEC. 101._0702 - Administrative Regulations
[No c}range in first paragraph.]
This Division shall be applied to any construction, establishment, alteration,
- enlargement or change in use that results in the following: |
A. and B. [No change.]
C. [No change in first two sentences.]
This Division shall also apply to any addition, alteration or repair to existing structures
(Municipal Code Section 91.0106) which results .in a change in the occupaney
classification as listed in Table No. 5-A of the California Building Code. The
-Development Services Director may prorate the requirements herein, based upon the
nature and extent of alterations and additions. |
For projects as indicated above, no certificate of occupancy, demolition permit, or
encroachment permit shall be issued unless: |
A. and B. [No charlge.]
| Section 19. That Chapter X, Article 1, Division 11, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amendin.g Sections 101.1101 and 101.1122, to read as follows: |
SEC. 101. 1101 Definitions

101.1101.1 rhrough 101.1101.130 [No change.]

-PAGE 22 OF 30-

() - 18656



101. 1101. 131 - Marquee
‘A building projection dver a public right-of-way a§ defined in thej California
Building Code, as adopted in Chapfer IX of the Municipal Code.l When the structure does
- not extend over the public right-éf-way, refer to "Architectural Projection," Section
101.110 1.4.
| 101.1101.132 through 101.1161.221_[No change.]
101.110 1.222 California Building Code
The current edition of the California Building Code, as Aadopted by The City of San
Diego.
Hereinafter referred to as C.B.C.
101.1101.223 through 1(_)‘1'.1 161.250 [No change.] |
SEC. 101. 1122 Face-Lift |
A. The provisions of this section apply to Building frontages visible from a public
right-of-way which are designed or redesigned so that all elements of the new building
facade and signs are integrated into one unit and comply with the following féquirements:
| -1. through 4. .[No changé.]
5. Thé face-lift area cdmplies with the Californi.a Building Code requirements.
B. [No change.]
Section 20. That Chapter X, Article 3, Division 4, of the San Diego Municipal Code
is amended by amending Section 103.0403, to read as follows:
"SEC. 103.0403 - Procedurés for Special i’ermit Application and Review

A. and B. [No change.]

-PAGE 23 OF 30-

[)- 18656



C. DETERMINATION
Upon subfnittal by the applicant of basic concept drawings and review of those basic -

concept drawings by the City Architect, the Executive Vice President may approve,
modify or disapprove any application for a special permit. In approving the special
permit, the Executive Vice President may ifnpose reasonable conditions to eneure |
vcompl‘iance with these regulations. The Executive Vice President shall not approve an
application for a special permit except upon determining that the Building, s;[mctpre or
improvement and use for which the special permit was,applied (D is consistent with the
California Building Code and Fire Code and the regulations ccmta_ined herein, and (2) will
not be detrimental to the health, safety, peaee, morals, comfort and general welfare Qf
persons residing or working in the ﬁeighborhood or injurious to property and
improvements in the neighborhood or to the general welfare of the city and is not
detrimental to implementation of the Gaslamp Quaﬁer Redevelopment Plan. Action by
the Executive Vice President shall include a statement that the Executive Vice President
finds that the building, structure, or improvement or use for which the special permit was
. applied does or does not copform to the regulationé contained herein. In the event the |
.Executive Vice President does not approve an applicatiop for a special permit, the
specific facts on which the determination is based shall be included in the written
decision as provided for in Section 103.0403 D following.

[No change in seeond paragraph.]

D. through H. [No change.] e

Section 21. That Chapter X, Article 3, Division 9, of the San Diege Municipal Code

-PAGE 24 OF 30-



is émended by amending Section 103.0959, to read as follév?s:
SEC. 103.0959 ""Redevelopment Subdistrict' - Property Development Regulations ‘_
- [No change in first paragraph.]
A. and B. [No change.]
C. MINIMUM SETBACK REQUIREMENTS
| - 1. [No change.] |
2. Ndmesidential
a. through d. [No change.]
e. Canopies/awnir;gs may encroach on ,.the sidewalk area in conformance with
Section 3206 of the California Building Code; 1998 Edition, and Se@tion 91.3208 of the
Mlinicipal Code.
D. through J. [No change.]
Section 22. That Chapter X, Article 3, Division 14, of the San Diego Muhicipal
Code is amended by‘.amending Section 103.1424, to read as follows:
SEC. 103.1424 - Streetscape Development Regulations/Encroachment Permits.
-[No change in ﬁfst two paragraphs. ] |
A. through C. [No change.] |
D. PARKWAY LANDSCAPING AND STREET TREES
[No chan‘ge in first three paragrabhs.]
Trees shall be positionéd and kept maintained so that any branches ‘;hat f:xtend out

- over dedicated street rights-of-way have a minimum of fourteen (14) feet six (6) inches of

clearance above the surface of the street.

_PAGE 25 OF 30-' | ﬂ _ 488656



1. [No change.]
| 2. Tree Grates.

Tree grates shall meet safety re‘quirements of Title 24 éf fhe California Code of
Regulations. The maximum siée of grid opening shall be no larg‘er th_a‘n one half inch. All
tree grates shall be installed flush with the sidewalk surface ahd shall be set a minimurﬁ
of two inches above a gravel base. The grates shall be factory p'rimed and péinted black.
Tree grates shall not be required if trees are planted in a laridsc'apedk parkwéy; prdvided no
safety hazards are caused by this exception.

3. and 4. [No change.]

E. throﬁgh_ I. [No change.]
_ éection 23. That Chapter X, Article 3, Di_visio'n .16, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending Section‘103.1606,. to read as follows:
SEC. 103:1606 Property Development Regulations
[No change in first paraéraph.] |
A. [No change.]
B. Minimum Building Setbacks
The following minimum building setbacks shall be provided:
1. through 4. [No change.] |
5. | .Cou'rts Réquired for Dwelling Units or Guest Rooms:
a. Courfs opposite Walls.on Same Sité. The minimum depth of a court
opposite a window of a living room shall equal one-half th§: height of the opposite wall, '

but shall not be less than 18 feet. The minimum depth of a court opposite a window of

-PAGE 26 OF 30-

[ 18656



any other habitable room shall be 12 feet if theie is a window Qf any habitable room in
the c')ppoisite iivall. All other depth dimensions shall be governed by the Caiifornia
Building Cede, 1998 Edition. (Depth is measured perpendiculai to subject windoW). ‘
b. and c. [No change.] | ‘ | L
d. Exceptions to Required Dimensions. On each lot with a single-room occupancy
(SRO) residential hotel, a building designed for group residential use, or a building or
portion thereof converted for live/work quarters, the dimensional requirements for courts
prescribed by the California Building Code, 19.9‘8‘ Edition shall apply in lieu of the
ieqnirements of this section.
C. tnrough J. [No ehange.]
Section 24. That Chapter X, Article 3, Division 17, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending Section 103.1704, to read as follows:" o
SEC. 103.1704 Residential Regulations
[No chainge to first paragraph.]
CAll manufaciured or factory built housing and move-onbstruct.ures and all institutional
- _structures including churches are subject to the development criteria of the underlying
Planned District zone unless otherwise stated in this Division. All move-on structuies
must -obtain_ a Sontheast San Diego‘Developnient.Permit as specified in Section
103.1703.B. of the l\/funicipal Code. For all manufactured and factory built housing, roof, '
siding and foundation treatments shall conform to the relevant sections of the California
Building Code, including, but not limited to, Chépters 29 thiougli 32 and roof overhang,

roofing material and siding material shall be similar to types used for existing adjacent .

-PAGE 27 OF 30- | ﬁ - 48656



residential structures. Foundations and footi'ngs' must be finished in a rﬁanner consistent
with the structure for all housing types. |
Section 25. That Chapter X, Article 3, Division 4, of the San Diego Municipal Code
is amended by amending Section 103;2002, to read ag follows:
SEC. 103.2002 Definitions

For purposes of Chapter X, Article 3, Division 20, th¢ following terms are deﬁned as:

~ [No change from “Atrium” through “Floor Area”.]

"Floor Area Ratio (FAR)" means the ratio of total enclosed building area including
parkiﬁg at and above grade to the areé of the site. The FAR is an indication of the
intensity of development.

[No changé in remainder of Definitions.]
Section 26. That Chaptér X, Article 3, Division 20, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is amended by amending Section 103.2012, to réad as folloWs:
SEC. 103.2012 - Property Developmént Regulatioﬁs
N [No change.] | o
B. REGULATIONS
The following regulations shall apply to the specific areas as indicated:

| l..Mixéd Residential/Nonresidential Land Use Areas.

bThe major land use in the Marina Planngd District shall be residential as illustrated on
Figure 1. In the area designated eighty perceﬁt (80%) residential/twentsl percent (20%)
nonresidential (e‘xcept in structures ﬁﬁy (50) feet or less in height), at least eighty percent

(80%) of the gross floor area shall be residential use-and up to twenty percent (20%) of

-PAGE 28 OF 30-

[)- 18656



the gross floor area may be nonresidential. Where structures are fifty (50) feet or less in
“height or @eet the ‘heighf requirements of the Califbmia Building Code, as adoptéd by
| ~ Chapter IX of the San Diego Municipal Code, for Type V c;)nstruction,_gré)ss floor area

in nonresidential use may exceed twenty per;:ent (20%) if the entire nonresidential use is
accessible to and located at the street level of the project. The permitted uses are
described in Municipal Code section 103.201' 1. Exceptions to the percentage ratio‘ of
eighty percent to twenty percent (80%-.2(.)%) for High-Rise

structures are contained in Municipal Code section 103.2012(B) (4).

2. thfough 15. [No change.|

Section 27. That Chapt'erAXI, Article 1, Division 13, of the San Diego Municipal
Code is émended by arﬁending Section 111.1305, to read as follows:

SEC. 111.1305 - Building Permits

(a) Supplemental Provisions. The provisions of this section shall éupplement the
provisions of Municipal Code Chapter IX and the California Building Code as adopfedr
in Chapter IX of the MunicipalC(;de.

(b) [No change.j |

() Modiﬁcations‘ and Deviations. An "App'licént" may request in ;Jvriting that the
Building Official grant a modiﬁcatilbn or minor deviation from the relevant provisions of
Municipal Code Chapter IX or California Building Code in accordance with Section
104.2.7 of the 1998 Califémia Buil»ding Code. |

(d) thropgh () [No chaﬁgé.] .

Section 28. That a full reading of this ordinance is dispensed with prior to its final

-PAGE 29 OF 30-

ﬂ/ 18656



passage, a written or printed copy having been available to the City Council and the public a day
prior to its final passage.
Section 29. That this ordinance shall take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day

from and after its passage.

APPROVED: CASEY GWINN, City Attorney

MJL:cdk

06/11/99 _
Or.Dept:Plan.&Dev.Rev.
0-99-121

-P.AGE 30 OF 30- ﬂ - 15856_.



STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: Struck-Out
NEW LANGUAGE: Underlined - - 3
- (0-99-121)

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- | ___(NEW SERIES)

ADOPTED ON

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER III, ARTICLE 3, ’
DIVISION 33 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 33.3313; AMENDING CHAPTER 111,
ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 35 BY AMENDING SECTION 33.3540;
AMENDING CHAPTER V, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 3 BY
AMENDING SECTION 54.0309; AMENDING CHAPTER VI,
‘ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 22 BY AMENDING SECTION 61.2202;
AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 1, BY
AMENDING SECTIONS 91.0101, 91.0104, 91.0106, 91.0107,
AND 91.0108; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING SECTION 91.1503; AMENDING
CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 18 BY AMENDING
SECTION 91.1804; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE1
DIVISION 29 BY AMENDING SECTION 91.2902; AMENDING
CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 34 BY AMENDING
SECTION 91.3404; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 84 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 91.8402 AND .
91.8403; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 1
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 95.0112 AND 95.0113;
AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 4 BY
AMENDING SECTION 96.0403; AMENDING CHAPTER IX,
ARTICLE 8, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 98.0101
AND 98.0103; AMENDING CHAPTER IX, ARTICLE 8,
DIVISION 2 BY AMENDING SECTION 98.0202; AMENDING ‘
CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING
SECTION 101.0410; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 11 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 101.1101 AND .
101.1122; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 5
BY AMENDING SECTION 101.0570; AMENDING CHAPTER
X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTION
101.0620; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 7
BY AMENDING SECTION 101,0702; AMENDING CHAPTER
X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 14 BY AMENDING SECTION .
103.1424; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION

-PAGE 1 OF 26-

/) - 48658



16 BY AMENDING SECTION 103.1606; AMENDING
CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 17 BY AMENDING
SECTION 103.1704; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3,
DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 103.0403; AMENDING
CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING
SECTION 103.0959; AMENDING CHAPTER X, ARTICLE 3,
DIVISION 20 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 103.2002 AND
103.2012; AND AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 1,
DIVISION 13 BY AMENDING SECTION 111.1305, ALL
RELATING TO THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE.

SEC. 33.3313 VPeep Booth Construction

No person shall operate a peep show establi’shmerit ualéss peep Booths are constructed of
“material which has a_ﬂame spread rating of Class III when tested in accordancev with Standard 42-
- 1, YUntform California Building Cade (1988 Edition), adobtea.and incorporated ‘bylrveférence.
herein. | |
SEC. 33.3540 Massage Establishments - Operating Requnrements

[N o change in ﬁrst paragraph ]

(a) through (1) [No change.]

(m) All plumbing and electrical in_stallaﬁons shall be installed under pemit and
inspection by thé Developmenf Services Department and'such installations shall be installed in
accordance with the Yntform California Builciiné Code and the Uniform Califomia Plumbing
.Code, as adopteci iri Chapter IX of the Municipal Code.

(n) through (1) [No change.] o
SEC. 54.0309 Entry or Interference with Notice Prohibited

(2) [No change.]

(b) Itis unlawful for any person to remove or deface any notice posted pursuant to Section

-PAGE26F 2_,64-. E 0 - 48656



54.0308(a)(8) of this Code until the required repairs or demolition have been complefed ora
Certificate of Occupancy has been issued in accordance with approprlate provisions of the
Cahfomla-Hm-form Bulldmg Code as adopted—by—the—@rty in Chapter IX of the Mun1c1pal Code
SEC. 61.2202 Definitions | |
Unless the context req'nires.otherwise, the deﬁlnitions‘ set forth in this s.ection apply to the
following terms as used in this Division: |
(a) and (b) [No change.]

(c) "Building Permit" means the nennif issued or required for the consn'ucnon of any
structure in connection with the development of land pursn.ant to and as defined by the Hmform
Califomia Building Code, as adopted in Chapter IX of the. MunicipalCode;

(d) th:ough' () [No change.] | |
. SEC. 91.0101 Title and Adopti_on

101 .'1 .1 Title and Adoption. Subject to the exceptions listed in Sections 101.1.2 through
101.1.4, tiié “HﬂiformCalifomia Building Code, -1-994 1998 Edition,Velumes+2-&3,”

published by the Inte nati ed California

Building Standards Commission, as amended by the State Department of Honsing & Community

Development [HCD]: the Division of the State Architect/Access & Comblianée [ DSA/AC]: the

State Office of St_atewide Health Planning & Development [OSHPD3]: and the State Fire

Marshal [SFM], and, taken together with the provisions of Chapter IX, Article 1 of the San

Diego Municipal Code, shall be known as the Building Code of The City of San Diego,
- California (the “Building Code” or this “Article”). The Building Code together with any

applicable provisions of the San Diego Municipal Code s'hallf regulaté the erection, construction,

-PAGE 3 OF 26-

). 18656



enlargément, alteration, repair, rpoving, remO\}al, demolition, com}ersion, occupanC};,‘equiprr;ent,
_use, height, area and maintenancé,of all privately'owﬁed buildings or structures in The C.<ity‘of |
Saﬁ Diego, California; provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and
-p.rovide benalties for violations of this Article. Each of the regulations, provisions, penélﬁes, -
conditions and terms of the Uniferm-California Building Code, -1-994 1998 Edition phbli§hed by
the _}nfemaﬁenakeenfefeﬂéée%&iﬂdéﬁg—efﬁeia’:sCali‘fpmia Building Standards Commission, as

amended. is-on file in the office of the City Clerk, aé Doéument No. 00- "~ ,andis

referred-to;-adopted by reference and made a part of this Article as if fully set forth in this
Article. . | | "

The adéptioﬁ of the Hﬁ%fern%Célif;)mia Building Code, +994 ﬂ Eciition, shall 1n no
way limit, prohibit, 'impede or prevent the City Council from adopting ord‘inanc;es limiting or pre;
venting thé issuance of any type, number, or gedg_raphical ldistributi(‘)npf permits for cthtruction
or demolition of %my facility for Wilich"a permit is reéuired.

Numbering of subsections in this Article is designed to be consistent with numbers of

sections in the YnifermCalifornia Building Code, 994 1998 Edition.

101.1.32 Sections not Adopted. The following Sections or Subsections of the’

UnifermCalifornia Building Code, 994 1998 Edition, are not adopted by-Fthe-City-of-San

Diege:
SECTION 101 TITLE, PURPOSE ‘AND SCOPE
' 101.1 Title '
101.3 Scope
-PAGE 4 OF 26- .

N 18656



SECTION 102 UNSAFE BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES

.SECTION 103 VIOLATIONS :

SECTION 104 ORGANIZATION AND ENFORCEMENT
104.1 Creation of Enforcement Agency
104.2.1 General

104.2.2 Deputies

104.2.3 Right.of Entry
SECTION 105 BOARD OF APPEALS
SECTION 106 PERMITS |

106.2 Work Exempt from Permxt
106.4 Permits Issuance

SECTION 107 ‘FEES
SECTION 108 INSPECTIONS

108.4 Approval Required
TABLE 1-A BUILDING PERMIT FEES
SECTION 1503 - ROOF-COVERRMNG ROOFING REQUIREMENTS
SECTION 1804 FOUNDATION INVESTIGATION |

' 1804.2 Investigation
"SECTION 3301 EXCAVATION AND FILLS
3301.1 General

SECTION 3403 - ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS OR REPAIRS
' © 3403.5 Historic Buildings

101.1.43 Appendix Chapters Adopted. The following Appendix Chapters of the
UnifermCalifornia Building Code, 994 1998 Edition, are adopted by The City of San Diego.

The rerhaining Appendix Chapters are not édopted.

CHAPTER 3, Division II AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS

CHAPTER 9 - BASEMENT PIPE INLETS

CHAPTER 18 . - WATERPROOFING AND DAMPPROOFING
FOUNDATIONS

CHAPTER 31, Division II - MEMBRANE STRUCTURES |

CHAPTER 31, Division IIT PATIO COVERS

101.2 Purpose. Sectlon 101.2 of the HﬂrfemCahfomla Building Code, 1994 1998 Edltlon

has been adopted without change pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1.

-PAGE 5 OF 26-

0 18656



101.3 Scope. [No change in first two paragraphs.]
~ Wherever in the H-ni—feﬂﬂCalifE)rnia Building Code, +994 1_99_8_ Edition, reference is made to
thé Appendix, the provisions in the Appendix shall not apply unless speciﬁcélly adOpted'aé T
shown in Section 91.0101 143, |
SEC. 91.0104 Organization and Enforcement

104.1 [No change.]

- 104.2 Enforcement i’owers and Duties of Building Official ahd Neighborhood Code
Compliance Director. | | |

104.2.1 through 104.2.3 [No change.]

104.2.4 Stop Ordefs through 104.2.10 Cooperation ;)f Other Officials and Officers. Sections
104.2.4 ihrough 104.2.10 of the %fem(ialifofnia Building Code, +994 1998 Ediiion have beeﬁ.'.
adopted without change pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1. h '. |

[No change td remaipder of section.] ‘

SEC. 91.0106 Permits |
| 106.1 Permits Required. Section 106.1 of the MCalifomia Building Code, -1-994 1998
Edition has been adbpted without change ﬁursuant to Section 91:0101.1.1. i |

106.2 [No change.] i

. 106.3 Application for Permit. Sectioﬂ 106.3 of the YntfermCalifornia Building Code, 1994 |
1998 Editivon has Been adopted without change pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1. o
'106.4 [No change.]
SEC. 91.0107 Fees |

107.1 General. Pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.32, Section 107.1 of the UntfermCalifornia

-PAGE 6 OF 26-

| ﬂ;mssé



Building Code, $994 1998 Edition has not been adopted.

107.2 through io7.5 [No change.]

107.6 Other Inspections. In'addition to the inspections specified above, the Building Ofﬁcial
may make or requiré any othér inspections of any construction work to determine compliancé_
with the Building Code and other applicable laws which are en_forcéd by the Beve-}epmenf
- Serv-iees—_Bepaﬁmen’eCiiy Manager.

For purpose of determining compliance with Sections 3103, 3402, 3404 and 3405 of the
YnifermCalifornia Building Code, 1994 1_9_98, Edition, the Building Official niay inspect any
struc'iure. N |

107.87 and 107.9 [No change.]

SEC. 91.0108 Inspections

108.1 Génerai. through 108.3 Inspection Requests. Sections 108.1 through 108.3 of the
YntfermCalifornia Builciing Code, $994 1998 Edition have béen adopted without change
pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1. |

108.4 [No chainge.] |

108.5 Requiredlnspections. through 108.8 Reinspections. Secticins 108.5 through 108.8 of |
the HﬁifeﬂnCalifomia Building Code, 1994 1998 Edition have been adopted without change
pursuant to S_ection'91 .0101.1.1. |

DIVISION 15
Roefs {Ro'ﬂg and Roof Siructures
SEC. 91.1503 Reef-CeveringRoofing Réquirem.ents -

1503.

-~ -PAGE 7 OF 26-

()~ 18656



_H%ef—the-H-nifefm—Bﬁing—Qader}W—E&iﬁeﬂ;The roof covering or rooﬁng assembly on any
stfucturé regulated by the Municipal Code shall be as specified in Table 15-A of the éalifomia

| Building Code. 1998 Edition, and as classified in Sectién 1504 of the California Building' Code,
1998 Edition. Noncombustible roof covering as defined in Section 1504.2 of the California
Building Code. 1998 Edition, may be applied in accordahce with the manufalcturer's |

requirements in lieu of a fire-retardant roofing assembly.

Single family residences (Group R, Division 3 Occupancies) and accessory structures
(Group U, Division 1 Occupancies) shall have a minimum Class B roofing assembly for all new

roofs and complete reroofs.

atton: Roofing shall be

secured or fastened to the supporting roof construction and shall p.rovid.e weather protection for
the building at the roof, |
DIVISION 18 -
Foundations and Retaining Walls -
SEC. 91.1804 'Foundation Ipvestigatibn
| 1804.1 General. Section 1804.1 of the UntfermCalifornia Building Code, 994 1998

Edition has been adopted without change pursuant to Section 91 .0161 1.1

1804.2 Investigation. [No change.]

1804.3 Reports. through 1804.79 BfaiﬂageGeotechhical and Supplemental Ground-

response Reports. Sections 1804.3 through 1804.79 of the YnifermCalifornia Buflding Code,

-PAGE 8 OF 26-

). 18658



1594 1998 Edmon have been adopted without change pursuant to Section 91 .0101.1.1.
1804.810 Requlred Geologlc Investlgatlon
1804 810.1 A geologlc 1nvest1gat10n shall be- made submitted when required by Table 18-

I-E or the Bulldmg Official, for all new structures, non-exempt addmons to existing structures or

whenever the occupancy classification of a building changes to a higher relative hazard category
(refer to Table 5-E of the current edition of the Uniform Code for Building Conservation) as a
result of the proposed work. unless exeepted exempted by Section 1804.8.3.

1804.810.2 [No change.]

¢

1804.810.3 Additions to detached one-and two-family dwellings are exempt from
geologic investigation requirements for building permits, except when the site is located within
Geologic Hazard Categoﬂ 11 or 21, or when required by' discretionary action. All new additions

~ to-existing-struetures of less than five hundred (500) square fept of ﬂpdr area, remodels and non- .
structural tenant improve.ments (TI’S:) to existing‘ structures are exempt from geologic
investigatiod requirements. Cpnsecutive ddditions to the same structure which fotal five hundred

| (500) square feet or more in any twelve-month period méy'require a geologic investigation.

1804.810.4 The Building Official may require that a “NOTICE OF GEOLOGIC AND
GEOTECHNICAL CONDITIONS” be executed by the property owner as a condition to the
1ssuance of a bulldmg permit for any structure to be located over a suspected fault or other
geologic hazard. A “NOTICE OF GEOLOGIC AND GEOTECHNICAL CONDITIONS” may |
also be required v;lhen the a geolpgic in?estigat.ion cannot concludively establish that buildings.or
structures located on the site would either be safe or undafe_.' The form of notice shall beas

provided by the Building Official, and be executed by the owner of the property, recorded with

-PAGE 9 OF 26-

)~ 1sese



the San Diego County Recorder and filed with the City of San Diego asa condition to issuance

of the permit.
TABLE 18-1.E -
REQUIRED GEOLOGIC INVESTIGATION(S)
Hazard Category® " Geologic ’ Geologic Investigation -
) Reconnaissance o
113, 13021, 319,41 - A A® B@ C? D@
120,22, 42, ' C,D A,B.
43 -44:-54 4
$2223-27,329,54 | . B,C - - A
4544-48, 52, 53 - B A
51,55 . - - A
FOOTNOTES TO TABLE 18-1-E
1. [No change.]

2. Building, Structure and Facility Classes A, B, and C and D.

A. Class A inéludes the following:

1)  Essential Facilities as defined in Section 16257 of the HﬂtfeﬂﬂCallforma Bulldlng
- Code, 994 1998 Edition. : _

. 2) [No change.]

B. Class B includes the following developments occupancy groups and structures '
prov1ded they are not included in Class A:

1) and 2) [No change.]
3)  All buildings over twe three stories in height.
. 4)- All buildings containing the fbllowing occupancies (Refer to 1994 BB€E
California Building Code, 1998 Edition, Table 3-A): -

a. Group A, Divisions 1, 2, and 2.1.
b. ~ Group E, Division 1.

PAGE 10 OF 26-

-



€ GroupFDivistontand2: -
dc. . Group H, Divisions 1.2.3.6 and 7.
ed. .Group I, Divisions 1 and 3.

5) All buildings with an occupant load of more than three hundred (300) persons as
determined by Seetton16-22;-Table 10-A of the YnifermCalifornia Building
Code, 1994 1998 Edition.

6),7),8)and 9) [No chaxlge.]

C. Class C includes the following occupancy groups and structures provided they are not
1ncluded in Classes A or B:

1) Al buildings qontaining the following occupancies (Refer to 994 California .
Building Code, 1998 Edition-UB€, Table 3-A):

., b. and c. [No change.]

GroupH; Prvistons4-and-5 Group F, Divisions 1 and 2.
GreupHDivisten2: Group H, Divisions 4 and 5.
Group™: Group 1, Division 2,
GroupR;Divistens+-and3- Group M

Group-5;-Divistons2,34-and-5- Groun R, Division 1.
Group S, D1v1sxons 1. 2 34.and 5.

F@ oo A

e

2),3),4) and 5) [No change.]

D. Class D includes the following occuparlcy group and structures prdvided they are not
included in Classes A B.orC: .

1)  All buildings containing the following occupancies (refer to Callfomla Bulldmg
Code, 1998 Edition 1997 UB€, Table 3-A):

‘a.  GroupR, D1v1510n 3

Note: o No geologic investigations are required for occupancy- Group

‘U, Division 1, or any other structures of a similar minor
nature.

~ [No change.]
Liquefaction Potential - Hazard Category 3.1 and 32. Wherl an lnvesti‘gaﬁon is required, .
adhere to Section 1804.5 of the Hm-fmeahfomla Building Code, -l-994 1998 Edition for
minimum requirements.
[No change.]
-PAGE 11 OF 26-

0 - 18636



END OF FOOTNOTE-S- TO TABLE 18-I-E
o DIVISION 29 |
Plumbipg SYSTEMS
' SEC. 91.2902 Number of Fixtures
2902.1 General. through 2902.6 Group R dccupanciés. Sections 2902.1 through 2902.6 _
of the UnifermCalifornia Building Code, 994 1998 Edition have been adopted without
change purs.uant to Sectioﬁ 91 .0101.1.1. | | |
2902.7 [No change.]
' DIVISiON 34
Existiﬁg Structures
SEC. 91.3403 Additions, Alterafions or Repairs
3463.1 General through 3403.4 Glass Repla'c-ement. Sections 3403.1 ihrough 3403.4 f)lf
the U—n%fem&California Building Code, 1994 1998 Edition have beeh{aaopted without change
pursuant to Section 91.0101.1.1: |
3403.5 Hiétoric Buildings. Pursu;lnt to Séctiori 91.0101.1.32, Section 3403.5 vof the
Q-n'tfem&Califomia Building Code, 1994 1998 Editioﬂ has not been‘adopted. Title 24, Part-8,
California Code Qf Regulations governs restoration of historic buildings. |
3403.6 [No change.] |
| | DIVISION 84 B
_ Swimming Pools,. Spasu‘.and Hot Tﬁbs
SEC. 91.8402 Definitions

For the purpose of this Section, certain terms, words and phrases are defined as follows:

-PAGE 12 OF 26-.

- |) - 18656



“Aboveground pool, In-ground pool and On-ground pool” each mean the same thing as

“Swimming Pool”.

“Barrier” means a fence, wall, building wall or a combination iihereof, which éompleteiy
surrounds the swimming pool and obstructs acci,éss to the swimming pool.

“Grade” means the uiicierlying .surface,” such eis earth oi a walking sixrface.

“Hot Tub” méans the sa'me‘thing as “Swimming Pocl)li”.

“Indoor Swimming Pool” means a swimming pool which is totally contained within a -

residential structure and surrounded on all four sides by walls of said structure.
“Outdoor Swimming Pool” means any swimming pool which is not an indoor pool.
“Spa” means the same thing as “Swimming Pool”. -

“Swimming Pool” means any structure intended for swimming or recreational bathing that

- can contain water over twenty-four{24) eighteen (18) inches in depth. This includes in-ground,
aboveground and on-ground swimming pools, hot tubs and spas.

SEC. 91.8403 Barrier Requirements

[No change in first pariclgraph.]

1. through 6. [No change.]

7. Where the barrier is composeci of diégi)nal memb’Crs,—sueh?'.as—a—}atfiee—fenee; the - o
maximum opening formed by the.diagona'l members .shali be no more than two (2) |
inches. | |

8. Access gates shall comply with the requirements of Section 91-.8403, items 1. through 7.,

-PAGE 13 OF 26-

/)~ 18656



10.

. have rigid peo} ockmg safety covers eqtit

and shall be equipped to accommodate a locking device no les'sb f_han 54 60 inches above
grade. Pedestrian-access gates shal.l open outward av_vay' from'thé pool and shall be self-
closing and have a self—latching device. Gates other than pedestrian access gates shall
comply with the requiremepts of Section 91 .8463, items 1. through 7., and shall be
equipped with a locking device. |

[No change.]

Hot tubs and spas located outdoors and not exceeding 64 Square feet of water surface may

deviee that comply with American Society for Testmg and Materials (ASTM) Standard

F1346-91) in lieu of the barrier requlred by this Division.

Outdoor swimming pools may have a rﬁanually or pbwer-operated safety pooi cover that
complies with all of the performance standards of ASTM F1346-91 in lieu of the barrier

" required by this division.

When the house forms part of the sWimming pool barrier and the house wall has dbor
openings that lead directly into the pool yard'area, one of the folloWing éhild safety

features must be provided:

a. The pool area must be isolated from the home by an additional barrier as described in

this section

s

The pool must be equipped with an approved safety cover as described in Section

91.8403.10 above,

¢. The residence must have exit alarms on all doors leading from the house directly to

the pool yard area,

d. All doors leading to the pool yard area must have self—cloéing, self-létching door

' _PAGE 14 OF 26~

ﬂ - ﬁBSS@



hardware with a release mechanism located no less than 54 inches above the floor.

~ 4+ 13, Where unusual circumstances exist that make strict enforcement of this Division
impraétical, the Building official may grant modiﬁéatioﬁs for individual cases per Section-
104.2.7 of the H—ni%bﬂnCalifofnia Building Code, +994 1998 Edition.
SEC. 95.0112 Stmctural_besign |
(@) No change]
: (b) Wind loéds. Signs and sign stmcturés shall be designed and constructed to resist wind
- forces as specified in the Ynatferm California Building Code as adopted by 5F§hé Cityﬁf
(c) and (d) [No change.]
~ (e) Allowable stress'es. The design of wood, _<A:‘oncret'e, aluminum, or steel members shall

- conform to the requirements of the Yniferm Califo.mia Buildiﬁg Code as addpted by Fthe

| City-of-San-Dtege. Vertical and hbrizontal loads exerted on the soil shall not produce
stresses exceeding those specified in the Hﬂtfefm Caiifomia Building Code as a_dopted by._
Fthe City-ef-SanDiego. The working stresse_s of wire ropes and its fastenings shall not . ‘
exceed 25 peréent of the ultimate strength‘ of fhe rope or fasteners. | .
Working stresses for wind or seismic loads combined with dead loads méy be increased
as specified in the Hm-ferm California Building Code as adopted by :Fﬂle City-of-San
Diego.

(H) [No cﬁange.]

| SEC. 95;01 13 - Construction Material and .Inst‘a]lation Standards
(é) [No change.] | |

(b) Materials. Materials or construction for signs and sign structures shall be of a quality

-PAGE 15 OF 26-

o MR aess



‘and grade allowed for buildings in the YUniferm Cali'fomiaBuild'ing Code.as adopted by
Fthe City-e-f—Sén—Biego. | o
If the frame or cabinet of va sign is.to be fabricated of steel, the steel shall be galvanized or

| painted with rust- inhibiting paint. |
Anchors and,supports of wood, Whén embedded in the soil or within six inghes of the :
sbi_l, shall bé pressure-treated with an'appr_oved preservative. Such treated wood rﬁ'embers
shgll be marked or branded by an approved agency. |

| Ground .é,ign‘s may be construc_ted of z.1ny> material meeting the requiremenfs of this Code.

(c) through (g) [No change.] }- |

_ »SEC. 96.0403 Payment of Fees

~ Prior to the issuance of any building permit, the Building Official shall assure that fees
are paid to the City for park and recreational faciliﬁes in accordaﬁée Qith the following
schedule:
1. and 2. [No changé.] ‘

~ Fees collected shall be refunded to the individual making payment in event the building
permit expirés, within the meaning of Section 302(d) of the Yniform California Building
Code. Requests fdr a refund of fees shall be in writing and shall set forth in full the facts
showing that such pérrhit has expired. |

: SEC. 98.0101 Designation, Scol;e and D_efin_itioﬁs of the San Diego Housing Code '

(a) and (b) [No change.] )

(c)‘Deﬁx;itions. The definitions contained m the H-nrferm Céllifomia Building Code :as
ad'opted in Section 91 .0101, the Uniform Houéing Code as adopted in Secﬁon 98.0103;

the definitions contained in Chapters 1, IX'and X of the Municipal Code, and the

 -PAGE 16 OF 26- ﬂ - 18656



following definitions apply to the administration and enforcement of this Division:
[No change in definitions.] |
SEC. 98.0103 State Hbusing Law Regulations Adopted
The provisions of Article 5, Division 1, Chapter 1, Subchaptcr 1,. Title 25, California
Co.de éf Regulations, on file 1n the ofﬁcé of the City Clerk as Document No. 769796,
| together with‘ the provision.s"of Chaptér 8 and Section 264¢€)201.3 of thé Uniform
" Housing Code, 199+7 Edition, a copy of which is on ﬁl¢ in the office (;f the City Clerk as

Document No. . are hereby adopted and made a part of this Division as if

fully set forth.

SEC. 98.0202 - Mobilehoines, Recreational Vehicles and Corﬁmeréial Coaches Located |
| Ou¥sidé Licensed Mobilhohe and Special Occupancy Parks - Special Perinit ?,Fee
a) No personvshall usé or occupy any mobilehome; commercial coach or recreational

vehicle on private property not licensed as a mobilehome park or special occubéncy park
e;cept as follows: |

1) and 2) [No chaﬁge.]

3) For a business establishment, provided (.l) the use is p&miﬁed by the zoﬁing
regulatioﬁé applicable to the site oﬁ which the commercial coach is to be located; (2) the
commercial coach béars a California Insignié of Approval (issued pursuant to Section |
18025 et seq’., California Health and _Safet;/ Code) fof the tjfpe of use involved; (3) the
;:ommercial cqach is lqéated from site préperty lines the distances specified in the
Yniferm California Building Code, as adopted by the City, for buildings based upon type
of use, fire resistance of exte.ri'or walls, and c‘>p‘enings in exterior walls. |

4) through 6) [No change.]

race oFs [ - 18656



SEC. 101.0410 - R Zdnes (Multiple Family Residential)
A. through H. [No change.]

I. MAXIMUM BUILDING HEIGHTS, LoT COVERAGES, AND FLOOR AREA
RATIOS (FAR)-

1. through 5. [No change.]
6. Excepﬁon broceciufe for rhaximl_xm lot coverages.
a. ithrough c. [No change.] N
d. Any exterior usable area described in this pardgraph may be sited étop the roof or
- covering of a building or garage, and, further, that the bortion of the roof or cover serving
as an exterior usable areﬁ shall not have a slope exceeding five 'peréent and must'co_.mply
with all applicable requirements for exit and entrance. Further, any ;ooftop exterior
usable area shall include a guardrail, as specified in the YUniform California Building .

Code, as adopted by the City, along the perimeter of all exterior walls and vertical drops. -

“All roof-mounted heating, ventilatirig, air-conditioning, solar energy collecting or other
 mechanical or electrical equipment shall be complefely and safely fenced aﬁd visually
screened from the rooftop exterior usable drea, and further, all stqﬁdpipes, vents, drains or.
similar other rooftop appurtenances shall be §:i£her:_
1) and 2) [No change.]
e. [No change.]
_' 7. [No change.]
J. through Q [Nb change.]”
SECTION 101.0570 - Live/Work Quarfers (Lofts)
A. tﬁrough D. [Né change.]
E. ADMINISTRATION'

- -PAGE 18 OF 26- ﬂ

18656



1. and 2. [No change.]
3. Building Permit Required
Prior to the use of any building, or portion th_ereof, for live/work quvar‘ters, a building
permit shall be obtained from the Development Services Department. A copy of the
applic‘ation for a live/work quartersi permit, approved by the Developnlent Services |
Director, shall accompany the building permit application. The prevailing H—mfom&
California Building Code regulations shnll apply except as provided by Code.'
interpretations as shown in a Developrnent Services.‘ Denartment Newsletter.
F. [No change.] |
- SEC. 101.0620 Fences
A. through F. [No change.]
G. FENCES- MAINTENANCES AND REPAIR
All fences (including retaining walls) shall be constructed of new or good used maierial
and in accordzince with the methods of constructionwhich conform to the reduirements.of
.the Yniferm California Building Code,‘ as»adopted in Chapter IX of the Municipal Code.
Additionall}i, they shall be inaintained in a state of good repair. Any dilapidated,
dangerous or unsightly fences or retaining walls shall be repaired or removed.
' SEC. 101.0702 - Administrative Regulations
[No change in first paragraph.]
This Division shall be applied to any construction, establishment, alteration, enlargement
or change in use that results in the following:
A. and B. [No change.] | |

C. [No change in first two sentences. |

-PAGE 19 OF 26-

AT ~[)- 48658



This Division shall also apply to any addition, alteration or repairA to existing structures
_ ‘-(Municiéal Code Se.ction 91 ;0106) which results in a change in the occupancy
* classification as listed in Table No. 5-A of the BOntferm California Builciing Code. The
Developmént Services Direptor may brorate the requirem’ents herein, basedv upon the
nature and extent of alterations and additions. |
For projects as indicated above, no certificate of occupancy, demolition permit, or .'
encroachment permit shall be issued unless: '
A.and B. [No change.]
SEC. 101.1101 Definitions
101.1101.1 through 101.1101.130 [No change.]
101.1101.131 Marquee |
A Eui]ding projection over a publfc ‘ri;ght-of-way_as defined in the California-Bu,ilding |
Code, as adobted by The-City in Chap'ter IX of thé Muniéipal quee%San-Bieée. When
the structure does not extend over the publ‘ic right-df—Way, refer to “Architcctural L
Projection,” Section 101.1101.4.
10.1.1.101.132 »through 101.1101.221 [No'change‘.] |
101.1101.222 - Yniform California Bgilding Code
The current edition of the Yniferm California Bﬁilding Code, as adoptéd by Fthe City—é-f
SanDiege. Hereinafter referred to asBC.B.C. | |
101.1101.223 through 101.1101.250 [No change.]
SEC.. 101.1122 Face-Lift
A. The p‘rlovisionsl of this section apply to building frohtages visible from a public’

right-of-way which are designed or redesigned so that all elements of the new building

-PAGE 20 OF 26- ! ﬂ i 18656



facade and sighs are integrated inio one unit and. comply with Athé following requirements:
1. thfough 4. [No change.]
5. The face-lift area complies with the Hnifém'gm Bpilding Code
requiremeﬁts., | |
B. [No change.]
SEC. 103.0403 Procedures for _Speciz;l Permit Application énd Review
A. and B. fNo change.] |
C. DETERMINATION

Upon submittal by the applicant of basic concept 'dréwings'and review of those ;basic
concept draWings Sy the City Architect, the Exeéutivé Vice President may approve,
modify or disapprove any application for a special permit. In approviﬁg the special
permit, the Executive Vice Preéident rﬁéy impose geasonable ébnditions to ensure
compliance witﬁ these regulations. The Executive Vice'Presi:dent shall n;it approve an

 application for a special permit except upon detérmining that the buildiﬁg, étfucture or
'irﬁpr_ovement and use for which tﬁe special permit was appl;ed (1) 1s édnsistent with the

‘Yntterm California Building Code and Fire Code and the regulatibﬁs contained herein,
and (2) will not be detrimental tp thq health, safety, peace, morals, clomf(')rt 'and géneral

| welfare of persons residing or working in the neigh_bbrhood or injurious to property and
improvements in the ﬁeighborhood or to t-he geheral welfare of the city and is not
detrimenfal to implementation of the Gaslamp Quarter Rédevelopmént Plan. Action by
the Executive Vice President shall include a staterﬁent that the Executive Vice Presidént
finds that the building, strucfure, or improvefﬁent or use for which the Special permit we;s

applied does or does not conform to the regulations contained herein. In the event the

_PAGE 21 OF 2§- | & _ '18‘65.6



Executive Vice Pfesident does not appr'ove'an-appli;:‘ation fora épecial permit, the
specific facts on which .thé determination 1s based shall be included in the written
deCision as provided for 1n Section 103.0403_D following.
[No chénge in second paragraph. ]
D. through H. [No change.]
SEC. 103.0959 "Redevelopment Subdistl;ict" - Property Development Regulationsi
[No change in first paragraph.] |
A. and B. [No change.] |
E. MINIMUM SETBACK REQUIREMENTS
1. [No change.]
2. Nonresidential
a. through d. [No change ]
E. Cénopies_/awning.s may encréach on the §ideWalk area in conformance with Section
. %&%&Mm&cﬁon 3206 of the California
| Building Code. 1998 Edition, and Section 91.3208 of the Municipal Code.
D. through J. [No change.] o '
SEC. 103.1424 Stfeetsca’pe Development Regulatiéns/Encroéchment Permits
[No chapge in first two paragraphs.]
A. through C. [No change.]
D. PARKWAY LANDSCAEING AND STREET TREES
_[No change in first three baragr.aphs.] |
Trees shall be positioned and kept maintaineE so that any br;mches that eXtend out ove‘r.

dedicated street rights-of-way have a minimum of fourteen (14) feet six (6) inches of

-PAGE 22 OF25 | 0~ 18656



cleafance above the surface of the street.
| 1. [No change.] - |
2. Tree Grates. |
Tree grates shall meet safety reduirements of Title 24 of the Hni-feﬂﬁ.Califomia
Butlding Code of Regulations. The maximum size of grid opeﬁing shall be no lafger than
| one half inch. All tree grates shall be installed ﬁush with the sidewalk surface and shall
be set a minimum of two inches al‘)ove a ._gravel base. The grates shall‘ be féctorsf primed
and painted black. Tree grates shall not be'pequired if trees are planted in a landscaped
parkwéy, provided no safety hazards are caused by this exception.
3. and 4 [No change.]
E. througﬁ I. [No change.]
| SEC. 103.1606 Property Development Regulations
| [No ,'change- in first paragraph.] |
A. [No change.]
B. Minimum Buiiding Setbacks |
The fo]loWing minimum building setbacks shgll be prdvided:
1. through 4. [No change.] -
5. Courts Required for Dwelling Units or Guest Rooms:

a. Courts opposite Walls oh Same Site. The minimum _dep.th of a court opposité a
window ofa liying room shéll equal one-half the height of the opposité wall, but shall not
be less than 18 feet. The minimum depth of a court opposite a wipdow of any other
habitable room shall be 12 feet if there is a \;vir}aow of any habitable room in the opposite

“wall. All other depth dimensions shall be governed by. the Bniferm California Building

/) - 18656

-PAGE 23 OF 26-



Code, 1998 Edition. (Depth is measured perpendicular to subjeét window).
b. and c. [No change.]
d. Exceptions to Required Dimensions. On each lot with a single-room océupancy'

(SRO) residential hotel, a building designed for group residential use, or a building or

portion thereof converted for live/work quarters, the dimensional requirements for courts

prescribed by the Yaiferm California Buiiding Code, 1998 Edition shall apply inAlieu of
thé requirements of thi‘s section.- |
C. through J. [No change.]
| SEC. .-103.1 704, Residential Regulations
[No chaﬁge to first paragraph.]
| All manufactured or factory built housing and move-on structures Aand all institutional
strﬁctures including churches are subject to the development criteﬁa of the linderllying;
Planned District zone unless otherwise stated in this Division. All move-on structures
must obtain a Southeast San Diego Development Perrﬁit as specified in Section
103.1703.B. of the Municipal Code. Fér "cill manufactured and factolryvbuil,t houéiﬁg, roof,

siding and foundation treatments shall conform to the relevant sections of the Yntform

California Building Code, 19'98 Edition, including; but not limited to, Chapfers 29
th;ough 32 and roof overhang, r(;oﬁng material and siding material shall be similar to
fypes used for existing adjacent residcntiai structures. Foundations and footings must be
finished in a manner consistent with the structure for all housing types.

SEC. 103.2002 Definitions
For purposes of Chapter X, Article 3., Divisi‘oﬁ 20, the following terms are defined as:

[No change from “Atrium” through “Floor Area”.]

| | -PAGE 24 OF 26- D - i8655



" . "Floor Area Ratio (FAR)" means fhe ratio of total enclosed building area inci_‘uding
parking at and above grade to the area of the site. The FAR is an indicati'on' of the
intensity of dévelopm_ent.

' [No change in remainder of Definitions.]
SEC. 103.2012 Property Development Regulations
A. [Né) change.] . |
B.l REGULATIONS
The following regulations shall apply to .the épeciﬁc_ areas as indicated:f
1. Mixed Residential/Nohresidential Land Use Areas. )
" The major land use in the Marina Planned District shall be residential as.illustrated on
'Figure 1. In the area designated eighty percent téO%) residential/}wenty percent (20%)
nonresidential (except in. structur,es'ﬁfty (50) feet or less in height), at least eighty percént
(80%) of the grc;ss floor area shall be residential ﬁse ana up to twenty percent (20%) of
~ the gross floor area may be noriresidential. Where structures are fifty (505, feet or‘less in
height or meet the height reduiremgnts of the Hnrfefm California Buﬂding Code,as
adopted_by«Chapter IX of the ‘S-an Diego Municipal Code, for Type V construction, gross
floor area in nonresidential use may exceed twenty percént '(20%) if the entireﬁ
nomesidential ﬁse' is accessible to and located atﬂ the street level of the project. The
permitted uses are described in Muhicipal Code section 103.2011. Exceptions to the
percentage ratio of eighty percent to twenty percént (80%-20%) for High-Rise
structures are cdntained in Municipal Code section 103.2012(B) (4).
2. through 15. [No change.] R |

SEC. 111.1305 Building Permits

- PAGE25OF26- | 0 -1885?6



(a) Supplemental Provisions. The provisions of this section shal‘lv supplement the

provisions of Municipal Code Chapter IX and the Yntferm California Building Code as

adopted by-the-City in Chapter IX of the Municinal Code. .

(b) ‘[No ;:hange.]

(c) Modifications and Deviations. An "Applicant” méy request in writing that the

Building Official grant a modiﬁcétion or minor deviation from the relevant provisioris of - |
Municipal Code Chapter IX or Hni-.feﬂn-Califomi_a Building Code in accor’da_nce with )
Section 104.2.7 of the 1 9948_ H-n'tfeﬂﬁvCalifornia Building Code.

(d) through (f) [No change.]

MIJL:edk

06/11/99
Or.Dept:Plan.&Dev.Rev.
0-99-121

-PAGE 26 OF 26- ﬂ o 18656 -



