PN

ORDINANCENUMBER O-__ v 21181 ~ (NEW SERES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE APR 092020

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9,

DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN-DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODEBY

AMENDING SECTION 129.0104; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE 9; DIVISION 2 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
129.0203,129.0211, 129.0216, AND 129.0218; AMENDING

' CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING

“ SECTION 129.0307, AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION
129.0309; AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 4
- BY AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0410;
" AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BAY
* AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0907;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 12 BY
AMENDING SECTION 142.1210; AMENDING CHAPT ER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 1 BY: AN[ENDING SECTIONS -
145.0101, 145.0103, 145.0104, 145.0105, 145.0106, AND .
145.0107; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 2
BY AMENDING SECTION 145.0201 AND REPEALING '
SECTION 145.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 4 BY AMEND[NG SECTION 145.0401 AND-
ADDING:NEW SECTION 145.0406; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 7 BY REPEALING SECTION.
145.0702 AND AMENDING SECTION 145.0711; AMENDING
. CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY-RENUMBERING
AND RETITLING SECTION 145.1207 TO SECTION 145, 1206
AND ADDING NEW SECTION 145. 1207, AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 145, 1501 145.1505 AND 145.1507, ADDING NEW
SECTION 145.1510, AND RENUMBERING AND RETITLING
CURRENT.SECTION 145.1510 TO SECTION 145.1511;
. AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 18§ BY
-AMENDING SECTION 145.1803; AMENDING CHAPTER '14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 31 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3101
AND REPEALING SECTION 145.3109; AMENDING = -
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 32 BY AMENDING
SECTION 145.3203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 33 BY -AMENDING SECTIONS 145.3301 AND
145.3303; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION
38 BY RETITL]NG DIVISION 38 AND BY AMENDING AND

. RETITLING SECTIONS 145.3801, 145.3802, 145.3803,

145.3804, 145.3805, AND 145.3806; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 39 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3905
AND AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 145.3910;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 40 BY

v

-PAGE 1 OF 66-’

oS

(0-202082)
/ ‘l/ ;loo'zc

D




" 'AMENDING SECTION 145.4005; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, -

' ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
146.0103, 146.0104, 146.0105, 146.0106, AND 146.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 2 BY

(0-2020-82)

REPEALING SECTIONS 146.0208 AND 146.0209; AMENDING :

CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING

" SECTIONS 147. 0103, 147.0104, 147.0105, AND 147.0106;
.AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 2 BY
ADDING NEW SECTION 147.0203, RENUMBERING
SECTION 147. 0213 TO SECTION 147.0211, AND AMENDING
AND RETITLING SECTION 147.0212; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 4 BY- AMENDING SECTION
147.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 8, DIVISION 1
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 148.0103, 148.0104, 148.0105,
148.0106, AND 148.0107, AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

- ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
149.0103, 149.0104, 149.0105, 149. 0106, 149.0107, AND

149.0108; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2

" BY AMENDING SECT. ION 149.0201 AND REPEALING
SECTION 149.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9,
" DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 149.0301 AND -

| . 149.0302, ADDING NEW SECTION 149. 0309, AMENDING

' AND RETITLING SECTION 149.0319, ADDING NEW
SECTION 149.0324, REPEALING SECTION 149.0326, AND .
AMENDING SECTION 149.0337; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

- - ARTICLRE 9, DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0902; .

. AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ‘ARTICLE 10, DIVISION 1 BY

_AMENDING SECTIONS 1410.0103 AND 1410.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIVISION 4 BY
AMENDING SECTION 1410.0403; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECT IONS .
1411.0103, 1411 0104, 1411.0105, 1411.0106, AND 1411.0107,
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3 BY

. AMENDING SECTION 1411.0301 AND AMENDING AND

" RETITLING SECTION 1411.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
'ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING AND RETITLING

.SECTION 1411 .0401, REPEALING SECTIONS 1411.0402,
1411.0403, AND 1411.0404, AND ADDING NEW SBCTION

* 1411.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, BY :
. ADDING NEW DIVISION 5, SECTIONS 1411.0501, 1411.0502,

AND 1411.0503, RELATING TO THE 2019 CALIFORNIA

BUILD]NG STANDARDS CODE

-PAGE 2 OF 66~




(0-2020-82)

‘WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Co:de,.2_019 Edition, was poblished by the |
California Building Standards Commission, and 'oroended'b‘y. the State Department of Housing
and Con_lmunity Development, the Division of the State A_rch_itécf/Access Compliaoce, the State
Ofﬁce of Stotewide Health i?lenning em_i Developxoeog and the State Fi1;e Marshal; aod

" . WHEREAS, California Health and Safetsf Code section 17958 provides that the
, govenﬁng body of every city‘or county shall adoot ordinances or regulations impoeiﬁg the.ea'me
requirements as those contained in the California Building Standards Code; and -

WHEREAS the Clty of San Dlego desn‘es to adopt these requqements except as

. modlﬁed below, and to make necessary clanﬁcatlons and remove inconsistencies; and
WHEREAS Callforma Health and Safety Code sectlons 17958 5 17958.7, and 18941.5 -
provide that a c1ty or county may make such changes or modifications to the requlrements o
'containod“in the 'Califoﬁlia Buildiog Standards Code as i't determines are reasonably necessary
. because of loeal clu:nat:c geologlcal or topogmphmal condmons NOW THEREFORE,

. BEIT ORDAINED, by the Councll of the Clty of San Dlego as follows

Sectxon 1. That it finds and ,declar il accordance with Cahforma Health and Safety
Code sectxon 17958 5, that the followmg addmons and deletxons meorporate changes and
: -modlﬁcatlons that-are reasonably necessary because of the local chmauc geologxc&l or
topographical conditions set forth below ‘ |

1. Climatic Conditions -

Each year, the City of San Diego expenencee penods of high temperatures, accompamed
by low humu_hty and hlgh,wmds. Years of drought in the City’s semi-arid natural environment -
- have increased the combustibility of vegetation. These conditions create an environment in
.wh'i'cl.ln t‘he' Fire Department commits large nmobers of ﬁreﬁghﬂng reeources to control and

extinguish wildland fires. The City experienced major wildfires in 2003 and 2007. Limited

' ~ -PAGE 3 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)
, ﬁreﬁghting reSources means that ﬁreﬁghters may have great difﬁeult)r eontr'olling ﬁres in |
structures | | a

San Drego is exposed to sunny or parhally sunny days for more than half of the days in
‘ the .year and asa result, isa natronal leader in the unplementahon of solar photowltarc systems.
Strearnlmmg the approval process through the adoptron of standards for solar systems facilitates:
| broader adoptlon and w111 help the Clty achleve the net Zero energy oonsumptron goals of the )
Crty s General Plan.

As noted above, the C1ty of San Dlego has a serni- -a.nd natural envrronment and as such,
~ -water conservatron isan 1mportant goal The Chmate Action Plan for the City of San Diego has '
water eﬁiexent buﬂdrngs as one of its: goals To achreve that goal San Dlego must adopt water |
eonservatlon and efﬁetent water usé standards In addltlon to requmng the use of water efficient
pIurnbmg ﬁxtures the City of San Diego reduces water consumphon through various water reuse -
programs Reducmg the quantlty of water supphed to plumbmg fixtures can also result in
reduced water eonsumptlon N | o ' B h

San D1ego is subjeet to flood hazards along the coastal nerghborhoods to the west and in .

1ts valleys and, therefore restricts constmetron in speetal ﬂood hazard areas.

2. | Geologeal Condltlons

The City of San Diego is sittm'ted nea.r three major’ e‘arthquake fa:xlts each eapable of
| generatmg quakes Wlth magmtude of 7. 0 or greater on the RJchter seale the Elsinore Fault,
northeast of the City; the Rose Canyon Fault which extends from LaJ olla Cove through Rose
'Canyon and into downtown SarrDiego; and the Coronado Banks Fault ‘which extends ina B

northwest/southeast direction Just off the coast under the Paclﬁc Ocean The most severe threat

. from earthquakes is damage to and eollapse of buﬂdmgs and other structures due to ground

-PAGE 4 OF 66- -




- (0-2020-82)

movement. Earthquakes can also cause ﬁréd py damaging gds and power lines, gnd can make |

’ _I firefighting difficult or impossible by breaking water mams and damaging sprinkler systems.
The City of San Dieéo is included in the Acquist Priolp _Special Pault Study Zone and the’

Rose Canyon fault area, bo‘.th with high m&pped_s_eisﬁlic accqiprdtiqns t'hat' itﬁpact construction of n

| iligh rise buildings.

3, Topographical Conditidns‘ ‘ _ ‘

_The Cit)} pf San Diego has over 900 linear miles of wildland urbad interface, where-
backyards of homes meet the natural vegetatlon, mcludmg coasta] sage scrub and chaparral
Access to this natura.l vegetatlon for purposes of ﬁreﬁghtmg is made difficult by topographlcal
- features of the City that include hills, I_nountm_ns and ca.nyoins. These topographlcal features
“create sdgniﬁdant difﬁélﬂﬁes for emergency pe;somcl'aﬁedlpﬁdg to extmgmsh fires in dleée

Due_td t];e.‘prevalenc_:_é of canyons, preéerved open space, the Paciﬁc Ocean, and an '
_intcrngdonal 'border; the City of S%m Diego has constrained buildable spacé that requires vertical
constructlon - o -
San D1eg0 mcludes nexghborhoods that are sub_]ect to ﬂoodmg during periods of h:gh
rainfall due to the prevalence of canyons steep slopes, the ocean to the west, as well as nvers
: ‘passmg thx‘ough canyons and termmatmg in the ocean. _

Section 2, That Chapter 12 Arhcle 9, Dmsmn 1 of the San D1ego Mumclpal Code is k
amended by amendmg section 129. 0104 to read as follows. Co ‘ P
§129.0164 | Construction PermltAuthorltles | | .

(ﬁ) * The powers and dutles of the Building Official are as follows:

(1) through (13) [No change in text. ]

-PAGE 5 OF 66~




(14y

(15)

(16)

(0-2020-82)

To review applicafidns for Grading Perrmts fer,' and to inspect

: gradin'g on, private lots thatdo not iriclude publi‘c rights of way, as
well as associated plans speelﬁcatlons, and other data to determme h

"~ ifan apphcanon isin comphanee w1th the gradmg regulatlons in-

the Callforma Building Code, other adopted Clty standards; and

- engmeermg standa.rds of prachee |

[No change in text.]_

To review planis and specifications for water and sewer utilities and

‘installations, and to inspect the utilities add installations wheri

' ,"located in pnvate sireets for oomphanee w1th the issued .
,constmctzon permzt the San Diego F1re Code, the San Dlego
:Bu11dmg, Electrical, Plumbmg, Mechamca!,.Remdentlal Bu1]dmg,

- Green Building, and Existing Building Regulations, and, all other -

apphcable prowswns of the San Diego Mumclpal Code

(b) through (c) [No change in text ]

Secnon 3. That Chapter 12, Artlcle 9, Division 2 of the San Dxego Mumc1pal Code is

amended by amendmg sections 129.0203, 129, 0211 129. 0216 and 129. 0218, to read as folloWs

' §129.0203 Exemptions from a Bmldmg Permit .

(a)

A Bulldmg Penmt is not reqmred for the followmg structures and
actwmes, except when the development would mvolve alteratxons, repairs,
or 1mprovements toa historical resource as. descnbed in Sectxon
143.0220; when development on'a premwes eontalmng enwronmentally
sensitive lands reqmres a development permitin aceordance with ~Sect19n .

143.0110; or whien a building is constructed with unreinforced masonry

-PAGE 6 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)
bearing walls or ox;;erior wali parapets:

(1)  [Nochangein text]

: (2) - Fences that are 7 feet in height or less.

(3) through (6) [No change in toxt.] _

(D Sidewoiks and dﬁveways that are 30 inches or less abové adjaceht

grade, are not over any basement or story, and are not part ofan

accessxble route in acoordance with the Cahforma Buﬂdmg Code. |

-(8). through (9) [No change in text.]

(10) Wmdow awnmgs supported by an extenor wall of Group R
D1v151on 3, and Group U Occupancm that do not project more-
than 54 mches from the extenor walI and do not require addltlonal
support ‘ |

(1 1) through (13) [No change in text. ]

(14) Blectrohcr standards, ﬂag poles and a.ntennas that are 30 feet or

| - less in helght above ﬁmsh grade when' fully extended.

(15) Decks accessory to bulldmgs mthm the scope of the California

| Remdentlal Code that do not exceed 200 square feet (18 58 m2) in
area, that are not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade at
any pomt, that are not attached toa dwellmg, and that do not serve

| the exit door reqmred by Section R311.4 of the Cahforma '
| Remdentlal Code. . . '

(16) - Renewal of roof coverings on any building permitted on the

California Building Code and the California Residential Code,

-PAGE 7 OF 66-




an

- (0-2020-82)

where the existing roof _structur'e, including roof diaphragm, is not
altered.

Repairs that 'invol.ve only the replaeenrerit of components or

" existing work with similar meteriels for thefpurpose of

(18) -

(19
..bulldmgs ' : S

(20)

. @D

mamtenance, that do not have an aggregate valuatlon of over

$1, 000. 00, and that do not affect any eléctrical or meohamcal

' iostallatlons. Repalrs exempt from perrmt requirements shall not '

include any addition, change, or modification in construction, exit

o fac111t1es or permanent ﬁxtures or equlpment The followmg

repalrs are exempt from permit requirements w1thout limit to

: valuatron.

(A) through (D) [No change in text]

Structures plaoed in pubhc streets, alleys and sidewalks, except
those regulated by Chapter 32 of the California Building Code

Work done by employees of the C_rty on City-owned or leased

A temporary shed, ofﬁce or storage butldlng and other structure
mcldental to and for work authonzed bya valid Grading or

Bulldmg Pertmt Suoh structures must be removed upon exp1rat10n -
of the permit or complenon of work covered by the Gradmg or

Bl_nldmg Penmt.

Inistalling replacemerit windows in existing window ooeriings

| ~ where all of the following conditions apply:

-PAGE 8'OF 66-




(A)

®)

©

(D)

@)

(0-2020-82)

The windows are replaced in detached one and two-family

dwellings or towrihouses as defined in the California

Residential Code.

The proposed window_ljep'lacemenf shall not require any . .
modifications to the weather resistive exterior wall -

énvelope protecting the structure or-the interior of the

_structure.

The existing windows to'be réélaced are not required to be

fire resistive.

"The propbsed work shall not require modiﬁpaﬁbﬁs to the ~

~ existing rough openings.

New permanent parking and vehicular use areas for less than four

-

" vehicles, including access to the spaces, but excluding parkmg for.

single dwellir@g unit uses on a single lot in Residential-Single Unit .

~Zones. .

ey

4

Specific stfuctt_tres as determined by the Building Official fora. -

particular and justifiable reason.

A sidewalk cafe that is in compliarice with Section 141.0621,

- unless any one of the fpilowing‘- éﬁplies;‘

.(A)

®)

. 'The sidewalk cafe would alter or modify the existing

‘building, building fagade, or any means of building egress;

The sidewalk cafe would be located on a raised platform or -

in a sunken area; or

-PAGE 9 OF 66- -




§129.0211

§129.0216

§129.0218

(0-2020-82)

, | ©) "A' barrier 'consisting_ of railings, fences, or plantec_ boxen- ) :
| would be installed to delineate the area of the sidevk;allc
cafe. ) |

(b) th.rough:(c) [No change in text.]

Closing of Building Pernﬁn Applicéti'on ’

(a) through (d)[Ng change in text | -

(e) The application for all Electncal Plumbmg, Mechamcal or Fire Permits
" associated with a Bugldl_ng Permit shall expire concurrently with l;hc _
Building Permit. | | |

Initial. Utilization of a Building Pe_rnﬁt-

A Building Permit shall bécome void if work authorized by the permit is suspended,

the strucinre is aban'doned, or substantial work authorized by the permit hés nct
. becn completed and validated by an. mspechon w1thm 12 months of the date of
- pcrmlt 1ssuance unless an extensmn has been grantcd pursuant to Sectlon

'129 0219.

Expiratlon ofa Bulldlng Permlt

- (a) - [No change in text.]

) if the bu:ldmg or work authonzcd by a Bulldmg Permit has not received |
: ﬁnal mspectlon approval by the penmt expiration date, all work shall stop
until a new permit is issued. All Electncal Plumbmg, Mechamca.l or Fire

- Pcrmits assqciated with a Building permit shall expire concurrently with

the Building Permit.

-PAGE 10 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

Section 4. That Chapter 12, Artlcle 9 D1v1s1on 3 of the San Diego Mumelpal Code ig

amended by amendmg secuon 129 03 07, amendmg and retltlmg section 129.0309, to read as

follows.

§129.0307

§129.0309

How to Apply for an Electrical Permit

* (a) through () [No change in tex{ ]

Issuance of an Electrical Permit and Closing of an Electrical Permit
Application .

(a) through (b) [No chiange in text.]

L ©

@)

©

If one year has eiapsed since the date an EIectncal Permit apphcatlon is’

- deemed complete dnd the apphcant has not requested that an Elecincal

_Permit be issued, the appheat:on file shall be closed. Plans and other data

submitted for review may be returned to the applzcant or destroyed by the
Bmldmg Official. To reapp}y, the applzcant shall submit a new Electrical

Permit apphcatlon w1th required sublmttal matenals and shall be subj ect to

Cooall apphcable fees and regulatlons in effect on the date the new apphcanon

is ﬁ]ed

The Electrical Permit applieatien file fof City projects shall be closed after _

two years have elapsed since the date the El'ecj::ical Permit application is

- deemed complete.

The Building Official may extend an.Elee'tn'lcal Permit applicadon one

_ time, for a period not exceeding 180 calendar days, if the Building Official -

determines that clrcumstances beyond the control of the apphcant

prevented issuance of the Electrical Perriit.

Section 5 ‘That Chapter 12, Arhcle 9, Dmswn 4 of the San Dlego Mumc1pa1 Code is

amended by a.mendmg and retltlmg section 129 0410, to read as follows:

-PAGE'11 OF 66-




§129.0410

(0-2020-82)

-Issuance of a Plumblnngechanlcal Permit and Closmg ofa

PlumbinglMechanical Permit Appllcatlon :

(a)

®

©-

A Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permit may be 1ssued aﬂer all approvals have

‘been obtained and the requlred fees have been paid. -

A Plumblng/Mechamcal Permit shall not be issued for a development thal

‘requlree a development permu‘ until the deveiopment permit has been

. 1ssued

If one year has elapsed since the date a Plurnbmg/Mecha.mcal Permit
application is deemed complete and the apphcant has not requested thata

Plumbmg/Meohamcal Permit be issued, the apphcatxon ﬁle shall be

g closed Pla.ns and other data sublmtted for review may be retumed tothe

_ appl:cant or destroyed by the Building Ofﬁc1a1 To reapply, the apphcant

aha]l.subm_lt_ 8 new Plu_mbmg/Me_chamcal Permnit application with reqt_ured

subnital materials and shall be subject to all applicable fees and .

. regulatlons in eﬂ’ect on the date the new apphcahon is ﬁled

@ -

(e)

The Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permit appheatxon ﬁle for Clty pro; jects sha.ll be

elosed aﬁer two years have elapsed since the date the Plurnbmg/

- Mechamoal Perrmt appllcaﬁon is deemed complete
The Bulldmg Official may extend a Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permit
'apphcatlon one t1me for a period not exceedmg 1 80 calenda.r days, if the —

Building Ofﬁcia.l detet'mines that cucpmstances beyond the cor_1trol of the

applicant prevented issua;nee of the Pliunbing/Mechanical Permit,

Section 6. That Chapter 12, Article 9, Division 9 of fhe San Dlego Mumcxpal Code is

amended by arnendmg and retltlmg s‘ectlon 129 0907 to read as follows

-PAGE 12 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§129.0907  Issuance of a Fire Permit and Closing of a Fire Permit Application

(@
®)

©

(d)

©

[No change in text.) .
A Fire Permit shell not be issued until associated permits have been
issued.

If one year has elapsed since the date-a Fire Perm1t application is deemed

, complete and the appl:cant has’ not requested that a Flre Pern:ut be 1ssued

the application file shall be closed. Plans and other data submitted for

review may be re"curned to the applicant or destroyed-bf the Bililding

Official. To reapply, the apphcant shall submit a new Fire Penmt '

apphcatxon Wlth required submittal matenals and shall be subject to all

‘ appllcable fees and regulations in eﬂ'eet on the date the new application is

filed.

| The Fire Permit application file for City projects shall be closed after two *

years have elapsed since the date the Fire Permit application is deemed
complete,

The Building Official may extend a Fire Permit application one time, for a

period ndtlexceeding 180 calendar days, if the Building Official -

determines that clrcumstances beyond the control of the applicant -

: p@@ted issuance of the Fire Permit.

Section 7. That Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 12 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 142.1210, to read as follows:

-PAGE 13 OF 66-




(:(')-2020-82)-
§1421210  CGenoral Sign Regulations
This section.is divided into subsections for copy regulations, loee.tionel
regulations, srruetoral regulaﬁon.s,. and sién maintenance r'egil_le_tions.
* (a) through (b) [No change intext] - |
' (e) -Structural Regularioos |
. (1) through (3) [No cha.née in text. ] »
4 When mstalled on the exterior walls of hxgh-nse bulldmgs as .
| deﬁned in Chapter 4 of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code, exterior, wall
‘s1gus greater than 100 square. feet in area or greater than 10 feet in

' elther dlmensmn shall oomply with Section 705.12 of the 2019

R Cahfor_ma Building Code and Sect:on 705.1 of the 2019 California -

Fire Code' '

Ifd) [No change in text 1.

Section 8. That Chapter 14 ArtrcIe 5, Division 1 of the San Dlego Mumcrpal Code is - -

_amended by amending sectlons 145.0101, 145.0103, 145.0104, 145.0105, 145.0106, and
145.0107, to read a3 follows: |
_ §145.l_}101 Purpose of the Bulldmg Regulations

(a) . The purpose of the Building Regulatxons is to estabhsh minimum -

! standards to safeguard health and safety, property, and pubhc welfare, and

to satlsfy the purpose of the 201 9 Cahforma Burldlng Code as provrded in
_Sectlon 1.1.2 of the 2019 Cal_lforma Building Code.

' (b) - [No changein text.]

.PAGE 14 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

~ §145.0103 Adoption of the Cahforma Buﬂdmg Code

(a)

(®)

©

@

BCR

‘ through 38.

. The 2019 Cahforma Buildmg Code, published by the Callforma Bu11d1ng

Standards Cormmssxon (BSC), and as amerided by the State Department of .

' ~ Housing and Communitj Development (HCD 1, i—ICD IIACj; the Division _
| .of the State Architect/Access and Comphance (DSA/AC), the State Office:
3 of Statew1de Health Plannmg and Development (OSI-IPDS), and the State
o Fire Marshal (SFM), is a.dopted by referencc, except as otherw:se prov1ded
' m‘ Chapter 14, Article 5 of the Land Development Code,--Dmsmns_?

through 38. A capy of the 2019 California Building Codé is on file in the

office of the City Clerk__ae Document No. 00-_ 21181 .

"When refei:ence is made to'the -Califomia Building Code, it shali be the

2019 Cahforma Bmldmg Code, Cahforma Code of Regulatlons Tltle 24
Part 2, as pubhshed by the Cahfomla Buildmg Standards Commisswn
Bach of the regulations, provisions, CODdlthllS, and terms of the 2019 '

Cahforma Bulldmg Code is made a part of Chapter 14 Artlcle 5 as if fully

_ set'forth in thls Artlole except as otherwise prowdod in Dmsmns 2

- Numbering of Sections in Divisions 2 through 38 of this Article is cross

referenced to Sections in the 2019 California Buiiding Code. -

The adoption of the 2019 California Building Code shall in no way limit, -

prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council from adopting ordinancw |

lnmtmg or preventmg the issuance of any type, number or geographical

- dlstnbution of permits for construction or demohtion of any faclhty for ’

which a permit is required.

- =-PAGE 15 OF 66-




| §145.0104 -

§145.0105

(0-2020-82)

) © [No change in text]

Portions of the Cahfornia Bmldmg Code Not Adopted by the City o{ San
Diego . :

The following portions of the 2019 California Building Code are not addpt_ed by

the City of San Diegoi i

(8)  Chapter 1, Division 11 “Scope and _Adminietration,” all portions with'the

exceptxon of SBGtIOIl 104.11,

(b) Chapter 15, Roof Assem'ohes and Rooﬂop Structurm, Sectlon 151 1 4.

(). [No change in text ]

_' Mo.dificatlons to the Cahfornla Bullding Code Adopted by the Clty of San

Diego _ o _

: The followmg Secnons or Subsections of the 2019 Callfomla Bmldmg Code are
' modlﬁed by the City of Sart Diego:

‘ (a) [No che.nge in text.]

®) 'Chapter 12, Interior Environment,- Section 120_6, Sound Tranémiesion,
| Section 1207 .4, Efficiency Dwelling Umts | | |

(¢) . Chapter 15 Roof Assembhm and Rooﬁop Structures, Section 1505.1

' General, Section 1505 Flre Class1ﬁcat10n Section 1505.8 Buddmg-

mtegrated photovoltaic prodt_lcts, Section 1505.9 Rooftop_ mounted .
photovoltaic panel s_ysteme, Secti‘dﬁ 1510.7.1 Fire classification, Sectioe
1-507.8. Weod Shirli_gl'es,_ Seeﬁon 15@7.9 Wood Shakes, and Section 1511.1
General. | -

(d) through (f) [No cliange in text.]

-PAGE 16 OF 66-




§145,0106

(®

© (0-2020-82)

Appendix o, Emérgency Housing Section 0103.2.1 Exception 1,.0103.6
nghtmg, Ventllahon and Heatmg, 0106 General, Sec’aon 0106 1.1

Tents and Section 0106 1.2 Membrane Structures.

Additions to the Californln Building Code Adopted by the City of Sati Diégo

The followmg Sectlons and Subsect10ns are added to the 2019 Callforma Btuldmg o

Code by the Clty of San Diego: -

)
®)

(©)

@

G

®

4

Chapter 4, Motor ‘Vehicle Occupanc1es, Sectlon 406 2.1.1.
Chapter 7A, Mateﬂals and »Constmction Methods for Exterior Wildfire
Exposure, Section 702A, Dcﬁnitjons, Section 703A.6.-1, Alternative

Materials, Designs or Methods, Section 703A.6.2, Modifications, Section

© 705A. 4 Roof Gutters, Section 705A4. 1 Dﬁp Edge‘Fla‘shihg, Section

708A 2 2.1, mel Wmdow Remforcmg, and Sectlon 711A.1 Spark
An&etors

Chapter 12, Sound Transission, Section 1206.05.

* Cltapter 15, Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures, Subsections
1505.1.5.and 1505.1.6, Sections 1507.1.3 and Subsections 1511,1 through

1511.1.5.

Chapter 16, Structural Design, Section 1607.2, Fire Trucks and

Emergency Vehicle Live Load and 1612.3, Flood Loads.

. Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspections, Section 1704.3.1

item 6,

Chapter 18, Soils and Foundaﬁons Section 1803 Geotechnical

.[nvestlgatlons, Subsectlons 1803 2 excepnons 2 through 4 Sectlons

i

- -PAGE 17 OF 66-




®)

®

0

§145.0107

(0-2020-82)

" 1803.2.1;1803.2.2, 1803.2.3, 1803.5.11.1, 1803.5.11.2, 1803.5.13,

1803.5.13. 1 1803.5.13.2 and Table 145. 1803

Chapter 32, Encroachments mto the Public Right-of- Way, Sectlon 3203
Entrance Canopies, Subsections -3203 1 through 3203.6.
Chapter 33, Safeguards Durmg Constructlon, Section 3303 8, Demohtmn

and Removal Regulatlons

Appendix O, Bmergéncy Housing, Subsection 0103.2.1 Exception 2,
. Subsections 0106.2 through 0106.7, Section O111 Emergency Housing
" Lighting and Ventilation Requirements, Subsections O111.1 and 0111.2,

Section 0112 Emergency Housiﬂg Fire and Life Safety Requirements,

Subsectlons 01121 through 0112.13, and Section 0113 Emergency

" Housing Altematlves and Modifications, Subsechon 0O113.1.

Adoptlon of Appendlces to the California Bullding Code

The followjxig App'er_ldix Chapters of the 2(_)19 Cahforma'BmIding Code are

(8)

adopted by the C1ty of San Diego:

Appendix chapters s])emﬁcally amended by a State agency listed i in

Section 145. 0103 and 1dent1ﬁed in the adoptlon matrices of the 201 9

- California Bmldmg Code.

(b) thrugh (e) [No change in text]

®

" Appendix O, Emergency Housing.

Section 9. 'I‘hat Cha.pter 14, Article 5, Division 2 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is

~ amended by amendlng sectlon 145. 0201 and repealing sectlon 145.0202, to read as follows:

-PAGE 18 OF 66-




§145.0201

(o-zbzo-si)

Local Modiﬂcatlons and Additions to Chapter 2 Definitions of the’ Californja

Bmlding Code
Chapter 2 of the Califomia Building Code is adopted"by referenco Wit_hout change

pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land Development Code.

Se'cti'on 10. That Chapter 14, Articlo 5, Division'4 of the San Diego Municipal Code is '

' amended by amendmg section 145, 0401 and adclmg new sectmn 145 0406 to read as follows N

§145.0401

§145.0406

.- Local Modlﬁcations and Addiﬂons to Chapter 4 “Special Detailed

Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy” of the Califomia Bluldmg

‘Code . r

Chapter 4 of the Cahfomm Bulldmg Code is adopted by refcrence with addltlons .

pursuant to Sectlon 145 0106 of the Land Development Code

- Local Modiﬁcations and Addntions to Secﬁon 406 “Motor Vehicle Related

Occupancies” . _ : , S
Section 406.2.1, “Automntic garage door openets and vehicular gates,” is adoptod _

with additions pursuant to Secﬁon 145.0106. Section 406. 2.1.1, “Backup Power -~

. for Automatic Garage Door Openers,” is added as follows: 406 2 11 Backup

Powcr for Automatxc Garage Door Openers. When private parkmg garages that -
serve an mdmdual dwellmg are equipped with automatlc garage door openers

the automattc garage door openers shall mclude battcry backup functions that are

" des1gned to operate in a manner so that the automatlc garage door openors are

operational without interruption' during an electrical outage.

* Section 11, Th_at Chapter 14, Atticle 5, Division 7:of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by repealing section 145.0702 and amiending section 145.0711, to read as follows:

-PAGE 19 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§145.0711 °  Local Additions to Section 711A “Additional Building Standards for |

‘Buildings Located in the Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity
Zone” of Chapter 7A of the California Bulldmg ‘Code '

. Section 711A. 1 is added as follows to Chapter 7A pursuant to Sectlon 145. 0106
~of the Land Development Code ‘ . .
.'7 11A.1 Spark arrester. All structures havmg any chmmey, flue, or stoveplpe shall
._ be equipped w1th an approved spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or stovepipe is
attached to any ﬁteplace, stove, barbecue, or'other_sollid or liquid fuel burning
_ equ1pment or devwe | o | |

Sectmn 12 That Chapter 14, Arhcle 5, Dmsmn 12 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is

amended by renumbermg and retltlmg secnon 145.1207 to sechon 145.1206 and addmg new

section 145 1207 to read as follows

L

: §145.12_06A Local dditions and Modiﬁcatlons _to Sectlon 1206 “Sound Transmlssion” of

the C 'fornia‘Bluldmg Code
Section 1206 of the Cahforma Buddmg Code is adopted w1th addmons
I_ a.nd modlﬁcatlons pursuant to Sectlons 145 0105 and 145 0106 of the-
.Land Development Code Section 1206 is modlﬁed by addmg Sectlon
- 1206.5.,

(b) . Section 1206.5. Additional Noise Regulations. For addiﬁonal noise
regulatwns hrmtmg the intrusion of exterior noise mto buﬂdmgs based on
land use standards see Chapter 13, Arncle 2, Dmsmn 15 of the Land

" Development Code. For additional noise l;egulatlons 'lnmtmg the intrusion
of exteﬁor noise into non;resident'lal l)llildings, see Section 5.507 of the

-California Green Building Standards Code.

-PAGE 20 OF 66-




§145.1207

' (0-2020-32) '

Local Addmons and Modiﬂcations to Section 1207 “Interlor Space
Dimensions” of the California Building Code

(a)

(®)

~ Section 1207.4 of the California Bmldmg Code is adopted with

modifications pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the Land Do%;élopment'

Co_del

. Section 1207.4 item 1 is modified as follows: 1. The dwelling unit shall

" . have a living roomof not less thah'l-SO squo.re feet. (13 93 mﬁ) of floor

area. An addmona] 100 square feet (9.3 m2) of ﬂoor area shal] be

‘ prov:ded for each occupant of the dwelhng unit in excess of two. .

| Sectlon 13 “That Chapter 14, Article 5, Dmsmn 15 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code is

amended by a.mend_mg sections 145.1_501, 145.1505, ond 145.1507, addmg pew section "

145.1510, and renumbering and retitling current section 1451510 to section 145.1511, to read as

- follows: "

§145.1501

Local Modiﬁcations and Adchtions to Chapter 15 “Roof Assemblies and -

(a)

®

-

Rooftop Structures” of the California Btuldmg Code

[No change in text. ]

. Sections 1501 through 1504 and Soctlons 1506, 1508, and 1509 are

adopted by reference thhout change pursuant to Section 145:0103 of thc '
Land Deve]opment Code o

Sections:ISOS.l,' 1505.8, 1505.9, 1507.1, 1507.8,-15.0'7.9,' and 1510.7.1,
and 1511 are adopted by reference with mooiﬁ_catio_ns and additions
pursuant t6 Sections 145._01 05 and 145.0106 of the Land De.ve_lopollent

Cods. '

"PAGE 21 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)_ |

§145.1505 Local Addltlons and Modifications to Sectlon 1505 “Fire Classiﬁcation” of
: : the ‘California Bulldlng Code _

(a) through (b) (No change in text.]
(c) . Section 1505 8 is modified pursuant to Section 145. 0105 of the Lmd :

. Development Code as follows: 1505.8 Bulldmg-mtegrated photovoltalc _
produets Buﬂdmg-mtegrated photovoltaw products installed as the roof
covermg shall be teSted 11sted and labeled for fire elass1ﬁcet10n in
accordance Wlth Section 145 1505(b) ) | | ‘

"l('d)" * Section 1505 9 is modified pursuant to Sectlon 145 0105 of the Land |
- Development Code as follows 1505 9 Rooﬁop mounted photovoltaue
"panel systems Rooﬁop rack—mounted photovoltmc panel systems shall be.
tested listed and 1dent1ﬁed witha fire elasmﬁcatlon in accordance v\>1th |
UL 1703 a.nd UL 2703 and Seetton 145. 1505(b)

- §145.1507 Local Additions and Modiﬁeatlons to Section 1507 “Requirements for Roof
- Coverings” of the California Bulldlng Code

(a). [No change in text 1

| (bj ~ Section 1507 1.3 s added as follows pursuant to Sectlon 145. 0106 ofthe' -
‘Land Development Code: 1507.1:3. Roof coverings shall be secured or . -
fastened to the supportmg roof eonstructlon | o

§145.1510  Local Ad(ht]ons and Modlﬁcatlons to Sectlon 1510 “Rooftop Structures” of
the Callfornla Buildlng Code - :

‘Seehon 1510.7. 1 is modtﬁed pursuant to Seetlon 145. 0105 of the Land
: Development Code as follows 1510. 7 1 Fire classxﬁcanon Rooftop-mounted
photovoltmc panels and modules sha.ll have a fire elassxﬁcataon in accordanee

with Section 145.1505.

-PAGE 22 OF 66-




§145.1511°

‘ (o-zozoasz)

Local Additions and Modlﬂcations to Section’ 1511 “Reroofing” of the

California Buildlng Code

(a)

o).

©

Section 1511.1 is modified pUreuent' to Section 145.0105 of the Land

Development Code as foIIOWS' 1511.1 General. Materials and methods of

'apphcatlon used for covering or replacmg an emstlng roof covermg shall

' comply with the requtrements of Chapter 15 of the Cahforma Bmldmg

Code as adopted and amended by the City of San Dlego

'Sectlons 1511 1.1 through 1511.1 2a are addedpursuant to Section

145, 0106 of the Land Development Code
) 1511 1.1. All replacements alteratlons, or repairs shall bea Class

“A” roof assembly

@) _ 1511 1 2, The entlre roof shall be a Class “A” roof assernbly where

: more than twenty-ﬁve percent of the total roof area is replaced
-altered or repmred within atty twelve-month penod

Sectlons 1511. 1.3 through 1511 1.5 axeaddedpursuantto Section

_ 145 0106 of the Land Development Code

(1) 1511.1.3. Wood shakes and shingles are prohibited throughout the

roof vvhere more than twenty-ﬁve percent of the total roof area is

replaced, altered- or repmred within any twelve- month period. .
(2) 151 l.'1.4. Wood shakesand shingles are not permitted, except as -

provl_ded in California Historical Building Code Section 8-408 and -

Land Development Code Section 145.1511(c)(1).

| (3) 1511.1.5.No roof covering shall be applie’d over any existing

wood shakes or wood shingles.

_.PAGE 23 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

Section 14. That Chapter 14, Artile'S, Division 18 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amendmg section 145 1803, to read as follows:

§145.1803 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 “Geotechmcal
Investigations” of the Californja Bulldjng Code '

(a) through (e) [No change in text 1

) -

The Geolog1c Hazard Category and the Bmldmg, Structure and Facrhty
Class must be determmed as follows when using Table 145 1803t0

determiine whether a geotechmcal 1nvest1gatron report is requlred due to

| . local geologlcal hazards w1thm the Clty of San Dlego
' (1) ' [No change in text. ]

(2) Citystaff shall assign one of four Buildiné, Structure and Facility

classes to each builtliné, structure, of fecility ba'sed on their use, - |
) type of oeeupancy, number of occupants and whether hazardous -_
materlals are bemg used or stored in the butldmg, structure, or . )
facility to detenmne whether a Geotechmcal Investigation Report
s requlred. | .
(A) [No cho.nge in t-ext..].
®) ClassB includes the folldwing deve_lopnterrm; oecuponc'y_ _
_gtohps,‘and- structures proyided they are not iucluded m '
Class A: a |
@) All new ‘structures requiring deepl foundaﬁons, such
as prers or pilings. .

(i)  All structures over three stories in height. .

" .PAGE 24 OF 66-




(iif)

 (0-2020-82)

All structures cor_ztainir{g_'thé following occupancies

.pursuant to the California Buildihg Code, |

. Chapter 3:

8. GroupA,Divisions 1,2,3 and 4;

b.  Group B, buildings and ofher structures
containing élerfwnt.ary_ schc;ol,_ secondary
scﬁc;ol or day care facilities v;'ith an

' oé:égpant .lo‘a('i greater than 250; .

c. . - Group H, Divisions 1,2, and 3; and -

4 Groupl, Divisions2and3,

({v).

™)

‘Al stryctures with an occupant load of more than
300 occupants as determined by Table 1004.1.2 of

 the California Building Code and structures used for

public assembly assigned to Risk Category Illin
Table 1604.5 of the California Building Code,

Tanks, bins, hoppers, si.losg and other storage -

" structures with more than 20,000-gallon capacity

o)

. structures over 35 feet high,

(vii)

inténded to store toxic, hazal‘ddus, or flammable
contents that are not associated with a building,
structure, or facility in Class A. |

Tanks, bins, hoppers, silos, and other storage

Towers over 35 feet high.

"_PAGE 25 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

(vm) Retairiing walls over the heights hsted in the '
: followmg Subsectlons a. and b. w1th the hei ght
measured from the top of the footmg to the top of
the wall - v
2 Retalmng walls over 12 feet in helght and
b. . Retammg walls over 8 feet in helght
suppomng a surcha;ge or ;etammg toxic,
hazardous, or ﬂamn}eﬁle contents. . - |
(C) through (D) No change in text ] |

(g) [No change in text ]

Table 145.1803(1)
Required Geotechnlcal Investigatlon
Type of Hazard | L Hazard Category '. ~Bu~ﬂdi1,1g, Structure, -.
: E : ' and Facility Class,
Fault Zones/Ground " o | .
Rupture . 1,12,13 A,B,C,D
- : 21,22 - . A,B,C,D
Landslides/Potential - '
Slope Instability '
X ' 23, 24, 25, 26, 27 - ~ AB,C
.Liquefection/Potential S : e "
Ground Failure - ' 31,32 . ABCD
o 41,42,43 ° - A,B,C,D
Constal Bluff Stability : —
44,45,46,47,48 ' . AB"

_PAGE 26 OF 66-




{(0-2020-82)

54, - © A,B,C.
_ All Other Terrain 52,55 - 1 AB
51,55 A
Footnotes [I\fo change in text]

Section 15. That Chapter 14 Artlcle 5, Division 31 of the San Dlego Mumclpa] Code is |
ended by amendmg sectton 145 3101 and repealmg sectxon 145 3109, to read as follows 2

‘ §145.3101 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 31 “Special Constructmn” of
: the California Buildlng Code - ' : .

Chapter 31 of the California Bmldmg Code is adopted by reference w1thout
change pursuant to Sectlon 145 0103 of the Land Development Code -
B Sectxon 16 That Chapter 14, Article 5 D1v1310n 32 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is
amended by amendmg section 145. 3203 to read as follows

§145.3203  Local Additions to Chapter 32 “Encroachments Into The Public Right—of-
. way”

_'Section 3203 “Entrance Canopies” is added pursuant to Seetion 145.0106 of the :
Land Development t:odet ‘ . |
(2) through (b) [No change intext] .
(c) 3203.3. 'Constrnction. Entranee eanopy framés and supporting stz'nettlral
| nlembers shall be constructed of oorroslon;resistant met'al. deaigned and .
eonstruoﬁ to withstand wind or other lateral loads and live', loads as
requited -l)y Chapt_er 16 of the California Building Code. Entrance -

.' canopies shall also meet all of the following requirements:

-PAGE 27 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

) Canopies shall be oovered with an approv.e'd covering that
| ‘ comphes with Section 3105 3of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code
2) through (4) [No change in text. ]
(d) through ® [No chauge in'text.]
Section 17. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Dmsmn 33 of the San Diego Mumcnpal Code is
amended by amendmg sections 145, 3301 and 145.3303, to read ns follows:

§145.3301 Local Mod;ﬁcatlons and Additlons to Chapter 33 “Safeguards Durmg
: Construction” of the Califorma Building Code :

@ [No change in text] ‘
. ® Sections 3301 through 3302 and 3304 throogh 3314 aro.adop.ted by
roferenco without change pprouant to Section 145.0103 of the Land
Dehelopnienf Cod'e' N | |

§145.3303  Local Modlﬂcations and Additions to Section 3303 “Demohtion” of the
B Cahfornia Building Code S .

Sectlon 330’7 8 is added pursuant to Sectlon 145.0106 of the Land Developmcnt
Code 3307 8 Adchtlonal Demohtlon Regulatlons The followmg regulatlons
' apply to the demolmon ofa Structure ot bulld.mg, in wholo orin pa.rt or the
* removal o_f a structure from a site: |
(a) through (j) [No change in text.] _
. Section-18: That Chapter 14, Arhcle 5, Dmsmn 38 of the San Dxego Municipal Code is
‘amended by tefitling Division 38 and amendmg and retitling sectlons 145 3801 145. 3802

145.3803, 145.3804, 145.3805, and 145‘.3806, to read as follows:

" PAGE 28 OF 66-




§145.3801

§145.3802

(0:202082) |

Division 38: Addltions and Modifications to Appendix 0 of the
. California Building Code .

Local Modlfications and Additions to Appendix O “Emergency Housing” of
the California Building Code i

()

)

©

@

' Appendix O of the California- Building Code is adopted by reference with

modifications and additions pursuant to SectionstéS.OlOS and 145.0106

of the Land Development Code.

[No change in text.]

The regulations in th.lS Division and in Appendix 0 shall be apphcable to
emergency housmg established pursuant to. the declaratxon of a shelter
crisis under C&hforma Government Code Sectlon 8698.4 and located in
new or ex1st1ng buildings o structures owned, operated, or constructed by, 3

for or on behalf of, the City.

The regulatlons in t}ns D1v181on and in- Appendlx 0 shall apply to

emergency housmg operated during a declaratlon of a shelter crisis. Other
than the requn'ements in Appeéndix ( 0 as‘adopted w1th modJﬁcatlons and
addltrons by this Division, the emergency housmg need not comply with .

the requlrements of the Callforma Bmldmg Code for Group R

occupancles

Local Modlﬁcations and Addltlons to Section 0103 “Emergency Housing” of
the Cahfornia Building Code :

()

)

Sectlon 0103 is adopted with modlﬁcanons and adchtrons pursuant to

-Sectrons 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

The existing excepnon in Seetlon 0103 2.11s numbered as Excepnon 1.

- Exception 2 is added to Secnon 0103.2. L as follows:

. -PAGE 29 OF 66-




 §145.3803

©

(@)

®). -

“the Buil&ing Ofﬁciel'. When required, 'ligl_a.ting end ventiletien shall

(0-2020-82)

2. Change in occupancy shall not mandate conform'ance with new
construction requlrements set forth i in the Cahforma Bulldmg Standards

Code, prov1ded such change in occupancy meets-the minimum fire and life

.safety requirements set forth in S_ectlon 145.3805 of the Land
: D,e\'relopment Code. :

, 'Sectmn 0103.6 Heatmg is modified as follows:

01 03.6 nghtmg, Venulatlon and Heatmg All sleepmg areas shall be

_ pro_vided with adequate lighting, ventilation, and heating as determined by -

comply with Section 145 3804

Local Modifications and Addltions to Section 0106 “Tents and Membrane .
Structures” of the California Bmlding Code :

Sectlon 0106 is adopted with modlficatlons and additions pursuant to
Sectlons 145. 0105 and 145. 0106 of the Land Development Code, |
Sectlon 0106.1 General is modlﬁed as follows ‘
(1) Section 01_06_.1 .1 Tents is modlﬁed as fo%lows:_
0_i06;1 ;1 ’fen'ﬁs. Tents shal'l..r—lot be use_d to house occupaute for
more than 7 coeSecutiv_e days unless sech tents are mmntamed with -
| tight wooden ﬂeors raised at least 4 inches (10i.6 mm) above the
' ground level and are equipped with baseboards on al] stdes toa
height of at least 6 inches (152. 4 mm). Tents may be rnamtamed
with concrete slabs with the finished surface at least 4 inches
(101.6 mm) above grade end equiilped. with curbs on all sides at.
least 6 inches (152.4 mm) high. A tent shall not be considered a
suitable sleeping piace when it is.found necessary to provide

-PAGE 30 OF 66-




©

@

(0-2020-82)

heating facilities in order to maintain a minimum temperature of 50

. degree's _Fahrenheit (10 degrees .Cellsius) within such tent during the

period of occupancy

Section 0106.1.2 Mernbrane Structm'es i3 added with modiﬁcation
as follows:

0106.1.2 Membrane Structures Membrane structures installed
and/or assembled in accordance with Chapter 31 of the Cahforma

Building Code and the Caltforma Fu'e Code may be penmtted to -

' .be used as emergency housmg and emergency housmg faciiities , ‘

Sectlon 0106 2 Membrane Structures In Use for More than 180 Days is -

added as follows

0106 2 Membrane Stmctures In Use for More Than 180 Days. Membrane

' structures in use for 2 penod of more than 180 calendar days shall comply

with the Cahforrua Fire Code and with the followmg

)

.The membrane stmcture shall be mspected bya Cahforma

) reglslered design professional at least once every 180 calendaij

days from the date of final _inSp_ection to ensure that the membrane
sn-ucmre continues to perform as designed and initially erected.

The registered design profes_sional shall certify in writing that the

. membrane structure conitinues to be in compliance with the
_ :apﬁlicable_regulations_ of the California Fire Code and California |
Btii_lding’ Code.in effect on the d-ale of final inspection. Inspection

. records shall be kept and'shall be made available for veriﬁcation _

by the Fire Code Official and the Building Official,

-PAGE 31 OF 66-




@

(e) .

o

&

(0-2020-82)

@ No. change in text. ]

Section 0106.3 Means of Egrees is added as follows:

0106.3 Means of Egress. Means ofe egress for membrane structures used

as emergency housmg shall be deterrmned b_as_ed on the oocupant Joad
pecrﬁed in Sectron 0103 3. | |
Section 0106 4 Storage of Flarnmable Matenals Within Terits or ._
Membrane Structures is added as follows:

0106 4 Storage of Flammable Matenals Wrtbm Tents or. Mernbrane
Structures Flammable rnatenals mcludtng the possessrons of ocwpa.nts

and users stored in tents and membrane structures shall not obstruct

' requrred alsle wrdths between beds or other fumlstungs The ¢ quantrty of °
' stored ﬂammable materials wrthm a mernbrane structure not protected ‘
w1th an automatrc ﬁre spnnkier system, or w1t1rm tents, shall be subj ect to
| the approval of the Frre Code Ofﬁcxal | | .

:Sectlon 0106 5 Flammable or Combustrble quurds is added as follows

01 06 5 Flarnmable or Combustrble Liguids. The possessron or storage of

' any ﬂammable or combust:ble 11qu1ds or gases shall not be perrmtted '
inside a tent or membrane structure except for.intact ctgarette.hghters. The

. use of any type of open flamé inside a tent or mer_nbrane structure is

prohibited unless each separate use is approt/ed by the Fire Code Otﬁcial;
Section dl 06.6 Rire Department Access is added as follows:

0106.6 Fire Ijepartrnent Access. Fire Department access to tents or-

T membrane structures used for emergency bousing shall be in compliance '

~ .PAGE 32 OF 66-




§145.3804

()

(0-2020-82)

with Sectmn 503, Section 504 and Appendix D of the California Fire
Code and approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 0106.7 Water Supply is added as follows:

' 0106.7 Water Supply. An aporoved fire protection water supply

' complying with Section 507 of the California Fire Code, or ae approved

by the Fire Code Ofﬁcml shall be prov1ded for each tent or membrane

structure group of structures or premzses used for emergency housmg

Local Addition of Section O111 “Emergency Housing nghtmg and

(8)

()

(©)

‘Ventilation Requirements” to the Calii]ornia Buildjng Code

Section 01 11 Emergency Housmg nghtmg and Ventllatlon Reqmrements

is added pursuant to Sectlon 145 0106 of the Land Development Code, -

Section O1 1 1.1 Bmergency Housmg L1ghtmg Requlrements is added as -
- ' I : ' N R .

follows; -

O111.1 Emergency Housing L‘ighﬁng Requirements. Buildings or

- structures used for emergency housmg shall either be prowded with

b

" natural hght by means of extenor g]azed opemngs in accordance w1th

Sectlon 1205.2 of the Cahfomm Buﬂdmg Code or shall be prowded with
arhﬁcla.l light in accordance with Sectlon 1205 3 of the Cahforma
Building Code ‘ i
Section O111.2 Ventilation is added as follows:
0l111.2 V.entilation. Buﬁdings or e:tructures' used for emergency housmg
shall either be provided with natural vmﬁlaﬁon in accordance with |
Sec_tion 1203.5 of the California Building Code or mechanical ventilation
in accordance with the California Mechanical Code. |
:
-PAGE 33 OF 66-

|
I




| §145.3805

(0-2020-82)

Local Addition of Section 0112 “Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety
Requirements” to the California Building Code

(a)

®

: ©

(d)

Section o112 Emergency Housmg Fire and Llfe Safety Requlrements is -

added pursuant to Sectlon 145.0106 of the Land Development Code. -

A -Sectlon O112.1 Fire Separatlon Dlstance is added as follows v

01 12 1 Fire Separatlon Dlstance Bmldmgs or structures used for

emergency housmg, mcludmg sleepmg cabms shall e constructed and .

ilocated ona lot in comphance with the regulatlons in Chapters 6 a.nd 7 of

the Callforma Bulldmg Code, based oi their ﬁre separahon dlstance

Dunng a declared shelter crisis, the fire separatlon dlstances are permrtted '

to be measured to the exi stmg bmldmgs on the adj acent parcels rather than i

to the interior lot lmes, prowded the open spaces ' within the ﬁre separatlon

distance rernam clear and enobstructed for the duratlo_n of the declared’ -

" ghelter crisis.

Section O112:2 Fire Separation Distance, Buildings on the Same Lot is

. added as follows:

, 01 12. 2 Fire Separatlon Distance, Buﬂdmgs on the Same Lot, Buﬂdmgs or

structures used for emergency housmg, mcludmg sleepmg cabms shall be.

: _separated ﬁ'om each other and from other hmldmgs on the same lot as sset

forth in Sectlon 705 3 of the Caleorma Bulldmg Code.
Sectlon O112. 3 Means of Egress is added as follows
0112.3 Means of egress Buﬂdmgs or. structures used for emergency

housmg shall be provided with means of egress in compllance w1th

- Chapter 10 of the California Building Code.

-PAGE 34 OF 66-




@)

®

(g)

)

(0-2020-82)

Section O112.4 Emergency Escape .arid Rescue is added as follows:

0112.4 Emergency Escape and Réscu_'e. Each area of a building or

structure used for sleeping accommodations in emergency housing shall

contain an emergency escape and rescue opening in accordance with’

. Section 1030 of the California Building Code. .

Seation 0112.5 Smoke Alarms is added as follows: -
0112.5 Smoke Alarms. Buildings or structures with sleepmg

accommodatlons used for emergency housmg shalt be equ1pped with

. single statlon staoke a.la.rms mstalled in accordance with the reqmrements :
' of Section 907 2.11 and Sechon 1103 8 3 of the California F1re Code
. Secnon.Ol 12.6 Carbon Mono;ude Alarms is added as follows: |
) 61 12.6 Carbon Monoxide Alarms Bmldmgs or structuree with sie’eping ‘
aocoinmodetiqns used for emergency houejng end. equi.pped with fuei—

Abuniing upp]iances shall be provided with carbon mionoxide detection in

aocordance w1th Secuon 915 of the California Fire Code and fhe
Cahfomla Building Code

Sechon 0112.7 Ftre A]arm is added as follows:

) 01 12.7 Fire Alarm A manual ﬁre alarm System oapable of arousmg

sleeping occupants desxgned and constructed f in compllance with Sectmn A

907.2.10.1 of the Cahforma Fire Code and the Cahforma Bulldmg Code
shall be installed in bulldmgs, structures, or groups of bulldmgs or
structures, used for emergency housmg and havmg a gross ﬂoor area of

more than 2,500 square feet or havmg the capaclty for more than 49

_ sleeping occupants.

-PAGE 35 OF 66-




RO

0}

@

(0-2020-82)

-Exception; lndividuai buildings or structutes in a‘group of .
bdildinge or structures witl'i sut‘ﬁcierd sepatation diétaneee to allow
. | each building or structure to function mdependently in case of a-
ﬁrc shall have their own 1nd1v1dual fire alarm systems as approved
-_by the Fire Code Official,

Sectlon 0112.8 Automahc Fire Sprmklers is added as follows

0112.8 Automatlc Fire Spnnklers Fire spnnklers shall be prowded for
. new and emstmg buildings or structures used for emergency housmg that

- 'prov1de sleepmg accomrnodatlons as requlred by Sectlon 903 3 of the :

California Fire Code and the California Bmldmg Code. '

_Section o1'12 9 Fire Extinguisliers is added as follows:
- 01 12 9 Flre Extmgu;shers Portable ﬁre extmgmshers shall be prov1ded in

_ accorda.nee w1th Sectxon 906 1 of the Cahforma Fxre Code and the o

California Bulldmg Code.

Sect:lon 0112 10 Flammable or Combustible quulds is added as follows: .

-0112.10 Flammable or Combustible qumds The possess1on or storage of

any ﬂammable or combustible llqmds or gases shall not be permltted
except for mtact c1garette hghters The use of any type of open ﬂame

indoors is pro_hlblted unless eaeh separate use is appraved I_Jy the Fxre_

Code Ofﬁcial'

-Sectlon 0112.11 Storage is added as foﬂows

o1 12 11 Storage Flammable matenals, 1nc1udmg the possessmns of

qccupants, users, and staff, _shall not obstruct required aisle widths

_ between beds or other‘ﬁJ.t"n_ishings and shall not be stored in attlcs, under-

-PAGE 36 OF 66-




§145.3806

(@)

(0-2020-82)

floor spaces, or within other concesled spaces of buildings or structures -

“with sleeping accomrnodations used for emergency housing.

Section O112.12 Firo beparnnen't Access is added as follows:
01 12 12 Fire. Department Access Fire Department acoess to bmldmgs and .
premzses used for emergency housmg shall be in comphance w1th

Sectron 503, Se'ctmn 504, and Appendxx D of the Cahforma Fire Code,

~ and approved by the Fire Code Ofﬁclal

(@)

- Section 01 12.13 Water Supply is added as foIlows

0112.13 Water S_upply. An approved fire protection water supply
complying with §ection 507 of the California Fire.Code, or as appmued -
by the Fire Code Official, shall be provrded for each- building or structyre, .

group of structures or premzse.s' used for emergency housmg

Local Addlﬁon of Section Ol 13 “Emergency Housing Alternatlves and ’

©

Modifications” to the Califomia Building Code

“(a)

Section 01 13 Emergency Housmg Alternatlves and Modlﬁcatlons is

" added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code

Sectxon 01 13 1 Altematlves and Modlﬁcatlons is added as follows )

Y 13.1 Altematwes and Modrﬁcatlons Alternatlves and!or modrﬁeatrons

.that are reasonably equlvalent to the reqmrements in Appendlx 0 and thrs

Dmsron may be granted by the Bmldmg Oﬂiclal and Fu'e Coc[e Oﬁicral

for individual bmldmgs or structures used for emergency housmg

‘Section 19, That Chapter 14, Article 5, Dlvrs1on 39 of the San Diego MUIIIClpal Code is -

amended by amendmg section 145.3905 and_emendrng and retitling sectm_n 145.3910, to read as

follows:.

-PAGE 37 OF 66-°




§145.3905

. §145.3910

Except as othérwise prdvided for the purposeé of this Division:

Autorrtated Extemal Deﬁbrzllator or-AED [No change in text ]

change of oc_cupancy shall not be pons1dered an alteration for purp_oses of this

Deﬁnitions

. Alteration means a tenant merovement or renovatlon to an existing bmldmg A

Dmsmn

@

(b)

©

New Construction and Alterations Requiring AEDs

{No change in text.] .

Pnor to approval of ﬁnal mspectmn AEDs shall be placed in all existing |
buildings nndergmng glterq{ton when the any of the follow_mg apply: | . -;
M
Co January 1, 2017;.
L@

G)

" (0-2020-82)

The building undergoing alteration was constructed prior to

The accumulated value of the altgraffons within the building within

one calendar year is $100,000 or more; or

The alterations dre within a public assembly occupancy use,

| including auditoriums and performing arts and movie théaters.

The reqmrements in Sectlon 145. 3910(b) shall not apply to the followmg

(1

2

A general acute care hospital, acute psychlatnc hospital, skilled -
nursing facility or speclal hospital licensed under Section 1250(a),
(b), (c), or (t) of the California Health and Safety Code, and’

An exxstlng AED that is located within a common area of the
bmldmg descnbed in subdlwsmn (b) such as the main entry 1ohby

or similar location.

_PAGE 38 OF 66-



(0-2020-82) -:

d AEDS shall be conspicucusly placed and readily accessible in the event of
an emergency. AEDs shall be mounted such that the top of the AED isno

more than five (5) feet above ﬂoor level B

Table 145-3910
Occupancy Group Occupant Load
Group A “Assembly” ) 300 ..
- Group B “Business” f. 200
.. Group E “Educational” ) 200
Group F.“Factory” | 200
Group I “Institutional” | =~ = 200
Group M “Mercantile” ' 200
" Group R “Residential™! - |- . 200

1 No eh:mge n toxt] |
Sectmn 20. lThat Chapter 14 Artlcle 5, Division 40 of the San Diego Mummpal Code is
' amended by amendmg section 145.4005, to read as follows
§145 4005 E Tier II-Vlsitable Unlt Desngn Standards_
" (a) through (d) [No change in text.] |
()  Atleast one interior acoeesible route of trev.el shall be provided in
o c-ompl.iance with California Building Code Section 1119A as may be
amended The interior route of travel shall connect an accessible entrancc
_ to the following rooms located on the I;rimory entt;y level: |
(1) through (3) [No change in text.]
© (§through G) [No chengeintext] |
Section 21. That Chapter 14; Article 6, Division 1 of the San oie'go Mom'cipal Code is
amended by amendmg sectlons 146. 0103 146.0104, 146.0105, 146 0106 and 146 0107 toread . - _-

as follows

 -PAGE 39 OF 66-




'§146.0103

§146.0104

§146.0105

(0-2020-82)

Interpretation of the Electrical Regulations

(8)

- (b)

The language used in this Asticle anci in the 2019 Califorsiia Electrical

- Code whlch is made a part of this Article by reference, is mtended to

convey the oommon and accepted meamng famlhar to the electrical
mdusﬁy. _ -

[No change in text.]

Adoptlon of the Californla Electrical Code -

@

®)

© .
Portions of the Californis Electrical Code Not Adopted

The 2019 California Electncal Code publlshed by the Callforma Bulldmg

S_tandards Con1_1mss1on (BSC), as amended by the Cahf_orn;a Department

“of HoiJsing and Community Development (HCD); thé Division of the

State Arclutect-Access Compha.nce (DSA/AC) the State Office of

: Statew;de Planmng and Development (OSHPDS), and the State Fire -

Marshal (SFM), is adopted by referénce and made a part of this Article as .

if fully set forth, exccpt 88 othemnse prowded in thls Artlcle The

-regulations referenced are the.standard for clequcal 1qstallat10ns regul&ted _

by this Atticle. A copy of the 2019 California Electrical Code is on file in -

the'-bfﬁcé of the City Clerk as Document No. 00-__ 2 1 18 1 ’.

When reference is made to the Cahforma Electrical Code, it shall be the
2019 California Elecmcaj Code, Cahforma Code of Regulatlons Title 24
Pgrt 3, as published by the Callfomla Buﬂmng Standards Commission. -

[No change in text.]

. The follo{w?ing Sections or Subsections of the 2019 California Electrical Coﬂe are’

~ not adopted by the City of San Diego:

-PAGE 40 OF 66-




(a)

('b)'

. (0-2020-82) -

Artlele 230, Servrcea Section 230 A3, Wmng Methods for 1000 Volts,

. Normnal or Less numbers (l) “Open Wmng on Insulators and )}

“Servrce-entranee Cables” are 'no_t adopted.

[No ehange in text.] SN

§146.{]106 Portions of the Cahforma Electrlcal Code Adopted With Modlﬁcations

The following Sectlons of the 201 9 Callforma Eleemcal Code are adopted by the .

Crty of San Dlego with modlﬁcatlons

The 2019 Cahforma Electneal Code is adopted without modxﬁcatrons

§146.0107 Portions of the Callfornia Electrical Code Adopted With Additions

" The followmg Sectlons of the 2019 Cahforma Electrical Code are adopted by the

-Clty of San D1ego ‘with addltlons

: The 2019 Cahforma Eleetncal Code is adopted w1thout addmons

Sectlon 22 That Chapter 14, Artlcle 6, Dmswn 2 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code 1s

a.mended by repealmg sectlons 146 0208 and 146.0209.

Sectlon 23. That Chapter 14, Artlcle 7, Dmsxon 1 of the San Diego Mumc1pa] Code is .

amended by amendmg sectlons 147.0103, 147. 0104 147, 0105 and 147. 0106 to read as follows

§147.0103  Adoption of the California Plumblng Code

@

Except as prowded in Sectlons 147. 0104 through 147. 0108 the 2019

‘ Cahforma Plumbmg Code, pubhshed by the Cahforma Bulldmg-Standards -

Commlssmn (BSC), and as amended by the Cahforma Department of

Housing and Commumty Development (HCD), the Dmswn of the State
Archltect-Access Comphanoe (DSA/AC); the State Ofﬁee of Statew1de

Health Planmng and Development (OSHPD3), and the State Fire Marshal

-PAGE 41 OF 66-




§147.0104

. §147.0105 "

§147.0106

(0-2020-82)

* (SFM); & copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

Docm_'neﬁt'CO- 2 1 1 8 1 _, is adopted by reference
{(b) When reference is made to the Ca]lforma Plumblng Code, 1t shall be the
2019 Cahforma Plumbmg Code, Ca.hforma Code of Regu]atlons Title 24,

" Part5as pubhshed by the California Bmldmg Standards Comrmssnon

) (C), [Ne change in text.]

Modlﬁcaﬁons to the California Plumbing Code Adopted by the Cuty of San
Diego .

The following Seetioris of the 2019 California Plumibing codé. aie fnodified bythe |
| "Clty of San Dlego _ o - |

(@ - Chapterd, Plumbmg Fixtures dnd Fitings, Section 42221 1 Single User o

- 'To1let Fac1hty Identlﬁcatlon

(b) Chapter 11, Storm Dramage Sectlon 1101 .2. Where Requlred Sectlon '

| ~1101 6.1 Dlscharge

Addiﬁons to the Californja Plumbmg Code Adopted by the City of San Diego -
- The following Seetlens or Subsections of the 2019 California Elumbmg Code are

* added by the .City of San Diego: |

(a) [No. change in te:{t.]

(). Ceepter 12, Section1208.8.2.1 Gas:Pressure Reg_uletoxjs, Location.

Adoption of Appendices to Californie Plumbhig Code |

_ The followmg Appendlx Chapters of the 2019 California Plumbmg Code not

adopted by a State agency as 1dent1ﬁed in Land Development Code Section

147. 0103 and in the adoptlon matnces of the 2019 Cahforma Plumbmg Code are

'not adopted by the Clty of San Dlego .

(1) through (7) [No change in text.]

- -PAGE 42 OF 66--




@)

(0-2020-82)

Appendix M ~Peak Water Demand Calculator

Section 24, That Chapter 14, Article 7, D1v131on 2 of the San Diego Mumclpa.l Code is

amended by adding new sectlon 147 0203 renumbenng section 147. 0213 to sectlon 147, 0211

and amendmg and retltlmg section 147 0212, to read as follows

§147.0203 Local Modifications to Sectwn 422.2 “Separate Faclhtles” of the .
: Californla Plumbing Code

'-(a)|

L)

Sectlon 422, 2 of the California Plumbmg Code is adopted w1th

‘modlﬁcatlon_s pursuant to Sectlon 147.0104 of the Land Development .
 Code. o

.Sect_ion 422.2.1 of the California P;qmbmg Code is niodiﬁeq as follows:
‘ 4?2.2:1 S..in.gle-ilser Toilet Facilities‘ldeoﬁﬁcation. F amily. or assisted use

toilet facilities shall be identiﬁegi with signage indicating use by either sex.

All single-user toilet facilifies in any business establishment, place of

. .public accommodation, or state or local government e"gency shall be .

 identified as all-gender toilet facilities by signage that comiplies with

Section 11B-703.7.2.6 of the California Building Code and designated for

use by no more than one occupant at a time or for family or assisted use.

" Forthe fJUIposeé of Section 422.2.1, “single-'user toilet facility” means a

toilet facility with no more than one water closet and one urinal with a

locking mechanism 'controlled by the user.

§147.0211  Local Modifications and Additions to Section 1101 “General” Storm
Drainage Regulatlons of the California Plumbing Code

(a) through (c) [No change in text. ]

PAGE 43 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

' §147.0212  Loocal additions to Section 1208.8 “Gas Pressure Regulators” of the
' .Callfornia Plumblng Code

Section 1208. 8.2.1 of the Callforma Plumbmg Code is added as follows
' 1208.8:2.1.‘Approved gas pressure regulators shall be 1nstalled and used in A
lo'cations approﬁed l:ly the Building Ol’ﬁeiel . | | a
Secnon 25. That Chapter 14 Artlcle 7, D1v131on 4 of the San D1ego Mummpal Code is | N
amended by ret1tlmg and amendmg section 147.0405, to read as follows :

§147.0405 , Retrofit upon Alteration

“When a responsxble persan proposes to replace plum‘omg fixtures, the respons;ble
person shall replace plumbm g ﬁxtures with water-conservmg plumbmg ﬁxtures
complymg w1th the prevailing edltlon of the Cahforma Plumbing Code and
'Sectlons 147 0304 and 147.0305 of the Addmonal Plumbmg Regulatlons for i
Water and Energy Conservanon . - '
Secnon 26. That Chapter 14 Arncle 8, Division 1 of the San Dlego Mumcnpa.l Code is
amended by nm_endmg sectlons 148.0103, 148.0104, 148'.01(_}5,‘ 148.0106, and 148.01Q7, to read
a8 follows | | | | |

§148 0103 Adoptlon of the Cahfornla Mechanical Code
- (&) . Except as prowded in Land Development Code Sectlon 148 0104, the

- 2019 Callforma Mechanical Code published by.the Cahforma Bulldmg .
Standards Comnnsswn (BSO); and as amended by the Cahforma
Department of Housmg and Commumty Development (HCD), the

- Division of the State Arcthect-Access Comphance (DSA/AC), the State
Office of Statew1de Health Plannmg and Development (OSHPD3); and |

.the State Fire Marshal (SFM); a copy of w_hleh is on ﬁle.ln the office of

-PAGE 44 OF 66-




§148.0104
§148.0105
§148.0106

. §148.0107

(0-2020-82)

“the City Clerk as Docume;lt No. 0_0- 2 1 1 8 1 ., is adopted by

reference.

' (b): When reference is mede to‘the California Mechanical Code, it shall be the '

- ; . . . . B .
2019 California Mechanical Code, California Code of Regulatioﬁ_s Title

24, Part 4 ag published by the California Building Standards Commission.

(c) - [No change in text.]

“Portions of the California Mechanical Code Not Adopted

" The followipg.po'rtions,_of the 2019 ,Ca]ifomia Mechanical Code are not adopted: .

Chepter 1 - Division II, Administration, -

Modlfications to the Cahforma Meehanical Code Adopted by the City of San
Diego : .

The 2019 Califoﬁﬁa Mechanical Code is adopted with no modiﬁcations :

Additions to the California Mechanical Code Adopted by the Clty of San
Diego- .

" The 2019 Cahforma Mechanical Code is adopted thh no additions.

Adoption of Appendices to Califorma Mechanical Code:

’ Appendlx Chapters of the 2019 Cahforma Mechanical Code are not- a.dopted

. Section 27 'I'hat Chapter 14, Amcle 9, Dlvzsxon 1 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is

amended by amendmg sectlons 149. 0103 149.0104, 149.0105, 149 0406, 149.0107, and

149, 0108 to read as follows

§149.0103

Adoptmn of the Cahforma Residéntial Code

' (8)-  The 2019 California Residential Code, pubhshed by the Callforma

Bmldmg Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by the State
.Department of Housmg and Commumty Development (HCD 1, HCD

llAC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference except

-PAGE 45 OF 66-




§149.0104

®)

©

@

' Arhcle is cross referenced to Secttons in the 2019 Callforma Resndentlal

©

'(f)'

' (0-2020-82)

as 0therwtse provided in th_is Atticle of the Land Development Code,

Divisions 2 through 45. A copy of the 2019 California Residential Codeis

on ﬁ]e in the office of the Cll'y Clerk as Document No 00- 2 ] I 8 |

When reference is made to the Caltforma Res1dent1al Oode, it shall be the

- 2019 Cahfomm Remdentlal‘Code, California Code of Regulatlons Title

' 24, Part 2.5, as published by the Califoria Building Standards ~

Cornmission

.Each of the regulations pr0v1s1ons, condmons and terms of the 201 9

' Cahforma Re51dentlal Code is made a part of this Article as if fully set

fotth in thxs Artlcle except as othermse prov1ded in D1v151ons 2 through "

45.

.Numbenng of Sectlons and Subsectlons in Dmsmns 2 through 45 of this

Code

The adoptlon of the 2019 Caltforma Remdcntlal Code shall in no way -

. limit, proh1b1t, impede, or prevent the City Council from adoptmg

ordinances hrmtmg or preventmg the issuance of any type, number or

~ geographical distribution qf permits for construction ot demolition of any '

facility for which a pefmit is required.

fNo change in text ]

Portions of the Cahfomia Resldential Code Not Adopted by the City of San
Diego - S _ :

The following Sections or Subsectione of the 2019 California Residential Code -

: have not been adopted by the City of San Dlego

(8) through (b) [No ehange in text. ]

-PAGE 46 OF 66-




. §149.0105

'§149.0106

(0-2020;82) -

~ Modifications to the Cahforma Residential Code Adopted by the Cnty of San

Diego
The following Sections o Subééctions of the 2019 California Residential _Code )

' are modified by the Clty of San Diego:

(a) Chapter 3, Sectlon R301 2 Chmatlc and Geographlc Des1g11 Cntena

_ Section RS 19.1, Address Identification; R322, Flood Resistant™ -
. C.onstruction;‘ Section R324.4.2, Fire cyagéiﬁcaﬁoii‘; Section 3324,.5.2, )
Fire Classification; Section R337.1.3.1, A.pplic-ation Date and Where
_, Requirod' Section R337..2 Definitions; -Scction R337.5. 4, Roof Gutters

| and Downspouts Sechon R33’7 8 Extenor Wmdows and Doors

®) .- Chapter 9 Sect:lon 902, 1 5, Roof Covermg Matena.ls Sectmn R902.2. 1

Wood Shlngles Sect:on R902 2.2, Wood Shakes Section R902 4,
‘Photov.oltmo Panels and Roof Modules.; Section R905.1 3, Roof Coveﬁng
anochmeni"'Secﬁon R9.08.—1.1 RepIdceihbnf Roof Covering, Class A;
Section R908 12, Replacement Roof Covermg, Class A, Add1t10ns, .

| Sectlon R908.1.3, Wood Shake Shmgles Reroof; Section R908 1.4, Wood
.Shake Shmgles Hlstoncal Bulldmgs, Section R908 1.5, Reroofmg Over

Wood Roofs

Additions to the Callforma Residential Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following Seotions and Subsections are added to the 2019 Califoroid
Residential Code by the City of San Diego: |

(a) - [No change in text]

(b)  Chapter 3 Sectlon R309 4.1 Backup Power for Automatic Ga.rage Door

- Openers, S_ectlon R320.2 Voluntary_ Acc_esmbxhty program; Section R329,

- -PAGE 47 OF 66-




§149.0107

© -

(d)

| (0-2020-82)

Structural Tests and Speclal Inspcctlons Sectmn R332, Encroachments

_into the' Pubhc nght-of ~Way; Section R333 Safeguards Durmg

Constructlon' Section R337 1 3 1 Exceptlon 2.3; Section R337.2 Local

Very H1gh Fire Hazard Seventy Zone Section R337.3.6.1, Altematlve

Materials, De31gns or Methods of Constructlon Sechon R337.3.6.2,

Modiﬁcaﬁqn.s; ‘Section R33-7.5.4, Roof Gutters and D_ownspouts; Section

R337.5.5, Drip Edge Flashing; Section R337.8.2.1.1, Vinyl Windows;

Section R337 11, Spark An'ester;. Section R341, Sound Transmission
Control '

Chapter4 Sectlon R401 5, Geotechnical Investigations; Sectlon R401.6,

Geotechmcal Reports; Section.R401 7 Notice of Geologic Hazards
_ [No change in text ] |

. Adoptlon of Appendlces to the Callfornia Residential Code

The follomng Appendxx Chapters of the 2019 California R@sldentigl Code are -

ad(;pted by the City of San Diego:

(a) Appendix Cilap;el; H, Patio Covers.

()  Appendix éh;prer Q, Tiny Houses.

(¢) = Appendix Chapter S, Straw Bale Construction. .

@

" Appendix V, Swimming Poo]-Safety Act. .

-PAGE 48 OF 66-,




§149.0108

(0-2020-82)

Applicabihty of the California Building Code to Exnstmg Bluldmgs and
Structures Regulated by the California Residentral Code '

(a) _

®) .
© .

The legal occupancy of any bmldrng or structure ex1st11rg on the date of -.
adoption of the 2019 Cahforma Resrdentml Code shall be perrmtted to
oontmue without change exoept as is speclﬁcally regulated by Chapters 3,
4, and 5 of the 2019 Callfomla Exrstmg Bulldmg Code the California Flre
Code or as i deemed necessary by the Bmldmg Official for the general :

safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. ‘

"[No cha.nge in text, ]

Buﬂdmgs and stmctures, and parts thereof shall be mamtamed ina safe |
~and samtary_ condition. Devices or safeguards which are req_ulred by the
o '-20'1'9:C§1'_ifor;_1ia,BuiIdin_g._Code shall be rrnair_ltaihed in conformarice with
rthe—code edition under which installed The owner shall be responsihle for |

'the maintenance of buildings and structures To determme comphanee ‘

with th15 Subsectlon the Building Oﬁicml shall have the authority to

" require a& bulldmg_oro-s.tructure to be re-inspected. The requirements of the _

.Btlilding Regulations shall not provide the basis for removal or _abrogatioe '

of fire protection and safety sjr_stems and devices in existing building or -

structures.’

Section 28. That Chapter 14, Article 9, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

'amended by amending sectioh 149.0201 :and repeafing.eecﬁon 149.0202, to read as fotloWS'

§149.0201

Local Additions to Chapter 2 “Deﬁnitmns” of the California Residential

Code’

- Chapter 2 of the California Residential Code _is"adopted by reference without

change pursuant to Section 149'.'01'03 of the Land Development Code.

~PAGE 49 OF 66-




'. (0-2020-82)

. Section 29. That Chapter 14, Article 9 D1v131on 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code is |

| amended by amending sections 149. 0301 and 149.0302, adding new sectlon 145.0309, amending
and retltlmg sectlon 149.0319, addmg new secnon 149.0324, repealmg sectlon 149, 0326 and
amendmg secuon 149 0337, to read as follows :

- .§149.0301 Local Additions to Chapter 3 “Building Planning of the California
Residential Code

(@ [No change in text. ]
(b)  Sections R302 through R308,R310 through R318, R321 'R325 through
. R336, and R338 throngh R340 are adopted by reference wtthout change
| pursdanfto Section 149. '0.1 03 of the Land Develoj)mentncode. -

§149.0301 -Local Modlﬁcatlons and Additions to Section R301 2 “Cllmatlc and
: Geographic Design Cnteria” ,

‘_ _(a_) [No change in text.] '
® Sectlon R301.2is adopted w1th mod1ﬁcahons as follows. Bulldmgs shall
be const_ructed in accordance thh the prowsmns of the California
K Reeidential Code as limited by the pro‘visions of Section R301. Additional -
cntenaare outlmed in Table 149, 0302 of the La.nd Development Code |
' (o) : [No change in text.] _
Table 149l03'oz

[No change in text.]

_PAGE 50 OF 66-




—

'§149.0309

| §149.0319

§149.0324

(0-2020-82)

Local Addltlons to Sectlon R309 “Garages and Carports”

E Sectlon R309 4 is adopted w1th additions pursuant to Sectlon 149, 0106 of the

Land Development Code Section R309.4. 1is added as folIows R309.4. 1

Backup power for automatxc garage door openers. Where residential garages are
eqmpped w1th automattc. garage door openers, the. remdentlal automatic garage

door opener sﬁalf include a battery baokup function that is destgned to operate in a |

‘manner so that the automatic garage door opener is operatlonal without

. xnterruptlon durmg an electrlcal outage,

Local Modiﬁcations to Section R319 1 “Address Identtﬁcation” of the

'. California Residential Code ;

3 Sectlon R319. 1 of the Cahforma Remdentlal Code is adopted as amended in San :

Diego Muhicipal Code Section 95.0209 for building addressm_g requirements for -

- the City of San Diego

Local Modiﬂcations and Additlons to Section R324 “Solar Energy Systems”

* of the California Resndential Code _

({1) . ‘Section R324 4.2 is modtﬁed as follows pursuant to Sectlon 149, 0105 of
" the Land Development Code R324 4.2, Fire clasmﬁcatlon Rooﬂop— . |
mounted photovoltalc panel systems shall have the same ﬁre clasmﬁoatlon
requlred in Sectton 149 0902(a) |
® Section R324. 5.2 is modified as follows pursuant to Section 149.0105.of
- the Land Development Code: R324 5. 2 Fire classification. Bulldmg-
_:mtegrated photovoltalc systems shall have the same ﬁre class1ﬁcat10n .

_required in Section 149,090_2(&).

-PAGE 51 OF 66-




| §149.0337

'. (0-'2020-__82) _

Local Additions and Modifications to Section R337 “Materials and Methods
for Exterior Wildfire Exposure” of the California Re91dentml Code

(@ [No change in text ] _
(b): - Section R337 2 is adopted by reference w1th modifications and addltlons
pursuant to Sectlons 149. 0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development
Code as f0110w3' Local Agency Very High Fue Haza.td Severity Zonee
. shall mean the Very ngh Fire Hazard Seventy Zones as desxgnated on the )
'Very ngh Fn'e Hazard Severity Zone Map Local Rcsponsxblhty Areas
adopted pursuant to Sectlon 55.9401 of the Lan_d Development Code. .
(c)  Section R337.3.6 is adopted vvith additions purseant fo_ Section 149.0106
| | ofthe_Land Development cede. eectioﬁs.R337.6._1 and R337.3.6.2 are
: .added'.&js follow.si . . | | -'
(1) R337.361, Alernative Materials, Desigas or Methods _of '
o Conettneﬁon. The Duﬂdiﬁg Ofﬁcml may approve the use of
alternzitive materiels; designs or methods'of eonstruetioh put'suant
: to. Sectlon 129 0109 of the Land Development Code. |
(2) R337.3.6.2, Modlﬁcanons The Buﬂdmg Ofﬁclal may modlfy the_
o provllsxons‘of Sectmn R337 of the _Cahforma Residential Co_de for :
- site-speoitic conditions in accordance with Section 129.0104(&)(5)
. of the Land Develo_pment Code. When nequired by the Bmldmg '
. Official, a fire proteeﬁon plan shall be snbmitt_ed maccordance : |
with the California Fire Code, Qhepter 49,
@ 'Sectlton R337.5 is adopted with modiheations and additions pnrsuant_to

‘Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development Code:

-PAGE 52 0F 66-




(0-2020-82)

(1) SectionR337.5.4is modified as follows: R337.5.4, Rooqutter;
._ | and Downspouts Roof gutters shall be constructed to prevent the
accumulation of leaves and debms in the gutter All roof gutters
and downspouts shall be lconstruoted of noncombustible m:_aterials. _ |
@ | Section R337.§.5 is added as follows: R337.5.5, Drip.Edge
Flashing. When drip edge flashing is used at the free edges of = |, |
roofing matedds, it shgll t_;e'non-codabuétible.
{e)  Section 3337.8 is adopted with mddiﬁdations and additions pursuant to
" Sections 149.0105 anid 149.0106 of the Land Development Codé. Section -
R337.8.2.1 is added as follows: R337.8.2.1.1, Glazing frames niade-of -
| vmyl materials shall have welded corners, metal remforcemcnt in the
. interlock area, and be certlﬁed to the most cuxrent edmon of |
ANSI/AAMA!NWWDA 101/1.8.2 structural requlrements
® Sectlon R337:11 IS added pursuant to Section 149 0106 of the Land
. Deve]opment Code.as follows: R337. 1 1, Spark Arrester, All structur&s
~ having any dhir'me’y, ﬂue,. or stovepipe shall bd equil.).ped withan -
dpprd_véd spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or‘stovepipd is attdched to
any fireplace, stove, barbecue, or other solid or liquid fuél burning
equipment or dewce : | _
Section 30 That C‘haptet_' 14, Article 9, Division 9 of the San Diego Municipal Codeis
amended by amending sectlon 149.0902, to read as follows:

§149.0902 Local Additions and Modifications to Section R902.1 “Roof Classification” of
' the California Residential Code :

" (a) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 53 OF 66-




d

©(0-2020-82)

 Section R902.4 is adopted by reference and modified as follows: R902.4

R'oofton ntounted'solar photovoltajc panels and modules. Rooﬁop

' mounted photovoltalc panels and modules 1nstalled on or above the roof

' eovermgshall be tested listed and 1dent1ﬁed with a ﬁre class:ﬁcatlon in

aecordance w1th UL 1703 .and UL 27 03 Class A Bor C photovoltmc
panel systems and modules shall be mstalled in areas deaxgnated by
Section R902 of the Callforma Re81dtla] Code in Junsdlctlons
des1gnated by law as reqmnng then use or where the' edge of the roof 1 is
less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot lme When located in the Very ngh
Fire Hazard Seventy Zone Map Local Respons1bﬂity Areas adopted
pursuant to Sectron 55. 9401 of the San D1ego Mumcrpal Code, roof-top :

mounted photovoltalc panels and modules shall: have a mmlmum ﬁre

: eIaSSIﬁcatlon ratmg of Class A

Seetlon 31. That Chapter 14 Article IO D1v1310n 1 of the San Dtego Munlclpal Code is .

amended by amendmg sectlons 1410 0103 and 1410 0107, to read as follows

' §1410.0103. Adoption of the Californla Green Buildmg Standards Code

@

®)

"The 201 9 Cahforma Green Burldmg Standards Code, pubhshed by the
: Cahforma Building Standards Comlmssron_ (BSC), and as amended bythe

_ State Deparnnent of Housidg and Community Development (HCD),is

adopted by refe_re'nee except as.Otherwise provided in this Artiele, A copy

" of the 2019 California Green Building Standards Code is on file in the

officeof the City Clerk as Document No. 00-_*. 21 18 1
When referenee is made to the Calrforma Green Buﬂdmg Standards Code '

it shall be the 2019 Cahforma Green Buﬂdmg Standards Code Callforma .

"PAGE 54 OF 66-




§1410.0107

_'(c)

(@

(©

®

- (0-2020-82)

‘Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11, as puBlished_ by the California

Bm]dmg Standards Com:mssmn

i Each of the regu]atlons prowsmns, condltlcns, and terms of the 2019

- California Green Bulldmg Standards Code is made a part of this Artlcle as

if fully set .forth_m this Article. -

‘Numbering of Sections and Subsections in this Article is cross referenced

to Seetions in the 2019 California Green Building 'Standards Code.

The adoptmn of the 201 9 California Green Bmldmg Standards Code sha.ll

".inno way lumt prohxblt, impede, or prevent the City Councﬂ from

adopt;ng ordinances l1;_mtmg or preventmg the issuance of any type,

number, or géographical distribution of permits for consh'_ucﬁon or

demoiition of any facility for wliicﬁ a permit is reqt.xire.d_..

[No change in text.]

Adepti('m of _A:ppendices to the California Green Building Standards Code -

Appendix Chapters to the 2019 California Green Building Standards Codeare

adepted as follows: The Residential Voluntary méasures of the California Green

Bulldmg Standards Code, Appendlx Chapter A4, Resxdentml Volunta:ry Measures

Section A4.305.1 “Graywater ”

Sectlon 32. That Chapter 14, Article 10, Division 4 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code i is

' a.mended by amendmg section 1410. 0403 to read as follows

§l410 0403 Local Modlﬁcations to Section A4.305 “Water Reuse Systems” of the
Califomia Green Building Standards Code -

(@)

(b)

['No change in text.]
. Section A4. 305 1is adopted with the followmg modifications. AII new

remdentla] buildings that are within the scope of the CaliforniaResidential

-PAGE 55 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

Code shall be constructed to include waste piping to’ disch_arge gray water
from clothes washers to a plaee where it may 'be used for outdoor
1rngatlon in comphanee with Section 1503 of the Ca.hforma Plumbmg

Code

Seet1on 33 That Chapter 14, Art1c1e 11 Division 1 of the San Diego Munlc1pa1 Code is

amended by a.mendmgsectlons 1411 0103 1411; 0104 1411 0105 1411 0106, and 1411 0107 to

read as follows

§1411 0103 Adoption of the ‘California Exlsting Bulldlng Code _

(a)

.@) _

(©)

The 2019 Cahforma Ex1stmg Bulldmg Code pubhshed hy the California -

Bulldmg Standards Conumsswn (B_S_C),.as amended by the State

Department' of Housing and Community Develooment (HCD L, HCD

' llAC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM) is adopted by reference except
) as otherwnse prov1ded in this Article of the Land: Development Code, '
" Divisions 2 through S and Divisions 17 and 18 A copy of the 2019
” California Bxisting Building Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk’

-es Docoment No. 00:__ 21 1 8 1

When reference is made to the Califorria Exlstmg Buﬂdmg Code it shall
be the 201 9 Cahfomm Emstmg Bmldmg Code, Cahforma Code of

Regula.tlons Title 24, Part 10, as p_ubh_shed by the Callforma Bmlding_ |

_ Standards Commission. o

Fach of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2019
California Existing Building Code is made a part of this Article as if fully -

set forth in this Article except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2 .-

through 5 and Divisions 17 and 18,

-PAGE 56 OF 66-




§1411.0104

(@)

. ©

o

- (0-2020-82) -
The numbering of Sections and Subsections in Divisions 2 through 5 and

Divisions 17 and 18 6f this Article- is crosé-fe_ferenc’:ed to Séctions in the .

i

* 2019 California Emshng Bulldmg Code.

The adoptlon of the 2019 Ca]lforma Exzstmg Bulldmg Code shall in no

way hm1t, proh1b1t impede, of prevent the City Council from adoptmg

-ofdmances 11rmt1ng or preventmg the i 1ssuanoe of any type, number, or

- geographJcal dlstnbutmn of perrmts for constructlon or demolition of any

facility for which a perm1t is requ1red

The Buﬂdmg Ofﬁcfal is only authonzed to enforce amendments to the

2019 California Exlstmg Building Code made by the followmg State

B agenmem

(l) through (3) No change in text ]

Port:ons of the Callfomla Existing Bmlding Code Not Adopted by the City of
San Diego ,

The following Sect:lons or Subsectlons of the 2019 Cahforma Existing Bmldmg

. Code have not been adopted by the Clty of San Dlego

(@)
()
-+ 301.3.3 Petformance Compliance Method.

' [No change in text.]

Chapter 3, Section 301.3.2 Work Area. Complianqe Method; Section

Chapters 6 through 13 and Chapter 15. . -

-PAGE 57 OF 66-




(0-2020-32)

§1411 0105 Modlﬁcations to the Cahfornia Existing Bmlding Code Adopted by the City
of San Dlego - , )

@

§1411.0106

The followmg Sections or Subsectlons of the 2019 Cahforma Existing Buﬂdmg

Code are modified by the City of San Dlego

@
® .

C)

© -

[No change in text.]
Chapter3 Section 301.1, General Section 301.3 Alteration,-Addition or

Change of Occup_ancy, mcludmg the exception; Section 302.4; Existing

_ Materials,

Chapter 4, Sectlon 401 3 Repairs, Flood Hazard Areas
Chapter 5, Sectxon 502. 3 Flood Hazard Areas; Sectxon 503.2, Flood
Hazard Areas, Sectlon 405.2.5, Flood Hazard Areas.

Appendix, Chapter‘ Al, Section A102.1, Scope, Géneral.

Addltions to. the California Existing Buﬂding Code Adopted by the City of

_San Dlego

The followmg Sectxons and Subsechons are added to the 2019 Ca.hforma Bxlstmg

" Building Code by the Clty of San Dlego.

@
®)

[No change in text ]

_Chapter 3 Sectlon 302.7, antenance, Sectlon 302 8, Mandatory

' regulahons for wall anchorage and parapet bracmg for unremforced

masonry bearing Wall buildings; Sectxon 302.8.1, Appllcablhty, Section :

302.8.2, Compliance Period; Section 302.8.2.1, Removal, Stabilizaﬁon

. and Bracing Procds's; Section 302.8.2.2, Historical‘Bui[dings.

-PAGE 58 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§1411.0107 Adoption of Appendices to the Californtn Existing' l‘luilding Code
The folIowmg Appendnt Chapters of the 2019 Callforma Emstmg Building Code
are adopted by the City of San Diego:
. (a) through (¢) [No change in text,)
Section 34. That Chapter 14, Article 1 l D1v131on 3 of the San DngO Municipal Code is
amended by amendmg sections 141 1 0301 and amendmg and retltlmg section 14110302, to read

as follows. |

'§1411.0301 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 “Provisions for All
: Compliance Methods” of tlie California Existing Building Code

@ Chapter 3 of the Cahforma Ex1st1ng Bmldmg Code is adopted by reference
- _ with mod:ﬁcatlons and addltlons pursuant to Sectlons 1411 0105 and
141 l 0106 of the Land Development Code | |
® Secnon 301 3 mcludmg the exceptlon, of the Cahforma Ex1stmg Bulldmg :
“Codeis adopted by reference w1t.h modlﬁcatlons pursua.nt to Sectlon
s 1411 0105 of the Land Deve}opment Code
G Section 301,3 is modified as follows: 301.3, Alteration, edditior_t or
cﬁang'e of odcupancp; The nlteration, addition or change of |
: occupancy of all existing l;uildings shall comply witIr Section
3013.1. | .
(2) The exceptlon to Sectton 301.3 is modified as foIlows Exceptron
o Subject to the gpproval of the Bmld_mg Official, alterations
' compl)}ing with the laws in existence at the time the building or the
affected portion of the building was built are in compliance with
the | prowstons of the current Callforma Extstmg Building Code.

New structura.l members added as part of the a.lteratlon shall

_-PAGE 59 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)
oomply wiih the Californ'ia Eﬁsﬁng Building Code. Thls exc,eption.
shall not apply to an alterations that constltutes a substantial |
unprovement to an existing buﬂdmg ina flood haza:d areas, whlch
alterations shall cdmply.with'Section 1411 .0503 of the Land

: Development Code This exoeptlon shall not apply to the structural

' -"provlsmns of Chapter 5 of the California Emstlng Buﬂdmg Code

§1411 0302 " Local Modxﬂcatlons and Additions to Sectlon 302 “General Provisions” ofthe .
California Existmg Building Code :

@

©

Section 302 of the Cahforma Exxstmg Building Code is ad{)pted by

o reference with modlﬁcatlons and addltlons pursuant to Sectlons 141 1 .Oi 05
" and 1411.0106 of the Land Development Code..
®

, ‘already in use ina buﬂdmg or structure m comphanoe with requlrements .

fSectlon 302 4 is modified as follows 302 4, Ex1stmg materials. Matenals

or approvals in effect at the tlme of their erection or installation shall be
permitted to remam in use unless determmed by the Building 0fﬁc1a1 tobe _
unsafe pursuant to Sectlon 121 0404 of the Land Developnient Code |
Sectlon 302.7is added as followsr 302.7 Maintenance. Buildingsand

structures, and parts thereof, shall be mamtamed in & safe and sanitary

_condltlon. Dewces or safeguards that are reqn.ured by the Bulldmg, )
Electrical, lenbmg, Mec_:hamcal, Resndentlal, Green Building a_nd

- Existing Building Regulaﬁona of the Land'Development Code shallbe - .

maintained in conformance with the edition of the CaliforniaBuilding

‘Standards Code (California Code of Regulations Title 24) underwhich the

devices or safeguards were installed. The owner shall be responsible for

' the maiotenance of buildings and structures: To determine compliance

-PAGE 60 OF 66-




@)

(e)

(0-2020-82) -

with this Section 302.7, the Building Official sﬁall have the suthority to

reinspect a building or'structure. The requirements of the Existing

Building Regulations shall not provide the basis for removal or abrogation

of fire protection and_séfety systems and devices in existing buildings or
structures.
Section 302.3 is added as follows: 302.8, Mémdatory reguteitioné for wall

anchorage and parapet bracing for unreinforced masonry bearing wall

* buildings. The provisions of Secﬁan 302.8 shall apply to buildings that
were constructed or that were under consh*uctlonbeforc March 24, 1939,
. or for whlch a Bmidmg Per:mt was. lssued before March 24, 1939, and to
'Clty—owned bmldmgs deslgrxgtpd pursuant to d City Councll resoluhop,_
- which on J amidxy ¥, 1994, had at leétgt one; umetnfqrt:ed mdédnr)t beari,:ig.
" wall. S;ection 362 8 shall not dpplyto the following; | |

(- Any detached smgle or two-fauuly dwellmg unit-and detached

apartment houses contmmng five or fewer units used solely for
residential purposes and the accessory buﬂdmgs for th&ce |
'occupan01es ThlS exemphon does' not apply to buﬂdmgs or-
| structures contalmng mixed or nonremdentlal occupancles
(2) ' Bulldmgs that have been completely seismically retroﬁtted, as )
| _ | detcrmmed by the Bmldmg Ofﬁcml to comply with earher )
| editions of the California Existing Bmldmg Code, or eqmvalent
tegulations.. '

Section 302.8.1 is added as follows: 302.8.1, Applicability. The

regulations in Section 302.8.1 shall apply to buildings or structures that

-PAGE 61 OF 66-




o

@

- (0-2020-82)

 are within the scope of Section 302.8, that aré not classified as Essential or

Hazardous Facilities, and that contmn any parapets and other external

E hazards attached to or Iocated on the roof structure or formmg the extenor

. facade ofa bulldmg or structure that meet both of the folIowmg cntena

(1) Critical Placement: The paxapets exterior wall, roof appendages or. | .
any o_ther_ extemal hazards_ have the potential to gly_e way internally
or onto lower adjacent buildings (with a minimum ﬁeight-

.. differential of 6 feet) or property, of onto an adjscent exit or public

. _way; and

i 2) Relaﬁve H_eig_ht. 'I‘He parapets and other .'extemal hazardsor . °

, _ _ T
exterior wall or roof appendages that extend above the lower of

"_either the level of the close'st.adj acent roof to wall anchors or the
roof sheafhing do not mect the fequirements of Section Al 13-'of ﬁle '

Cahforma Exlstmg Bulldmg Codc

. Section 302.8.2 is added as follows: 302.8.2, Comphance perlod The

owner.of abulldmg regulated by Section 302.8 shall, within 5 years after :

. the date of service of an order to comply, provide partial seismic

mitigationin the form of the rermoval, stabilization, or bracing of all the

) building elements that meet both of the criteria in Section 302.8.1.

Sectlon 302.8.3 is added as follows 302. 8 3, Removal Stabilization and

: Bracmg Process The owner shaIl instail roof to wall anchors around the

perimeter of the entire bulldmg as part of the removal, sta‘olhzatxon, and

bracmg process Extstmg roof to wall anchors must meet, or shall be

upgraded to meet, the mlmmum reqmrements of Sectlon AI 13 1 of the

-PAGE 62 OF 66- .




(0-2020-82)

California Bﬁisting Builddng Code. or new anchors ineeting _the minimum
.requlrements of Section Al 13 1 sha.ll be 1nstalled |
(h)  Section 302.8.4, is added as follows: 302.8.4, Hlstpncal Bmldmgs If the
bmldmg is aHlstoncal Bulldmg, the installation shall comply with the
requlrements of the Cahforma Hlstoncal Bulldmg Code and parapet
remova.l shall notbe used as a method to mitigate extemal hazards.
Seetxon 35. That Chapter 14 Atticle 11, Dmsxon 4 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending end retitling section 141 1.0401, repealing sections 141 1.0402, 1411.0403,
and 1411 .0404 and edding new section 1411 04035, to read as fOIlOV;IS‘ -

§1411,0401 Local Modifications to Chapter 4 “Repairs” of the California Exisl:mg
Building Code - '

(® - 'Chapter 4 of the Cahforma Bx1stmg Bulldmg Code is adopted by
. reference with modlﬁcatlons pursuant to Section 1411 0105 of the Land
' Development _Code. | _ ‘

(b) . Section401:3 is modified perSuant to ‘Section 1411.0105 of the Land
Developmeot Code as follox;vs: 4d1.3; Flood hazard areas In flood hazard
areas, the owner shall comply with Section 145.1612 or Section 149.0322 |
of the Land Development Code, as applicable, when makmg repalrsthat

constitute substantial improvement,

-PAGE 63 OF 66-




(0-2020-82) .

§1411 0405 Local Modificati‘ons to Section 405 “Structural”.of the California Existmg
Bmlding Code

- (a) Sectton 405 of the Cahforma Ex1stmg Bmldmg Code is adopted by
reference with modlﬁcattons pursuant to Sechon_141 1.0105 of the Land -
~ Development Code: - o ' . |
(b) Sectioh 405.é.5, Repair, is adopted .with,modtﬁcations as follows: 405.2.5,
. | Flood hazard areas. In ﬂood hdzard areas, buildings that have sustalned -
. substantlal damage shall be brought into comphance w1th Section’
145. 1612 or Sectlon 149.0322 of the Land Development Code,
apphcable : .
o Sectlon 36. That Chapter 14, Article 11 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code is amended by
adding new DlVlElOl’l 5 sections 1411 0501, 1411 0502, and 1411.0503, to read as follows:
Chapter 14. General Regulatlons |
Art:cle 11: Existmg Buildlng Regulations ] |

Dlvision 58 Addltmns and Modlﬁcations to Chapter 5 ot‘ the Callfornia Existing Building ‘
: - Code -

§1411 0501 . Local Modlﬁcatwns and Addltlons to Chapter 5 “Prescriptive Compliance .
. Method” of the California Ex.tsting Building Code

~Chapter 5 of the Cahforma Ex:stmg Bu:ldmg Code is adopted byreference with
- modtficatmns and addmons pursuant to Sections 1411 0105 and 1411 0106 of the
Land Development Code -

§1411.0502 Local Modifications to Section 502 “Addltlons” of the California Existlng
' " Building Code : ,

(@ ~Section 502_ of the California‘Existing Building Code is a_dopted by
reference with modiﬁct_itions pursuant to:Section 1411.0105 of the Land

Development Code. |

-PAGE 64 OF 66-




®)

(0-2020-82)

Section 502.3 is modified as follows: 502.3, Flood Hazard Areas. For

buildings and stﬁx‘ctm;es in flood hazard areas established in S-ec.tion
145.1612 or Sectioﬁ 149.0322 of _’Ehe Land Development Code, as
applicable, any addition that const‘:ittheS substantial improvement of the

existing, .s'tmctﬁre shall comply with the flood design fequiremeﬂté for new

constmchon, and all aspects of the exlstmg structure shall be brought 1nto

_ comphance w1th the requxrements for new oonsu'uctton for flood dmgn

For bmldmgs and structures in ﬂood hazard areas estabhshed in Section

145 1612 or Secuon 149.0322 of the Land Devclopment Code, as

apphcable ‘any addmons that do not constitute substant1al 1mprovement of
' the existing structure are not requlred to comply with the flood de31gn

requlrements for new constmctxon

§1411 0503 . Local Modifications to Section 503 “Alteratlons” of the Califorma Exlsting
.Building Code .

(&)

®

Section 503 of the Cahforma Ex1stmg Buddmg Code is adopted by
reference w1th modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 of the Land o

Development Code.

~ Section 503.2 is modified as follows: 503.2 Floqd hazard areas. For

" buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section

145.1612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Dev'elbpinen; (_:Ade; as
applicable, any alteration that constitutes substénﬁai improvement of the
existing strucuér‘e shall comply with the flood design reguirem_énts for new
cotistruction, and all aépects of mé eii.sting snuct;;f.-e shall be brought into

compliance with the rec[uirements‘ for new construction for flood design.

For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas éstablished in Section

-PAGE 65 OF 66-




(0-2020-82) -

145.1 612 or Section 149.0325 of the Land De\}‘a-lopment. Code as
apphcable, a.ny alteratlons that do not constitute substantial mprovement
of the existing srructure are not requu'ed to comply w1th the flood design
-regulrements for new construction. ‘
 Section .37.' Thata full readmg of thls Ordinahcc ié dispeqsed with‘p.rior to passage,a
written.copy h'aving. bgen made ai_vajlé.blAe to the Council and the public prior to the day of 1ts
paésage. . o | | | ‘ | -
. Sec;tiqn.SS‘. That this Ordmance shall take effect i be in force on the thirtieth day from “
and after its final passage. | ' -

APPROVED: MARA W. EL;LI(:)TI‘, City Attorney |

A

_ Noah J Yam
Deputy C1ty Attomey

.NJB:als-
02/10/2020
Or.Dept:DSD
Doc. No.: 2228015 2.

I hereby certify that the foregomg Ordmance was passe(Tby the Council of the C1ty of
" San Dlego, at this meetmg of __04/07/2020 '

ELIZABETH S. MALAND
' C:ty Clerk

_ : By /s Gil Sanchez
: .‘DepuClcr

Approved: 2 " l %0 0 y A M/( . :
S : (date) - . . KEVIN L. FAULCONER, Mayor

Vetoed: . ‘ _ ’

: ' (date) ' " KEVIN L. FAULCONER, Mayor

-PAGE 66 OF 66-



(0-2020-82)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: Struek-Out
NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- (NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9,
DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 129.0104; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
129.0203, 129.0211, 129.0216, AND 129.0218; AMENDING
CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING
SECTION 129.0307, AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION
129.0309; AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 4
BY AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0410;
AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BY
AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0907;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 12 BY
AMENDING SECTION 142.1210; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
145.0101, 145.0103, 145.0104, 145.0105, 145.0106, AND
145.0107; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 2
BY AMENDING SECTION 145.0201 AND REPEALING
SECTION 145.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.0401 AND

. ADDING NEW SECTION 145.0406; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 7 BY REPEALING SECTION
145.0702 AND AMENDING SECTION 145.0711; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY RENUMBERING
AND RETITLING SECTION 145.1207 TO SECTION 145.1206
AND ADDING NEW SECTION 145.1207, AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 145.1501, 145.1505 AND 145.1507, ADDING NEW
SECTION 145.1510, AND RENUMBERING AND RETITLING
CURRENT SECTION 145.1510 TO SECTION 145.1511;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 18 BY
AMENDING SECTION 145.1803; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 31 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3101
AND REPEALING SECTION 145.3109; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 32 BY AMENDING
SECTION 145.3203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 8,
DIVISION 33 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 145.3301 AND
145.3303; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION

-PAGE 1 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

38 BY RETITLING DIVISION 38 AND BY AMENDING AND
RETITLING SECTIONS 145.3801, 145.3802, 145.3803,
145.3804, 145.3805, AND 145.3806; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 39 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3905
AND AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 145.3910;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 40 BY
AMENDING SECTION 145.4005; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
146.0103, 146.0104, 146.0105, 146.0106, AND 146.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 2 BY
REPEALING SECTIONS 146.0208 AND 146.0209; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 147.0103, 147.0104, 147.0105, AND 147.0106;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 2 BY
ADDING NEW SECTION 147.0203, RENUMBERING
SECTION 147.0213 TO SECTION 147.0211, AND AMENDING
AND RETITLING SECTION 147.0212; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION
147.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 8§, DIVISION 1
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 148.0103, 148.0104, 148.0105,
148.0106, AND 148.0107; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
149.0103, 149.0104, 149.0105, 149.0106, 149.0107, AND
149.0108; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2
BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0201 AND REPEALING
SECTION 149.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9,
DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 149.0301 AND
149.0302, ADDING NEW SECTION 149.0309, AMENDING
AND RETITLING SECTION 149.0319, ADDING NEW
SECTION 149.0324, REPEALING SECTION 149.0326, AND
AMENDING SECTION 149.0337, AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0902;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIVISION | BY
AMENDING SECTIONS 1410.0103 AND 1410.0107;
AMENDING.CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIVISION 4 BY
AMENDING SECTION 1410.0403; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
1411.0103, 1411.0104, 1411.0105, 1411.0106, AND 1411.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3 BY
AMENDING SECTION 1411.0301 AND AMENDING AND
RETITLING SECTION 1411.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING AND RETITLING
SECTION 1411.0401, REPEALING SECTIONS 1411.0402,
1411.0403, AND 1411.0404, AND ADDING NEW SECTION
1411.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, BY
ADDING NEW DIVISION 5, SECTIONS 1411.0501, 1411.0502,

-PAGE 2 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

AND 1411.0503, RELA_TING TO THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE. .

§129.0104  Construction Permit Authorities
(a) - The powers and du.ties of the Building Official are as follows:

(1) through (13) [No change in text.]

(14) To review applications for Grading Permits for, and to inspect
grading on, residential private lots thatdo not include public rights
of way, as well as associated plans, specifications, and other data to
determine if an application is in compliance with the grading
regulations in the California Building Code, other adopted City

standards, and engineering standards of practice.

(15) [No change in text.]

(16) Toreview wglggi&signgjﬁ;gﬂnn&iom&mndmﬂlﬁi&md
installations, and to inspect the utilities and installations, when

(b) through (c) [No change in text.]
§129.0203  Exemptions from a Building Permit
(a) A Building Permit is not required for the following structures and
activities, except when the development would involve alterations, repairs,

or improvements to a historical resource as described in Section

-PAGE 3 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

143.0220; when development 0n a premises containing environmentally

sensitive lands requires a development permit in accordance with Section

143.0110; or when a building is constructed with unreinforced masonry

bearing walls or exterior wall parapets:

(1) [No change in text.] _

(2) Fences that are 67 feet in height or less;and-netsupportingany
othersuper-imposed-loads.

(3) through (6) [No change in text.]

(7)  Platforms-walks; Sidewalks and driveways that are 30 inches or

less above adjacent grade, and are not over any basement or story,

and are not part of an accessible route in accordance with the
California Building Code:

(8) through (9) [No change in text.]

(10) Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R,

Division 3, and Greup-M Group U Occupancies when-they that do

not project more than 54 inches from the exterior wall and do not

(11) through (13) [No change in text.]

&35)(14)Eiectrolier standards, flag poles, and antennas that are 30 feet or

less in height above finish grade when fully extended.

-PAGE 4 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

within the scope of the California Residential Code that do not

&A1 6)Renewal of roof coverings on any building permitted by the
California Building Code and the California Residential Code,
where the existing roof structure, including roof diaphragm, is nbt
altered.

)1 7)Repairs that involve only the replacement of components or
existing work with similar materials for the purpose of
maintenance, that do not have an aggregate valuation of over
$1,000.00, and that do not affect any electrical or mechanical
installations. Repairs exempt from permit requirements shall not
include any addition, change, or modification in construction, exit
facilities, or permanent fixtures or equipment. The following
repairs are exempt from permit requirements without limit to
valuation:

. (A) through (D) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 5 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

E99(18)Structures placed in public streets, alleys and sidewalks, except
those regulated by Chapter 32 of the California Building Code.

20(19)Work done by employees of the City on City-owned or leased
buildings.

e—]—)@A temporary shed, office or storage building and other structure
incidental to and for work authorized by a valid Grading or
Building Permit. Such structures must be removed upon expiration
of the permit or completion of work covered by the Grading or
Building Permit.

(2 Installing replacement windows in existing window openings
where all of the following conditions apply:

(A)  The windows are replaced in detached one and two-family
dwellings or townhouses as defined in the California
Résidential Code.

(B)  The proposed window replacement shall not require any
modifications to the weather resistive exterior wall
envelope protecting the structure or the interior of the
structure.

(C)  The existing windows to be replaced are not required to be
fire resistive.

(D}  The proposed work shall not require modifications to the
existing rough openings.

23)(22)New permanent parking and vehicular use areas for less than four

vehicles, including access to the spaces, but excluding parking for

-PAGE 6 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

“single dwelling unit uses on a single lot in Residential-Single Unit
Zones.
24)(23)Specific structures as determined by the Building Official ‘for a
particular and justifiablé reason.
25)(24)A sidewalk cafe that is in compliance with Section 141.0621,
unless any one of the following applies:
(A)  The sidewalk cafe would alter or modify the existing
building, building fagade, or any means of building egress;
(B}  The sidewalk cafe would be located on a raised platform or
in a sunken area; or
(C) A barrier consisting of railings, fences, or planter boxes
would be installed to delineate the area of the sidewalk
cafe.
(b) through (c) [No change in text.]
§129.0211 Closing of Building Permit Application

(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

§129.0216  Initial Utilization of a Building Permit

A Building Permit shall become void if work authorized by the permit is suspended,
th_st_ruﬁurg is abandoned, or substantial work authorized by the permit has not
been completed and validated by an inspection within $86-¢alendardays 12

-PAGE 7 OF 76-



§129.0218

§129.0307

§129.0309

(0-2020-82)

months of the date of permit issuance unles$ an extension has been granted

pursuant to Section 129.0219.

Expiration of a Building Permit

(a)
(b)

[No change in text:]

If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not recei.ved
final inspection approval by the permit expiration date, all work shall stop
until a new permit is issued. All Electrical, Plumbing, e Mechanical
Permits, or Fire Permits associated with a Building permit shall expire

concurrently with the Building Permit.

How to Apply for an Electrical Permit

(2} through (f) [No change in text.]

&
Issuance of an Electrical Permit_and Closing of an Electrical Permit
\pplicati

(a) through (b} [No change in text.]

()

ince the date an Electrica i ication is

submitted for review ma e i destro 5
Building Official. To reapply, the applicant shall submit a new Electrical

-PAGE 8 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)
all applicabie fees and regulations in effect on the date the new application
is filed.

(d)  JThe Electrical Permit application file for City projects shall be closed after

two vears have elapsed since the date the Electrical Permit application js

§129.0410  Issuanceof a PlurﬁbinglMechanical Permit_and Closing of 3

Plumbing/Mechanical Permit Application

(a) A Plumbing/Mechanical Permit may be issued atter all approvals have

been obtained and the required fees have been paid. A

Plumbiee/Mechaniosl Permit.shatlnot be-iesued-foradevel ]

issued:
(0 APlumbing/Mechanical Permit shall not be issued for a development that
lires a devel rmit unti v
issued.
()  Ifone year has elapsed since the date a Plumbing/Mechanical Permit
ication is deemed co ear icant iested that
Plumbing/Mechanical Permit be issued, the application file shall be
closed. Plans and other data submitted for review may be returned to the
licant or destroye uildi icia

-PAGE 9 OF 76-



§129.0907

(0-2020-82)

o

shall submit a new Plumbing/Mechanical Permit application with required

Issuance of a Fire Permit_and Closing of a Fire Permit Application

(a) [No change in text.]
(b) A Fire Permit shall not be issued until & associated Building Permit
permits has h;'ivg; been issued.

-PAGE 10 OF 76-



§142.1210

§145.0101

(0-2020-82)

complete,
period not exceeding 180 calendar days, if the Building Officia]
detenmines that circumstances bevond the control of the applicant

prevented issuance of the Fire Permit.

General Sign Regulations

This section is divided into subsections for copy regulations, locational

regulations, structural regulations, and sign maintenance regulations.

(c)

(d)

-(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

Structural Regulations

(1) through (3) [No change in text.]

(4)  When installed on the exterior walls of high-rise buildings as
defined in Chapter 4 of the California Building Code, exterior wall
signs greater than 100 square feet in area or greater than 10 feet in
either dimension shall comply with Section 705.12 of the 2643
2019 California Building Code and Section 705.1 of the 2019
California Fire Code.

[No change in text.]

Purpose of the Building Regulations

(a)

The purpose of the Building Regulations is to establish minimum

standards to safeguard health and safety, property, and public welfare, and

-PAGE 11 OF 76-



(b)

(0-2020-82)

to satisfy the purpose of the ;_194-6 2019 California Building Code as
provided in Section 1.1.2 of the 2646 2019 California Building Code.

[No change in text.]

§145.0103  Adoption of the California Building Code

(a

(b)

(c)

(d)

The 268+6 2019 California Building Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by the State
Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD 1, HCD
1/AC); the Division of the State Architect/Access and Compliance
(DSA/ACY); the State Office of Statewide Health Planning and
Development (OSHPD3); and the State Fire Marshal; (SFM), is adopted
by reference, except as otherwise provided in Chapter 14, Article 5 of the
Land Development Code, Divisions 2 through 36 38. A copy of the 2016
2019 California Building Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

Document No. O0-2080+4

When reference is made to the California Building Code, it shall be the
2016 2019 California Building Code, California Code of Regulations Title
24, Part 2, as published by the California Building Standards C-ommission.
Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2016
2019 California Building Code is made a part of Chapter 14, Article 5 as if
fully set forth in this Article, except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2
through 36 38.

Numbering of Sections in Divisions 2 through 36 38 of this Article is

cross referenced to Sections in the 2846 2019 California Building Code.

-PAGE 12 OF 76-



§145.0104

§145.0105

(e)

®

(0-2020-82)

The adoption of the 2046 M C;iiifomia Building Code shall in no way
limit, prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council from adopting
ordinances limitin.g or preventing the issuance of any type, number, or
geographical distribution of permits.for construction or demolition of any
facility for which a permit is required.

[No change in text.]

Portions of the California Building Code Not Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following portions of the 2646 2019 California Building Code are not

adopted by the City of San Diego:

(@

(b)

(©)

Chapter 1, Division H 1l “Scope and Administration,” all portions with
the exception of Section 104.11.

Chapter 15, Roof Assemblies and Reef Rooftop Structures, Section
15104 1511.4.

[No change in text.]

Modifications to the California Building Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Building Code

are modified by the City of San Diego:

(a)
®)

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 13 OF 76-



§145.0106

(0-2020-82)

(©)

photovoltaic panel systems, Section 1510.7.] Fire classification, Section
1507.8 Wood Shingles, Section 1507.9 Wood Shakes, and Section 1511.1
General.

(d) through (f) [No change in text.]

(2 Appendix N O, Emergency Housing Section N 0103.2.1 Exception 1, N
0103.6 Lighting, Ventilation, and Heating, N 0106 General, Section N -
0106.1.1 Tents, and Scction N 0106.1.2 Membrane Structures.

Additions to the California Building Code Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2646 2019 California

Building Code by the City of San Diego:

R 2. Definitions, Seetion-202 Live/Work Dwelling

o
\
¢
']
jo]
c
(83
113
c

€)(b) Chapter 7A, Materials and Construction Methods for Exterior Wildfire
Exposure, Sections HB8A3:701A6; 702A, Definitions, 765A=4;
F05A-4-); Section 703A.6.1, w
Section 703A.6.2, Modifications, Section 766A<4 705A.4, Roof Gutters,
Section 705A4.1, Drip Edge Flashing, Section 708A.2.2.1, Vinyl Window
Reinforcing, and Section 711A.1, and-+HA-2 Spark Arrestors.

{d){c) Chapter 12, Sound Transmission, Section +287-5 1206.05.

-PAGE 14 OF 76-



te)(d)

Hle)

e

th(g)

S}

€50

&)

(0-2020-82)

Chapter 15, Reeofing-and Roof Assgmhli_es,and_&aof_igg Structures,
Subsections 1505.1.5 and 1505.1.6, Sections 15074346 1507.1.3 and

Subsections 5404+ 1511.1 through +546-45 1511.1L.5.

Chapter 16, Structural Design, Section 1607.2, Fire Trucks and
Emergency Vehicle Live Load and 1612.3, Flood Loads.

Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspections, Section 17055
1704.3.1 item 6.

Chapter 18, Soils and Foundations, Secﬁon 1803 Geotechnical
Investigations, Subsections 18032 exceptions 2 through 4. Sections
1803.2.1, 1803.2.2, 1803.2.3, 1803-2-exeeptions-2-threugh4; 1803.5.11.1,
1803.5.11.2, 1803.5.13, 1803.5.13.1, 1803.5.13.2 and Table 145.1803.

~ 31 Specialc ‘on-Seetion 3109 Swimming Pool
Enelosures-and-Safety Deviees; -Beviees; Subseetions3169-1-1-3169-1-2-and
Chapter 32, Encroachments into the Public Right-of-Way, Section 3203
Entrance Canopies, Subsections 3203.1 through 3203.6.

Chapter 33, Safeguards During Construction, Section 33637 3303.8,
Demolition and Removal Regulations.

Appendix N Q, Emergency Housing, Subsection N 0103.2.1 Exception 2,
Subsections N 0106.2 through N 0106.7, Section N Q111 Emergency
Housing Lighting and Ventilation Requir;sments, Subsections N O111.1
énd N O111.2, Section N 0112 Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety

Requirements, Subsections N O112.1 through ¥ 0112.13, and Section N

-PAGE 15 OF 76-



§145.0107

§145.0201

(0-2020-82)

0113 Emergency Hou§ing Alternatives and Modifications, Subsection N
Q113.1. | |

Adoption of Appendices to the California Building Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 2646 2019 California Building Code are

ad0pt§d by the City of San Diego:

(a) Appendix chapters specifically amended by a State agency listed in
Section 145.0103 and identified in the adoption matrices of the 2646 2019

 California Building Code.
(b) through (e) [No change in text.]
§)] Appendix N O, Emergency Housing,

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 2 Definitions of the California
Building Code

Chapter 2 of the California Building Code is adopted by reference with-additions

without change pursuant to Section +45-0106 145.0103 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 16 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

1

(6  Section202 ofthe California Building Code is adopted-with the additi

¢ the definition-ef Liveiwork it A Li i well

§145.0401 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 4 “Special Detailed
Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy” of the California Building
Code
Chapter 4 of the California Building Code is adopted by reference witheut-change
- with additions pursuant to Section 1456403 145,0106 of the Land Development

Code.

the automatic garage door openers shall include batte
designed to operate in a manner so that the automatic garage door openers are
erational without | i i lectn e

-PAGE 17 OF 76-



§145.0711

(0-2020-82)
I I A l lolc I pl » g . - ' -. @ . ’
\oolication?-of theCaliforniaBuildins-Cod f I
145.0106 of the-Land-Development Code:
Local Additions to Section 711A “Additional Building Standards for

Buildings Located in the Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity
Zone” of Chapter 7A of the California Building Code

Sections 711A.1 and-FH-A2-are is added as follows to Chapter 7A pursuant to

Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

711A.1 Spark arrester. All structures having any chimney, flue, or stovepipe shall
be equipped with an approved spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or stovepipe is
attached to any fireplace, stove, barbecue, or other solid or liquid fuel burning

equipment or device.

. oca itions and Modifications to Section oun
~ §145.12076  Local Additi d Modificati Section 207 1206 “Sound

Transmission” of the California Building Code

(a) Section 4267 1206 of the California Building Code is adopted with
additions and modifications pursuant to Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106
of the Land Development Code. Section 4267 [ 206 is modified by adding

Section +20%5 1206.5.

-PAGE 18 OF 76-



§145.1207

§145.1501

(b) -

(0-2020-82)

Section 12075 M Additional Noise Regulations. For additional
noise regulations limiting the intrusion of exterior noise into buildings
based on land use standards, see Chapter 13, Article 2, Division 15 of the
Land Developmént Code. For éd:clitional noise regulations ]imi}ing the
intrusion of exterior noise into non-residential buildings, see Section 5.507

of the California Green Building Standards Code.

g. . Py !I! g !-g . E -! !- g !

)

(a)
(b)

()

Section 1207.4 item 1 is modified as follows: 1. The dwelling unit shall
have a living room of not less than 150 square feet (13,93 m2) of floor

provided for each occupant of the dwelling unit in excess of two,

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 15 “Roof Assemblies and Reef
Tep Rooftop Structures” of the California Building Code '

[No change in text.]

Sections 1501 through 1504 and Sections 15635; 1506, 1508, and 1509 are
adopted by reference without change pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the
Lz;nd Development Code.

Sections 1505.1, 1505.8, 1505.9, 1507.1, 1507.8, and 15079, 1510.7.1,
and 1511 are adopted by reference with modifications and additions
pursuant to Sectiong 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 19 OF 76-



§145.1505

§145.1507

(0-2020-82)

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1505 “Fire Classification” of
the California Building Code

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

«

Dey e de as follows: 1505.8 Building-integrated photovoltaic

Section 1505.8 is modified pursuant to Section 145,010 of the Land

Development Code as follows: 1505.9 Rooftop mounted photoveltaic
panel systems. Rooftop rack-mounted i hall be
tested, listed and identified with a fire classification in.accordance with
UL 1703 and UL 2703 and Section 145.1505(b).

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1507 “Requirements for Roof
Coverings” of the California Building Code

(a)
(b)

[No change in text.]
Section +507-146 1507.1.3 is added as follows pursuant to Section
145.0106 of the Land Development Code: 450446 1507.1.3. Roof

coverings shall be secured or fastened to the supporting roof construction,

LmaLAsMHEn&éniMndiﬁsaﬁnnﬂm&eﬂinniﬂlﬂﬁRooftonStmﬁumsld
he California Building Cod

Section 1510.7.1 is modifie rsuant to Section 145.0105 of the Land
Development Code as follows: 1510.7.1 Fire classification. Rooftop-mounted
photovoltaic panels and modules shall have a fire classification in accordance

with Section 1451505,

-PAGE 20 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

[

§145.151011 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1510 1511 “Rerooﬁng” of the
California Building Code

(a) Section 3536} 1511 1 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the
Land Development Code as follows: +546-+ M General. Materials
and methods df' application used for covering or replacing an existing roof
covering shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 15 of the 2643
California Building Code as adopted and arﬁended by the City of San
Diego.

(b)  Sections +5+0-34-+ 1511.1.1 through +548-3-2 1511.1.2 are added pursuant
to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(N +54034 151 1.1.1. All replacements, alterations, or repairs shall be
a Class “A" roof assembly.

2) +5464-2 1511.1.2. The entire roof shall be a Class “A” roof
assembly where more than twenty-five percent of the total roof
area is replaced, altered or repaired within any twelve-month
period.

(c) Sections +510-1-3 1511.1.3 through +546-4-5 1511.1.5 are added pursuant
to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(N 53013 1511.1.3. Wood shakes and shingles are prohibited
throughout the roof where more than twenty-five percent of the '
total roof area is replaced, altered or repaired within any twelve-
month period.

(2) 151014 1511.1.4. Wood shakes and shingles are not permitted,

except as provided in California Historical Building Code Section

-PAGE 21 OF 76-



§145.1803

(3)

(0-2020-82)

[

-y

8-408 and Land Development-Code Section +45-+510¢e)(H)
145.1511(c)(13,
353015 1511.1.5. No roof covering shall be applied over any

existing wood shakes or wood shingles.

Local Additions and Modifications to Sec¢tion 1803 “Geotechnical
Investigations” of the California Building Code

(2) through (e) [No change in teit.]

®

The Geologic Hazard Category and the Building, Structure and Facility

Class must be determined as follows when using Table 145.1803 to

determine whether a geotechnical investigation report is required due to

local geological hazards within the City of San Diego:

(D
(2)

[No change in text.]

City staff shall assign one of four Building, Structure and Facility
classes to each building, structure, or facility based on their use,
type of occupancy, number of occupants, and whether hazardous
materials are being used or stored in the building, structure, or
facility to determine whether a Geotechnical Investigation Report
is required.

(A) [No change in text.]

(B)  Class B includes the following developments, occupancy

groups, and structures provided they are not included in

Class A:
6) AMidevel . e

-PAGE 22 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

€0 All new structures requiring deep foundations, such
as piers or pilings.

i All structures containing the following occupancies

' pursuant to the California Building Code,

Chapter 3:

a. Group A, Divisions 1, 2, 3 and 4,

b. Group E, buildings and other structures
containing elementary school, secondary
school or day care facilities with an
occupant load greater than 250;

C. Group H, Divisions 1, 2, and 3; and

d. Group I, Divisions 2 and 3.

() All structures with an occupant load of more than
300 occupants as determined by Table 1004.1.2 of
the California Building Code and structures used for
public assembly assigned to Risk Category 11l in
Table 1604.5 of the California Building Code.

&)(v) Tanks, bins, hoppers, silos, and other storage
structures with more than 20,000-gallon capacity
intended to store toxic, hazardous, or flammable
contents that are not associated with a building,

structure, or facility in Class A.

-PAGE 23 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

{—H-r)gg)Tanks .bins, hoppers, silos, and other storage
structures over 35 feet high.

esin(vii)Towers over 35 feet high.

@)(viii)Retaining walls over the heights listed in the
following Subsections a. and b. with the height
measured from the top of the footing to the top of
the wall:

a. Retaining walls over 12‘ feet in height; and
b. Retaining walls over 8 feet in height
supporting a surcharge or retaining toxic,

hazardous, or flammable contents.

(C) through (D) [No change in text.]

(g)  [No change in text.]

Table 145.1803 (1)
Required Geotechnical Investigation
Type of Hazard Hazard Category Building, Structure,
and Facility Class

Fault Zones/Ground 11,12, 13 A,B.C,D
Rupture

21 threugh 24,22 A,B,C,D
Landslides/Potential
Slope Instability

-PAGE 24 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Liquefacti.on/Potential " RS
Ground Failure 31,32 A,B,C,D
4] through48,42, 43 A,B,C,D
Coastal Bluff Stability
44,45, 46,47, 48 A.B
5 54 (with-slope-greater-than-or
53;54 ‘ A,B,C.D
Vagiehl equak-to-4:1-or25%)
e
SE 5] ) :S ; Ei.l
Sleping Topegraphy 33 &.B
All Other Terrain
51,55 A
25%) A B; €
11 Other Conditi
55255 A-BC

Footnotes: {No change in text.]

§145.3101  Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 31 “Special Construction” of
the California Building Code

¢@)  Chapter 31 of the California Building Code is adopted by reference

without change pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 25 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

ol v with Figure 31 B-5-of the California Building Code.

-PAGE 26 OF 76-



§145.3203

§145.3301

§145.3303

efr "

ar (0-2020-82)

Local Additions to Chapter 32 “Eiiéro':fxc'hments Into The Public Right-of-
Way” ST

Section 3203 “Entrance Canopies” is added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the
Land Development Code:
(a) through (b) [No change inr tcxt.]-“ |
(c) 3203.3. Construction. Entrance canopy frames and supporting structural
members shall be constructed of corrosion-resistant metal designed and
constructed to withstand wind or other lateral loads and live loads as
required by Chapter 16 of the California Building Code. Entrance
cahopies shall also meet all of the- following requirements:
(1 Canopies shall be covered with an approve(i covering that
complies with Section 3405-4 3105.3 of the California Building
Code.
(2) through (4) [No change in text.]
(d) through (f) [No change in text.]

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 33 “Safeguards During
Construction” of the California Building Code

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Sections 3301 through 3302 and 3304 through 3343 3314 are adopted by
reference without change pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land
Development Code.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section 3303 “Demolition” of the
California Building Code

Section 3303-7 3307.8 is added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land

Development Code: 3363-+# 3307.8 Additional Demolition Regulations. The

-PAGE 27 OF 76-



§145.3801

§145.3802

(0-2020-82)

following regulations apply. to the demolition of a structure or building, in whole

or in part, or the removal of a structure trom a site:

| (a) through (j) [No change in text.]

Division 38: Additions and Modifications to Appendix N O of the

California Building Code

-Local Modifications and Additions to Appendix N O “Emergency Housing”
of the California Building Code

(@)

(b)

(c)

(d)

Appendix N Q of the California Building Code is adopted by reference
with modifications and additions pursuant to Sections 145.0105 and
145.61 06 of the Land Development Code.

[No change in text.]

The re.gt_llations in this Division and in Appendix N O shall be applicable ‘
to emergency housing established pursuant to the declaration of a shelter
crisis under California Government Code Section 8698.4 and located in
new or existing buildings or structures owned, operated, or constructed by,
for, or on behalf of, the City.

The regulations in this Division and in Appendix N O shall apply to
emergency housing operated during a declaration of a shelter crists. Other
than the requirements in Appendix NQ, as adopted with modifications
and additions by this Division, the emergency housing need not comply
with the requirements of the California Building Code for Group R

occupancies.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section N Q103 “Emergency Housing”
of the California Building Code

-PAGE 28 OF 76-



§145.3803

(2)

(b)

- (¢)

(0-2020-82)

Section NQ103 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to
: e BRTLRRN
Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.
The existing exception in Section NQ103.2.1 is numbered as Exception 1.

Exception 2 is added to Section NQ103.2.1 as follows:

2. Change in occupancy shall not mandate conformance with new

construction requirements set forth in the California Building Standards
Code, provided such change in occupancy meets the minimum fire and life

safety requirements set forth in Section 145.3805 of the Land

Development Code.

Section NQ103.6 Heating is modified as follows:

NOI103.6 Lighting, Ventilation, and Heating. All sleeping areas shall be
provided with adequate lighting, ventilation, and heating as determined by
the Building Official. When required, lighting and ventilation shall

comply with Section 145.3804.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section N 0106 “Tents and Membrane
Structures” of the California Building Code

(a)

(b)

Section NQ106 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to

Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

Section NO106.1 General is modified as follows:

(1) Section NQ106.1.1 Tents is modified as follows:
NQ106.1.1 Tents. Tents shall not be used to house occupants for
more than 7 consecutive days unless such tents are maintained with
tight wooden floors raised at least 4 inches (101.6 mm) above the

ground level and are equipped with baseboards on all sides to a

-PAGE 29 OF 76-



(c) .

(0-2020-82)

height of at least 6 inches (152.4 mm). Tents may be maintained
with concrete slabs with the finished surface at least 4 inches
(101.6 mm) above grade and equipped with curbs on all sides at
least 6 inches (152.4 mm) high. A tent shall not be considered a
suitable sleeping place when it is found necessary to provide
heating facilities in order to maintain a minimum temperature of 50
degrees Fahrenheit (10 degrees Celsius) within such tent during the
period of occupancy.

(2) Section NQ106.1.2 Membrane Structures is added with
modification as follows:

NO106.1.2 Membrane; Structures. Membrane structures installed
and/or asserﬂbled in accorda_nge with Chapter 31 of the California
Building Code and the California Fire Code may be permitted to
be used as emergehcy hdusing and emergency housing facilities.

Section NQIO&Z Membrane Structures In Use for More than 180 Days is

added as follows:

NQ106.2 Membrane Structures In Use for More Than 180 Days.

Membrane struct-ures in use for a period of more than 180 calendar days

shall comply with the California Fire Code and with the following:

(1) The membrane structure shall be inspected by a California
registered design professional at least once every 180 calendar
days from the date of final inspection prierte-initial-eceupaney to
ensure that the membrane structure continues to perform as

designed and initially erected. The registered design professional

-PAGE 30 OF 76-



(d)

(e)

®

(0-2020-82)

shall certify in writinglt}'{at‘ 'thé membrane structure continues to be
in compliance with the appiicable regulations of the California Fire
Code and California Building Code in effect on the date of final
inspection prieste-initial-eceupaney. Inspection records shall be
kept and shall be made available for verification by the Fire Code
Official and the Building Official.
(2) [No change in text.]
Section NQ106.3 Means of Egress is added as follows:
NO106.3 Means of Egress. Means of egress for membrane structures used
as emergency housing shall be determined based on the occupant load
specified in Section NQ103.3.
Section NQ106.4 Storage of Flammable Materials Within Tents or
Membrane Structures is added as follows:
NQO106.4 Storage of Flammable Materials Within Tents or Membrane
Structures. Flammable materials, including the possessions of occupants
and users stored in tents and membrane structures shall not obstruct
required aisle widths between beds or other furnishings. The quantity of
stored flammable materials within a membrane structure not protected
with an automatic fire sprinkler system, or within tents, shall be subject to
the approval of the Fire Code Official.
Section NQ106.5 Flammable or Combustible Liquids is added as follows:
NO106.5 Flammable or Combustible Liquids. The possession or storage
of any flammable or combustible liquids or gases shall not be permitted

inside a tent or membrane structure except for intact cigarette lighters. The

-PAGE 31 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

use of any type o"f.opeﬂ flame inside a tent or membrane structure is
prohibited unless e;ch separate use is approved by the Fire Code Official.
(g) Section NQ106.6 Fire Departmeﬁt Access is added as follows:
NO106.6 Fire Department Access. Fire Department access to tents or
membrane structures used for emergency housing shall be in compliance
with Section 503, Section 504, and Appendix D of the California Fire
Code and approved by the Fire Code Official.
(h) Section NO106.7 Water Supply is added as follows:
NQO106.7 Water Supply. An approved fire protection water supply
complying with Section 507 of the California Fire Code, or as approved
by the Fire Code Official. shall be provided for each tent or membrane
structure, group of structures, or premises used for emergency housing.

§145.3804  Local Addition of Section N Q111 “Emergency Housing Lighting and
Ventilation Requirements” to the California Building Code

(a) Section NO111 Emergency Housing Lighting and Ventilation
Réquirements i; added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land
Development Code.

(b) Section NQ111.1 Emergency Housing Lighting Requirements is added as
follows:

NQ111.1 Emergency Housing Lighting Requirements. Buildings or
structures used for emergency housing shall either be provided with
natural light by means of exterior glazed openings in accordance with

Section 1205.2 of the California Building Code or shall be provided with

-PAGE 32 OF 76-



.. §145.3805

(c)

(0-2020-82)

artificial light i-n accordance with Section 1205.3 of the California
Building Code. S

Section NQ111.2 Ventilation is added as follows:

NQ111.2 Ventilation. Buildings or structures used for emergency housing
shall either be provided with natural ventilation in accordance with

Section 1203.5 of the California Building Code or mechanical ventilation

in accordance with the California Mechanical Code.

Local Addition of Section N Q112 “Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety
Requirements” to the California Building Code

(a)

(b)

(c)

Sectibh NOI112 Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety Requirements is
added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.
Section NQ112.1 Fire Séparation Distance is added as follows:

NO112.1 Fire Separation Distance. Buildings or structures used for
emergency housing, including slgeping cabins, shall be constructed and
located on a lot in compliance with the regulations in Chapters 6 and 7 of
the California Building Code, based on their fire separation distance.
During a declared shelter crisis, the fire separation distances are permitted
to be measured to the existing buildings on the adjacent parcels ratﬁer than
to the interior lot lines, pfovided the open spaces within the fire separation
distance remain clear and unobstructed for the duration of the declared
shelter crisis.

Section NO1 12.2I Fire Separation Distance, Buildings on the Same Lot is

added as follows:

-PAGE 33 OF 76-



(d)

(e)

(M

(2)

(0-2020-82)

NO112:2 Fire !_Sep_ar?‘t,idn Distance, Buildings on the Same Lot. Buildings
or structures |;Sed for emergency housing, including sleeping cabins, shall
be separated from each other and from other buildings on the same lot as
set forth in Section 705.3 of the California Building Code.

Section NO1 12'.3 Means of Egr'c‘ss fs added as follows:

NO112.3 Means of egress. Buildings or structures used for emergency

housing shall be provided with means of egress in compliance with

Chapter 10 of the California Building Code.

Sectior; NQ112.4 Emergency Escape and Rescue is added as fotlows:
NO1 i2.4 En'mergenc;f Escape and Rescue. Each area of a building or
structure used for sleéping accommodations in emergency housing shall
contain an emergency escape and rescue opening in accordance with
Section 1030 of the Califoﬁia Building Code.

Section NO112.5 émoke Alarms is added as follows:

NO112.5 Smoke Alarms. Buildings or structures with sleeping

accommodations used for emergency housing shall be equipped with
single station smoke alarms installed in accordance with the requirements
of Sectibn 907.2.11-and Section 1103.8.3 of the California Fire Code.
Section NO112.6 Carbon Monoxide Alarms is added as follows:
NQ112.6 Carbon Monoxide Alarms. Buildings or structures with sleeping
accommodations used for emergency housing and equipped with fuel-
burning appliances shall be provided with carbon monoxide detection in
accordance with Section 915 of the California Fire Code and the

California Building Code.

-PAGE 34 OF 76-



(h) -

M

0

(k)

(0-2020-82)

Section NQ112.7 Fire Alarm is added as follows:

‘NO112.7 Fire Alarm: A manual fire alarm system capable of arousing

sleeping occupants désigned and constructed in compliance with Section
907.2.10.1 of the California Fire Code and the California Building Code
shall be installed in buildihgs, structures, or groups of buildings or
structures, used for emergency housing and having a gross floor area of
more than 2,500 square feet or having the capacity for more than 49
sleeping occupants. |
Exception: Individual buildings or structures in a group of
buildings or structures with sufficient separation distances to allow
each building or structure to function independently in case of a
- fire shall have their own indi\;ridual fire alarm systems, as approved
by the Fire Code Official.
Section NQ112.8 Automatic Fire Sprinklers is added as follows:
NQ112.8 Automatic Fire Sprinklers. Fire sprinklers shall be provided for
new and existing buildings or structures used for emergency housing that
provide sleeping accommodations, as required by Section 903.3 of the
California Fire Code and the California Building Code.
Section NQ112.9 Fire Extinguishers is added as follows:
NQ112 9 Fire Extinguishers. Portable fire extinguishers shall be provided
in accordance with Section 906.1 of the California Fire Code and the
California Building Code;
Section NQ112.10 Flammable or Combustible Liquids is added as

follows:

-PAGE 35 OF 76-



(0©-2020-82)

NO112.10 F l_ammql?ie or Cenﬁbu‘stibie Liquids. The possession or storage
of any flammable of combustible liquids or gases sh;all not be permitted
except for intact cigarette lighters. The use of any type of open flame
indoors is proh_ibited unless each separate use is approved by the Fire
Code Official.

(1) Section NQ112.11 Storage is added as follows:

NO112.11 Storage. Flammable materials, including the possessions of
occupants, usei's, and staff, shall not obstruct required aisle widths
between beds or other furnishings and shall not be stored in attics, under-
floor spaces, or within other concealed spaces of buildings or structures
with sleeping accommodations used for emergency housing.

(m)  Section NQ112.12 Fire Department Access is added as follows:
NQO112.12 Fire Department Access. Fire Department access to buildings
and premises useci for emergency housing shall be in compliance with
Section 503, Section 504, and Appendix D of the California Fire Code,

- and-approved by the Fire Code Official.

(n) Section NO112.13 Water Supply is added as follows:

NO112.13 Water Supply. An approved fire protection water supply
complying with Section 507 of the California Fire Code, or as approved
by the Fire Code Official, shall be provided for each building or structure,

group of structures or premises used for emergency housing.

-PAGE 36 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

§145.3806  Local Addition of Section N Q113 ‘?Eine'rgency Housing Alternatives and
Modifications” to the California Building Code

(a) Section NOQ113 Emefgency ﬁousing Alternatives and Modifications is
| " added pursuant to.Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.
(b) Sectioﬁ -Ngl 13.1 Alternatives and Modifications is added as follows:
NOI113.1 Altemnatives and Modifications. Alternatives and/or
modifications that are reasonably equivalent to the requirements in
Appendix NQ and this Division may be granted by the Building Official
and Fire Code Official for individual- buildings or structures used for
emergency housing.
§145.3905  Definitions
Except as otherwise provided, for the purposes of this Division:
Au}omated External Deﬁbrillator or AED [No change in text.]
mew
change of occupancy shall not be considered an alteration for putnoses of this
§145.3910  New Construction and Alterations Requiring AEDs

(a) [No change in text.]

()  Priorto approval of final inspection, AEDs shall be placed in all existing
(1) Thebuilding un ing alteration was constructed prior to
January 1, 2017,
()  Theaccumulated value of the alierations within the building within
one calendar year is $100,000 or more; ot

-PAGE 37 OF 76-



§145.4005

(0-2020-82)

() Thedlle _ rations are within a public assembly occupancy use,
including au | ditoriums and performing arts and movie theaters,
(¢)  The requirements in Section 145.3910(b) shall not apply to the following:
(1) Asencral aculc care hospital, acule psychialric hospital, skilled
nursing facility or special hospital licensed under Section 1250(a),
(b, (), ox () of the California Health and Safety Code; and
(2}  Anexisting AED that is located within a common area of the
building described in subdivision (b), such as the main entry lobby
| or similar location.
)(d) AEDs shall be conspicuously placed and readily accessible in the event of
an emergency. AEDs shall be mounted such that the top of the AFD is no

more than five (5) feet above floor level.

Table 145-3910

s Occupancy Group Occupant Load

Group A “Assembly” 300
Group B “Business” 200
Group E “Educational” 200
Group F “Factory” 200

13 M kil _2'99
Group I “Institutional” 200
Group M “Mercantile” 200
Group R “Residential™! 200

l [Nb change in text.]

2

Exeluding-parking-garages
Tier I1-Visitable Uﬁit Design Standards
(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

(e) At least one interior accessible route of travel shall be provided in

compliance with California Building Code Section H20-A-} 1119A as

-PAGE 38 OF 76-



§146.0103

§146.0104

(0-2020-82)

1

may be amended. The interior route of trave} shall connect an accessible

entrance to the following rooms located on the primary entry level:

(1) through (3) [No change in text.]

(f) through (i) [No change in text.]

Interpretation of the Electrical Regulations

(a)

(b)

The language used in this Article and in the 2816 2019 California

~ Electrical Code which is made a part of this Article by reference, is

intended to convey the common and accepted meaning familiar to the
electrical industry.

[No change in text.]

Adoption of the California Electrical Code-

(a)

(b)

The 2046 2019 California Electrical, Code published by the Catifornia
Building Standards Commission (BSC), as amended by the Califormia
Department of Housing and Coinmunity Development (HCDY); the
Division of the State Architect-Access Compliance (DSA/AC); the State
Office of Statewide Planning and Development (OSHPD?3); and the State
Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference and made a part of this
Article as if fully set forth, except as otherwise provided in this Article.
The regulations se referenced are the standard for electrical installations
regulated by this Article. A copy of the 2646 2019 California Electrical
Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as Document No.
00-26897-2

When reference is made to the California Electrical Code, it shall be the

2016 2019 California Electrical Code, California Code of Regulations

-PAGE 39 OF 76-



§146.0105

§146.0106

§146.0107

, (0-2020-82)

Title 24, Part 3, as published by the California Building Standards

Commission. -

“(c) [No change in text.]

Portions of the California Electricat Code Not Adopted

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Electrical

Code are not adopted by the City pf San Diego:

(a) Article 230, Services, Section 43 230,43, Wiring Methods for 660 1000
Volts, Nominal or Léss, numbers (1) “Open Wiring on Insulators™ and (7)
“Service-entrance Cables” are not adopted.

(b) (No change in text.]

Portions of the California Electrical Code Adopted With Modifications

The following Sections of the 2016 2019 California Electrical Code are adopted

by the City of San Diego with modifications:

of PV-Systems-on-Buildings: The 2019 Califoria Electrical Code is adopted

Portions of the California Electrical Code Adopted With Additions

The following Sections of the 2046 2019 California Electrical Code are adopted

by the City of San Diego with additions:

-PAGE 40 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

-PAGE 4! OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

‘e
¢

l I Pl l.ﬁ |' ] ! l ].I. .I-' S I. ;95.12 “P 3 I FG I' 9

; ) Soinbiide

v

S . ;QS_IEEE;B; ’F] -Ga,"ﬁ S. v E] . ] S l . i l .!

it o difont Seeti  0106-and-146.0107

- this-seetion; dwelling has-the-same-meaning-as-in-the-California

Residential-Cod | the California Buildine Code.

§147.0103  Adoption of the California Plunibing Code

(a)

(b

Except as provided in Sections 147.0104 through 147.0108, the 2616 2019
California Plumbing Code, published by the California Bﬁilding Standards
Commission (BSC), and as amended by the California Department of
Housing and Community Development (HCD); the Division of the State
Architect-Access Compliance (DSA/AC); the State Office of Statewide
Health Planning and Development (OSHPD3); and the State Fire Marshal
(SFM); a copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

Document O0-20897-3 _, is adopted by reference.

When reference is made to the California Plumbing Code, it shall be the

2046 2019 California Plumbing Code, California Code of Regulations

-PAGE 42 OF 76-



§147.0104

§147.0105

- §147.0106

(0-2020-82)

Title 24, Part 5 as published by the California Building Standards
Commission.
(c) [No change in text.]

Modifications to the California Plumbing Code Adopted by the City of
San Diego L

. The following Sections of the 2846 2019 California Plumbing Code are modified

by the City of San Diego:

(a) . Chapter6;Seection-6091astallation; Testing, Unions-and-Location;
ﬂMggleMﬂglM

(b)  Chapter 11, Storm Drainage, Section +104-+ 1101,2. Where Required,
Primary Reof Drainage; Section 160454 1101.6.1 Discharge.

Additions to the California Plumbing Code Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Plumbing
Code are added by the City of San Diego:
(a) {No change in text.]

)
€)(b) Chapter 12, Section 4208-73-1 1208.8.2.1 Gas Pressure Regulators,

Adoption of Appendices to California Plumbing Code

@  Thefollowi ixCl ¢ the 2016 California Plumbine Cod

-PAGE 43 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

&

&) " The following Appendix Chapters of the 2046 2019 California Plumbing
Code not adopted by a State agency as identified in Land Development Code
Section 147.0103 an_d in the adoption matrices of the 2046 2019 California
Plumbing Code are not adopted by the City of San Diego:

(1) through (7) [No change in text.]

(8)  Appendix M — Peak Water Demand Calculator

California Plumbing Cod

(a)  Section 422.2 of the Califoria Plumbing Code is adopted with
modifications pursuant to Section 147.0104 of the Land Development

Code,

-PAGE 44 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

All single-uses tojlet faclitis in any business establishment, place of

public accomimodation, or s_,;,mw

- identified as all-gender toilet facilitics by signage that complies with

Section 11B-703.7.2.6 of the California Building Code and designated for

EFor the purposes of Section 422.2.1, “single-user toilet facility” means a

 toilet facility with no more than one water closet and one urinal with a
he user, |

§147.021311 Local Modifications and Additions to Section 1101 “General” Storm
Drainage Regulations of the California Plumbing Code

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

§147.0212  Local additions to Section 4208-7 1208.8 “Gas Pressure Regulators” of the
California Plumbing Code .

‘Section 1208-73-1 1208.8.2.1 of the Califormia Plumbing Code 1s medified added
as follows: 1208734 1_29_8_._8_,_2_1 Apprcm)'ved gas pressure regulators shall be
installed and used in locations approved by the Building Official.

§147.0405  Retrofit upon Bathreom Alteration

Sections 147.0304 and 147.0305 of the Additional Plumbing 5ggglgjions_£qﬁ
Water and Energy Conservation,

L

-PAGE 45 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

-§148.0103°  Adoption of the Cal'ifor:rfli'n' Mechanical Code

§148.0104

§148.0105

§148.0106

(a)

(b)

(c)

Except as provided in Land Déifciopment Code Section 148.0104, the
2046 2019 California Mechanical Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC); and as amended by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD), the
Division of the State Architect-Access Compliance (DSA/AC); the State
Ofﬁce of Statewide Health Planning and Development (OSHPD3); and
the State Fire Marshal (SFM); a copy of which is on file in the office of
the City Clerk as Document No. 00-208974 , 1s adopted by
reference.

When reference is made to the California Mechanical Code, it shall be the
2016 2019 éalifomia Mechanical Code, California Code of Regulations
Title 24, Part 4 as published by the California Building Standards
Commission.

[No change in text.]

Portions of the California Mechanical Code Not Adopted

The following portions of the 2846 2019 California Mechanical Code are not

adopted:

Chapter 1 - Division 1I, Administration.

Modifications to the California Mechanical Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The 2046 2019 California Mechanical Code is adopted with no modifications.

Additions to the California Mechanical Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The 2046 2019 California Mechanical Code is adopted with no additions.

-PAGE 46 OF 76-



§148.0107

§149.0103

ST (0-2020-82)

B A

Adoption of Appendices to California Mechanical Code
Appendix Chapters of the 2046 2019 California Mechanical Code are not
adopted.

Adoption of the California Residential Code

(a) .The26+6 2019 California Residential Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by the State
Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD 1, HCD
1/AC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference, except
as otherwise provided in this Article of the Land Development Code,
Divisions 2 through 45. A copy of the 2046 2019 California Residential
Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as Document No.
00-20897%5___ .

(b) When reference is made to the California Residential Code, it shall be the
2046 2019 California Residential Code, California Code of Reguiations
Title 24, Pén 2.5, as published by the California Building Standards

- Commission.

{c) Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2016

2019 California Residential Céde is made a part of this Article as if fully
set forth in this Article except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2
through 45.

((i) Numbering of Sections and Subsections 1n Divisions 2 through 45 of this
Article is cross referenced to Sections in the 2846 2019 California
Residential Code.

(e) The adoption of the 2046 2019 California Residential Code shall in no

-PAGE 47 OF 76-



§149.0104.

§149.0105

(0-2020-82)

way limit: pro-];?:i‘?‘it, if;_l'pede,‘ 0_1:£r§vcnt the City Council from adopting
ordinances lirr;iti’rln'g‘(')r})revénting the issuance of any type, number, or
geographical distribution of permits for construction or demolition of any
- ..facility for which a permit is required.

() - [No change ii1 text.]

Portions of the California Residential Code Not Adopted by the City of San
Diego

The following Séctions or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Residential
Code have not been adopted by the City of San Diego:
(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

Modifications to the California Residential Code Adopted by the City of San
Diego ' .

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Residential

Code are modified by the City of San Diego:

()(a) Chapter 3, Section R301.2, Climatic anci Geographic Design Criteria;
Section R319.1, Address Numbers Jdentification; R322, Flood Resistant
Construction; Sectionr R326-Swimming Poels;-Spas-and-Het Tubs;

- Section R324.4.2 Fire Classification; Section R324.5.2 Fire Classification;
Section R337.1.3.1, Application Date and Where required Required;
Section R337.2, Definitions; Section R337.5.4, Roof Gutters and
Downspouts; Section R337.8, Exterior Windows and Doors.

te){b) Chapter 9, Section 902.1.5, Roof Covering Materials;; Section R902.2.1,
Wood Shingles;; Section R902.2.2, Wood Shakes, Section R902.4,

Photovoltaic Panels and Roof Modules; Section R.905.1.3, Roof Covering

-PAGE 48 OF 76-



§149.0106

(0-2020-82)

-Class A; ROO7F2 Section R908.1.2, Replacement Roof Covering, Class

A, Additions; R997+3-Section R908.1.3, Wood Shake, Shingles Reroof;
RO07-1-4 Section R908. 1.4, Wood Shake, Shingles, Historical Buildings;

ROO71-5 Section R908.1.5, Reroofing Over Wood Roofs.

Additions to the California Residential Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2046 2019 California

Residential Code by the City of San Diego:

(a)

(b) .

[No change in text.]

Chapter 3, Section R309.4.1 Backup Power for Automatic Garage Door
Openers, Sectiqn R320.2 Voluntary Accessibility program; Seetion
Swimming-Peel-Barrer; Section R329, Structural Tests and Special

Inspections; Section R332, Encroachments into the Public Right-of-Way;

Section R333, Safeguards During Construction; Seetion R337.1-3;

. Exeeption5; Section R337.1.3.1, Exception 2.3; Section R337.2, Local

Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zoné; Section R337.3.6.1, Alternative
Materials, Designs or Methods of Construction; Section R337.3.6.2,
Modifications; Section R337.5.4, Roof Gutters and Downspouts; Section
R337.5.5, Drip Edge f]ashing; Section R33+8-22-4 R337.8.2.1.1, Vinyl

Windows; Section R337.11, Spark Arrester; Section 337:12-Glazing

Matertals-tn-Sleytights; R341, Séund Transmission Control.

- -PAGE 49 OF 76-



§149.0107 .

§149.0108

(0-2020-82)

(c) .Chapter 4, Sectlon 49-1—5 R&QL,;, Geotechmcal Investigations; Section
R401.6, Geotechnical Reports; Section R401.7, Notice of Geologic
Hazards.

(d) [No change in text.] .

Adoption of Appendices to the California: Residential Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 26+6 2019 California Residential Code

are adopted by the City of San Diego: |

(a) Appendix Chapter H, Patio Cover-s.

(»  Appendix Chapter Q, Tiny Houses.

)(c) Appendix Chapter S, Straw Bale Construction.

(d)  Appendix V. Swimming Pool Safety Act.

Applicability of the California Building Code to Existing Buildings and
Structures Regulated by the California Reésidential Code

(a) The legal occupancy of any building or structure existing on the date of
adoption of the 2646 2019 California Residential Code shall be permitted
to continue without change, except as is specifically regulated by Chapters
3,4, and 4-5 of the 2046 2019 California Existing Building Code, the
California Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building Official
for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

(b) [No change in text.]

{c) Buildings and structures, and parts thereof, shall be maintained in a safe
.and sanitary condition. Devices or safeguards which are required by the
2646 2019 California Building Code shall be maintained in conformance

with the code edition under which installed. The owner shall be

-PAGE 50 OF 76-



§149.0201

(0-2020-82)

responsible for the maintenance of buildings and structures. To determine

o SR TTRAS )
) B T

compliance with this éubseﬁl‘idn, -li‘.le Building Official shall have the
authority to require a building or structure to be re-inspected. The
requirements of the Building Regulations shall not provide the basis for
removal or abrogation of fire protection and safety systems and devices in
existing building or structures, -

Local Additions to Chapter 2 “Definitions” of the California Residential
Code

¢a)  Chapter 2 of the California Residential Code is adopted by reference with
edditiens without change pursuant to Section 149.0103-and-1+49-6106 of

the Land Development Code.

+45-04 %ﬂ'gwweﬁde‘ ; i icipal-C O
@  SectionR202 has! topted with addit Seti
.0106-0f the San DiesoMunicisal Code.

Leeal Meodifications-an PE] it it L2

-PAGE 51 OF 76-



§149.0301

§149.0302

(0-2020-82)

Code LIVE WORKUMNITA uaitinwhiel . ¥ . 4
for-other than Jivi lefined-and-subi he limitati

33 .

Local Additions to Chapter 3 “Building Planning” of the California
Residential Code

(a)
(b)

[No.change in text.]

Sections R30+ R302 through R308, R310 through R318, R321, R324
through R325:-R334 R325 through R336, and R338 through R340 are
adopted by reference without change pursuantto Section

145:0183149.0103 of the Land Development Code.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section R301.2 “Climaticand
Geographic Design Criteria”

(a)
®)

(c)’

[No chanée in text.]
Section R301.2 is adopted with modifications as follows. Buildings shall
be constructed in accordance with the provisions of the California
Residential Code as limited by the provisions of Section R301. Additional
criteriaare outlined in Table 149.0302 of the Land Development Code,
[No change in text.]

Table 149.0302

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 52 OF 76-



&

(0-2020-82)

§149.0309 LmalAddmnnmSmnnn_RiﬁﬂGﬂageund___Cm
Section R309.4 is adopted x_\_f dﬂnmn_&guxmautimmmwﬂm_qﬂh:
Land Development Code. Section R309.4. L is added as follows: R309.4.1,
Backup power for automatic garage door.openers. Where residential garages are
equipped with automatic garage door openers, the residential automatic gatage
door opener shall include a battery backup fanction that is desiened to operate in a
manner 50 that the automatic garage door opener is operational without
interruption during an electrical outage,

§149.0319  Local Modifications to Section R319.1 “Address-numbers [dentification” of
- the California Residential Code

Section R319.1 of the California Residential Code Building-Cede is adopted as
amended in San Diego Municipal Code Section 95.0209 for building addressing
requirements for the City of San Diego.

§149.0324  Local Modifications and Additions to Section R324 “Solar Energy Systems”
of the California Residential Code

(a)  Section R324.4.2 is modified as follows pursuant to Section 149.0105 of
e v le: R324.4 ] I ion -
mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall have the same fire classification
required in Section 149,0902(a),
(b)  Section R324.5.2 is modified as follows pursuant to Section 149.0105 of
the Land Development Code: R324.5.2, Fire classification. Building-
integrated photovoltaic systems shall have the same fire classification

required in Section 149,0902(a).

-PAGE 53 OF 76-



(O-2020-32)

. Leeal—r&d&twn—and-l\hd:ﬁeat—wﬂs-te See&en—!&%%w&mmg—l’eols—s-pm
and-Hot-Tubs?-to-the-California Residential Code '

@)

@

e
| 1 . nend LA; ] it |
meansany sirueture-intendedfor swimming-or recreational bathing that

can-containwater over 1 8-inchesin-depth-and-is-not tetally eontained

Thisinehidesi ol ¢ and 1 owimnmi

_&1}

)

-PAGE 54 OF 76-



§149.0337

7]

(0-2020-82)

peﬂable—ﬂmha&m&eadee—fer—nea—eemmemakusees—a—sm&g—peel

a..,

byﬂet—mefe-ﬁhaﬂ-ﬂafeeewnef-fumihes-aﬁd-thewgﬁm

Local Additions and Modifications to Section R337 “Materials and Methods
for Exterior Wildfire Exposure” of the California Residential Code

(a)

te)b)

()

[No change in text.]

Section R337.2 1s adoﬁted by reference with modifications and additions

pursuant to Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development

- Code as follows: Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones

shall mean the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones as designated on the
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Map — Local Responsibility Areas
adopted pursuant to Section 55.9401 of thé Land Development Code.
Section R337.3.6 is adopted with additions pursuant to Section 149.0106
of the Land Development Code. Sections R337.6.1 and R337.3.6.2 are
added as follows:

(N R337.3.6.1, Alternative Materials, Designs or Methods of

. Construction. The Building Official may approve the use of

-PAGE 55 OF 76-



(2)

(0-2020-82)

altematfvei materialsl,. Eit_ésign.s or methods of construction pursuant
to Sect-io'n 12'9.0109 of tllle Land Development Code.

R337.3.6.2, Modifications. The Building Official may modify the
provisions of Section ﬁ337 of the California Residential Code for
site specific conditions in accordance with Section 129.0104(a)(5)
of the Land Development Code. When required by the Building
Official, a fire protection plan shall be submitted in accordance

with the California Fire Code, ehapter-Chapter 49.

¢e)(d) Section R337.5 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to

REo)

Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(N

@

Section R337.5.4 is modified as follows: R337.5.4, reof Roof
Gutteré and Downspouts. Roof gutters shall be constructed to
prevént the accumulation of leaves and debris in the gutter. All
roof gutters and downspout.s shall be constructed of
noncombustible materials.

Section P_\BZ",'J‘.S.S is added as f;)lléws: R337.5.5, Drip Edge
F!asﬁing. When drip edge flashing is used at the free edges of

-~

roofing materials, it shall be non-combustible.

Section R337.8 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to

Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development Code. Section

R337.8.2.1 is added as follows: R337.8.2.1.1, Glazing frames made of

vinyl materials shall have welded corners, metal reinforcement in the

interlock area, and be certified to the most current edition of

ANSVAAMA/NWWDA 101/1.8.2 structural requirements.

-PAGE 56 OF 76-



§149.0902

(0-2020-82)

oy

() Section R387.,},1,.is‘g1dd¢d pursuant to Section 149.0106 of the Land

- Devclopment Code as follows: R337.11, Spark Arrester. All structures

having any chimney, flue, or stovepipe shall be equipped with an
approved spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or stovepipe is attached to

any fireplace, stove, barbecue, or other.solid or liquid fuel burning

equipment or device.

Local Additions and Modifications to Section R902.1 “Roof Classification” of
the California Residential Code

(a) through (¢) [No change in text.]

(d)

Section R902.4 is adopted by reference and modified as follows: R902.4
Reof-top Rooftop mounted solar photovoltaic panels and modules. Roof-
top mounted photovoltaic panels and modules installed on or above the
roof coveringshall be tested, listed and identified with a fire classification
in accordance with UL 1703 and UL 2703. Class A, B or C photovoltaic
panels gsystems and modules shall be installed in areas designated by
Section R902 of the CalifomiavResidentiall Code, in jurisdictions

designated by law as requiring their use or where the edge ofthe roof is

. less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot line. When located in the Very High

-PAGE 57 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Fire Hazard S_gveﬁty Zone Map — Local Responsibility Areas adopted

. pursuant to Section 55.9401 of the San Diego Municipal Code, roof-top

-mounted photovoltaic panels and modules shall have a minimum fire

classification rating of Class A.

§1410.0103 ° Adoption of the California Green Building StandardsCode

(a)

- (b)

(c)

@

(€)

The 2046 2&7 California Green Building Standards Code, published by
the California Building Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by
the State Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD), is
adopted by reference except as otherwise provided in this Article. A copy
of the 2046 2019 California Green.Building Standards Code is on file in
the officeof the City Clerk as Document No. OO-20897-6

When reference is made to the California Green Building Standards Code,
it shall be the 2046 2019 California Green Building Standards Code,
California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11, as published by the
California Building Standards Commission.

Each of the regulations, provision;, conditions, and terms of the 2846
2019 California Creen Building Standards Code is made a part of this
Article as if fully set forth in this Article.

Numbering of Sections and Subsections in this Article is cross referenced
to Sections in the 2046-2019 California Green Building Standards Code.
The adoption of the 2046 2019 California Green Building Standards Code
shall in no way limit, prohibit, .impede, or prevent the City Council from
adopting ordinances limiting or preventing the issuance of any type,

number, or geographical distribution of permits for construction or

-PAGE 58 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

demolition‘(‘)f‘ any facility for g:hi;qh_a pemﬁt is required.
) [No change.in text.j
§1410.0107 . Adoption of Appendices to the California Green Building Standards Code
Appendix Chapters to the 26+6 2019 Calitoraia Green Building Standards Code
are adopted as follows: The Residential Voluntary measures of the California
Green Building Standards Code, Appendix Chapter A4, Residential Voluntary
Measures, Section A4.305.1 "‘Graywater.”

§1410.0403 Local Modifications to Section A4.305 “Water Reuse Systems” of the
California Green Building Standards Code

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Section A4.305.1 is adopted with the following modifications. All new
—residential buildings that are within the scope of the California Residential
Code shall be constru;:ted té. include waste piping to discharge gray water
from clothes washers to a piace where it may be used for outdoor
irrigation, in compliance with Section 562 1503 of the California
Plumbiﬁg Code.

§1411.0103 Adoption of the California Existing Building Code

(a) The 2016 M California Ekisting Building Code, published by the
California Building Standards Commission (BSC), as amended by the
State Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD 1,
HCD 1/AC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference,
except as otherwise provi;led in this Article of the Land Development

Code, Divisions 2 through 4-5 and Divisions 17 and 18. A copy of the

-PAGE 59 OF 76-



-(b)

- {c)

()

(¢}

6]

(0-2020-82)

LA

- 2046-2019 California iﬂjxistingBu_il‘d‘ing Code is on file in the office of the

City Clerk as Document No, O0O-20897-7 .

When reference is made to the California Existing Building Code, it shall
be the 2646 2019 California Existing Building Code, California Code of
Regulations Title 24, Part 10, as ;:ﬁt;lished by the California Building
Standards Commission. . .

Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 286

2019 California Existing Building Code is made a part of this Article as if

fully set forth in this Article except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2
through 4-5 and Divisions 17 and 18.

The numbering of Sections and Subsections in Divisions 2 through 4-3 and

Divisions 17 gnd_j__& of this Article is cross-referenced to Sections in the

2016 2019 California Existing Building Code.

“The adoption of the 2046 2019 California Existing Building Code shall in

no way lin;nit, prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council from adopting

ordinances limiting or preventing the issuance of any type, number, or

gebgréphical distribution of permits for construction or demolition of any

facility for which a permit is required.

The Building Official is only authorized to enforce amendments to the

26816 2019 Califomnia Existing Building Code made by the following State

agencies:

(1) through (3) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 60 OF 76-



4

(0-2020-82)

E,

§1411.0104  Portions of the California anstmg Bmldmg Code Not Adopted by the City of
San Diego

§1411.0105

The following Sections or Subsections ot‘the 2946 2019 Califorma Existing

Building Code have not been adoptcd by the (,1ty of San Diego:

@
()

()

[No change in text ]

Chapter 3, Seeheﬂ-%@l—4—E-xeept+eﬂ+ Section 38442 301.3.2 Work

Area. Compliance Method; Section 36413 301.3.2 Performance

Comphiance Method.

Chapters 5 6 through M@ 15.

Modifications to the California Exnstmg Bulldmg Code Adopted by the City
of San Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Existing

Building Code are modified by the City of San Diego:

(a)

(b)

(©

(d)

[No change in text.]

Chapter 3, Section 301.1, General, S¢ction 301,3, Alteration, Addition or
Change of Occupancy, including the exception; Section 3623 302.4,
Existing Materials.

Chapter 4, See&elFM—I—Pcepaifs—Geneml- Section 40].3, Repairs, Flood
HAZEH‘QAI‘.G&&

Chapter 3, Section 4822 502.3, Flood Hazard Areas; Section 4632 503.2,

Flood Hazard Areas; Section 404:5 405.2.5, Flood Hazard Areas.

tdi(e) Appendix, Chapter Al, Section A102.1, Scope, General.

-PAGE 61 OF 76-



§1411.0106

(0-2020-82)

FEEN

Additions to the California Existing Building Code Adopted by the City of
San Diego

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2046 2019 California

. Existing Building Code by the City of San Diego:

(a) [No change in text.]

o) ] : ' : ' .8 dat

§1411.0107

$1411.0301

Adoption of Appendices to the California Existing Building Code

The followihg Appendix Cﬁaptérs of the 2046 2019 California Existing Building
Code are adapted by the City of San Diego:

(a) through (¢) [No change in text.]

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 “Provisions for All
Compliance Methods” of the California Existing Building Code

(a) Chapter 3 of the 2046 California Existing Building Code is adopted by
reference with modifications and additions pursuant to Sections 1411.0105
and 1411.0106 of the Land Development Code.

(b}  Section 301.43, including the exception, 1 of the California Existing
Building Code, is adopted by reference with modifications pursuant to

Section 1411.0105 of the Land Development Code.

-PAGE 62 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Sé(;;i;)rg 39]-.-]-7-'_,1135 modified as follows: 301.4 3, General—The
repairyaAlicration, addition or change of occupancys, The
alteration, addition or change of occupancy releea&eﬂ of all

| existing buildings shall comply with Section 301.43.1. Where-the -
Colifornie Existing Building Cod . desation ofthe

| seismicf - e istine buildi bi

The exception to Section 301.3 is modified as follows: Exception:
Subiest to the anproval of the Building Official. alterations
complying with the laws in existence at the time the building or the
affected portion of the building was built are in compliance with
the provisions of the current California Existing Building Code,
New structural members added as part of the alteration shall

ly with the California Existing Building Code. Thi .

shall not apply to an alteration that constitutes a substantial
improvement to an existing building in a flood bazard area, which
alterations shall comply with Section 1411.0503 of the Land
Devclopmens Code. This exception shall not apply to the structural

provisions of Chapter S of the California Existing Building Code.

-PAGE 63 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

§1411.0302 Local Modlﬁcanons and Deletiens-Additions to Section 302 “General
Provisions” of the Cahforma Enstmg Building Code

.. (a)

(b)

Section 362:3 302 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by

 reference with modifications and additionsg pursuant to Sectiong 1411.0105

and 1411.0106 of the Land Development Code.

| Section 3623 302.4 is modified as follows: 362:3 3024, Existing

mat-e.n:ials. Materials already in use in a building or structure in compliance
with reduirements or approvals; in eﬂ';eét at the time of their erection or
installation shall be pe&nitted to remain in use unless determined by the
Building Official to be unsafe pursuant to Section 121.0404 of the Land

Developmem'Co'dc

' S_ecngniQZJ_ls_&dded.@lelms. .302.7, Maintenance, Buildingsand

s_m;;tu_&. and ggncmmMmammME and sapitary
condition, Devic lition, Devices or safeguards that are required by the Building,
Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Residential, Green Building and

maintained in conformance with the edition of the California Building

Standards Cod lifornia Code lations Tit under which the
devices or @H@Mﬁﬁhgﬂ be responsible for

reinspecta building or structure, The requirements of the Existing
Building Regulati a vide the basis forremoval or gt_zggg;jg. n

-PAGE 64 OF 76-



()

(0-2020-82)

of fire protection‘andsafety sytems and devicesin existing buildings o -

S{ructures,

Section 302.8 is added as_follows: 302.8, Mandatory regulations for wall

anchorage and parapet bracing for unreinforced ma: earing wall
buildings. The provisions of Section 302.8 shall apply to buildings that

| were constructed or that were under constructionbefore March 24, 1939

or for which a Building Permit was issued before March 24, 1939, and to
Citv-owned buildings designated pursuant to a City Council resolution,
M@MﬁdM__;___w@g@m; forced masonry bearing
wsll. Section 302.8 shall not applyto the following;

() Amﬂm@ggkcﬂiwﬁamﬂvgni;ﬂm;@i@m@g
apartment bouses containing flve ot fewer units usedsolely for
residential purposes and the accessory buildings for these
mgggeié;_ﬂﬁy_._mpﬁgn_dgeg not apply to buildings or

structures containing mixed or nonresidential occupancies.

(2)  Buildings that have been completely seismically retrofitted, as
determined by the Building Official, to comply with earlier

within the scope of Section 302.8, that are not classified as Essential or
Hazardous Facilities, and that contain any parapets and other external

-PAGE 65 OF 76-



Lod

(0-2020-82)

hazacds attactied to ot located.on the roof structure, or forming the exterior
facade of a building or structure that meet both of the following criteria:

) Critical Placeme m_;m______;mmmﬂ@w

any other external hazards have the potential o give way internally
oronto lower adiacent buildings (with a minimum height
differential of 6 feet) or property, or.onto an adjacent exit or. public

-~ exterior wall or roof appendages that extend above the lower of
mgﬂsldﬂfimgmm;'ggmmmm&ugg
£oof sheathing do not meet uirements of Section A113 of the
Calitorpia Existing Building Code.

Section 302.8.2 is added as follows: 302.8.2, Compliance period. The

wper of a building regulated by Section 302.8 shall, within § years afier
. the date of sexrvice of an order to comply, provide partial seismic

building elements that meet both of the criteria in Section 302.8.1,

Section 302.8.3 is added as follows: 302.8.3, Removal, Stabilization and

perimeter of the entire building as part of the removal, stabilization, and

bracing process, Existing roof to wall anchors must meet, or shall be

upgraded to meet, the mini equirements of Section A113.1 of the

California Existing Building Code, or new anchors meeting the minimum
e ecti all be installed.

-PAGE 66 OF 76-



2

(0-2020-82)

Section 302 845 added as follows: 302,84, Historical Buildings. fthe

lgu;ﬂ@,g;_s_aﬂsii;ﬁca_l_Byjl ding, the installation shall comply with the

;M@;c_a@nmgmmmgggm;x
 semoval shall notbe used. s . method to mitigate exteral hazards,

§1411.0401 - Local Modifications and-Additiens to Chapter 4 “Preseriptive-C ifHice
Method Repairs” of the California Existing Building Code

@)

®)

Chapter 4 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by
reference with modifications and-additions pursuant to Sections 1411.0105
aﬂd—M—l—l—O-}Gé of the Land Development Code. |

ials—Materials-aiready-in-use-isra building Lanee with
. . ] . ﬂ:‘ee.t_a'[ l . E:] . .
installation-shall - -be-permitied-to-remuain-in-use-unless-determined-by-the

Development Code: Section 401.3 is wodified pursuant to Section

14110105 of the Land Development Code as follows: 4013, Flood hazard

m&&mﬂmj@gm’gﬁé, the owne shall comply with Section

145.1612 or Section 1490322 of the Land Development Code, as

gm@m&ima_nﬁh_w at -_c.mmﬁisuhﬂ“;___;agg__mm
: i o 1060k the Land

Development Code.

-PAGE 67 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

-PAGE 68 OF 76-



{0-2020-82)

: etached ) ino ; )

bildings. ford {05 T] o d
v to buildings rine mixed-or

-PAGE 69 OF 76-



4

B

Building-Code:

-PAGE 70 OF 76-

(0-2020-82)




o

(0-2020-82)

LRI

o Historiesl

=
s

Building the installation-shall Iwith gl irerm £ the

| Califormia Historical Building Code-and |

814110402 Leeal-Medificationsto-Section402-“Additions™ of the Californin Existing
BuildineCod

- ex%s&ﬂgﬁm;emm—sha%cemp}rm%he—ﬂakkdes%gaﬁeq&kememg—fepﬁew

-PAGE 71 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

bo-oxicti v-shalt e with the-fead-desi ¢ ements for
designForstuerres in-speeial flood-hazard-areas-established-in Seetion
145:1612-or Section149: .esae-efﬂaem - -as
Licablo—any-alterations thatd e cerbstantial-inton
Cho-axit eouired e with-the Sood-desi

-PAGE 72 OF 76-



- ik

(0-2020-82)

fepmmd—s}m#net—be-subjeeHe—ehﬁequﬁemeﬁes%ermheasm

Mﬂ%&@ahﬁemw—%sﬂagﬁmlémg—@ede—%wﬂm&mﬁmme

fequﬁemaﬁs—m-aeeefé&ﬁee%th—SeeﬂmH%D—%-eﬁhe—Eaﬂd
Develepme&t—@ede—aaé—aba&ement—eﬁwea%due—te-neﬁnal-qemee

-PAGE 73 OF 76-



- (0-2020-82)

LosaL Modil ‘

(@)

Sgctipn_migf_tl_m_(:alj&mjg Existing Building Code js adopted by

reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 of the Land

Secti L, d ted with modifications as follows: 405.2.5,

Elood hazard areas. In flood hazard areas, buildings that have sustained

substantial damage shall be brought into compliance with Section
1451612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as
applicable,

Chapter 14: General Regulations

Artlcle 11: Exnstmg Bulldmg Regulatmns

DMMEMMMM;MXMM

modifications and additions pu rsuant to Section 1411.0105 and 14110106 of the

Land D

M I IBI rﬁ I. | S I.‘ §gz “5 ! !.!- Ty El! g !-E s E s !-

(a)

Seetion 502 of the California Existing Building Code is ad 1
reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 of the Land

Development Code,

Section 502.3 is modified as follows: 502.3, Flood hazard areas. For

-PAGE 74 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

. 1451612 or Section 19,0322 of the Land Development Code, as
apolicable, any addition that constitutes substantial improvement of fhe
existing structure shall comply with the flood design requirements for new
compliance with the requirements for new construction for flood design,

For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section
145.1612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as
applicable, any additions that do not constitute substantial improvement of
She.existing structure are not required to comply with the flood design
requirements for new construction,

§1411.0503 mwmmmnatgs:gmmmmms*mmmmmm
Building Cod : e

¢ (a) . SectionS03 of the Califorsia Existing Building Code is adopted by

- reference with modifications pursuant fo Section 1411,0105 of the Land
- Development Code. |
buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section
145.1612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as
anplicable, agy alteration that copstitutes substantial improvement of the
wsﬂwwmw
construction, and all aspects of the existing spructure shall be brought into
compliance with the requirements for new construction for flood design.
145.1612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as

-PAGE 75 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

applicable, any alterations that:do not constitute substantial improvement
of the existing strucnire are not required to comply with the flood design
NJB:als -
02/10/2020
© Or.Dept:DSD -

Doc. No.: 2215938 5

-PAGE 76 OF 76-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on ___-APR 07 2020 , by the following vote:

Councilmembers Yeas ‘ Nays Not Present  Recused
Barbara Bry
Jennifer Campbell
Chris Ward
Monica Montgomery
Mark Kersey
Chris Cate
Scott Sherman

Vivian Moreno

NNONNNEKN
o s o e o o
ﬁmmmmﬁmmm
o o s o e e e

Georgette Gomez

Date of final passage APR 0 9 2020

KEVIN L. FAULCONER

AUTHENTICATED BY: _ Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

ELIZABETH S. MALAND

(Seal) ' City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

By %’MI_W Deputy
r- \Sﬁ‘;ﬂéy 7

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finaily passed until twelve calendar
days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

MAR 1 672020 ' ,and on APR 09 2020

| FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such
reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of
the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day
of its passage. '

ELIZABETH S. MALAND
(Seal) : City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

Bywm_, Deputy
fo J‘fﬂz &Mg

Office of the City Clerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number O- 21181




