
#6 

7

/

3

o

j

a

(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

ORDINANCE NUMBER O-

 

2

1

8

5

9

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE AUG 0 5 2024

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 2,

DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 112.0102; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTION 129.0108;

AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 129.0211 AND 129.0218; AMENDING

CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY REPEALING

SECTION 145.1203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14. ARTICLE 5,

DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.1505 AND

REPEALING SECTION 145.1510; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 18 BY AMENDING SECTION

145.1803; AMEND[NG CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3

BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0341; AND AMENDING

CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11. DIVISION 3 BY REPEALING

SECTION 1411.0301, RELATING TO AMENDMENTS TO THE

2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE.

WHEREAS, the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code published by

the California Building Standards Commission became effective statewide on January 1,2023;

and

WHEREAS, the City of San Diego adopted the 2022 Edition of the California Building

Standards Code, with amendments, on May 8,2023; and

WHEREAS, the supplement to the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards

Code will become effective statewide on July 1, 2024; id

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code section 17958 provides that the

governing body of every city or county shall adopt ordinances or regulations imposing the same

requirements as those contained in the California Building Standards Code; and

-PAGE 1 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

WHEREAS,

 California

 Health and S

afety Code

 sections 1795

8.5, 17958.7

, and 1894

1.5

provide that

 a city or coun

ty may make such

 changes

 or modifi

cations

 to the r

equirements

contained in the California Building Standards Code as it determines are reasonably necessary

because of local cli

matic, geological, 

or topographic

 conditions; and

WHEREAS, the City of San Diego desires to adopt certain amendments necessary to

implement the supplement to the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code except

as modified 

below, and t

o make nece

ssary clarifi

cations and 

remove inco

nsistencies; 

and

WHEREAS, the amendments relating to permit application extensions is intended to

apply retroactively to any

 permit application

 that is submitted or has

 expired on

 or after June 1,

2024; and

WHEREAS, the Office

 of the City Attorney has drafted this ord

inance based on 

the

information provided by City staff (including information provided by affected third parties and

verified by City staff), with the understanding that this information is complete true, and

accurate; NOW, THEREFORE,

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council ofthe City of San Diego, as follows:

Section 1. That it finds and declares, in accordance with California Health and Safety

Code section 17958.5, that the following additions and deletions incorporate changes and

modifications that are reasonably necessary because of the local climatic, geological, or

topographical conditions set forth below:

1. Climatic Conditions

Each year, the City of San Diego experiences periods of high temperatures, accompanied

by low humidity and high winds. Years ofdrought in the City's semi-arid natural environment

have increased the combustibility of vegetation. These conditions create an environment in

which the Fire Department commits large numbers of firefighting resources to control and

-PAGE 2 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

extinguis

h wildlan

d fires. 

The City

 experienc

ed major wil

dfires in

 2003 an

d 2007. L

imited

firefightin

g resour

ces mean

s that fir

efighter

s may hav

e grea

t difficul

ty con

trolling

 fires in

s

tr

u

c

tu

r

e

s

.

San Dieg

o is exp

osed to s

unny or p

artially s

unny d

ays for m

ore th

an hal

f of the d

ays in

the year and, 

as a result, is 

a national le

ader in the im

plementation

 of 

solar photov

oltaic sy

stems.

Streamlining th

e approval p

rocess throug

h the ado

ption of standar

ds for solar

 systems f

acilitates

broader adop

tion and will 

help the City 

achieve the

 net zero ene

rgy consumpt

ion goal

s of

 

the

City's General Plan.

As noted 

above, t

he City 

of San D

iego has 

a semi-a

rid natur

al environ

ment, an

d as such

,

water con

servation 

is an imp

ortant go

al. The C

limate Acti

on Plan 

for the Cit

y of 

San Dieg

o ha

s

water-effic

ient build

ings as on

e of its g

oals. To 

achieve

 that go

al, San D

iego mu

st ado

pt 

water

conserv

ation an

d effici

ent w

ater use 

standa

rds. In 

addition t

o requiri

ng the 

use of w

ater-ef

ficient

plumbing 

fixtures, t

he City of San

 Diego redu

ces water co

nsumpt

ion throu

gh v

arious w

ater reus

e

programs. Re

ducing the 

quantity of w

ater supplie

d to plumb

ing fixtu

res can also 

result in

reduced water consumption.

San Die

go is subj

ect to fl

ood haz

ards along 

the.coas

tal neighb

orhoods t

o the w

est and 

in

its valleys

 and, theref

ore, restric

ts construct

ion in specia

l flood h

azard areas.

2. Geological Conditions

The City of

 San Diego i

s situated

 near three 

major

 earthquake 

faults, 

each capabl

e of

generating qu

akes with a m

agnitude

 of 7.0 or

 greater

 on the Ric

hter scale

: the Elsinor

e Fault,

northeast of

 the City; the

 Rose Canyon

 Fault, which 

extends from

 La Jolla

 Cove throu

gh Rose

Canyon an

d into do

wntown 

San Dieg

o; and th

e Coron

ado Ban

ks Faul

t, which 

extends in 

a

northwes

t/southea

st directi

on just off

 the coast u

nder the

 Pacific

 Ocean.

 The most 

severe th

reat

from earthquake

s is damage to and colla

pse of

 buildings and 

other structu

res due to g

round

-PAGE 3 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

movement unless special considerations are made. Earthquakes can also cause fires by damaging

gas and power lines and can make firefighting difficult or impossible by breaking water mains

and damaging sprinkler systems.

The City of San Diego is included in the Alquist Priolo Special Fault Study Zone and the

Rose Canyon fault area, which impacts the construction of high-rise buildings.

3. Topographical Conditions

The City of San Diego has over 900 linear miles of wildland-urban interface, where

backyards of homes meet the natural vegetation, including coastal sage scrub and chaparral.

Access to this natural vegetation for purposes of firefighting is made difficult by the

topographical features of the City that include hills, mountains, and canyons. These

topographical features create significant difficulties for emergency personnel attempting to

extinguish fires in these areas.

Due to the prevalence of canyons, preserved open space, the Pacific Ocean, and an

international border, the City of San Diego has constrained buildable space that requires vertical

construction.

San Diego includes neighborhoods that are subject to flooding during periods of high

rainfall due to the prevalence of canyons, steep slopes, the ocean to the west, as well as rivers

passing through canyons and terminating in the ocean.

Topographical conditions also limit availability ofbuildable land and, as a consequence,

housing is more affordable when multiple dwelling units are combined within one building with

units attached to one another through stacking or adjacency.

Section 2. That Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 1 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 112.0102, to read as follows:

-PAGE 4 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

§112.0102

Appli

cation

 Proc

ess

An application for a permit, map, or other matter shall be filed with the City

Manager in accordance with the following requirements:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Expiration of Application.

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Extensions.

(A) An application for a Demolition/Removal Permit, Grading

Permit, Public Right-of-Way Permit, Sign Permit, or a

Process One map may be extended for a period not

exceeding 180 calendar days, if the City Manager

determines that circumstances beyond the control of the

applicat

 

prevented issuance of the Demolition/Removal

Permit, Grading Permit, Public Right-of-Way Permit, Sign

Permit or approval of the Process One map. Iii such cases,

the existing application shall be automatically extended

until a decision is made regarding the request for extension.

(B) The City Engineer may extend a Grading Permit

applica

tion or a

 Public 

Right-of

-Way

 Permit ap

plication

 for

one additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days from

the expiration date.

-PAGE 5 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

(C) The Bui]ding Off

icial may extend an

 application for a

Building Pennit, Electrical Permit, Plumbing/Mechanical

Pennit, and Fire Permit in accordance with Sections

129.0211,129.0309,129.0410 and 129.0907.

(3) through (5) [No change in text.I

Section 3. That Chapter 12, Article 9, Division 1 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 1 29.0108, to read as follows:

§129.0108

 

Issuance of a Construction Permit

Construction shall

 not begin until

 the required permits 

have been issued

. After all

required approvals, including any required

 

dev

elo

pm

ent

 pe

rmi

ts,

 have been

obtained and all

 required fees have

 been paid, the

 Building Official

 or City

Engineer may issue a construction permit as follows:

(a) The Building Official may issue Building Permits, Electrical Permits,

Plumbing/Mechanical Permits, Demolitio/Removal Permits, Grading

Permits on private

 lots if

 

the Grading Permit does not include

 

public

rights-of-way, and Fire Permits.

(b) The City Engineer may issue all other Grading Permits and Public

Right-of-Way Permits.

Section 4. That Chapter 12, Article 9, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending sections 129.0211 and 129.0218, to read as follows:

§129.0211

 

Closing of B

uilding Perm

it Applica

tion

(a) If two years have elapsed since the date a Building Permit application is

deemed complete and the applicant has not

 

requested that a Building

Permit be issued, the application file shall be closed. Plans and other data

-PAGE 6 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

submitted for review may be returned to the

 

applicant or

 

destr

oye

d by

 the

Building

 Official

. To reappl

y, the

 

applicant

 

shall submit a new Building

Permit application

 with required

 submittal materials

 and shall be subjec

t to

all applicable fees and regulations in effect on the date the new application

is filed.

(b) [No cha

nge in

 text.]

(c) The Buildi

ng Officia

l may extend

 a Buildi

ng Permit a

pplicatio

n for

 a

period not exceeding 180 calendar days from the date the Building Permit

application was

 

deemed complete if

 

the Building Official determines that

circumstances beyond the control of the

 

applicant

 

prevented issuance of

the Building Permit.

(d) The Building Official may extend a Building Permit application for one

additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days i f the Building Official

determines that the building standards effective at the time that the

Building Permit application was submitted are sufficient to protect public

health and safety or the project complies with signi ficant life and safety

building standards effective at the time that the Building Permit application

was submitted and:

(1) The additional application extension is in the public interest; or

(2) Circumstances beyond the control of the applicant prevented the

issuance of the Building Permit.

(e) A Building Permit application shall not be extended more than

360 calendar days from the date the Building Permit application was

deemed complete.

-PAGE 7 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

(f) lf a request to extend the closing date of a Building Permit application has

been filed in accordance with this section, the existing Building Permit

application shall be automatically extended until the Building Official has

made a decision on the request for an extension.

(g) The application for all Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire Permits

associated with a Building Permit shall expire concurrently with the

Building Permit.

§129.0218

 

Expiration of a Building Permit

(a) A Building Permit for detached one- and two-family dwellings or

townhouses, as defined in the California Residential Code, and their

accessory structures, and for the relocation of structures shall expire three

years after the date of permit issuance. A Building Permit for all other

projects shall expire four years after the date ofpermit issuance.

(b) If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not received

final ispection approval by the permit expiration date, all work shall stop

until a new pennit is issued. All Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire

Permits associated with a Building Permit shall expire concurrently with

the Building Permit.

Section 5. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 12 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by repealing section 145.1203.

Section 6. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 15 of

 the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 145.1505 and repealing section 145.1510, to read as follows:

-PAGE 8OF ll-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

§145.1505

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1505 "Fire Classification" of

the California Building Code

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Section 1505.9 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the Land

Development Code as follows: 1505.9 Rooftop mounted photovoltaic

panel systems. Rooftop rack-mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall be

tested, listed, and identified with a fire classification in accordance with

UL 2703 and Section 145.]

 505(b).

Section 7. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 18 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 145.1803, to read as follows:

§145.1803

 

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 "Geotechnical

Investigations" of the California Building Code

(a) Section 1803.2 is adopted with additions and modifications pursuant to

Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 ofthe Land Development Code.

(1) 1803.2.1. A geotechnical investigation shall be conducted when

required by Section 1803.2 of the California Building Code,

Section 145.1803(d) of the San Diego Municipal Code, or the

Building Official for all new structures, additions to existing

structures not exempted by San Diego Municipal Code Section

145.1803(b), or whenever the occupancy classification ofa

building changes to a higher Risk Category pursuant to Table

1604.5 of the California Building Code as a result of

 

the proposed

work.

(2) through (3) [No change in text.1

(b) through (g) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 9 OF 11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

Section 8. T

hat Chapter 14

, Article 

9, Division 3

 of the San

 Diego Mu

nicipal Co

de is

amended 

by amen

ding sec

tion 149.0

341, to 

read as foll

ows:

§149.0341

 

Local Addition of Section R341 "Sound Transmission Control" to the

California Residential Code

Section R341 is adde

d to the Cal

ifornia Res

idential Co

de pu

rsuant 

to Sect

ion

149.0106 o

f the Land 

Developm

ent Code a

s follo

ws: 

R341 Sound T

ransmissio

n

Control. Wall and flo

or-ceiling 

assemblies

 separating dw

elling un

its from

 each

other and from public or service

 areas such as interior 

corridors,

 garages, and

mechanical spaces shall provide airborne sound insulation for walls, and both

airborne

 and impact s

ound insula

tion for 

floor-ceiling 

assemblies

, in compli

ance

with Section 1206 of the California Building Code. For additional noise

regulations limiting t

he intrusion of exte

rior noise into buildi

ngs based on land

use standar

ds, see Chap

ter 13, Art

icle 2, Divi

sion 15 o

f

 

the Land De

velopmen

t

Code.

Section 9. That Chapter 1

4, Article 11, Divis

ion 3 of 

the San Diego Mu

nicipal Code

 is

amend

ed by r

epealin

g sect

ion 141

1.0301

.

Section 10.

 That a full r

eading of thi

s Ordinanc

e is dispen

sed with prio

r to passag

e, a

written copy

 having been m

ade availabl

e to the Counc

il and the

 public

 prior

 to the da

y of its

p

as

sa

g

e

.

Section 11. 

That this Or

dinance shall 

take effect a

nd be in fo

rce on the t

hirtieth da

y from

and after its final passage.

-PA

GE

 1

0 O

F 

11-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

Section 

12. That 

for the a

mendm

ents in

 sections 

112.0102(

d)(1)(B

) and 

129.0211

 related

to the expir

ation of perm

it applicati

ons, this Ord

inance sha

ll apply

 retroactive

ly to 

any perm

it

applica

tion th

at is su

bmitted 

or has 

expired 

on or af

ter Ju

ne 1, 20

24.

): MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attorney

 

 

 

A

_

_

9

/ Iauren N. Hendrickson

Deputy

 City A

ttorne

y

LNH:cm

April 19,2024

July 10

, 2024 C

OR. COP

Y

July 12, 2024 COR. COPY 2

Or.Dept: DSD

Doc. No. 3628692 4

I certify that t

he foregoing

 Ordinance was

 passed by the C

ouncil of 

the City of S

an Die

go, at this

meeting of

 

J

U

L

 

3

0 

2

02

4

DIANA J.S. FUENTES

City Clerk

A 

By 72£

 

-

t_

* 

ts

-

Deputy City Clerk

Approved:

8Z4-

(date)

Vetoed:

(date)

-## A

TODD 6LRIA, Mayor

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

-PAGE 11 OF 11-

APPROVE



(O

-20

2

4-1

48

)

COR. COPY 2

STR

IKEO

UT

 ORD

INA

NCE

OLD LANGUAGE:tuck-Out

NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

OR

DIN

AN

CE

NU

MB

ER

O-

 

(NEW SERIES)

DAT

E OF

 FN

AL P

ASS

AGE

AN ORD

INAN

CE AM

ENDING

 CHA

PTER

 11, AR

TICL

E 2,

DIVIS

ION 1 

OF T

HE SA

N DIEG

O MUN

ICIPA

L CO

DE BY

AMENDI

NG 

SECT

ION 

112.01

02; A

MENDI

NG C

HAP

TER

 12,

ARTIC

LE 9, D

IVISIO

N 1 BY

 AMEND

ING SECTI

ON 2

9.0108

;

AME

NDI

NG CH

APTE

R 12,

 AR

TICLE

 9, D

IVIS

ION

 2 B

Y

AME

NDI

NG SECT

IONS

 129

.0211

 AN

D 129

.021

8; AME

ND

ING

CHAP

TER 

14 ARTI

CLE

 5, DIV

ISION

 12 B

Y REPEA

LING

SECTI

ON 145

.1203

; AME

NDING

 CHA

PTER 

14, A

RTIC

LE 5,

DIVIS

ION 1

5 BY AMENDING SECT

ION 1

45.150

5 AN

D

REP

EAL

ING SE

CTIO

N 14

5.151

0; AM

ENDING C

HAPT

ER 1

4,

ARTICL

E 5, DIVI

SION 18

 BY AMEN

DING SECTO

N

145.1803

; AMEND

ING CHAPT

ER 14, A

RTICLE 9, DIVIS

ION 3

BY AMEND

ING SEC

TION 149.03

41; AND

 AMENDING

CHAP

TER 1

4, AR

TICL

E 11, D

IVISIO

N 3 B

Y RE

PEALI

NG

SECT

ION 

1411.0

301, 

RELA

TING

 TO AM

END

MENTS

 TO THE

2022 

CALI

FORN

IA BU

ILDI

NG STA

NDAR

DS C

ODE.

§112.0102 Application Process

An app

lication 

for a pe

rmit, ma

p, or oth

er atter 

shall be f

iled w

ith the C

ity

Manage

r in ac

corda

nce w

ith th

e foll

owing

 requi

remen

ts:

(a) 

thro

ugh

 (c) 

[No

 cha

nge

 in te

xt.]

(d) Expiration of Application.

(1) [No ch

ange in t

ext.]

l Extensions.

 

(A) 

he-n_a

pplicati

on for a

 Demo

lition/

Remo

val Pe

rmit,

Gradi

ng P

ermit, P

ublic

 Right-

of-W

ay Pe

rmit. 

Sign P

ermit

or a Process

 One map

 may be extended f

or a

 period

 not

-PAGE 1 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

§129.0108

exceeding 180 calendar days, if the City Manager

determines that circumstances beyond the control of the

applicant

 

prevented issuance of the permi

Demolition/Removal Permit, Grading Permit, Public R.g

of-Way Permit, Sign Permit or approval ofthe Process One

map. In such cases, the existing application shall be

automatically extended until a decision is made regarding

the request for extension.

(Bì The City Engineer may extend a Grading Permit

application or a Public Right-of-Way Permit application for

one additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days from

the expiration date.

(O The Building Official may extend an application for a

Building Permit, Electrical Permit, Plumbing/Mechanical

Permit, and Fire Permit in accordance with Section

129.0211,129.0309,129.0410 and 129.0907.

(3) through (5) [No change in text.]

Issuance of a Construction Permit

Construction shall not begin until the required permits have been issued. After all

required approvals, including any required

 

development permits,

 have been

obtained and all required fees have been paid, the Building Official or City

Eneineer may issue a construction pmit. Construction-sha-et begi til the

required permits have been issued. as follows:

-PAGE 2 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

í) The Buildin

g Official m

ay issue Bui

lding Permi

ts, Electrical 

Permits

Plumbing

/Mechan

ical Perm

its, Demol

ition/Rem

oval Per

mits, Grad

ing

Perm

its on

 priva

te

 

lots

 

if the Grading Permit does not include

 

public

rihts-of-wav, and Fire Permits.

 

The City 

Engineer 

may issue 

all othe

r Grad

ing Per

mits and 

Public

Right-of-Way Permits.

§129.0211

 

Closing of B

uilding Perm

it Applic

ation

(a) 

If oe-yer 

hs two 

years ha

ve elap

sed since 

the date a

 Build

ing Per

mit

applica

tion is

 deemed-eemp

lete-dee

med complet

e a

nd the

 

applicant

 

h

a

s

not requeste

d that a

 Building P

ermit be

 issued, the

 applica

tion file

 shall be

closed. Pl

ans and othe

r data

 submitted

 for review

 may be retu

rned to

 the

applicant or

 

destroyed by

 the Buildin

g Official

. To reap

ply, the

 

applicant

shall subm

it a new

 Building Pe

rmit app

lication wit

h required 

submíttal

materials 

and shall

 be subject t

o all applic

able fe

es and

 regulatio

ns in

effect on the date the new application is filed.

(b) [No cha

nge in te

xt.]

(c) 

The Build

ing Offi

cial may exte

nd a Build

ing Pe

rmit appli

cation 

p-te-t

we

times, each

 for a peri

od not ex

ceeding 18

0 calend

ar days from

 the date

the Buildi

ng Permit a

pplicatio

n was

 

deemed complete

 

ifthe Building

Official determine

s that circums

tances beyo

nd the control of

 the

 

applicant

prevented iss

uance of

 the Buildin

g Permit,

 The Bu

ilding O

fficial may exte

nd a Buil

ding Per

mit app

lication 

for o

ne

additio

nal pe

riod not

 exceed

ing 18

0 calenda

r days i

f the Bu

ilding 

Officia

l

determ

ines tha

t the

 building

 standard

s effe

ctive a

t the tim

e that

 the

-PAGE 3 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

CO

R. C

OP

Y 2

Building P

ermit applic

ation was 

submitted

 are sufficie

nt to

 protect pu

blic

health an

d safety or

 the proj

ect compli

es with sign

ificant

 life 

and safety

building

 stand

ards effec

tive at t

he tim

e that th

e Buildi

ng Perm

it app

lication

was submitted and:

£1 The additional application extension is in the public interest; or

 Circumstan

ces bey

ond the c

ontrol of 

the applican

t preven

ted the

issuance of the Building Permit.

£ A Building Permit aplication shall not be extended more than

360 ca

lendar

 days f

rom the da

te the B

uilding

 Perm

it app

licati

on was

deem

ed com

plete

.

(ííl If a request t

o extend th

e closing d

ate of

 a Buildin

g Permi

t application

 has

been filed

 in accord

ance with th

is sectio

n, the

 existing 

Building

 Permit

application

 shall be

 autom

atically exte

nded until t

he Buildi

ng Official h

as

made a decision on the request for an extension.

feg The

 application f

or all Elect

rical, Plumb

ing, M

echanical or F

ire Pen

nits

associated

 with a Bu

ilding Perm

it shall exp

ire concu

rrently w

ith the

Building Permit.

§129.0218

 

Expiration of a Building Permit

(a) A Buildin

g Permit

 for detach

ed one-

 

and two-f

amily dwelli

ngs or

townhous

es, as defin

ed in the 

Californi

a Resid

ential Co

de, and th

eir

accesso

y strct

ures, an

d for th

e reloca

tion of

 struct

ures sha

ll expi

re we

three yea

rs after the

 date of p

ermit issu

ance. A

 Building

 Permit

 for all

other projects shal

l expire four ye

ars after the dat

e of

 permit is

suance.

-PAGE 4 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

(b) If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not received

final inspection approval by the permit expiration date, all work shall stop

until a new permit is issued. All Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire

Permits associated with a Building pemt-Permit shall expire concurrently

with the Building Permit.

4 1

Local odifictions and Additions to Section 1203 "

 

Ventilation" of the

California Building Code

f Section 1203.2 of the California Building Code is adopted with additions

ad modification: pursat to Sectios 145.0105 and 115.0106 efthe

Land Developmet Code. Section 1203.2 is modified by addig Section

1203.2.2.

 4203.2.2. Unented Attics and Unvented Enclosed Rafte

Assemblies. Unvented attic assemblies (spaces between the ceiling joists

of the tep story and the roof rafters) and unvented enclosed rafter

a:embes (spaces between ceiligs that are applied directly to the

underside eee-framing members/rafters and the structural roof

sheathig at the top of the rooËframng members/rafters) shall be

permitted if all the following conditions are met:

1 The unvented attic space is completely contained within the

building thermal enelope.

 o inteior Class I vapor retarders are istalled on the ceiling side

(attic floor) oftle nveted attic aselly or  the ceiing side of

the unvented enclosed rafter assembly.

-PAGE 5 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

3 Either Items A, B, or C ofthis Section 145.1203(b)(3) shall be met,

depending on the air permeabiity of the inculatien directly under

the structural roof sheathing. No inslation shall be requied whe

roof tiles, wood shingles, wood shakes, or any other roofing

system-using-batten-and no continuous underlayment is installed. A

cotinuous layer shall be considered to exist if sheathig, roofing

er any continuous layer is sed which has a perm rate of no

more than oe penn under te dry cup method.

 Air impermeale-inatien-enly. I:ulation shall bo

applied in direct cotact with the underside of t

he structural

roof.heathing.

 Air permeale

 

insulation enly. In addition to the air -

permeable insulatio installed directly below the structura

:heathing, rigid board or sheet insulation with ati R value

ofR 4 shall be instaled directly above the strcural roof

shea

ng for condensatie control.

 Air impermeable and air pemeable insulation. The

air impermeabe insulation shall be applied in direct

contact with the uderside of the structural roof sheathi

for codensation conrol. The air permeable isulation shU

be installed directly under the air impermeable insulation.

-PAGE 6 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

D Where p

erforme

d insulat

ion board

 is used a

s the air

impereale islation lyer, it shall be scaled at the

perimeter of each idividual sheet iìterior srface-to form a

continuous layer.

§145.1505

Local Additions and

 Modifications to Sect

ion 1505 "Fire

 Classification" of

the California Building Code

§S510

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Section 1505.9 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the Land

Development Code as follows: 1505.9 Rooftop mounted photovoltaic

panel systems. Rooftop rack-mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall be

tested, listed and identified with a fire classification in accordance with

UL 1703 and UL 2703 and Section 145.1505(b).

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1510 "Rooftop Structures" of

the Clifornia Building Code

Section 1510.7.1 is modified prsuat to Sction 115.0105 of the Land

Development Codeas folows: 1510.7.1 Fireckssificatie. Rooftop mounted

photovoltaic paes and modles shall have a fie classification i accordance

with Section 115.1505.

§145.1803

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 Geotechnical

Investigations" of the California Building Code

(a) Section 1803.2 is adopted with additions and modifications pursuant to

Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

(1) 1803.2.1. A geotechnical investigation shall be conducted when

required by Section 1803.2 of the California Building Code,

Section 145.1803-(d) of the San Diego Municipal Code, or the

-PAGE 7 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

Building Offi

cial for all new

 structures,

 additions to e

xisting

structures not exempted by San Diego Municipal Code Section

145.1803(b),or whenever the occupancy classification of a

building changes to a higher relative hazard category Risk

Catgorv pursuan

t to Table 1604.5

 ofthe California

 Building

 Code

as a resul

t ofthe p

roposed

 work.

(2) th

rough 

(3) [N

o cha

nge in 

text.

]

(b) through (g) [No change in text.]

§149.0341

Local Addition of Section R341 "Sound Transmission Control" to the

California Residential Code

Section R341 is added to the C

alifornia Reside

ntial Code pursu

ant to Section

149.0106 of

 the Land De

velopment

 Code as 

follows

: R341 Soun

d Transm

ission

Control. Wall and floor-ceiling assemblies separating dwelling units from each

other and 

from publi or

 service are

as such

 as interior c

orridors,

 garagesa

nd

mechanical spaces shall provide airborne sound insuation for walls, and both

airborne and impact soun

d insulation for floo

r-ceiling assemblies. i

n compli

ance

with Section 42-1206 of the Cali fornia Building Code. For additional noise

regulations

 limiting the 

intrusion of

 exterior no

ise into buil

dings based 

on land

use standards, see C

hapter 13, Article 2, Di

vision 15 of the 

Land Development

Code.

*144.0301 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 "Provisions for Al

Compliance 1Methods" of the California Existing Building Code

 Chapter 3 of th

e Californi

a Existiiìg B

ildig Ced

e is 

adopted by ref

erence

with mødifieatiøns-ad-aditios-psuant to-Section M 1--.01 05 üd

1111.0106 of the Land Devlopment Code.

-PAGE 8 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

b Sectiøn 301.

3, inckdig

-the except

ion, of 

the Cafo

rnia Existig 

Buiþ

Code is

 adopt

ed by ref

erence w

ith modi

fication

s pursuat 

to

Sectien

 ll 1

.0105 o

f the Land 

Develo

pment

 Code.

61) Section 301

.3 ismodi

fied as f

lows

:

 31.3, 

Alteration,

 addit

ion

 e

chage ofoccupancy. The alteratio, addition or change of

occpancy

 efall existing

-ildings-sh

all-cømpywit

h Section

301.3.1.

 The exceptien to 

Section 301.3 is mod

ified as folows: Ex

ception:

Subject t

o te a

pproval o

f the Bi

liHg Off

icial,

 alteratio

s

cmplying with the

 laws in existece at

 the time

 the building or t

he

affected-por

tion of theuldi

g-

 was- bul

-

t aren co

plianee with

the provisions of the curent California Existing Building Code.

New structural members added-s part of the aeration shall

comply with the C

aliforia Existing B

uildig Code. T

his exception

shall not apply to:

 Alteratio

s for acce

ssibiity

 requir

ed by Cha

per 11Aof

 

the

California Buildng Ce{ie;

 Alterations tat constitute a sstatial improvement to a

existing buiding i a flood hazard area, whic alteratiøs

shall comply

 with Sectio 

il l.0503

 of

 

the La

nd

Dev

elop

me

nt C

ode; 

and

-PAGE 9 OF 10-



(O-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2

* Structural previsio: of Chapter 5, Section 301 ofthe

California Existig Building Code.

LNH:cm

April 19,2024

July 10, 2024 COR. COPY

July 12, 2024 COR. COPY 2

Or.Dept: DSD

Doc. No. 3645455 4

-PAGE 10 OF 10-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on

 

JUL 3 0 2024 ,

 

by the following vote:

Councilmembers

 Yeas

 

N

ays

 

Not Present

 

Recused

Joe Laava   .  

Jennifer Campbell .   

Stephen Whitburn

Henry L. Foster Ill

Marni von Wilpert

Kent Lee     

Raul A. Campillo

Vivian Moreno    

Sean Elo-Rivera    

Date of final passage

 AUG 0 5 2024

AUTHENTICATED BY:

TODD GLORIA

Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

DIANAJ.S. FUENTES

(Seal)

 

City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

By tU6¥L- ,

 

Deputy

F

 

C

o

n

 n

i 

6

 

F

+

F

r

S

o

1 HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar

days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

JUL 1 6 2024 ,

 

and on

 

A

G

 

0

 

5

 

2

02

4

1 FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such

reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of

the ordinance was made available to each memberof the Council and the public prior to the day

of its passage.

DIANA I.S. FUENTES

(Seal)

 

City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

-

8

 

 

, D

ep

uty

C

o

n

n

e

 

IŽ

--

t

r

o

n

r

Office of the City Clerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number 0-

 21859


