o A
d7/30/,u/

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

ORDINANCE NUmBER O- 1899 (NEW SERIES)

" DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE  AUG 0 5 2024

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 2,
DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 112.0102; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION | BY AMENDING SECTION 129.0108;
AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY
AMENDING SECTIONS 129.0211 AND 129.0218;, AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY REPEALING
SECTION 145.1203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.1505 AND
REPEALING SECTION 145.1510; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 18 BY AMENDING SECTION
145.1803; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3
BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0341; AND AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3 BY REPEALING
SECTION 1411.0301, RELATING TO AMENDMENTS TO THE
2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE.

WHEREAS, the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code published by
the California Building Standards Commission became effective statewide on January 1, 2023;
and

WHERLEAS, the City of San Diego adopted the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Standards Codc, with amendments, on May 8, 2023; and

WHEREAS, the supplement to the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards
Code will become effective statewide on July 1, 2024; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code section 17958 provides that the
governing body of every city or county shall adopt ordinances or regulations imposing the same

requirements as those contained in the California Building Standards Code; and

-PAGE 10F 11-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5
provide that a city or county may make such changes or modifications to the requirements
contained in the California Building Standards Code as it determines are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological, or topographic conditions; and

WHEREAS, the City of San Diego desires to adopt certain amendments necessary to
implement the supplement to the 2022 Edition of the Califorma Building Standards Code except
as modified below, and tq make necessary clarifications and remove inconsistencies; and

WHEREAS, the amendments relating to permit application extensions is intended to
apply retroactively to any permit application that is submitted or has expired on or after June 1,
2024; and

WHEREAS, the Office of the City Attorney has drafted this ordinance based on the
information provided by City staft (including information provided by affected third parties and
verified by City staff), with the understanding that this information is complete, true, and
accurate; NOW, THEREFORE,

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of San Diego, as follows:

Section 1. That it finds and declares, in accordance with California Health and Safety
Code section 17958.5, that the following additions and deletions incorporate changes and
modifications that are reasonably necessary because of the local climatic, geological, or
topographical conditions set forth below:

l. Climatic Conditions

Each year, the City of San Diego experiences periods of high temperatures, accompanied
by low humidity and high winds. Years of drought in the City’s semi-arid natural environment
have increased the combustibility of vegetation. These conditions create an environment in

which the Fire Department commits large numbers of firefighting resources to control and

-PAGE2 OF 11-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

extinguish wildland fires. The City experienced major wildfires in 2003 and 2007. Limited
firefighting resources means that firefighters may have great difficulty controlling fires in
structures.

San Diego is exposed to sunny or partially sunny days for more than half of the days in
the year and, as a result, is a national leader in the implementation of solar photovoltaic systems.
Streamlining the approval process through the adoption of standards for solar systems facilitates
broader adoption and will help the City achieve the net zero energy consumption goals of the
City’s General Plan.

As noted above, the City of San Diego has a semi-arid natural environment, and as such,
water conservation is an important goal. The Climate Action Plan for the City of San Diego has
water-efficient buildings as one of its goals. To achieve that goal, San Diego must adopt water
conservation and efficient water use standards. In addition to requiring the use of water-efficient
plumbing fixtures, the City of San Diego reduces water consumption through various water reuse
programs. Reducing the quantity of water supplied to plumbing fixtures can also result in
reduced water consumption.

San Diego is subject to flood hazards along the coastal neighborhoods to the west and in
its valleys and, therefore, restricts construction in special flood hazard areas.

2. Geological Conditions

The City of San Diego is situated near three major earthquake faults, each capable of |
generating quakes with a magnitude of 7.0 or greater on the Richter scale: the Elsinore Fault,
northeast of the City; the Rose Canyon Fault, which extends from La Jolla Cove through Rose
Canyon and into downtown San Diego; and the Coronado Banks Fault, which extends in a
northwest/southeast direction just off the coast under the Pacific Ocean. The most severe threat

from carthquakes is damage to and collapse of buildings and other structures due to ground

-PAGE 3 OF 11-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

movement unless special considerations are made. Earthquakes can also cause fires by damaging
gas and power lines and can make firefighting difficult or impossible by breaking water mains
and damaging sprinkler systems.

The City of San Diego is included in the Alquist Priolo Special Fault Study Zone and the
Rose Canyon fault area, which impacts the construction of high-rise buildings.

3. Topographical Conditions

The City of San Diego has over 900 linear miles of wildland-urban interface, where
backyards of homes meet the natural vegetation, including coastal sage scrub and chaparral.
Access to this natural vegetation for purposes of firefighting 1s made difficult by the
topographical features of the City that include hills, mountains, and canyons. These
topographical features create significant difficulties for emergency personnel attempting to
extinguish fires in these areas.

Due to the prevalence of canyons, preserved open space, the Pacific Ocean, and an
international border, the City of San Diego has constrained buildable space that requires vertical
construction.

San Diego includes neighborhoods that are subject to flooding during periods of high
rainfall due to the prevalence of canyons, steep slopes, the ocean to the west, as well as rivers
passing through canyons and terminating in the ocean.

Topographical conditions also limit availability of buildable land and, as a consequence,
housing is more affordable when multiple dwelling units are combined within one building with
units attached to one another through stacking or adjacency.

Section 2. That Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 1 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 112.0102, to read as follows:

-PAGE 4 OF 11-



§112.0102 Application Process

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

An application for a permit, map, or other matter shall be filed with the City

Manager in accordance with the following requirements:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d} Expiration of Application.

(D [No change in text.]

(2) Extensions.

(A)

(B)

An application for a Demolition/Removal Permit, Grading
Permit, Public Right-of-Way Permit, Sign Permit, or a
Process One map may be extended for a period not
exceeding 180 calendar days, if the City Manager
determines that circumstances beyond the control of the
applicant prevented issuance of the Demolition/Removal
Permit, Grading Permit, Public Right-of-Way Permit, Sign A
Permit or approval of the Process One map. In such cases,
the existing application shall be automatically extended
until a decision is made regarding the request for extension.
The City Engineer may extend a Grading Permit
application or a Public Right-of-Way Permit application for
one additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days from

the expiration date.

-PAGE 5 OF 11-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

(C)  The Building Official may extend an application for a
Building Permit, Electrical Permit, Plumbing/Mechanical
Permit, and Fire Permit in accordance with Sections
129.0211, 125.0309, 129.0410 and 129.0907.
(3) through (5) [No change in text.]
Section 3. That Chapter 12, Article é, Division 1 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending section 129.0108, to read as follows:
§129.0108 Issuance of a Construction Permit
Construction shall not begin until the required permits have been issued. After all
required approvals, including any required development permits, have been
obtained and all required fees have been paid, the Building Official or City
Engineer may issue a construction permit as follows;
(a) The Building Official may 1ssue Building Permits, Electrical Permits,
Plumbing/Mechanical Permits, Demolition/Removal Permits, Grading
Permits on private lots if the Grading Permit does not include public
rights-of-way, and Fire Permits.
(b) The City Engineer may issue all other Grading Permits and Public
Right-of-Way Permits.
Section 4. That Chapter 12, Article 9, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending sections 129.0211 and 129.0218, to read as follows:
§129.0211 Closing of Building Permit Application
(a) If two years have elapsed since the date a Building Permit application is
deemed complete and the applicant has not requested that a Building

Permit be issued, the application file shall be closed. Plans and other data

-PAGE6OF I 1-



(b)
(©)

(d)

(e)

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

submitted for review may be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the

Building Official. To reapply, the applicant shall submit a new Building

Permit application with required submittal materials and shall be subject to

all applicable fees and regulations in effect on the date the new application

is filed.

[No change in text.]

The Building Official may extend a Building Permit application for a

pertod not exceeding 180 calendar days from the date the Building Permuit

application was deemed complete 1f the Building Official determines that

circumstances beyond the control of the applicant prevented issuance of

the Building Permit.

The Building Official may extend a Building Permit application for one

additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days if the Building Official

determines that the building standards effective at the time that the

Building Permit application was submitted are sufficient to protect public

health and safety or the project complies with significant life and safety

building standards effective at the time that the Building Permit application

was submitted and:

(1) The additional application extension is in the public interest; or

(2) Circumstances beyond the control of the appficant prevented the
issuance of the Building Permit.

A Building Permit application shail not be extended more than

360 calendar days from the date the Building Permit application was

deemed complete.

-PAGE 7 OF 11-



§129.0218

()

(2)

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

If a request to extend the closing date of a Building Permit application has
been filed in accordance with this section, the existing Building Permit
application shall be automatically extended until the Building Official has
made a decision on the request for an extension.

The application for all Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire Permits
associated with a Building Permit shall expire concurrently with the

Building Permit.

Expiration of a Building Permit

(a)

(b)

A Building Permit for detached one- and two-family dwellings or
townhouses, as defined in the California Residential Code, and their
accessory structures, and for the relocation of structures shall expire three
years after the date of permit issuance. A Building Permit for all other
projects shall expire four years after the date of permit 1ssuance.

If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not received
final inspection approval by the permit expiration date, all work shall stop
until a new permit is issued. All Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire
Permits associated with a Building Permit shall expire concurrently with

the Building Permit.

Section 5. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 12 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by repealing section 145.1203.

Section 6. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 15 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 145.1505 and repealing section 145.1510, to read as follows:

-PAGES OF 11-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

§145.1505 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1505 “Fire Classification” of
the California Building Code

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Section 1505.9 1s modified pursuant to Se;:tion 145.0105 of the Land
Development Code as follows: 1505.9 Rooftop mounted photovoltaic
panel systems. Rooftop rack-mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall be
tested, listed, and identified with a fire classification in accordance with
UL 2703 and Section 145.1505(b).

Section 7. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 18 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending section 145.1803, to read as follows:

§145.1803 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 “Geotechnical
Investigations” of the California Building Code

(a) Section 1803.2 is adopted with additions and modifications pursuant to

Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

(1} 1803.2.1. A geotechnical investigation shall be conducted when
required by Section 1803.2 of the California Building Code,
Section 145.1803(d) of the San Diego Municipal Code, or the
Building Official for all new structures, additions to existing
structures not exempted by San Diego Municipal Code Section
145.1803(b), or whenever the occupancy classification of a
building changes to a higher Risk Category pursuant to Table
1604.5 of the California Building Code as a result of the proposed
work.

(2) through (3) [No change in text.]

(b) through (g) [No change in text.]

-PAGE9 OF 11i-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

Section 8. That Chapter 14, Article 9, Division 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending section 149.0341, to read as follows:

§149.0341 Local Addition of Section R341 “Sound Transmission Control” to the
California Residential Code

Section R341 is added to the California Residential Code pursuant to Section
149.0106 of the Land Development Code as follows: R341 Sound Transmission
Control. Wall and floor-ceiling assemblies separating dwelling units from each
other and from public or service areas such as intertor corridors, garages, and
mechanical spaces shall provide airborne sound insulation for walls, and both
airborne and impact sound insulation for floor-ceiling assemblies, in compliance
with Section 1206 of the California Building Code. For additional noise
regulations limiting the intrusion of exterior noise into buildings based on land
use standards, see Chapter 13, Article 2, Division 15 of the Land Development
Code.

Section 9. That Chapter 14, Article 11, Division 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by repealing section 1411.0301.

Section 10. That a full reading of this Ordinance is dispensed with prior to passage, a
written copy having been made available to the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage.

Section 11. That this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day from

and after its final passage.

-PAGE 10 OF 11-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

Section 12. That for the amendments in sections 112.0102(d)(1}B) and 129-.021 1 related
to the expiration of permit applications, this Ordinance shall apply retroactively to any permit

application that is submitted or has expired on or after June 1, 2024,

APPROVED: MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attorney

auren N. H endrlckson
Deputy City Attorney

LNH:cm

April 19, 2024

July 10, 2024 COR. COPY
July 12,2024 COR. COPY 2
Or.Dept: DSD

Doc. No. 3628692 _4

I certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed by the Council of the City of San Diego, at this
meeting of JUL 30 2024

DIANA J.S. FUENTES
City Clerk

0.l Do é : ,
Deputy City Clerk
Approved: 8 ‘ FZZ‘ Z
(date) TODD IA, Mayor

Vetoed:

(date) TODD GLORIA, Mayor

-PAGE 11 OF 11-



(0-2024-148)

COR. COPY 2
STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE
OLD LANGUAGE: StruekOut
NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline
ORDINANCE NUMBER O- (NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 2,
DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 112.0102; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTION 129.0108;
AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY
AMENDING SECTIONS 129.0211 AND 129.0218; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY REPEALING
SECTION 145.1203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.1505 AND
REPEALING SECTION 145.1510; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 18 BY AMENDING SECTION
145.1803; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3
BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0341; AND AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3 BY REPEALING
SECTION 1411.0301, RELATING TO AMENDMENTS TO THE
2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE.

§112.0102 Application Proccss
An application for a permit, map, or other matter shall be filed with the City
Manager in accordance with the following requirements:
(a) through (c¢) [No change in text.]
(d) Expiration of Application.
() [No change in text.]
(2)  Extensions.

& (A)  “Fhe-An application for a Demolition/Removal Permit

e e e PR
Grading Permit, Public Right-of-Way Permit, Sign Permit,

or a Process One map may be extended for a period not

-PAGE | OF 10-



§129.0108

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

exceeding 180 calendar days, if the City Manager'
determines that circumstances beyond the control of the
applicant prevented issuance of the permit

Permit, Public Right-

Demolition/Removal Permit, Grading

of-Way Permit, Sign Permit or approval of the Process One

map. In such cases, the existing application shall be
automatically extended until a decision is made regarding
the request for extension.

The City Engineer may extend a Grading Pernmnit

application or a Public Right-of-Wav Permit application for

one additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days from
the expiration date.

The Building Official may extend an application for a
Building Permit, Electrical Permit, Plumbing/Mechanical

Permit, and Fire Permit in accordance with Sections

129.0211, 129.0309, 129.0410 and_129.0907.

(3) through (5) [No change in text.]

Issuance of a Construction Permit

Construction shall not begin until the required permits have been issued. After all

required approvals, including any required development permits, have been

obtained and all required fees have been paid, the Building Official or City

Engineer may issue a construction permit—Construction-shatlnet begin-until-the
required-permits-have-been-issued-_as follows:

-PAGE 2 OF 10-



§129.0211

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

The Building Official may issue Building Permits, Electrical Permits,

Plumbing/Mechanical Permits, Demolition/Removal Permits, Grading

Permits on private [ofs if the Grading Permit does notinclude public

rights-of-way, and Fire Permits.
The City Engineer may issue all other Grading Permits and Public

Right-of-Way Permits.

Closing of Building Permit Application

(a)

(b)
(c)

If ene-year-has-two years have elapsed since the date a Building Permit

application is deemed-complete-deemed complete and the applicant has

not requested that a Building Permit be issued, the application file shall be
closed. Plans and other data submitted for review may be retumed to the
applicant or destroyed by the Building Official. To reapply, the applicant
shall submit a new Building Permit application with required submnittal
materials and shall be subject to alt applicable fees and regulations in
effect on the date the new application is filed.

[No change in text.]

The Building Official may extend a Building Permit application up-te-twe

times-each-for a period not exceeding 180 calendar days; from the date

the Building Permit application was deemed complete 1t the Building

Official determines that circumstances beyond the control of the applicant
prevented issuance of the Building Permit.

The Building Official mav extend a Building Permit application for one

additional period not exceeding 180 calendar days if the Building Official

determines that the building standards effective at the time that the

-PAGE 3 OF 10-



§129.0218

b

te)()

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

Building Permit application was submitted are sufficient to protect public

health and safety or the project complies with significant life and safety

building standards effective at the time that the Building Permit application

was submitted and:

[40)] The additional application extension is in the public interest; or

(2) Circumstances beyond the control of the applicant prevented the
issuance of the Building Permit.

A Building Permit application shall not be extended more than

360 calendar days from the date the Building Permit application was

deemed complete.

If a request to extend the closing date of a Building Permit application has

been filed in accordance with this section, the existing Building Permit

application shall be automatically extended until the Building Official has

made a decision on the request for an extension.

The application for all Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire Permits

associated with a Building Permit shall expire concurrently with the

Building Permit.

Expiration of a Building Permit

(a)

A Building Permit for detached one-_and two-family dwellings or
townhouses, as defined in the California Residential Code, and their
accessory structures, and for the relocation of structures shall expire twe
three years after the date of permit issuance. A Building Permit for all

other projects shall expire four years after the date of permit issuance.

-PAGE 4 OF 10-



(b)

(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not received
final inspection approval by the permit expiration date, all work shall stop
until a new permit is issued. All Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, or Fire

Permits associated with a Building permtt-Permit shall expire concurrently

with the Building Permit.

-PAGE 5 OF 10-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

-PAGE 6 OF 10-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

®) i ; Linsulationboardi o the ai
: ble insulation layer it shall- lodat il
. € eachindividual sheet intes : ;
continteustayer:

§145.1505 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1505 “Fire Classification” of
the California Building Code

(a) through (¢) [No change in text.]

(d) Section 1505.9 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the Land
Developl'nent Code as follows: 1505.9 Rooftop mounted photovoltaic
panel systems. Rooftop rack-mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall be
tested, listed, and identified with a fire classification in accordance with

UE-17063-and-UL 2703 and Section 145.1505(b).

1N o
4 06

§145.1803 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 “Geotechnical
Investigations” of the California Building Code

(a) Section 1803.2 is adopted with additions and modifications pursuant to
Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.
(1) 1803.2.1. A geotechnical investigation shall be conducted when
required by Section 1803.2 of the California Building Code,

Section 145.1803-(d) of the San Diego Municipal Code, or the

-PAGE 7 OF 10-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

Building Official for all new structures, additions to existing
structures not exempted by San Diego Municipal Code Section
145.1803(b), or whenever the occupancy classification of a
building changes to a higher relative-hazard-categery-Risk
Category pursuant to Table 1604.5 of the California Building Code
as a result of the proposed work.
(2) through (3) [No change in text.]
)] through (g) [No change in text.]

§149.0341 Local Addition of Section R341 “Sound Transmission Control” to the
California Residential Code

Section R341 is added to the Califorma Residential Code pursuant to Section
149.0106 of the Land Development Code as follows: R341 Sound Transmission
Control. Wall and floor-ceiling assemblies separating dwelling units from each
other and from public or service areas such as interior corridors, garages, and
mechanical spaces shall provide airborne sound insulation for walls, and both
airborne and impact sound insulation for floor-ceiling assemblies, in compliance
with Section 42871206 of the California Building Code. For additional noise
regulations limiting the intrusion of exterior noise into buildings based on land

use standards, see Chapter 13, Article 2, Diviston 15 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 8 OF 10-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

-PAGE 9 OF 10-



(0-2024-148)
COR. COPY 2

© | rovisi - _Section304-0£4
~ Liformia Exict \ding Code.

LNH:cm

April 19,2024

July 10, 2024 COR. COPY
July 12, 2024 COR. COPY 2
Or.Dept: DSD

Doc. No. 3645455 4

-PAGE 10 OF 10-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on JUL 302024 , by the following vote:

Councilmembers Yeas Nays Not Present  Recused
Joe LaCava
Jennifer Campbell
Stephen Whitburn
Henry L. Foster Il
Marni von Wilpert
Kent Lee
Raul A. Campillo

Vivian Moreno

i e o

Sean Elo-Rivera

AN{EINLNININININN
0 cCcJcacacs
(I I I R I R I

Date of final passage AUG 0 5 2024

TODD GLORIA

AUTHENTICATED BY: Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

DIANA |.S. FUENTES

(Seal) City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

By , Deputy
For Connie Fattersan
| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until tweive calendar
days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

JUL 1 6 204 , and on AUG_0_5 2024

} FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such
reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of
the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day
of its passage.

DIANA I.S. FUENTES

(Seal) City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

. Deputy

or Connie, Rtterson

Office of the City Clerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number O-___ 2 1859




