Proposed Local Amendments to
2010 California Building Standards Code

Report

to the

Board of Building Appeals and
Advisors

Part | - September 2, 2010 meeting

Part 1l - September 30, 2010 meeting

The proposed City of San Diego amendments to the 2010 edition of: California Building Code,

Title 24 Part 2; California Residential Code, Title 24 Part 2.5; California Electrical Code, Title

24 Part 3; California Mechanical Code, Title 24 Part 4; California Plumbing Code, Title 24 Part

5; California Fire Code, Title 24 Part 9; California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24 Part
11.



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments
to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

Introduction:

The report to follow compiles the proposed local amendments to the California Building
Standards Code developed by the City of San Diego Development Services Department in
collaboration with the Fire Rescue Department and the Engineering and Capital Projects
Department with the assistance of the City Attorney. The proposed amendments are necessary to
update the San Diego Municipal Code to correlate with the 2010 edition of the California
Building Standards Code. Additionally the amendments included corrections due to omissions in

certain parts of the California Building Standards Code.

The proposed changes to building standards published in the 2010 edition of the California
Building Standards Code and included in Chapter 14 of the Municipal Code, and which are
included in this amendment package, are prepared pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections

17958.7 and 18941.5 due to San Diego’s local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions.

Correlation of Local Standards to State Code:

The City of San Diego publishes the majority of its building standards in portions of the
Municipal Code identified as the Land Development Code which includes chapter 11 through 15.

Additional regulations can be found in chapter 5 and 9 of the Municipal Code.

The administrative regulations published in the various parts of Title 24 have not been adopted
by the City of San Diego and the local Administrative standards are published in Chapter 11 and
12 of the Municipal Code.

The following State standards are enforced at the local level by the City of San Diego.

1. 2010 California Building Code, Title 24 Part 2
a. Local amendments to building standards are published in the Buildings
Regulations, Chapter 14 Article 5 of the Municipal Code.
b. Administrative standards are in Chapter 11, Chapter 12 Article 9 Div 1, 2.
2. 2010 California Residential Code, Title 24 Part 2.5

Final Page 2 of 8 August 16, 2010



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments
to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

a. Local amendments to building standards in the proposed Residential Building
Regulations, Chapter 14 Article 9 of the Municipal Code.
b. Administrative standards are in Chapter 11, Chapter 12 Article 9 Div 1, 2.
3. 2010 California Electrical Code, Title 24 Part 3
a. Local amendments to electrical standards in the Electrical Regulations,
Chapter 14 Article 6 of the Municipal Code.
b. Administrative standards are in Chapter 11, Chapter 12 Article 9 Div 3.
4. 2010 California Mechanical Code, Title 24 Part 4
a. Local amendments to mechanical standards in the Mechanical Regulations,
Chapter 14 Article 8 of the Municipal Code.
b. Administrative standards are in Chapter 11, Chapter 12 Article 9 Div 4.
5. 2010 California Plumbing Code, Title 24 Part 5
a. Local amendments to plumbing and water efficiency standards in the
Plumbing Regulations, Chapter 14 Article 7 of the Municipal Code.
b. Administrative standards are in Chapter 11, Chapter 12 Article 9 Div 3.
6. 2010 California Energy Code, Title 24 Part 6
a. Enforced without change
7. California Historical Building Code, Title 24 Part 8
a. Enforced without change
8. 2010 California Fire Code, Title 24 Part 9
a. Local amendments to fire code standards in the Fire Protection and Prevention
regulations, Chapter 5 Article 5 of the Municipal Code.
9. California Existing Building Code, Title 24 Part 10
a. Enforced without change with administrative trigger in Chapter14 Article 5
Division 37
10. 2010 California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24 Part 11
a. Local amendments to building standards in the proposed Green Building
Regulations, Chapter 14 Article 10 of the Municipal Code.
11. 2010 California Standard Code, Title 24 Part 12
a. Enforced without change as is applicable by State regulated occupancy.

Local Enforcement:

Development Services through its permit review and inspection process administers all parts of
the California Building Standards Code including State amendments by the following State
agencies pursuant to regulations in the California Health and Safety Code and Government Code.

1. BSC, California Building Standards Commission for all uses and occupancies for which
no other State agency has authority.

Final Page 3 of 8 August 16, 2010



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments

to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

2. SFM. Office of the California State Fire Marshal as outlined in the authority and scope
outlined in Chapter 1 of each applicable part.

3. HCD 1, California Department of Housing and Community Development for all
residential and commercial occupancies that provide for sleeping and living
accommodations.

4. HCD 1-AC, California Department of Housing and Community Development
accessibility standards for all privately funded multi-family housing.

5. DSA-AC, California Division of the State Architect accessibility standards for all public
accommodations including commercial buildings, transient living occupancies such as
hotels and motels as well as publically funded housing.

6. OSHPD3. California Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development regulations
for outpatient clinics seeking State licensing.

7. DWR, California Department of Water Resources for certain recycled water and gray
water issues.

2010 Adoption Process:

Local implementation of the California Building Standards Code is dictated through State law in
the Health and Safety Code. Section 17958 requires that the California Building Standards Code
become effective shall become effective 180 days after publication by the California Building
Standards Commission regardless of whether the City of San Diego adopted the applicable parts
or adopted relevant local amendments as permitted through State law. The effective date for the
2010 California Building Standards Code is January 1, 2011 and will be effective for projects
deemed complete on or after January 1, 2011.

Local amendments to relevant parts of the California Building Standards Code will be effective
30 days after final passage and but not before the amendments are filed with the California
Building Standards Commission.

Time-line: The timeline for the local code adoption process is expected to be as follows. :

1. Board of Building Appeals and Advisors: Seeking recommendation for approval in two
meetings to be held in September (Staff contact Ali Fattah, 619-446-5092,
afattah@sandiego.gov):

a. September 2, 2010 — Part | adoption of the
i. 2010 California Residential Code, Title 24 Part 2.5
ii. 2010 California Electrical Code, Title 24 Part 3
iii. 2010 California Mechanical Code, Title 24 Part 4
iv. 2010 California Plumbing Code, Title 24 Part 5
v. 2010 California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24 Part 11
b. September 30 - Part 11 adoption of the
i. 2010 California Building Code, Title 24 Part 2
ii. 2010 California Fire Code, Title 24 Part 9

Final Page 4 of 8 August 16, 2010



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments

to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

2. Stakeholder Outreach: Mid August through October 2010.
a. Technical Advisory Committee, September 8, 2010
b. Sustainable Energy Advisory Board, September 14, 2010
c. Mailings to various local professional organizations in the construction and design
industry.
Land Use and Housing Committee: If necessary scheduled October 6 or November 10
4. City Council: Estimated November 30 or November 16; Second reading estimated to be
November 30 or December 7.
Mayor final action. Final Action expected December 14 or December 20
6. Local Amendments effective. Local amendments possible effective date January 13,
2010 or January 19, 2010 or sooner.

w

o

Staff Contacts:

Development Services Department
Afsaneh Ahmadi, Deputy Director, Building Official
Ali Fattah, Senior Research Engineer
Keith Bauerle, Deputy City Attorney
Fire Rescue
Frankie Murphy, Deputy Chief, Fire Marshal
Mark Dossett, Fire Prevention Supervisor

Noah Brazier, Deputy City Attorney

Useful Information:

Parts of the California Building Standards Code are based on model codes adopted by the State
of California and amended by various State agencies. As a result certain parts are available for
purchase through publishers such as the International Code Council, The International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials as well as the National Fire Protection
Association and BNI Building News publishers of the California Electrical Code.

Adopted State amendments to the adopted model codes and incorporated into parts of the
California Building Standards Code are available from the California Building Standards
Commission and through the Department of Housing and Community Development as well as
the Office of Statewide Health Planning and the Division of the State Architect and the office of

Final Page 5 of 8 August 16, 2010



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments

to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

the State Fire Marshal. Go to http://www.bsc.ca.gov/prpsd chngs/ApprovedStandards.htm for
more information.

The San Diego Municipal Code is available through the City of San Diego home page on the
world wide web at http://www.sandiego.gov/city-clerk/officialdocs/legisdocs/muni.shtml.

Final Page 6 of 8 August 16, 2010


http://www.sandiego.gov/city-clerk/officialdocs/legisdocs/muni.shtml

Proposed City of San Diego Amendments

§95.0209

to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

Administrative Issues

Obtaining and Posting of Number

(@

Address numbers allotted by the Building Official, Development Services
Department shall be placed on buildings on the transom over the principal

entrance or on some other place on the front of the building where the

number may be visible from the street. Forbuidings-tused-exelusively-for

Q alala N NOSA allalllaalaYal N aYal Q ALO NA-ON N
C v, waAw, v v C v vimiv e, v

1/2)inches-in-height: These numbers shall contrast with their background.

Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.

1) For buildings used exclusively for residential purposes

and complying with the California Residential Code,

address numbers shall comply with the requirements of
Section R319.1 as adopted and amended by the City of

San Diego.
(2) € For all other buildings buHdings-used-al-erin-partfor
commercial, industrial or institutional purposes, such

numbers shall be a minimum of six (6) inches in height

with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch.

In addition to address numbers required in Section 95.0209 (a) address

numbers for one and two-family dwellings and townhouses shall be

permanently added to the side of the curb or on a public side walk located

immediately in front of the main building on a site. The address number

shall be located and placed in a manner subject to the satisfaction of the
Building Official.

It shall be the duty of the lessee, occupant or owner, of any building to

obtain the proper house number from the Building Official, Development
Services Department and to place such number on the building in-guestion
as required by this Division. Ang-itshal-be-a-violation-of the Division-to

fatHHto-se-obtain-and-place-the proper-number-

Final

Page 7 of 8 August 16, 2010



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments
to 2010 CBC, CRC, CMC, CPC, CEC, CGBC

Reason: This code change is necessary for consistency with Section 501.2 of the 2010
California Building Code as well as Section 505.1 of the 2010 California Fire
Code. The additional address identification numbers are necessary identify
buildings completely destroyed due to fire or other natural disasters when the

building identification collapses or is destroyed with a building.

Final Page 8 of 8 August 16, 2010



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

THE FOLLOWING PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE STANDARDS IN CHAPTER 11 AND 12 OF
THE MUNICIPAL CODE WERE NOT INCLUDED IN THE PACKAGE REVIEWED BY THE
BOARD OF BUILDING APPEALS AND ADVISORS IN THE PART | PACKAGE RELEASED FOR
THE SEPTEMBER 2, 2010 MEETING.

Chapter 11 Article 3 Division 1

Update the definition for construction permits to include fire permits. Fire permits are for items
such as spray booths or hood systems, etc.

§113.0103  Definitions
No Changes to definitions from Abutting property through Condominium conversion.

Construction permit means a permit issued pursuant to Land Development Code
Chapter 12, Article 9. Construction permits include the following: Building
Permits, Electrical Permits, Plumbing/Mechanical Permits, Demolition/Removal
Permits, Grading Permits, Public Right-of-Way Permits, Fire Permits and Sign

Permits.

Remainder of section not changed.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-1



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
Chapter 12 Article 1 Division 4

1. Update Section 121.0403 to reflect adoption of the California Residential Code. Also
update the term City Manager to Mayor. Correct reference to CBC rather building
regulations.

8121.0403  Criteria for Determining That a Structure Is Unsafe

The City-Manager Mayor or designated Code Enforcement Official may
determine that a structure is unsafe if any of the following conditions exists to

the extent that it threatens the life, health, safety, or property of its occupants:

@ The building contains one or more structural components that

cannot withstand 100 percent of the vertical design standards as

required by the apphicable-versioen prevailing edition of the Building
Regulations-California Building Code;

(b) The building contains one or more structural components of the lateral

load resisting system that cannot withstand 25 percent of the wind or
earthquake forces as required by the apphicable-version prevailing edition
of the Building-Regulations California Building Code; or

(© The building contains parapet walls or other building appendages

that are not capable of resisting the wind or earthquake forces as

required by the-apphicable prevailing edition of the Building
Regulations California Building Code.

2. Update the sections to follow to reflect the change from City Manager and to reflect the
new regulations added. Green Building Regulations only apply to new buildings so if a
new building is constructed without a permit that circumstance does not require a green
building code reference.

8121.0404  Criteria for Determining That a Structure Is Dangerous

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-2



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
The City-Manager Mayor or designated Code Enforcement Official may

determine that a structure is dangerous if any of the following conditions exists to
the extent that it threatens the health, safety, or property of its occupants or the
public:

Item (a) through (h) are not changed.
(1) The exits of the structure or the means to exit do not conform with the

applicable provisions of the Municipal-Code Building Requlations or the
Residential Building Regulations regarding the number of exits, their

width, or any other features that may cause a hazard to the life or safety of

the occupants or the general public;

Tem (j) No change

(k)  The existing use or occupancy violates the fire, health, or Building,

Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical and Residential Building

Regulations of the Municipal Code.

8§121.0418  Standards for Repair of Unsafe, Dangerous, or Substandard Structures

When the City Manager orders the repair, vacation, or demolition of any unsafe,
substandard, or dangerous structure, the structure shall be repaired in accordance
with the most recent Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical_and

Residential Building Regulations as adopted by the City of San Diego.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-3



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

Ch 12 Article 9 Division 1

1.

Update Section 129.0104 (a) 1, 3, 4, 5, 6 to add Residential Building Regulations and Green
Building Regulations to reflect the addition of Ch 14 Article 9 for Residential Building
Regulations and Ch 14 Article10 for Green Building Regulations.

Add a new item # 4 to clarify the Building Official has the authority to inspect construction
activities.

Section 129.0104 and may portion of Chapter 12 Article 9 Division 1 as structured during the
development of the Land Development Code is intended to be general and to apply to
activities regulated by the City Engineer and the Building Official. However certain
subsections do not apply to City Engineer activities and the term construction permit may not
always apply. Only permits under the authority of the Building Official will be broken out
where appropriate throughout Chapter 12 Article.

due to the proposed change to include Fire Permit under the construction permit definition in
Section 113.0103 Fire Permits are addressed in various divisions in Chapter 12 Article 9.
Add item 13 to clarify the Building Official authority to classify occupancies of buildings.
Update all portions of chapter 12 Article 9 to replace the undefined term Permittee with
Permit Holder for consistency with definition in Section 113.0103

§129.0104 Construction Permit Authorities

@ The powers and duties of the Building Official are as follows:

1) To administer and enforce the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, anéd

Mechanical, Residential Building and Green Building Regulations.

2) To review applications for Building Permits, Electrical Permits,

Plumbing Permits, Demolition/Removal Permits, Fire Permits and

Mechanical Permits including plans, specifications, and other
data.

3) To determine if proposed work is in compliance with the Building,
Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical, Residential Building, Fire

Code and Green Building and other applicable provisions of the

Municipal Code and to make the decision to approve and issue the

appropriate construction permit.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-4



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

(4)

To inspect construction activity not located in the public rights-of-

6]

€5)(6)

61

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010

way to determine if the construction activity is in compliance with

the issued construction permit, the Municipal Code, and adopted

Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Residential Building

and Green Building.

To make interpretations of the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, and
Mechanical, Residential Building and Green Building. The

interpretations, rules, and regulations shall be in conformance with
the intent and purposes of the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, and

Mechanical Regulations.

To grant modifications for individual cases when there are
practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of the

Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical, Residential

Building and Green Building Regulations. The Building Official

shall first find that a special individual reason makes the strict
application of the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical,

Residential Building and Green Building Regulations impractical,

that the modification is in conformance with the purpose and intent
of the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical, Residential

Building and Green Building Regulations, and that the

modification does not lessen any fire protection requirements or
any degree of structural integrity. The details of any action
granting modification shall be recorded and entered in the project
file.

To adopt policies and regulations reasonably necessary to clarify
the application of the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ané
Mechanical, Residential Building and Green Building Regulations.

The policies and regulations shall be in conformance with the

purpose and intent of these regulations.
Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-5



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
£A(8) To request an interpretation of any provisions of this article or
Chapter 14, Articles 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 710, or the suitability of any
alternate material, design, or construction method from the Board
of Building Appeals and Advisors.

8)(9) To keep complete records of all permits issued, inspections and
reinspections made, and other official work performed in
accordance with the provisions of the Land Development Code.

£9)(210) To require the recordation of documents with the County Recorder
as necessary to effectively enforce the requirements of the Land

Development Code.

££6)(11)To request and receive the assistance and cooperation of other

City officials in carrying out these duties.

&H(12)To require plans, computations, and specifications to be prepared
and designed by an engineer or architect licensed by the State of
California, even if not required by state law.

&2(13)To classify the occupancy of building, or a portion of a building,

based on the occupancies and uses in Chapter 3 of the California
Building Code.

7. Modify Section 129.0109 (a), (b) and 129.0110 (a), (b) to add Residential Building
Regulations and Green Building Regulations and to reflect the addition of Ch 14 Article 9 for
Residential Building Regulations and Ch 14 Article10 for Green Building Regulations.

§129.0109 Use of Alternate Materials, Design, or Construction Methods

@ The provisions of the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, aré-Mechanical,

Residential Building and Green Building Regulations are not intended to

prevent the use of any alternate material, design, or construction method

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-6



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

(b)

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

not specifically prescribed by the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, or
Mechanical Regulations, provided the Building Official approves of their

use.

The Building Official may approve use of any alternate material, design,

or construction method if the Building Official determines the following:

1) That the proposed alternate material, design, or construction
method would comply with the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ané

Mechanical, Residential Building and Green Building Regulations;

Remainder of section not changed.

8129.0110  Testing of Materials, Designs, or Construction Methods

(@)

(b)

Whenever the Building Official determines that the evidence submitted is
insufficient to establish compliance with the applicable provisions of the
Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical, Residential Building and

Green Building Regulations, the Building Official may require tests to

prove compliance. These tests shall be made at no expense to the City.

Test methods shall be as specified by the applicable provisions of the
Building, Electrical, Plumbing, ard-Mechanical, Residential Building and

Green Building Regulations or by other recognized test standards. If there

are no recognized and accepted test methods for the proposed alternate,
the Building Official shall determine test procedures.

8. Update Section 129.0111 General Rules for Construction Inspections to focus on permit
activity under the authority of the Building Official and to delete reference to the Land
Development Manual for required construction inspections. No section exists in the LDM for
construction inspections.

8129.0111 General Rules for Construction Permit Inspections

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-7



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

All work for which a Building Permits, Electrical Permits, Plumbing Permits,

Demolition/Removal Permits, Fire Permits and Mechanical Permits censtruction

permit is issued shall be subject to inspection by the Building Official. Required

inspections shall be performed in accordance with the inspection procedures

established by the City Manager, except as may be exempted by the Land
Development Code. Inspections that may be required are-tisted-in-the-Land

Development-Manual-are as is established by the Building Official.

(a)

(b)

(©)

(d)

(€)

(f)

The permittee permit holder shall be informed of the inspections and the
sequence of inspections required for the construction permit.

No work shall be done beyond the point indicated in each successive
inspection without first obtaining the approval of the Building Official.

No portion of any construction work shall be concealed until inspected

and approved.

After making the requested inspections, the Building Official shall either
indicate that the inspected portion of the construction is satisfactory as
completed or shall notify the permittee permit holder or an agent of the
permittee permit holder that the inspected portion fails to comply with the
Building, Electrical, Plumbing, or Mechanical Regulations or with other
applicable regulations of the Municipal Code.

Any portions of work that do not comply with requirements shall be
corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until

inspected and authorized by the Building Official.

A survey of the lot may be required to verify that the structure is located

in accordance with the approved plans.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-8



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

§129.0112

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

(@)  Afinal inspection, with approval of all structures and installations, is
required before occupancy and use, unless specifically excepted. If
grading is involved, final inspection shall be after finish grading.

(h) The Building Official is authorized to accept reports of approved

inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to

gualifications and reliability.

Responsibilities of Permittee Permit Holder or Authorized Agent Regarding

Inspections

(a)

(b)

Requesting an Inspection. It shall be the responsibility of the permittee
permit holder or the person doing the work authorized by a construction
permit to notify the Building Official when work is ready for inspection.
The request shall be in accordance with procedures established by the City
Manager. The Building Official may require that every request for
inspection be filed at least one business day before the inspection is

desired.

Providing Access for Inspections. The person requesting any inspection
required by the Building, Electrical, Plumbing,-e¥ Mechanical, Residential

Building or Green Building Regulations or the Land Development Code

shall be responsible for providing access to, and means for inspection of,
the work to be inspected. Neither the Building Official nor the City shall
be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any

material required to allow inspection.

Remainder of section subsection (c) through (e) not changed

9. Add a code change to Section 129.0113 for limits on certificate of occupancy and include
buildings and structures approved under the California Residential Code. Update the
reference to Ch 34 of the CBC due to chapter renumbering in the CBC.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-9



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

8§129.0113  When a Certificate of Occupancy Is Required

(@)

(b)

No structure or portion of a structure shall be used or occupied, and no

change in the existing use or occupancy classification of a structure or
portion of a structure shall be made until the Building Official has issued a

certificate of occupancy approving that use or occupancy;-exeeptthat

existing or new one and two family dwellings, and townhouses as defined

in chapter 2 of the California Residential Code, and their accessory

structures.

Changes in the eharaeter-er use or occupancy of a building shall not be
made except as specified in the 2004 California Building Code Section
3405 Section 3408.

10. Update Section 129.0114 to include the list of required items provided in Section 111.2 of

the 2010 CBC Chapter 1 Division Il on content of certificate of occupancy. The Division in
the CBC is not adopted by the City of San Diego.

8§129.0114 Issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy

(a)

The Building Official shall inspect the structure and if the Building
Official finds no violations of the Land Development Code or other
regulations that are enforced by the City’s designated Code Enforcement
Officials, the Building Official shall issue a Certificate of Occupancy. All
work for which a Building Permit was issued must be complete and have
had a final inspection before issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy,
except in accordance with Section 129.0115. The Certificate of
Occupancy must be signed by the Building Official. Issuance of a
certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-10



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

violation of any of the provisions of the Municipal Code or any other local

or State requlations.

(b) A certificate of occupancy shall contain the following information:

1)
)
©)
(4)

()

(6)
(7)

(8)

(9)

(10)

(11)

(12)

The approval number.

The address of the structure.

The name and address of the permit holder.

A description of that portion of the structure for which the

certificate is issued.

A statement that the described portion of the structure has been

inspected for compliance with the requirements of this code for the

occupancy and division of occupancy and the use for which the

proposed occupancy is classified.

The signature of the Building Official or designated official.

The edition of the California Building Code under which the

permit was issued.

The use and occupancy, in accordance with the provisions of
Chapter 3 of the California Building Code.

The type of construction as defined in Chapter 6 of the California
Building Code.

The design occupant load in rooms used for public assembly and

classified in Occupancy Group A.

If an automatic sprinkler system is provided and the reason that the

automatic sprinkler is provided.

Any special stipulations and conditions of the building permit.

11. Modify Section 129.0115 based on CBC Section 111.3 to include that the temporary
occupancy can be granted when a building or portion of a building can be safely occupied
and to include provisions of a time limit for a temporary certificate of occupancy. Typically
certificates of occupancy have a 30 day time limit and are only granted when all building
construction necessary for fire, health and life safety are approved.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010

Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-11


http://ecodes.iccsafe.org/icce/gateway.dll?f=xhitlist$xhitlist_x=Advanced$xhitlist_vpc=first$xhitlist_xsl=querylink.xsl$xhitlist_sel=title;path;content-type;home-title$xhitlist_d=ICodes2006(IBC2006)$xhitlist_q=%5bfield%20folio-destination-name:'IBC2006CH3'%5d$xhitlist_md=target-id=0-0-0-537

Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

§129.0115 Issuance of a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy

If the Building Official finds that a structure or a portion of a structure can be

occupied safely, and that no substantial hazard will result from occupancy of any

structure or portion of a structure before all work is completed, a temporary

certificate of occupancy may be issued for the use of a structure, or portion of a

structure before the completion of the entire structure. A Certificate of

Occupancy is required upon completion of the remainder of the work. The

Building Official shall set a time period during which the temporary certificate of

occupancy is valid.

12. Revise the term Permittee and revise to Permit Holder.

8129.0119  Bond Required for Construction Permit for Grading or Public

Improvements

Subsection (a) no change

(b)

(©)

The permittee permit holder may utilize an annual and continuing bond for
more than one permit provided the total amount of the bond exceeds the
aggregate bond amount of the permits outstanding. Annual and
continuing bonds shall contain a clause providing the City Manager with

30 calendar days notice before cancellation.

In lieu of a bond, the permittee permit holder may post a cash deposit, or
other security acceptable to the City Manager, with the City Treasurer in
an amount equal to the required bond. In the event of a default, the notice
of the default as provided above shall be given to the principal and if the
default is not corrected within the time specified, the City Manager shall
proceed without delay and without further notice of proceeding to use the
cash deposit or other security or any portion of the deposit or security to

complete the required work. The balance, if any, of the cash deposit shall,

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-12



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part 11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
upon completion of the work, be returned to the applicant after deducting

the cost of the work.

Remainder of Section not changed

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-13



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

Ch 12 Article 9 Division 2

1. Update Section 129.0203 (a)

a.

§129.0203

Exemption # 12 needs to clarify that the addition of a patio cover will require the
installation of smoke alarms pursuant to SFM amendment in Section R314.3.1 # 2
smoke alarms in the dwelling required when patio covers or outdoor attached
structures are proposed.

Update exemption # 23 (E) for window replacements to reference the CRC
Sections R14 for smoke alarms, R315 for Carbon Monoxide detectors? And
Section 310 for emergency escape and rescue openings.

i. This section remains consistent with the CRC since the rough opening is
not being changed and nor the weather resistive envelope so the 25% limit
should not apply to the existing openings where a replacement window is
slipped over the existing window.

Clarify limits to permit exemption for replacement of roof covering to eliminate
confusion that the Development Services Department has attempted to clarify in
the publication of Information Bulletin IB 123 Replacement of Roof Covering.
Delete item #19 since acute care hospitals are under State OSHPD jurisdiction.
Update item # 22 references to the 2010 CRC.

Add a new item # 23 to exempt from a building permit new parking lots having
less than 4 four spaces. Table 142.0402 item # 3 and Section 142.0402 trigger a
building permit for certain new parking lots having four or more spaces. The table
is in the landscape requirements and results in an accessibility review, drainage
and grading review and landscape review.

Exemptions from a Building Permit

@ A Building Permit is not required for the following structures and

activities.

Item (1) through item (11) no change

(12) Patio cover structures attached to or detached from single dwelling
units in the RE, RS, and RX zones in the following circumstances,
except in the appealable area of the Coastal Overlay Zone or in

Planned Developments:

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-14



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

(A)  The patio cover structure has 300 square feet or less of

projected roof area.
(B)  The patio cover structure does not encroach into any yard.
(C)  The patio cover structure is 12 feet or less above grade.

(D) When value work in constructing a patio cover that is

attached to a one and two family dwelling, or townhouses

as defined in Chapter 2 of the California Residential Code,

exceeds $1,000, smoke alarms shall be provided within

dwellings or dwelling units to which the patio cover

structure is attached pursuant Section R314 of the

California Residential Code.

Subsection (13) through (16) no change

(17)

(18)

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010

Renewal of roof coverings on any building buidings-where the
existing roof structure, including roof diaphragm, is not altered and

where the additional dead load on sloped roofs (slope more than

2:12) due to recovering permitted in Section 1510 of the California
Building Code and Section R906 of the California Residential

Code is less than 6 pounds per square foot..

Repairs that involve only the replacement of components or
existing work with similar materials for the purpose of
maintenance, that do not have an aggregate valuation of over
$1,000.00, and that do not affect any electrical or mechanical
installations. Repairs exempt from permit requirements shall not
include any addition, change, or modification in construction, exit
facilities, or permanent fixtures or equipment. The following
repairs are exempt from permit requirements without limit to

valuation:

Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-15



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
(A)  Painting and decorating;

(B) Installation of floor covering;
(C)  Cabinet work; and
(D)  OQutside paving.

10} Hospital Buildi lofined in California Health and Saf

Item (20) through (22) not changed renumber (19) through (21)

£23) (22)Installing replacement windows in existing window openings

where all of the following conditions apply:

(A)  The “replacement windows” are installed in a single family

residence or a duplex.

(B)  The proposed window replacement shall not require any
modifications to the weather resistive exterior wall
envelope protecting the structure or the interior of the

structure.

(C)  The existing windows to be replaced are not required to be

fire resistive.

(D)  The proposed work shall not require modifications to the

existing rough openings.

(E)  Exemption from a building permit shall not exempt
compliance with the emergency escape requirements of
Section 310-4 R310 of the 2001 California Residential
Buiding Code and the provision ef for smoke deteetors

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-16



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
alarms per the requirements of Section 316-9 R314 of said

code.

(23) New permanent parking and vehicular use area for less than four vehicles

including access to the spaces, excluding parking for single dwelling unit

uses on a single lot in single dwelling unit zones.

(24)  Specific structures as determined by the Building Official for a particular

and justifiable reason.
Remainder of Section not changed
2. Modify Section 129.0207 for consistency with Section 129.0206 last sentence where the

Building Official can require certain projects to be signed by a registered design professional
if not required by the Business and Professions Code.

8129.0207  Designation of Architect or Engineer of Record on Plans

When state law or the Building Official, requires that documents be prepared by

an architect or engineer licensed by the State of California, the architect or
engineer of record shall be designated on the plans in the manner required by state

law.

3. Update Section 129.0208 to add coordination responsibility to architect or engineer of record
to require one overall professional to be in responsible charge of projects that have
subconsultants, for example a structural engineer designing the concrete portion of a podium
building and a second structural engineer designing the structure above.

§129.0208  Coordination Responsibilities of Architect or Engineer of Record

@ The architect or engineer of record shall be responsible for reviewing and

coordinating all submittal documents, including documents for partial

building permits and deferred submittal items, prepared by others for

compatibility with the design of the building.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-17



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
(b) If deferred submittals are requested and approved, the architect or
engineer of record shall list the deferred submittals on the plans. The
architect or engineer of record shall be responsible for reviewing and
coordinating deferred submittals and for forwarding them to the Building
Official with a notation indicating that the deferred submittal documents
have been reviewed and that they have been found to be in general

conformance with the design of the building.

4. Revise permittee to permit holder.

8129.0209  Change of Architect or Engineer of Record

If the circumstances require and in accordance with state law, the applicant or
permittee permit holder may designate a substitute architect or engineer of record
licensed by the State of California who shall perform all of the duties required of
the original architect or engineer of record. The Building Official shall be
notified in writing by the applicant or permittee permit holder if the architect or
engineer of record is changed or is unable to continue to perform the duties.

5. Update Section129.0211 to reflect current terminology where the deemed complete date is

the application date that establishes the permit application review timeline and from which
the expiration dates are established.

8§129.0211  Closing of Building Permit Application

@ If one year has elapsed since the date-efsubmittal-efa-Building Permit

application is deemed complete and the applicant has not requested that a

Building Permit be issued, the application file shall be closed. Plans and
other data submitted for review may be returned to the applicant or
destroyed by the Building Official. To reapply, the applicant shall submit
a new Building Permit application with required submittal materials and

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10
Page Admin-18




Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

shall be subject to all applicable fees and regulations in effect on the date

the new application is filed.

(b) The application file for City projects shall be closed after two years have

elapsed since the date-of submittal-of a-Building-Permit-application date

the Building Permit application is deemed complete.

Remainder of Section not changed.

Note to City Clerk:

Subsection (c) and (d) not changed however the hanging indents neeed to be .5 and not .25 as
currently published.

6. Update Section 129.0214 to be consistent with Section 1.8.4.3.1 of the CBC and Section
1.3.3.1 of the CRC. The SDMC currently requires retention of plans for 90 days however the
referenced CBC and CRC sections

¢ DIVISION 13. HOUSING, Part 3, Chapter 10 of State Housing Law in the Health
and Safety Code requires that certain plans be retained. This is an administrative
standard and the City may retain more.

o 19850. The building department of every city or county shall maintain an
official copy, which may be on microfilm or other type of photographic copy,
of the plans of every building, during the life of the building, for which the
department issued a building permit.

"Building department™ means the department, bureau, or officer charged with
the enforcement of laws or ordinances regulating the erection, construction,
or alteration of buildings.
Except for plans of a common interest development as defined in Section 1351
of the Civil Code, plans need not be filed for:
(@) Single or multiple dwellings not more than two stories and basement in
height.
(b) Garages and other structures appurtenant to buildings described under
subdivision (a).
(c) Farm or ranch buildings.
(d) Any one-story building where the span between bearing walls does not
exceed 25 feet. The exemption in this subdivision does not, however, apply to
a steel frame or concrete building.
e Section 107.5 in Chapter 1 Division Il which is not adopted by the City of San Diego
requires retention of plans for not less than 180 days, which is longer than the 90 days
Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-19



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

currently in the SDMC. State law only includes requirements for housing due to
amendments to the CBC and CRC by HCD.

8129.0214 Requirements for Approved Plans

@ Plans and specifications that are approved as part of the application for a
Building Permit shall be signed and stamped “APPROVED” by the
Building Official and shall be filed as an attachment to the Building
Permit. Approved plans and specifications shall not be changed,

modified, or altered without authorization of the Building Official.

(b) Except as required by Sections 19850 and 19851 of the Health and Safety

Code, the building official shall retain one set of approved plans,

specification and computations for aperied-ef-not-lessthan-90-calendar
days for the life of the building for which a Building Permit has been

issued

dispose-of-the-copies-or-Copies shall be retained retairthem as a part of

the permanent files of the Development Services Department.

7. Update Sections 129.0215 through 129.0219 updates for permit holder, permit expiration
rules as well as requirement for permit extensions.

a. Make clear that the overall utilization period of 2 or 4 years in subsection

129.0218 cannot be extended.
. Ensure that an inspection validates whether work has commenced or completed.

c. In Section 129.0215 clarify that the scope of work under a partial permit can be
based on the code in effect for the foundation if the foundation has been approved
due to a passed inspection. Additionally, partial permits can comply with codes in
effect at the time of application for the partial permit. The structural design for
buildings is in the direction of load path for vertical and lateral loads from the top
of the building down to the foundation and as a result it is not possible for the
foundation and remainder of the structure to be structurally designed for different
loads.

8129.0215 Issuance of a Building Permit for a Part of a Structure.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10
Page Admin-20




Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

§129.0216

§129.0217

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
The Building Official may issue a permit, and work may begin, for the
construction of part of a structure before the plans and specifications for the entire
structure have been submitted or approved, if adequate information and detailed
statements have been submitted complying with all applicable requirements of the
Building Code. As a condition of issuance, the permittee- permit holder shall
agree that he or she proceeds at his or her own risk without assurance that the
Building Permit for the entire structure will be issued. The partial construction
shall comply with the Building Regulations and any other regulation in effect on

the date the permit application for the scope of work under the partial permit is

submitted to, and is accepted by the Building Official. If a foundation inspection

is completed, the construction of the remainder of the structure may rely on the

Building Code in effect at the time the foundation permit was deemed complete.

Initial Utilization of a Building Permit

shall become void if substantial work authorized by the permit has not

commenced and validated by an inspection within 180 calendar days of the date

of permit issuance unless an extension has been granted pursuant to Section
129.02109.

Maintaining Utilization of a Building Permit

A Building Permit shall become void if at-any-time-after-the-werk—is-begun,-the
K authorized byt i1di _ todor_abandened
for a-continveusperiod-of-180-calendar-days—substantial work authorized by the

permit has not been completed and validated by an inspection, or the work is

suspended or the structure is abandoned for a continuous period of 180 calendar

days unless an extension has been granted per Section 129.0219.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-21



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

8§129.0218  Expiration of a Building Permit

(a)

(b)

A Building Permit for single dwelling unit or two-dwelling unit projects,

and for the relocation of structures shall expire-by-Hmitationand become
void two years after the date of permit issuance, urless-an-exceptionis
granted-in-accordance-with-Section129-0218(b). A Building Permit for all
other projects shall expire-by-Hmitation-and become void four years after

the date of permit issuance.

If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not received
final inspection approval by the permit expiration date per Section
129.0218 (a), all work shall stop until a new permit is issued eran
extension-of-time-is-approved-in-accordance-with-Seetion-129.0219. All

Electrical, Plumbing, or Mechanical Permits and Fire Permits associated

with a Building Permit shall expire concurrently with the Building Permit.

8129.0219 Extension of Time for a Building Permit

(@)

Except for relocation of structures, a permittee-permit holder may submit
to the Building Official and application for and extension of time before
the expiration date of the Building Permit due to the limitations of Section
129.0216 and 129.0217. The application shall be filed no later than one

month in advance of the expiration date. The Building Official may extend

the Building Permit one time, for a period not exceeding 180 calendar
days, if the Building Official determines that circumstances beyond the
control of the permittee-permit holder prevented completion of the work.

All Electrical, Plumbing, or Mechanical Permits and Fire Permits

associated with a Building Permit shall be extended to expire concurrently
with the Building Permit. An extension of time shall not cause the overall

permit validity to exceed the time limits in Section 129.0218 (a).

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-22



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
(b) If an application for an extension of time has been filed before expiration
and in accordance with this section, the existing Building Permit shall
automatically be extended until the Building Official has made a decision
on the application for an extension.

(© If the Building Permit has expired pursuant to Sections 129.0216 and

129.0217 before an application is submitted for an extension of time, no
extension shall be granted. If the previous permittee-permit holder or any
other applicant wants to proceed with the same development, a new
application is required and the application is treated in all respects as a
new application.

(d) If an extension of time has been previously approved in accordance with
Section 129.0219 (a), the Building Official may extend the expiration of

the Building Permit one additional time, for a period not exceeding 180

calendar days, if the Building Official finds the following:

1) There has not been a significant change in the regulations
applicable to the site since the date the permit was issued,

2 The additional extension is in the public interest; and

3) Circumstances beyond the control of the applicant prevented the
authorized work from proceeding.

(4)  The Building Permit has not expired by limitation per Section
129.0218.

Note to City Clerk: Subsection (d) line 2, reference to section 129.0219 (a) requires a space
between the section and subsection referenced and the correction is reflected above.

8. Revise permittee to permit holder

129.0220 Issuance of a Building Permit for Relocation of a Structure

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-23



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

Subsection (a) no change

(b) If the performance of the work is secured by a surety bond, the bond shall
be conditioned as follows:

Item (1) through (3) no change

4) The permittee permit holder, owner, and surety shall hold harmless
the City, its officers, employees, agents, and contractors from any
liability in connection with the proposed work or the abatement of
the structure and any related work;

(5) The bond shall obligate the permittee permit holder, owner, and
surety to repair damage occurring on the public right-of-way as a

result of removing, transporting, or relocating a structure; and

Remainder of Section not changed.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-24



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

Ch 12 Article 9 Division 3 (Electrical)

1. Revisions to Section 129.0307 were included proposed code changes in the Part |
package to subsection (e) through (g) below are repeated for clarity.
2. Add a new subsection (h) to clarify that certain renewable energy projects such as

solar photovoltaics, wind turbines etc. require the preparation of plans and submittal
for a building permit review or an electrical permit review.

8129.0307  How to Apply for an Electrical Permit

@) An application for an Electrical Permit shall be submitted in accordance
with Sections 112.0102 and 129.0105.

(b) Every application shall include the following information:

(1)  The location of the work proposed to be installed; and

(2)  The amount and kind of work proposed.

(© Submittal documents including plans, specifications, and schedules may
be necessary to determine whether the installation as described will be in
compliance with the requirements of this article.

(d) Electrical plans shall be submitted for the following types of installations:
(1)  All commercial and industrial installations;

(2 Multiple dwelling buildings that have electrical heating and
contain three or more units (a single line diagram will not be
required if the electrical service is single phase and not more than
400 amps); and

3) Multiple dwelling buildings that have no electrical heating and
contain four or more units.

4 The Building Official may require that electrical and structural
plans be submitted for renewable energy projects including
electrical equipment such as but not limited to wind turbines and

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-25



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

similar equipment generating electricity from wind power, certain

ground or roof mounted solar photovoltaic and other similar

equipment as determined by the Building Official.

(e All submitted plans shall show a single line diagram of service, feeders,
conduit, and wire sizes. Electrical calculations shall accompany all
submitted plans. A Signed Certification ef for Compliance with
California-Administrative-CodeFitle24 the California Energy Code, Title
24 Part 6 shall appear on the plans.

()] All submitted plans shall be signed as required by the California Business
and Professions Code, Chapter 7 Article 3 Bivisien-3.

(9) All plans required for hospitals and electrical installations operating in
excess of 600 volts shall be signed by a State-Registered California

Licensed Electrical Engineer.

2. Update Sections 129.0301, 129.0311, 129.0314 to be consistent with structure in Sections
129.0216, 129.0217 and 129.011 for electrical permit expirations and utilization.
a. Create a new subsection (b) in Section 129.0310 to include repealed subsection
(@) in Section 129.0315.
b. Create a new subsection (c) in Section 129.0313 to reflect repealed portions of
Section 129.0313 (b).

8129.0310 Initial Utilization of an Electrical Permit

Electrical Permit shall become void if substantial work authorized by the permit

has not commenced and validated by an inspection within 180 calendar days of

the date of permit issuance unless an extension has been granted pursuant to
Section 129.0313.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-26



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

§129.0311

§129.0313

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

Maintaining Utilization of an Electrical Permit

A Electrical Permit shall become void if substantial work authorized by

(b)

the permit has not been completed and validated by an inspection, or the

work is suspended or the structure is abandoned for a continuous period of

180 calendar days, or per Section 129.0311 (b) unless an extension has
been granted per Section 129.0313.

If any person to whom an Electrical Permit has been issued guits suspends

work on an installation, the permittee permit holder—ewner—or-owner’s

authorized representative shall notify the Building Official in writing. The
notice shall be given within 2 calendar days of the date on which work

was discontinued and shall include a request for inspection of the work

installed. Upon receipt of this notification by the Building Official, the

Electrical Permit shall become void.

No Extension of Time for an Electrical Permit

(a)

(b)

(©)

An expired Electrical Permit may not be renewed unless extended by the

Building Official in connection with the extension of a Building Permit.

A new Electrical Permit is required to finish any work that was not
finished because of the expiration of the permit; however, unfinished work
may be removed without a permit. All work under a new Electrical Permit
must comply with the regulations in effect at the time the new permit is

issued.

No person shall resume work on any incomplete installation that has been

abandoned per Section 129.0311 (b) until the installation has been

released by the Building Official and a new Electrical Permit has been

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-27



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations
obtained. A copy of the notice shall accompany the application for the

new permit.

8129.0314  Required Inspections for an Electrical Permit

All construction work and equipment authorized by an Electrical Permit shall be
inspected by the Building Official in accordance with Section 129.0111 and-the

tnspectionrequirements-of the-Land-Development-Manual-. Inspections that may

be required are as is established by the Building Official.

3. Repeal Section 129.0315 relocate subsection (a) to 129.311 and subsection (b) to 129.313
where appropriate.

8129.0315  Notification of Incomplete Installations

@) If any person to whom an Electrical Permit has been issued quits an
installation, the permittee permit holder, owner, or owner’s authorized
representative shall notify the Building Official in writing. The notice
shall be given within 2 calendar days of the date on which work was
discontinued and shall include a request for inspection of the work
installed. Upon receipt of this notification by the Building Official, the

Electrical Permit shall become void.

(b) No person shall resume work on any incomplete installation until the
installation has been released by the Building Official and a new Electrical
Permit has been obtained. A copy of the notice shall accompany the

application for the new permit.

§129.63160315 No Deviation from Electrical Permit Without Approval

The Electrical Permit shall be for the installation described in the permit
application and no deviation shall be made from the installation so described

without the written approval of the Building Official.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-28



Proposed City of San Diego Amendments — Part |11

§129.03170316

Construction Permit Administrative Regulations

Temporary Electrical Permit

Remainder of section not changed.

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(€)

The Building Official may issue a Temporary Electrical Permit for the
following types of electrical installations:

1) Construction Power. The temporary power authorization shall be
for the time construction is in progress;

2 Carnivals, Conventions, Festivals, Fairs, and similar events. The
temporary power authorization shall be for the time the event is in
progress, not to exceed 90 calendar days; and

3) The Testing of Any Permanent System of Wiring Prior to the Final
Approval of That System. The temporary power authorization shall
be for the time required for testing, not to exceed 30 calendar days.

The Building Official shall determine that the safety of life and property
will not be jeopardized by the temporary electrical installation.

All temporary installations shall conform as nearly as practicable with the
requirements of the Electrical Regulations for permanent installations. The
Building Official may permit deviations that will not cause hazard to life
or property.

If the Building Official subsequently determines that the electrical
installation is a hazard to life or property, the Building Official may
immediately rescind or cancel the temporary permit covering the
installations and disconnect or order disconnection of all energy to the
equipment.

Upon the expiration of the time designated in the temporary permit, the
Building Official may disconnect or order disconnection of all electrical
energy authorized by the temporary permit.

Boa Meeting 10-07-2010 Doc date 9/23/10

Page Admin-29



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(5-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 1: Adoption of the 2807 2010 California Fire Code

(““Fire Code” added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)
(““Adoption of the Uniform Fire Code (1994 Edition)”added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Retitled to ““Adoption of the California Fire Code (1998 Edition)” 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)
(Retitled to “Adoption of the California Fire Code (2001 Edition)™ 9-24-2002 by O-19103 N.S.)
(Retitled to “Adoption of the 2007 California Fire Code™ 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§55.0101

(Retitled to “Adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code’ and

amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

Adoption of the 2007 2010 California Fire Code Purpose and Intent, and
Administrative Provisions

(a)

(b)

(©

Portions of the California Fire Code (2006% 2010 Edition) adopted. Except as
otherwise provided in this Article, the California Fire Code (206% 2010
Edition), which incorporates and amends the International Fire Code (2006
2009 Edition), including adopted appendices, is hereby adopted by reference.
A copy of the California Fire Code (206+ 2010 Edition), is on file in the office
of the City Clerk as Document No. O0-19728 XXXXX. The California Fire
Code (206% 2010 Edition), is referred to in this Article as the 2007 2010
California Fire Code.

San Diego Fire Code. The document known as the San Diego Fire Code
consists of the following documents:

1) Those portions of the 2007 2010 California Fire Code adopted by the
City in section 55.0101 with changes as specified in this Article.

(2 Sections 55.0101 through 55:4901 55.5001 of Chapter 5, Article 5, of
the San Diego Municipal Code.

3) Applicable sections of the California Code of Regulations.

Relationship of the San Diego Municipal Code section numbers to the 2007
2010 California Fire Code section numbers. Sections within the 2007 2010
California Fire Code retain those same section numbers when referred to
within the text of the San Diego Municipal Code. Thus, Section 901 of the
2007 2010 California Fire Code will be cited as the 200 2010 California Fire
Code section 901 within the text of the San Diego Municipal Code.

Ch. Art. Div.

1



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(5-2008 1-2011)

Ch. Art. Div.

2

(d)

(€)

(f)

(9)

Where a section of the 200 2010 California Fire Code is adopted with
changes, it is promulgated within the Municipal Code by using a numbering
system to reflect both the Municipal Code numbering system and the 2007
2010 California Fire Code numbering system. For example, section 901 of the
2007 2010 California Fire Code is adopted with changes in San Diego
Municipal Code section 55.0901. The first two digits to the left of the first
decimal point are the chapter and article number of the San Diego Municipal
Code. The two digits to the right of the first decimal point represent the San
Diego Municipal Code’s division number. The last four digits reflect the
numbering system of the 2007 2010 California Fire Code. A zero (0) after the
decimal point is a filler to accommodate the San Diego Municipal Code
numbering system and is added when the section number in the 2007 2010
California Fire Code is less than four digits.

The Municipal Code numbering system reflects the numbering system of the
2007 2010 California Fire Code excluding the chapter and article numbers to
the left of the decimal point and when appropriate, the utilization of a filler
zero (0). Consequently, with these modifications, the numbering in the San
Diego Municipal Code sections 55.0101 through 55-476% 55.5001
corresponds with the numbering system change in the 2667 2010 California
Fire Code.

Definitions. Whenever the following terms appear within the text of the 2007
2010 California Fire Code, they shall have the following definitions:

Fire Code Official means the Fire Chief of the City of San Diego.
Municipality or jurisdiction means the City of San Diego.

Prospective and Retrospective Application. Unless specifically stating that
they may be applied prospectively only, provisions of the San Diego Fire
Code may be retrospectively applied in accordance with the 20067 2010
California Fire Code, Appendix Chapter 1, Section 102.

Effective Date. Unless otherwise stated in a specific San Diego Municipal
Code section or 200+ 2010 California Fire Code section adopted by the City,
the effective date of the 2007 2010 California Fire Code shall be January 1,
2008 2011.

Reference to California Building Code. Any reference within the San Diego
Fire Code to the “C.B.C or California Building Code” shall refer to those
provisions of the California Building Code as adopted by Chapter 14 of the
San Diego Municipal Code.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(5-2008 1-2011)

(h) Portions of the 2807 2010 California Fire Code not adopted. The following
sections of the 2007 2010 California Fire Code are not adopted:

APPENDIX A
APPENDIX D
APPENDIX E
APPENDIX F
APPENDIX G
304.1.2
Reason: 1. Appendix Chapter 1 does not exist in the 2010 CFC. 2. Editorial. Section 304.1.2 was intended to be

adopted; however, it inadvertently appears both in this section and in §55.0101 Modifications to the California Fire
Code.

(Amended 4-8-2008 X-X-2011 by O-19728 XXXXX N.S; effective 5-8-2008 X-X-2011.)

§55.0102 Modifications to the 2667 2010 California Fire Code Adopted by the City of San
Diego

The following sections or sub-sections of the 266+ 2010 California Fire Code have
been modified by the City of San Diego:

b)(@) Appendix Chapter 1, Section 108, Board of Appeals.
&)(b) Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2, Vegetation.

©) Chapter 3, Section 307.4.1, Bonfires

(d)  Chapter 5, Section 505.1, Address identification.

{e)(e) Chapter 5, Section 5088:5:-% 507.5.1, Where required.

{d)(f) Chapter 9, Section 901.7, Problematic systems and Ssystems out of service.

Reason: Chapters, titles and sections updated to coordinate with the numbering system in the 2010 CFC and to correct

previous editorial errors.
Ch. Art. Div.

3



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(5-2008 1-2011)

(Amended 4-8-2008 X-X-2011 by O-19728 XXXXX N.S; effective 5-8-2008 X-X-2011.)

855.0103 Adoption of Appendices to the 266+ 2010 California Fire Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 2064 2010 California Fire Code are adopted
by the City of San Diego:

{b)(@) Appendix Chapter 4, Special Detailed Requirements Based On Use And
Occupancy.

{e)(b) Appendix B, Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings.

©) Appendix BB, Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings.

(d) Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution.

(e) Appendix CC Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution.

() Appendix H, Hazardous Materials Management Plans and Hazardous
Materials Inventory Statements.

Reason: 1. Appendix Chapter 1 does not exist in the 2010 CFC. The text was relocated to CFC Chapter 1, Division 2.
2. Appendix BB and CC were previously adopted by the State; however, they were inadvertently excluded from the
adoption ordinance. 3. Editorial. Appendix H was inadvertently split into two subsections in the previous ordinance.
Additionally, a portion of the body of the code was inadvertently copied into the Appendix H title. Both of these
editorial issues were corrected here.

(Amended 4-8-2008 X-X-2011 by O-19728 XXXXX N.S; effective 5-8-2008 X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

4



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(5-2008 1-2011)

855.0104 2007 California Fire Code, Chapter 1 - General-Code-Previsions Scope and
Administration

@) 1041 1.1.1 Title through 334 113.5 Reserved Refunds. Sections 4641 1.1.1
through 114 113.5 of the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted
without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

Reason: Appendix Chapter 1 was relocated by the State and combined with Chapter 1 in the 2010 CFC. Chapter title
and Section numbers were updated to coordinate with the numbering system in the 2010 C.F.C.

(Amended 4-8-2008 X-X-2011 by O-19728 XXXXX N.S; effective 5-8-2008 X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

5



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(5-2008 1-2011)

§55.0201

Ch. Art. Div.

6

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 2: Definitions
(“Definitions’added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)
(“Definitions’ amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

Definitions

@) 201.1 Scope through 202 General Definitions. Sections 201.1 through 202 of
the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant to
section 55.0101(a).

a O Q N - affactiva Q

gaes 008-b\vO 4 N5 S, 0 <
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S: effective X-X-2011.)




San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 3: General Precautions Against Fire

(“General Precautions Against Fire” added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)
(“General Precautions Against Fire”” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

855.0301 General Precautions Against Fire

(a)

301.1 Scope through 304.1.1 Waste material. Sections 301.1 through 304.1.1
of the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant
to section 55.0101(a).

(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

855.0304 Combustible Waste Material

(a)

304.1.2 Vegetation

Weeds, grass, vines or other growth that is capable of being ignited and
endangering property, shall be cut down and removed by the owner or
occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance requirements in the urban-
wildland interface areas shall be in accordance with Chapter 49 and the City
of San Diego Land Development Code.

Reason: Editorial. “Chapter 49” was inadvertently deleted in the previous ordinance.

()

304.1.2.1 Clearance of brush and vegetative growth from roadways

The code official is authorized to require areas within 10 feet (3048 mm) on
each side of portions of fire apparatus access roads and driveways to be
cleared of nonfire-resistive vegetation growth.

Exception: Single specimens of tress, ornamental vegetative fuels or
cultivated ground cover, such as green grass, ivy, succulents or similar
plants used for ground cover, provided they do not form a means of
readily transmitting fire.

304.1.2.2 Clearance of brush and vegetative growth from electrical
transmission and distribution lines

Clearance of brush and vegetative growth from electrical transmission and
distribution lines shall be in accordance with Sections 304.1.2.2.1 through
304.1.2.2.5. Ch. Art. Div.

7




San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(9-2005 1-2011)

Ch. Art. Div.

8

Exception: Sections 304.1.2.2.1 through 304.1.2.2.5 do not authorize
persons not having legal right of entry to enter on or damage the
property of others without consent of the owner.

304.1.2.2.1 Support clearance

Persons owning, controlling, operating or maintaining electrical transmission
or distribution lines shall have an approved program in place that identifies
poles or towers with equipment and hardware types that have a history of
becoming an ignition source, and provides a combustible free space consistion
of a clearing of not less than 10 feet (3048 mm) in each direction from the
outer circumference of such pole or tower during such periods of time as
designated by the code official.

Exception: Lines used exclusively as telephone, telegraph, messenger
call, alarm transmission or other lines classed as communication circuits
by a public utility.

304.1.2.2.2 Electrical distribution and transmission line clearances

Clearances between vegetation and electrical lines shall be in accordance with
Sections 304.1.2.2.3 through 304.1.2.2.5.

304.1.2.2.3 Trimming clearance

At the time of trimming, clearances not less than those established by Table
304.1.2.2.3 shall be provided. The radial clearances shown below are
minimum clearances that shall be established, at the time of trimming,
between vegetation and the energized conductors and associated live parts.

Exception: The code official is authorized to establish minimum
clearances different than those specified by Table 304.1.2.2.3 when
evidence substantiating such other clearances is submitted to and
approved by the code official.

TABLE 304.1.2.2.3
MINIMUM CLEARANCES BETWEEN VEGETATION
AND ELECTRICAL LINES AT TIME OF TRIMMING

NN DI CIEROCE
750-35,000 6
35,001-60,000 12
60,001-115,000 19
115,001-230,000 30.5
230,001-500,000 115




San Diego Municipal Code

Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2008 1-2011)

(@)  304.1.2.2.4 Minimum clearance to be maintained

Clearances not less than those established by Table 304.1.2.2.4 shall be

maintained during such periods of time designated by the code official. The

site-specific clearances achieved, at time of pruning, shall vary based on

species growth rates, the utility company-specific trim cycle, the potential line

sway due to wind, line saqg due to electrical loading and ambient temperature

and the tree’s location in proximity to the high voltage lines.

Exception: The code official is authorized to establish minimum

clearances different from those specified by Table 304.1.2.2.4 when

evidence substantiating such other clearances is submitted to and

approved by the code official.

TABLE 304.1.2.2.4
MINIMUM CLEARANCES BETWEEN VEGETATION AND
ELECTRICAL LINES TO BE MAINTAINED

LINE VOLTAGE MINIMUM CLEARANCE (inches)
750-35,000 6
35,001-60,000 12
60,001-115,000 19
115,001-230,000 30.5
230,001-500,000 115

During emergencies, the utility shall perform the required work to the extent
necessary to clear the hazard. An emergency can include situations such as
trees falling into power lines, or trees in violation of Table 304.1.2.2.4.

Woaste material shall not be placed, deposited or dumped in wildland-urban
interface areas, or in, on or along trails, roadways or highways or against

(h)  304.1.2.2.5 Electrical power line emergencies
(i) 304.1.2.3 Waste material

structures in wildland-urban interface areas.
(b)

304.1.3 Space underneath seats through 315:3-2 307.4 Height Location.
Sections 301.1.3 through 31532 307.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code have
been adopted without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

9



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(9-2005 1-2011)

Reason: The proposed provisions previously existed in the 2001 CFC, Appendix I1-A and were adopted in O-19103.
These provisions were relocated from the 2007 CFC to International Wildland-Interface Code (IWUIC) and were
inadvertently excluded in O-19728. This proposed code change reinstates these provisions which were extracted from
the 2009 IWUIC.

855.0307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces

(a) 307.4.1 Bonfires

A bonfire shall not be conducted within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of a structure or
combustible material unless the fire is contained in a barbecue pit. Conditions
which could cause a fire to spread within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of a structure
shall be eliminated prior to ignition.

Exceptions:

1. Fires upon beach areas shall be in accordance with SDMC
Sections 63.20.5(c)(d).

2. Fires are not permitted in public parks except as provided in
SDMC Section 63.0102(b)(11).

Reason: Added exception for clarity and to eliminate conflict between existing SDMC and the Fire Code.

(b)  307.4.2 Recreational fires through 315-3-2 317.1 Height Laundry carts with a
capacity of 1 cubic yard or more. Sections 307.4.2 through 315-3.2 317.1 of
the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant to
section 55.0101(a).

Ch. Art. Div.

10



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 4: Emergency Planning and Preparedness

(“Emergency Planning and Preparedness”added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(““Emergency Planning and Preparedness’ amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

§55.0401

§55.0403

Emergency Planning and Preparedness

(a)

401.1 Scope through 403.1.1 Duties. Sections 401.1 through 403.1.1 of the
2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant to
section 55.0101(a).

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Revised X-X-2010 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Standby Fire Department Personnel

(a)

403.1.2 Standby Fire Department Personnel. When, in the opinion of the Fire
Code Official, it is essential for public safety in a place of assembly or any
other place where people congregate, due to the number of persons, or the
nature of the performance, exhibition, display, contest or activity, the owner,
agent or lessee shall employ one or more qualified persons, as required and
approved, to be on duty at such place.

Such individuals shall be subject to the Fire Code Official’s orders at all times
when so employed and shall be in uniform and remain on duty during the
times such places are open to the public, or when such activity is being
conducted. Before each performance or the start of such activity, such
individuals shall (1) inspect the required fire appliances provided to see that
they are in proper place and in good working order; (2) keep diligent watch
for fires during the time such place is open to the public or such activity is
being conducted; and (3) take prompt measures for extinguishment of fires
that may occur.

Ch. Art. Div.

11



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2008 1-2011)

Such individuals shall not be required or permitted, while on duty, to perform
any other duties than those herein specified.

The City shall charge the permittee the cost of such services. The cost shall be
computed by the Fire Department using accepted cost accounting methods
including but not limited to the cost of salary, fringe benefits and general
overhead. Time cards of the assigned personnel shall be submitted by the Fire
Code Official to the Auditor and Comptroller and shall be prima facie
evidence of the expended work-hours. In no event shall a permittee be
charged less than the cost of two work-hours for each standby qualified
person.

(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Added X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

(b)  403.2 Public safety plan through 408.11.3 Maintenance. Sections 401.1
through 408.11.3 of the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without
change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

Reason: §55.0401(b) is unchanged and was relocated for consistency.

(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2010.)

Ch. Art. Div.

12



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 5: Fire Service Features
(““Fire Service Features™ added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(“Fire Service Features” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

§55.0501 Fire Service Features

@) 501.1 Scope through 508-5:6 504.3 Physical-Pretection Stairway access to
roof. Sections 501.1 through 508:5:6 504.3 of the 200% California Fire Code
have been adopted without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

855.0505 Premises Identification

(a) 505.1.Address ldentification. New and existing buildings shall have approved
address numbers, building numbers or approved building identification placed
in a position that is plainly legible and visible from the street or road fronting
the property. These numbers shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. For buildings used
exclusively for residential purposes complying with the California Residential
Code, such Nnumbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm) high with a
mlnlmum stroke Wldth of 0 5 lnch (12 7 mm) For all other buildings usee-aH

, such numbers

shaII be a minimum of 6 lnches (152 4 mm) hlqh Wlth a minimum stroke

width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Where access is by means of a private road and
the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or
other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure.

(b) 505.2 Street or road signs through 507.5.6 Physical Protection. Sections 505.2
through 507.5.6 of the California Fire Code have been adopted without
change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

Reason: This code change is necessary for consistency with Section 501.2 of the 2010 California Building Code,
Section 505.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code and existing provisions of tae SDMC Sec. 95.0209(a).

(Added X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Revised 10-06-2010. Revisions are indicated by double underline and/or double strikethrough.

Ch. Art. Div.

13



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(9-2005 1-2010)

§55.0507

Fire Protection Water Supplies

(@)

(b)

(©)

(d)

508.5:1 507.5.1. Where Required. An approved water supply capable of
supplying the required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to all
premises upon which facilities, buildings or portions of buildings are
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction after August 18, 1999.
When any portion of the facility or building protected is in excess of 300 feet
(91.4406 mm) from a water supply on a public street, as measured by an
approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire
hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided when required by the Fire Code Official.

507.5.2 Inspection, testing and maintenance through 507.5.6 Physical
protection. Sections 507.5.2 through 507.5.6 of the California Fire Code have
been adopted without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

508.-5-# 507.5.7. Fire protection equipment and fire hydrants shall be clearly
identified in a manner approved by the Fire Code Official to prevent
obstruction by parking and other obstructions. When required by the Fire
Code Official, hydrant locations shall be identified by the installation of
reflective bluecolored markers. Such markers shall be affixed to the roadway
surface, approximately centered between curbs, and at a right angle to the
hydrant.

508.1 General through 510.3 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing
buildings. Sections 508.1 through 510.3 of the California Fire Code have been
adopted without change pursuant to sections 55.0101(a).

Reason: Division renumbered for consistency with the 2010 California Fire Code.

Ch. Art. Div.

14

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S: effective X-X-2011.)




San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2008 1-2011)
Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 6: Building Services and Systems
(““Building Services and Systems™” added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(““Building Services and Systems™ amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

§55.0601 Building Services and Systems

@) 601.1 Scope through 6092 609.3.4 Wherereguired Extinguishing system
service. Sections 601.1 through 6092 609.3.4 of the 2007 California Fire
Code have been adopted without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(9-2005)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 7: Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction
(“Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction” added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(“Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

855.0701 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction

@) 701.1 Scope through 704.2 Opening Protectives. Sections 701.1 through 704.2
of the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant
to section 55.0101(a).

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S: effective X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

16



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 8: Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings
(“Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings’added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)
(“Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

855.0801 Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings

@) 801.1 Scope through 808.2 Signs. Sections 801.1 through 808.2 of the 2007
California Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant to section
55.0101(a).

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O0-19728 N.S; effective X-X-2011)

Ch. Art. Div.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2010 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 9: Fire Protection Systems
(““Fire Department Access and Water Supply”” added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Retitled to “Fire Protection Systems” and amended 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(“Fire Protection Systems” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

§55.0901 Fire Protection Systems

@) 901.1 Scope through 901.6.2.1 Records information. 901.6.2.1 through
903.6.1 of the 206% California Fire Code have been adopted without change
pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(b) 901.7 Problematic Systems and Systems out of service. Where a required fire
protection system is out of service for any reason, or experiences an excessive
number of accidental activations, the fire department and Fire Code Official
shall be notified immediately and, where required by the Fire Code Official,
the building shall either be evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be
provided for all occupants left unprotected by the shut down until the fire
protection system has been returned to service.

(©) 901.7.1 Impairment coordinator through 963-6-% 903.6.2 Pyroxytn-Plasties
Group 1-2. Sections 901.7.1 through 963:6-1 903.6.2 of the 2007 California
Fire Code have been adopted without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(Amended 9-24-2002 by O-19103 N.S.)
(Retitled to “Fire Protection Systems” and amended 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

Reason: Renumbered for consistency with the 2010 California Fire Code.

§55.0903 Automatic Sprinkler Systems — Existing High-Rise Buildings
@ [Reserved.]

(b) [Reserved.]

Ch. Art. Div.

[5[5]9 B



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2010 1-2011)

(©) 903-6-2-1 903.6.3 Purpose and Intent. The Council hereby finds as a matter
directly affecting public safety and the life safety of occupants of high-rise
buildings and the public safety personnel involved in fire suppression
activities in high-rise buildings that it is necessary to install fire sprinkler
systems in all existing high-rise buildings, which were previously exempt
from such installation. Those buildings in which such sprinkler systems have
been installed under the provisions of the 2067 California Building Code
Section 3412 3414 are exempt.

(d) 903-6-2.2 903.6.3.1 Definitions. For purposes of this Section, the following
terms have the following definitions:

1) High-rise building means any building or structure of any type of
construction or occupancy having floors used for human occupancy
located more than seventy-five (75) feet above the lowest floor level
having building access.

High-rise buildings do not include:
(A)  Hospitals as defined in Health and Safety Code section 1250.
(B)  Buildings used exclusively as open parking garages.

(C)  Buildings where all floors above the seventy-five (75) foot
level are used exclusively as open parking garage and are
located above all other floors used for human occupancy.

(D)  Buildings such as power plants, look-out towers, steeples,
green houses and similar structures with noncontinuous human
occupancy as may be determined by the Fire Code Official.

(E)  Any buildings or structures owned by any government agency
other than the City of San Diego.

(F) R-22 occupancies as defined in %@4@@@4&*%@9% th
California Building Code exe

2 Building access means an exterior door opening that conforms to all of
the following: (1) is suitable and available for fire department use; (2)
is located not more than two feet above the adjacent ground level; (3)
leads to a space, room or area having foot traffic communication
capability with the remainder of the building; and (4) is designed to
permit penetration through the use of fire department forcible-entry
tools and equipment, unless other approved arrangements have been
made with the Fire Code Official.

Revised 10-06-2010. Revisions are indicated by double underline and/or double strikethrough. ch Art Div

[5]5]9 B



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2010 1-2011)

Ch. Art. Div.

[ 5[5]9 HEN

()

()

(9)

3) Owner means every person who, or entity which, alone, jointly or
severally with others has legal title to any building or structure or has
the legal right to structurally alter or modify such building or structure.

903-6-2:3 903.6.3.2 Applicability. Except as provided in this section, the
provisions of section 55.0903 relating to installation of automatic fire
sprinkler systems are hereby made applicable to all existing high-rise
buildings, as defined in section 55.0903(d).

903-6-2:4 903.6.3.3 Fire Sprinkler System. Automatic fire sprinkler systems
required under section 983:6-2 903.6.3 of the California Fire Code shall be
installed in accordance with NFPA 13 as adopted by State Fire Marshal, with
the express provision that any later standard that imposes more stringent fire
and life safety requirement shall apply at the time of installation.

903.6-2.5 903.6.3.4 Schedule of Implementation. Each owner of a high-rise
building, as defined in section 55.0903(d) shall install an approved automatic
fire sprinkler system in each high-rise building in accordance with the
following schedule:

1) By January 1, 1990, the building owner shall submit a work plan to the
Fire Code Official for approval. The work plan shall include technical
sprinkler drawings and a time table for complete installation in
accordance with section 963-6-2.5 903.6.3.4 of the 2667 California
Fire Code. The plan shall detail a schedule for completing the fire
sprinkler system installation, giving priority to those floors in excess
of seventy-five (75) feet above the lowest floor level having building
access. The Fire Code Official is authorized to modify the schedule in
this section to accommodate long-term leases; once approved,
however, the schedule and plans may not be further modified.

2 By January 1, 1993, one third (1/3) gross square footage of the
structure shall be fire sprinklered.

3) By January 1, 1996, two-thirds (2/3) gross square footage of the
structure shall be fire sprinklered.

4) January 1, 1999, the entire gross square footage of the structure shall
be fire sprinklered.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2010 1-2011)

(h)

5) The owner of a high-rise building or structure that is subject to the
provisions of this section, and that contains significant quantities of
asbestos that will interfere with such installations shall have the option
of instead equipping the entire gross square footage of the building or
structure with an automatic fire sprinkler system by January 1, 1996;
provided, however, that under this option, the owner of the building or
structure shall be deemed to have waived any further extension of time
for compliance. In order to be eligible for this option, the owner must
establish the presence of asbestos in the affected building, that it is
impossible or impractical to complete the work in increments, with
supporting rationale, and that the work plan submitted clearly
demonstrates that all tenants will be vacated and all work will be
completed within the specified time frame.

For purposes of this section, the gross square footage of a building or
structure includes the sum total of all the floor areas for all floor
levels, basements and sub-basements, measured from the exterior
walls, irrespective of the existence of interior fire resistive walls,
floors and ceilings.

Notwithstanding the compliance schedule above, any owner of any
high-rise building or structure subject to the provisions of this section,
which contains significant quantities of asbestos, who agrees in
writing prior to January 1, 1996, to demolish the subject building, shall
be exempt from compliance schedule set forth in this section.

The written agreement shall constitute a covenant running with the
land. Such agreement shall be recorded in the office of the County
Recorder, San Diego County. The recordable agreement from
(demolition agreement) shall be provided by the City.

903-6-2-6 903.6.3.5 Waiver of Other Provisions. The Fire Code Official or
Building Official is authorized to waive or modify any or all of the following
provisions of the 2007 California Fire Code or the 200% California Building
Code as adopted by the City in the San Diego Municipal Code when requiring
the retrofitting of existing high-rise buildings with automatic fire sprinkler
systems pursuant to this section underground water storage tank will not be
required; (2) fire pump size or installation can be reduced or eliminated,
depending upon the adequacy of water pressure available to the building; (3)
existing dead end corridors without intervening doors may be permitted; (4)
existing ventilation shafts may be permitted; and (5) existing transoms may be
allowed.

Ch. Art. Div.

(5[50 HEM



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2010 1-2011)

Q) 903.6-27 903.6.3.6 Appeal and Modification provisions. The owner of a
high-rise building covered under this section may appeal a decision made by
the Fire Code Official under this section. An appeal shall be made to the City
Manager. The Board of Appeals and Advisors shall serve as the hearing body
for appeals under this section. For these purposes, the Board of Appeals may
(1) recommend a variance from any provisions of this section; (2) the
suitability of alternate materials and methods of sprinkler installation; and (3)
may provide reasonable interpretations of this section, so long as such
interpretations do not conflict with the purpose, intent and general objective of
this section nor extend the time for compliance established in this section.

The Board of Appeals may, in addition to any other considerations it deems
appropriate, examine the architectural or historical significance of the building
or structure. The City Manager shall thereafter consider the recommendations
of the Board of Appeals and issue a final decision. The City Manager’s
decision shall constitute the owner’s exhaustion of administrative remedies.

() 903.6-2.8 903.6.3.7 Violations.

1) It is unlawful for any owner of a high-rise building to allow any
person to occupy any portion of a high-rise building subject to the
provisions of this section except where: (1) the Fire Code Official or
City Manager has, in writing, authorized the occupancy; or (2) the
owner is complying with the implementation schedule set forth in this
section; or (3) the occupant is performing construction or maintenance
to the building related to the installation or maintenance of an
automatic fire sprinkler system; (4) the owner of the high-rise building
agreed in writing prior to January 1, 2004 to demolish the high-rise
building by January 1, 2000.

(2) It is unlawful for any owner of a high-rise building to allow
any person to occupy any portion of a high-rise building after
January 31, 2011, where occupancy has been authorized
pursuant to this section, except where: (1) the occupant is
performing minimal maintenance to prevent the high rise
building from being in an unsafe condition; or (2) the occupant
is performing construction or maintenance to the building
related to the installation or maintenance of an automatic fire
sprinkler system; or (3) an approved fire sprinkler system has
been completely installed.

Reason: Renumbered for consistency with the 2010 California Fire and Building Codes.

Ch. Art. Div.

[5]5]9 IR



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(4-2010 1-2011)

(k) 904.1 General through 934112 914.11.3 New-seund-stages Fire alarm
systems. Sections 904.1 through 934-11-2 914.11.3 of the 200+ California Fire
Code have been adopted without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

Reason: Renumbered for consistency with the 2010 California Fire Code.

(Amended 9-24-2002 by O-19103 N.S.)

(Retitled to “Automatic Sprinkler Systems — Existing High-Rise Buildings and
amended 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

(Amended 3-20-2009 by 0-19838 N.S; effective 4-19-2009.)

(Amended 3-18-2010 by 0-19936 N.S; effective 4-17-2010.)

(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

[5]5]9 NS



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2008)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 10: Fire-Protection-Systems-and-Equipment Means of Eqgress
(““Fire Protection Systems and Equipment” added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

(Retitled from “General” to “Means of Egress™
and amended 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(““Means of Egress’” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

Reason: Editorial. Changed title to “Means of Egress.” Though the previous Ordinance indicated that the Division was
retitled, the title was not actually changed in the final document.

§55.1001 Means of Egress

1001.1 Seepe General through £628-7 1030.8 Testing and Maintenance. Sections
1001.1 through 10628-# 1030.8 of the 26067 California Fire Code have been adopted
without change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(“General” added 9-24-2002 by O-19103 N.S.)

(Retitled from “General” to ““Means of Egress” and amended 4-8-2008 by O-19728
N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Reason: Renumbered for consistency with the 2010 California Fire Code.

Ch. Art. Div.

24



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 11: Aviation Facilities

(Added *“Aviation Facilities™ 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(““Aviation Facilities” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

§55.1101 Aviation Facilities

@) 1101.1 Scope through 1107.8 Federal approval. Sections 1101.1 through
1107.8 of the 2006% California Fire Code have been adopted without change
pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

25



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(9-2005)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 12: Dry Cleaning

(Added “*Dry Cleaning” 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)
(“Dry Cleaning” amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S.)

§55.1201 Dry Cleaning

@) 1201.1 Scope through 1208.4 Portable Fire Extinguishers. Sections 1201.1
through 1208.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code have been adopted without
change pursuant to section 55.0101(a).

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
(Amended X-X-2011 by O-XXXXX N.S; effective X-X-2011.)

Ch. Art. Div.

26



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(4-2008 1-2011)

Article 5: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 13: Combustible Dust-Producing Operations

(Added “Combustible Dust-Pro