San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

CHAPTER 5
Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

ARTICLE 1
Public Emergency Procedures

(—Ci vi |l Def ense aXd952byG24N8r Il | ncor p.

contained in O—4767 N.S. adopted 4-12-1951.)
(Amended 2-5-1974 by 0-11230 N.S.)
(—Public Emeregdn aymeinldid @yOdll280 N.S.)

§ 51.01 Purpose
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S., adopted 4—12-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.02 Definitions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S., adopted 4-12-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.03 Civil Defense and Disaster Council, Membership
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S., adopted 4-12-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

8§ 51.04 Civil Defense and Disaster Council 8 Powers and Duties
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S., adopted 4-12—-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.05 The City Manager shall be the Director of Civil Defense and Disaster
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S., adopted 4-12-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

8 51.06 Powers in Event of Proclamation of Disaster
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S., adopted 4-12—-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.07 Civil Defense and Disaster Organization
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-4767 N.S. adopted 4-12—-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

8 51.08 Divisions, Services and Staff of the Civil Defense and Disaster Organization

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4767 N.S. adopted 4-12—-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§51.09 Violations
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4767 N.S. adopted 4-12—-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

8 51.10 Continuation of Ordinance
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—-4767 N.S. adopted 4-12—-1951.)
(Repealed 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

DIVISION 1
Public Emergency Procedures
(Editors note: Division 1 created 11-3-1988 for clarity.)

§51.0101 Purposes
(Added 2-5-1974 by 0-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.0102 Definition
(Added 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)
(Amended 4-21-1976 by O-11833 N.S.)

§ 51.0103 Disaster Council Membership
(Added 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§51.0104 Disaster Council 8 Powers and Duties
(Added 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.0105 Director and Assistant Director of Emergency Services
(Added 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§51.0106 Powers and Duties of the Director and Assistant Director of Emergency Services
(Added 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.0107 Emergency Organization
(Added 2-5-1974 by O-11230 N.S.)

§ 51.0108 Emergency Plan
(Added 2-5-1974 by O—11230 N.S.)

§ 51.0109 Expenditures
(Added 2-5-1974 by O—11230 N.S.)

§51.0110 Punishment of Violations
(Added 2-5-1974 by O—11230 N.S.)

§51.0111 Severability
(Added 2-5-1974 by O—11230 N.S.)

5 IEl



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISIONZ2

Emergencies and Major Disasters; Unfair Pricing Practices
(Added 9/6/2005 by 0-19410 N.S.

§51.0201 Authority
(Added 9/6/2005 by 0-19410 N.S.)

§ 51.0202 Purpose
(Added 9/6/2005 by 0-19410 N.S.)

§ 51.0203 Definitions
(Added 9/6/2005 by O-19410 N.S.)

§ 51.0204 Unlawful Pricing Practices
(Added 9/6/2005 by O-19410 N.S.)

DIVISION 10
Recovery of Costs For Use of Police Services At Large Events On Private Property
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1001 Citation of Ordinance
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

8§ 51.1002 Purpose and Intent
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1003 Definitions
(Added 5—22-1989 by O—-17303 N.S.)

8 51.1004 Police Services At Large Events Requiring More Than One Response
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

8§ 51.1005 Police Services Fees
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1006 Billing
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1007 Affect on Criminal Prosecution
(Added 5-22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§51.1008 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1009 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1010 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1011 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1012 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1013 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

§51.1014 Reserved for future use
(Reserved for future use 5—22-1989 by O-17303 N.S.)

DIVISION 30
Recovery of Incarceration Costs
(Added 4—25-1994 by O-18061 N.S.)

§ 51.3001 Intent and Purpose
(Added 4-25-1994 by O-18061 N.S.)

§51.3002 City Manager Authorized to Collect
(Added 4-25-1994 by O— 18061 N.S.)

§ 51.3003 Defendant Rights
(Added 4-25-1994 by O-18061 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

ARTICLE 2
Police 8 Police Regulations 8 Offenses Against Government

8 52.05 Furnishing False Information to Peace Officer 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2825 N.S. adopted 5-9-1944.)

§52.05.1 Same d Prima Facie Proof
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2825 N.S. adopted 5-9-1944.)

§ 52.10 Signs Tending to Discriminate Because of Race or Color 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—793 N.S. adopted 12—-10-1935.)

8 52.15 Shoe Shine Stands on Public Place 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—6832 O.S. adopted 12—2-1916.)

§ 52.20 Obstructing Public Places 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-3324 O.S. adopted 7—6-1908.)

§ 52.25 Pedestrian Tunnel 8 Loitering in Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S. contained in O—2950 N.S. adopted 3—6-1945.)
(Amended 12—22-1953 by O-5893 N.S.)

8§ 52.25.1 Pedestrian Tunnel & Facilities for Locking
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0—2950 N.S. adopted 3—6—-1945.)
(Amended 12—22-1953 by O-5893 N.S.)

§52.25.2 Same 6 Locking Tunnels
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2950 N.S. adopted 3—6-1945.)

§ 52.30 No Trespassing Signs d Posting Authorized
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—1948 N.S. adopted 10-1-1940.)

§52.30.1 Same d Postingd Where Permitted
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§52.30.2 Loiteringd A Misdemeanor
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§52.30.3 Same & Exemptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 52.30.4 Same & Damaging Signs
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 52.35 Defacing, Removing, Altering, Etc. Notices 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 52.40 Smoking on Public Bus & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2800 O.S. adopted 3—28-1944.)
(Repealed 12-19-1974 by O-11459 N.S.)

§52.40.1 Same & Signs Displayed
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2800 O.S. adopted 3—18-1944.)
(Repealed 12—19-1974 by O—11459 N.S.)

§ 52.45 Devices Interfering with Radio Reception 8 Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§52.45.1 Same d Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§52.45.2 Same & Inspection Authorized
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§52.45.3 Same 0 Violation d Notice
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 52.55 Labor of Prisoners in City Jail 8 Authorized
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 52.55.1 Same & Supervision 8 Labor Applied only to City Property
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§52.55.2 Same d Transportation to Place Within or Without City
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8§ 52.55.3 Same & Detention Camps, Etc. 8 Authorized
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8 52.60 Registration of Persons Convicted of Certain Crimes 8 Required
(Repealed 4-27-1961 by O—-8471 N.S.)

§52.60.1 Same & Registration of Residents d Required
(Repealed 4-27-1961 by O—-8471 N.S.)

§52.60.2 Same & Exceptions
(Repealed 4-27-1961 by O-8471 N.S.)

§52.60.3 Same & Change of Residence Within City 8 Notice Required
(Repealed 4-27-1961 by O-8471 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§52.60.4 Same & Records Kept by Chief of Police
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0—2029 N.S., adopted 1-7-1941.)
(Repealed 4—27-1961 by O-8471 N.S.)

§52.60.5 Same & Failure to Furnish Information 8 False Information & Unlawful
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2029 N.S., adopted 1—-7-1941.)
(Repealed 4-27-1961 by O—-8471 N.S.)

§52.60.6 Same 0 Exceptions to Registration
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0—2029 N.S., adopted 1-7-1941.)
(Repealed 4—27-1961 by O-8471 N.S.)

§52.60.7 Same & Penalty
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2029 N.S., adopted 1-7-1941.)
(Repealed 4-27-1961 by O—-8471 N.S.)

§ 52.65 Use of or Addiction to Narcotics 8 Prohibited
(Added 2—23-1954 by O-5977 N.S.)
(Repealed 11-10-1955 by O—6744 N.S.)

§ 52.66 Under the Influence of Dangerous Drugs 8 Prohibited
(—Under the I nfl uenrRkRrahi dfi t[@aA§—E&dEdw©EbIT2N.81)g S
(Amended 4-19-1960 by O-8288 N.S.)

§52.70.01 San Diego Public School Trespass Ordinance
(Added 5-1-1973 by O-11049 N.S.)

§ 52.70.02 Unauthorized Persons & Failure to Report Presence on School Premises
(Added 5-1-1973 by O-11049 N.S.)

§ 52.70.03 Unauthorized Persons & Failure to Leave School Premises Upon Request
(Added 5-1-1973 by O-11049 N.S.)

§ 52.70.04 Penalties for Multiple Violations
(—Penalties for Mul-14-19991byeO-18786dNISart i onsll added

§52.80.01 Trespasses upon Privately Operated Business Premises Prohibited
(Added 4-27-1977 by O-12059 N.S.)

12



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 10
Public Access To Health Care Facilities, Places of Worship or Schools
(Added 3-15-1993 by O-17897 N.S.)

§ 52.1001 Establishment of Fixed Buffer Zone at Entrances And Exits to Health Care

Facilities, Places of Worship and School Grounds

(—I mpeding Acces s15-RPOIN0O-b/89TNeSgJIl added 3
(—Establishment of Fixed Buffer Zone asof Entr ar
Wor ship and School Gr o u-16€dl99T by O-48452 N.3)ed and amenc

§52.1002 Private Right of Action
(—Private Ri ghtt15-493bA®-17890NSl) added 3
(Amended 12-16-1997 by O-18452 N.S.)

DIVISION 20
Targeted Residential Picketing
(Added 8-9-1993 by O-17952 N.S.)

§ 52.2001 Intent And Purpose
(Added 8-9-1993 by 017952 N.S.)

§ 52.2002 Definitions
(Added 8-9-1992 by 0-17952 N.S.)

8 52.2003 Picketing Private Residence Prohibited
(Added 8-9-1993 by y O-17952 N.S.)

DIVISION 30
Loitering For Drug Activities
(Added 11-29-1993 by O-18011 N.S.)

§ 52.3001 Acts Prohibited
(Added 11-29-1993 by 0-18011 N.S.)

§ 52.3002 Circumstances Manifesting Drugi related Activity
(Added 11-29-1993 by O-18011 N.S.)

8§ 52.3003 Definitions
(Added 11-29-1993 by 018011 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 31
Limits on Sales of Products Containing Ephedrine
(—Li mits on Sales of Products Cont ai
added 6—29-1998 by O—18533 N.S.)

8 52.3101 Declaration of Purpose
(—Decl arati on 0c29-19&by P-d8538N.S)added 6

§ 52.3102 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i—20+%4d by G-i8638 NLS.) 6

§ 52.3103 Limitations on the Sale or Purchase of Ephedrine Products
(—Limitations on the Sale or -RPxlOby®<sl&h330.8) Ephec

8 52.3104 Separate Violation of Each Incident
(—Separate Violati onr29d998bg@t8633N.S)ci dentll added €

§ 52.3105 Enforcement Authority
(—Enf orcement A201988by(C-18583AINSadded 6

§52.3106 Enforcement Remedies
(—Enf orcement R6O1088by -BIB3INSJded 6

§ 52.3107 Strict Liability Offenses
(—Strict Liabi |-29+1998bp0O-f18833N8.E)sll added 6

DIVISION 32
Possession of Clonazepam
(—Possession of -G2000by®AFPH.NI added 5

§ 52.3201 Purpose
( —P u r pdded :1#200@by O-18793 N.S.)

§ 52.3202 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i-152008 Hy O-48798 ) 5

8 52.3203 Prohibitions of Possession

(—Prohibitions o0-120@by©48BH.$)onll added 5
§ 52.3204 Enforcement Authority

(—Enf or cemelnt aAtzD@ddy O5.8793 N.S.)

8§ 52.3205 Enforcement Remedies Ch.
(—Enforcement R&EHO-BHINSAdded 5 L5 HEI



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 52.3206 Strict Liability
(—Strict Liabi Hi2000py GO18MOENES ell added 5

DIVISION 40
Aggressive Solicitation
(Added 10-25-1993 by O-17998 N.S.)

§ 52.4001 Acts Prohibited
(Added 10-25-1993 by 017998 N.S.)

§ 52.4002 Aggressive Conduct
(Added 10-25-1993 by 017998 N.S.)

§ 52.4003 Reasonable Fear for Safety
(Added 10-25-1993 by O-17998 N.S.)

8§ 52.4004 Definitions
(Added 10-25-1993 by 0-17998 N.S.)

8§ 52.4005 Demand for Services
(Added 10-25-1993 by 0-17998 N.S.)

§ 52.4006 Free Speech
(Added 10-25-1993 by 0-17998 N.S.)

DIVISION 50
Cruising Activity
(Added 7-31-1995 by O-18197 N.S.)

§ 52.5001 Definitions
(Added 7-31-1995 by 018197 N.S.)
(Amended 8-14-1995 by 0-18202 N.S.)86

§ 52.5002 Acts Prohibited
(Added 7-31-1995 by 0-18187 N.S.)
(Amended 8-14-1995 by 0-18202 N.S.)

8 52.5003 Exceptions
(Added 7-31-1995 by O-18197 N.S.)
(Amended 8-14-1995 by 0-18202 N.S.)

Ch.

Bl 0



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 52.5004 Signs
(Added 7-31-1995 by 0-18197 N.S.)
(Added 8-14-1995 by 0-18202 N.S.)

§ 52.5005 Cruisingd Traffic Control Point
(Added 7-31-1995 by O-18197 N.S.)
(Added 8-14-1995 by O-18202 N.S.)

§ 52.5006 Written Notice of Cruising
(Added 7-31-1995 by 0-18197 N.S.)
(Amended 8—-14-1995 by 0—-18202 N.S.)

DIVISION 51
Temporary Street Closures Due
to Serious and Continual Criminal Activity
(—Temporary Street Closures Due t
Serious and Continual Criminal Activity —
added 10-2-2000 by Emergency Ordinance O—18861 N.S.;
replaced by O-18870 N.S. on 10-16-2000.)

§ 52.5101 Purpose
( —Pur p o s e-P-2000 dycEmetdgendy @rdinance O—18861 N.S.; replaced by O-18870 N.S.
on 10-16-2000.)

§ 52.5102 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i @-2080lby Ematgdneydrdibhace O-18861 N.S.; replaced by O-18870 N.S.
on 10-16-2000.)

§ 52.5103 Identification of Designated Streets
(—l denti fication of -DB2060 bydmesé¢ne Ordirtance Ce-18861sNIS.; add e d
replaced by O-18870 N.S. on 10-16-2000.)

§ 52.5104 Temporary Street Closure Violation
(—Temporary Street C42-2080byEmergency@idiaance @-i8861NMSd d ed 1 C
replaced by O-18870 N.S. on 10-16-2000.)

8 52.5105 Temporary Street Closure Exceptions
(—Temporary Street Cl-22000by&meigenay @rgirtaricedOr18861 N&b.dd d e d 1
replaced by O-18870 N.S. on 10-16-2000.)

8 52.5106 Removal and Storage of Vehicles; Release of Stored Vehicles; Liability for Towing

and Storage Fees

(—Re moval and Storage of Vehicl eowingailétoragease of
Feesl a2d2608 o/ Enfer@ency Ordinance O—18861 N.S.; replaced by O-18870 N.S. on 10-

16-2000.)

B



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 52
Spectators Prohibited at Illegal Speed
Contests or Exhibitions of Speed
(—Spectators Pr o hContestsoréxhibithons of Speel-eegal Speed
added 10-21-2002 by Emergency Ordinance O-19116 N.S.;
replaced by O-19118 N.S. on 10-28-2002.)

§ 52.5201 Purpose
( —Pur p o s e-R-2002 tycEmetdgendy @rdinance 0O-19116 N.S.; replaced by 0O-19118 N.S.
on 10-28-2002.)

§ 52.5202 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i @-80682lby EmadgdneydrdibaBice O-19116 N.S.; replaced by O-19118 N.S.
on 10-28-2002.)

8 52.5203 Spectator at Illegal Speed Contest or Exhibitions of Speed - Violation
(—Spectator at |11l egal Spedr¥eed!| €bnbae22002abgde @x b Dbi
Emergency Ordinance O—19116 N.S.; replaced by O-19118 N.S. on 10-28-2002.)

§ 52.5204 Relevant Circumstances to Prove a Violation
(—Rel evant Circumst anc e s-2-2002 byfEmergeneyrOrdiaancé ®—0 | at i or
19116 N.S.; replaced by 0-19118 N.S. on 10-28-2002.)

8 52.5205 Admissibility of Prior Acts
(AAdmi ssi bil ity e€2002byHmergency Ocdinamad 0149416 M.9l; refdladed
by 0-19118 N.S. on 10-28-2002.)

DIVISION 53
Forfeiture of Nuisance Vehicles Engaged in
Illegal Motor Vehicle Speed Contests or Exhibitions of Speed
(—Forfeiture of Nuisance Vehicl es E
Il 1l egal Motor Vehicle Speed Contests o
added 4-21-2003 by 0-19167 N.S.)

§ 52.5301 Purpose
(—Pur p o s e2l-20083dydOeld1674N.S.)

8§ 52.5302 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i-24-2083lby Ca181é7eNE.) 4

Ch.

| 5 I



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 52.5303 Forfeiture of Nuisance Vehicles
(—Forfeiture of Nu-Rl2@hbyg @-19%6éMS)c|l esll added 4

§ 52.5304 Right to Request a Hearing
(—RitpphtRequest a -HMW@Iby-PI67NSJded 4

§ 52.5305 Post-Storage Hearing
(—P-8sbr age He a-21+2008 by O-49d6d &.) 4

§ 52.5306 Notice of Forfeiture to Legal and Registered Owners
(—Notice of Forfeiturnertsd HeRpiebyOA9l6/NRergi st er ec

§ 52.5307 Personal Service of Notice of Forfeiture
(—Per sonal Service of 2N20WBbhy©O-€l91&¥yNS)For f ei turel ac

§ 52.5308 Contents of Notice of Forfeiture

(—Contents of Not i-21€2009by O-H#967 N.®e)i t ur ell added 4

§ 52.5309 Additional Notice Provisions for Legal Owners

(—Addi tional Noti ce Pr ovi21s2008hy ©-1%163F N.S)L e g a | Owner
§ 52.5310 Administrative Forfeiture

(—Admini strati v el-Zo@byfOelDl67NS.ell added 4

§ 52.5311 Claim Opposing Forfeiture and Petition for Forfeiture

(—Cl aim Opposing Forfeitur e-2122008by ®-4%67NS)on f or F
§ 52.5312 Judicial Forfeiture Proceedings

(—Judicial Forfeit «21-2003 By 0d%ler&l8) ngsl added 4

§ 52.5313 Community Property Interest Release
(—Community Property-21-2000€%G/NRel easel added 4

§ 52.5314 Stipulated Vehicle Release Agreement
(—Stipul ated Vehicl e -2R203bydDs1®l67A$)y eement ll added

§ 52.5315 Vehicle Title Vesting in the City
(—Vehicle Title Ve®120080i67N&)e Ci tyl added 4

§ 52.5316 Sale of Forfeited Vehicle After Declaration of Forfeiture
(—Sal e of Forfeited Vehicl e -20f2603by O-DEEN.SYr at i on

§ 52.5317 Sale of Forfeited Vehicle By Legal Owner
(—Sal e of Forfeited Ved{12008hyO-4MN67N&)g al Owner 3

8§ 52.5318 Sale of Forfeited Vehicle
(—Sal e of For f edi2it280dby@-d91i676.5)ell added 4



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 52.5319 Disposition of Low-Value Vehicles
(—Di sposi-Yalome oV e Ihioal-2008 iy Od@ler &l.8) 4

§ 52.5320 Distribution of Sale Proceeds
(—Pur p o s e2l-2003dydOeld1674N.S.)

§ 52.5321 Accounting of Sale Proceeds
(—Accou®dli e@» gProd c e-21e2G03 by @-d9d6é N.S.) 4

§ 52.5322 Stolen Vehicles
(—St ol en Ve h2l-2003éysO-19167aNb.yl e d 4

§ 52.5323 Innocent Owner Remedy
(—I nnocent Owne21-2608ne-dNeFNA)dded 4

§ 52.5324 Towing and Storage Fees
(—Towing and St o+122008by 6-4d65N.S)added 4

DIVISION 60
Trespass on Zoo Grounds
(—Trespass on Z026-198by0u185d8NIS.) added 5

8 52.6001 Declaration of Purpose
(—Decl arati on o026-198by -b8518N.S)added 5

§ 52.6002 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i—26+%4d by G-i8618 NL.S.) 5

8 52.6003 Trespass on San Diego Zoo Grounds
(—Trespass on San Di-E®8REOadBNSUNdsIl added

8 52.6004 Trespass on the Wild Animal Park Grounds

(—Trespass mal t Rar Wi Gd o-2619938 by Oal8btB&.8.) 5
8 52.6005 Exceptions

(—Except i o6-26<1998 by @-1i8E18 N.SH

§ 52.6006 Enforcement Authority
(—Enf orcement A261988byC-18518INSadded 5

§ 52.6007 Enforcement Remedies
(—Enf otr cRenmend i e-26H#199& by @—£8818 19.5S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 70
Border Public Safety Zone
(Added 11-24-1998 by O-18604 N.S.)

§52.7001 Title
(—Ti t | e l24-5088 dyeOell 8604 N.S.)

§ 52.7002 Purpose
(—Pur pos e-P4-1898 by @-tB604 NLS.)

§ 52.7003 Definitions
(—Definiti-an1898byA-H360&NS.) 1 1

§ 52.7004 Soliciting Within the Zone
(—Soliciting Wi t+{4-1898HyD-860Z0)ell added 11

A 52.7005 |l nterference with Peace Officerbs L
Section 1500
(—I nterference with Peace Officer’s Duties Unc

added 11-24-1998 by O-18604 N.S.)

§ 52.7006 Minimum Penalties for Violations Occurring in the Zone
(—Mi ni mum Penalties fornei od d2#-4988 by E18BGAN.8)Y r i ng |

§ 52.7007 Geographical Probation for Juvenile Offenders
(—Geographical Probati on -24-4998byQ+18684NiS.) e Of f ender

§ 52.7008 Geographical Probation for Gang Related Offenses
(—Geographitec @aln Proo Gang Re 241998 oy O-0860M E.)s esll add:e



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 90
Standards of Conduct and Attire for Entertainers
and Employees of Oni sale Licensed Premises
(Added 10-28-1985 by 0O—-16521 N.S.)

§ 52.9001 Purpose and Intent
(Added 10-28-1985 by 0-16521 N.S.)

§ 52.9002 Definition
(Added 10—28-1985 by 016521 N.S.)

§ 52.9003 Police Inspection
(Added 10-28-1985 by 0-16521 N.S.)

§52.9004 Attire and Conduct
(—Attire and &6-4985bycC-1652laNSded 10

§ 52.9005 Stage Requirements
(Added 10-28-1985 by 0-16521 N.S.)

DIVISION 91
Hotels, Motels, Inns, Auto Courts, Trailer Parks, Transient Lodging Places
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16814 N.S.)

§ 52.9100 Posting of Rates
(Added 2-23-1987 by 0-16814 N.S.)

§ 52.9101 Charges in Excess of Posted Rates Prohibited
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16814 N.S.)

§ 52.9102 Posting of Rules and Regulations of Establishments
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16814 N.S.)

§ 52.9103 Registers at Hotels, Apartment Houses, Rooming Houses
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16814 N.S.)

§ 52.9104 Registration of Guests
(Added 2-23-1987 by 0-16814 N.S.)

8 52.9105 Registration of Vehicles and Trailers
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16814 N.S.)

§52.9106 Trailer Parks 8 Trailer Fronting on Roadway

(Added 2-23-1987 by O-16814 N.S.)
Ch.

L5 I



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 95
AIDS Discrimination
(Added 2—2—-1988 by O—17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9500 Findings
(Added 2-22-1988 by O—17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9501 Public Policy
(Added 2-22-1988 by O—17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9502 Definitions
(Added 2-22-1988 by O-17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9503 Housing Accommodations and Housing Services
(Added 2—22-1988 by O—-17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9504 Employment
(Added 2-22-1988 by O-17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9505 Business Establishments
(Added 2—22-1988 by O—17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9506 Testing
(Added 2-22-1988 by O-17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9507 City Facilities and Services
(Added 2—22-1988 by O—-17031 N.S.)

§ 52.9508 Advertising
(Added 2-22-1988 by O-17031 N.S.)
(Amended 3-20-1989 by O-17271 N.S.)

§ 52.9509 Exceptions
(Added 2—22-1988 by O—-17031 N.S.)
(Amended 3-20-1989 by O-17271 N.S.)

§ 52.9510 Liability and Damages
(Added 2-22-1988 by O-17031 N.S.)
(Amended 3-20-1989 by O-17271 N.S.)

§52.9511 Enforcement
(Added 2—22-1988 by O—17031 N.S.)
(Amended 3-20-1989 by O-17271 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 52.9512 Severability
( Added 2-22-1988 by O-17031 N.S.)
(Amended 3—20-1989 by O-17271 N.S.)

DIVISION 96
Discrimination Based On Sexual Orientation
(Editors note added to title 4-16—1990.)

§ 52.9601 Statement of Policy
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—17453 N.S.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)
§ 52.9602 Definitions

(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)

§ 52.9603 Employment
( —Empl oy me AL6-1990 dydDd1&483 N&.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)

8 52.9604 Housing and Other Real Estate Transactions
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—-17453 N.S.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)

§ 52.9605 Business Establishments
(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)

8 52.9606 City Facilities and Services
(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)

§ 52.9607 Educational Institutions
(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)
(Amended 7-28-2003 by 0-19203 N.S.)

8§ 52.9608 Frivolous Action Prohibited
(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)

§52.9609 Enforcement
(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)

§52.9610 Liability
(Added 4-16-1990 by O-17453 N.S.)

Ch.

.5 IEEH



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 52.9611 Limitation On Action
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—17453 N.S.)

§ 52.9612 Retaliation Prohibited
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—17453 N.S.)

§ 52.9613 Nonwaiverability
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—17453 N.S.)

§ 52.9614 Severability
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—17453 N.S.)

§ 52.9615 Exemption
(Added 4-16-1990 by O—17453 N.S.)

DIVISION 97
Hate Crimes Training and Tracking
(Added 5-26-1992 by O—17771 N.S.)

§ 52.9701 Purpose and Intent
(Added 5-26-1992 by O-17771 N.S.)

§ 52.9702 Findings
(Added 5-26-1992 by O-17771 N.S.)

§ 52.9703 Collection and Reporting of Data Regarding Hate Crimes: Training and Creating
Standardized System
(Added 5-26-1992 by O-17771 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

ARTICLE 25
Consumer Commodities Price Marking

DIVISION 1
Consumer Commodities Price Marking
(Editors note: Division 1 added 3—2-1989 for clarity.)

§ 52.5.0101 Purpose and Intent
(Added 4-7-1980 by O—15235 N.S.)

§ 52.5.0102 Definitions
(Added 4—7-1980 by O—15235 N.S.)

§ 52.5.0103 Consumer Commodity Item Pricing
(Added 4—-7-1980 by O-15235 N.S.)

§ 52.5.0104 Violations; Civil Fines; Injunctions
(Added 4—-7-1980 by O-15235 N.S.)

§ 52.5.0105 Liability for Losses and Expenses; Additional Penalty; Applicability to Single
Plaintiff; Inapplicability to Multiple Plaintiff or Class Actions
(Added 4—-7-1980 by O-15235 N.S.)

§52.5.0106 Unintentional Error; No Violation
(Added 4—7-1980 by O-15235 N.S.)

§52.5.0107 Exclusive Remedies
(Added 4-7-1980 by O—15235 N.S.)

§52.5.0108 Severability
(Added 4—-7-1980 by O-15235 N.S.)

§ 52.5.0109 Termination of Article
(Added 4—7-1980 by 015235 N.S.; effective 5—7—1980 through 5-6-1981.)
(Amended 4—6-1981 by O-15479 N.S.)

Appendix A

Consumer Commodities Not Generally Item Priced on January 1, 1977 of Chapter 5,
Article 2.5 of the San Diego Municipal Code

(Added 4-7-1980 by O-15235 N.S.)

(Editors note: Location note added 8-9-1988.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

ARTICLE 3
Firearms & Dangerous Weapons 8 Explosives 8 Hazardous Trades
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 53.01 Blasting & Permit Required

(—BIl asLtiicregrs e and Per mi—2-1982byQ+-5046 &l.8.,IconthinecciroO—p .
10053 O.S., adopted 7—-7-1925.)

(Amended 3—19-1963 by O-8802 N.S.)

(—BIl asPteirmg t Re qui 22 byddrie7a7dNs.d 2

§ 53.01.1 Blasting & Application For License d Insurance Required

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-10053 O.S., adopted 7—7-1925.)
(Amended 3-19-1963 by O-8802 N.S.)

(Amended 10-8-1963 by O-8902 N.S.)

(Amended 2—22-1972 by O-10787 N.S.)

§53.01.2 Same & Duration Of License & Notice Of Blasting d Permit Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-10053 O.S., adopted 7—7-1925.)
(Amended 3—19-1963 by O-8802 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—22-1972 by O-10787 N.S.)

§53.01.3 Same d Permits Issued Only To License Holder
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-10053 O.S., adopted 7—7-1925.)
(Repealed 3—19-1963 by O—-8802 N.S.)

§ 53.05 Explosives & Definitions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 2—22-1972 by O-10787 N.S.)

§53.05.1 Same & Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§53.05.2 Same d Permit Required 8 Inspection
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 53.05.3 Same & Magazines For Storage
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§53.05.4 Same & Distance From Buildings 8 Quantity Of Explosive
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

B



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 53.05.5 Same & Enclosed And Encased In Containers
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§53.05.6 Same & Permit To Transport
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§53.05.7 Same & Vehicles For Transportation
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 53.05.8 Same & Smoking Prohibited 8 Storage Of Blasting Caps
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

8 53.05.9 Same & Quantity Of Detonators Transported
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 53.05.10 Same & Records Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§53.05.11 Same d Selling Or Disposing 8 Statement Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 53.05.12 Same & Discharge Of Fire Arms In Proximity Of Explosive Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§53.05.13 Same 8 Small Arms Ammunition d Regulated By Fire Marshal
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-11756 O.S., adopted 5-31-1928.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 53.10 Firearms, Etc. d Firing Prohibited 8 Exceptions

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0—2404 N.S., adopted 3—24-1942.)
(Amended 12-13-1955 by O—-6778 N.S.)

(Amended 10-8-1964 by O—9092 N.S.)

§ 53.15 Air Guns, Sling Shots, Pointed Missiles, Etc. d Discharge, Propelling Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—61 N.S., adopted 10-24-1932.)

N 22



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§53.15.1 Same & Sale To Minors Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—61 N.S., adopted 10—-24-1932.)

§ 53.15.2 Possession of Air Guns, Pointed Missiles, Etc., by Minors
(—Possession of Air Guns, P o +1iA-1988dy OMILB4ATSNIS) e s |, Et

§ 53.16 Penalties for Firearms and Other Weapons Offenses

(—Penalties for Firear ms an+dl7-098hye0-184D02aNt5.y er ous V
(Retitled to —Penalties for Firear4s1998hy@ Ot her
18736 N.S.)

§ 53.20 Steam Boiler, Steam Engine, Unfired Pressure Vessel 8 Inspection 8 Operation
Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4265 N.S., adopted 12—-13-1949.)

§53.20.1 Same & Operating Pressure
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4265 N.S., adopted 12—-13-1949.)

§ 53.25 Fireworks, Toy Cannon, Pistols, Etc., Regulated

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—1313 N.S., adopted 1-18-1938.)

(Amended 10-8-1964 by O-9092 N.S.; portions formerly under Secs. 53.25.1, 53.25.2 and 53.25.3.)
(Amended 10-14-1965 by O—9303 N.S.)

(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—-9651 N.S.)

§53.25.1 Same d Permits For Display

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-1313 N.S., adopted 1-18-1938.)
(Amended 7-23-1963 by O—8861 N.S.)

(Repealed 10-8-1964 by O—9092 N.S.; now part of Sec. 53.25.)

§53.25.2 Same d Application For Permit
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-1313 N.S., adopted 1-18-1938.)
(Repealed 10-8-1964 by O—9092 N.S.; now part of Sec. 53.25.)

§53.25.3 Same & Permitd Bond Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0—1313 N.S., adopted 1-18-1938.)
(Repealed 10-8-1964 by O—9092 N.S.; now part of Sec. 53.25.)

§ 53.25.4 Discharge Of Blank Cartridges
(Added 6-16-1960 by O—-8317 N.S.)

(See Sec. 12.02 of Uniform Fire Code.)
(Repealed 4—-3-1969 by O—-10005 N.S.)

§ 53.30 Dangerous Weapons Used During Picketing, Demonstrations And Strikes
(Added 1-2-1979 by O-12537 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 53.31 Assault Weapons, Nuisance, Temporary Custody
(—Assaulst, Waiapamce, Tempe2I-ABWyGEI¥2HINSJy Il added

DIVISION 1
0 1 Reserved for future use 0 1

ARTICLE 4
Public Hazards and Public Nuisances
(Retitled from —PUW®Iby@1795aNSgdr dsll on 8

§ 54.01 Captive Balloons d Definition
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-879 N.S. adopted 4—7-1936.)
(Repealed 8—3-1977 by 0O-12120 N.S.)

§54.01.1 Same & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-879 N.S. adopted 4—7-1936.)
(Repealed 8-3-1977 by O-12120 N.S.)

§ 54.10 Blinker Lights & Definitions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9424 O.S. adopted 4—1-1924.)
(Repealed 7—-9-1953 by O-5685 N.S.)

§54.10.1 Same & Permit Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0—9424 O.S. adopted 4-1-1924.)
(Repealed 7—-9-1953 by O-5685 N.S.)

§54.10.2 Same & Application for Permit
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9424 O.S. adopted 4—1-1924.)
(Repealed 7—-9-1953 by O-5685 N.S.)

§54.10.3 Same d Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9424 O.S. adopted 4—1-1924.)
(Repealed 7—-9-1953 by O-5685 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 1
General Provisions
(Added 1-28-1980 by O—15174 N.S.)

8 54.0105 Sidewalk Sales and Displays Prohibited

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—7767 O.S. adopted 6—25-1919;

amended 2-9-1977 by O-12008 N.S.; amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —
formerly Sec. 54.05; —Wares, Merchandi se or
Sidewalk—Pr o hi bi t e d #16-889dy0d1&339 NIS.D

(Amended and retitled to —Si d-a8a97ky O03&1398.8S) and

§ 54.0106 Wares or Merchandise Displayed on Sidewalk 8 Permits

(Added 2—-8-1977 by O—12008 N.S.; amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by 0-15229 N.S.,

formerly Sec. 54.06.; amended 11-16-1987 by O-16978 N.S.)

(—War es or Mer chandi-sPe rDni g mllla yr eelp-£28HbyeRH 8d38nw all 1k
N.S.)

8 54.0110 Unauthorized Enchroachments Prohibited provided by this Code.
(Added 10-18-2007 by 0-19670 N.S.; effective 11-17-2007)

8 54.0115 Debris, Etc., on Street 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained O-5492 O.S. adopted 2—24-1914.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.15.)

§54.0115.1 Same & Penalty
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-5492 O.S. adopted 2—24-1914.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.15.1.)

8 54.0116 Building Materials on Streets, Etc. 8 Warning Lantern Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-1791 O.S. adopted 11-15-1904.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.16.)

§ 54.0117 Work in Public Rightsi ofi Way & Barriers and Safety Precautions Required
(Added 1-7-1958 by O—7715 N.S.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.17.)

8§ 54.0120 Excavations 8 Permit Required

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S., formerly Sec. 54.20.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by 0-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

P €

C



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§54.0120.1 Same & Procedure on Application for Permit

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.1.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

§54.0120.2 Same & Payment of Fees

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3836 N.S. adopted 8—17-1948.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.2.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

§ 54.0120.3 Same & Investigation and Recommendation

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.3.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

§54.0120.4 Same & Consideration by The City Manager

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.4.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

8 54.0120.5 Same & Bond and Certificate of Insurance

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.5.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

8 54.0120.6 Same & Preventing Collapse of Sides of Excavations

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.6.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

8 54.0120.7 Same & Other Conditions Required of Applicant

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.7.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

8§ 54.0120.8 Same & Revocation or Suspension of Permit

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.8.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by 0-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

8§ 54.0120.9 Same 8 Expiration of Permits d Issuance of Supplemental Permits
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.9.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by 0-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

B >



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 54.0120.10 Same & Permit Does Not Excuse Compliance with other Laws
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2830 N.S. adopted 5-17-1944.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.20.10.)
(Repealed 12-9-1997 by O-18451 N.S.; effective 1-1-2000.)

§ 54.0121 Distribution of Handbills and Advertising 8 from Aircraft Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3256 N.S. adopted 9-3-1946.)
(Amended by renumbering 3—31-1980 by O-15229 N.S. —formerly Sec. 54.21.)

8 54.0122 Prohibitions and Regulations Applicable to the Sale or Distribution of Foods,
Beverages, Merchandise or Services from Vehicles and Mobile Food Units
(Added 7—25-1988 by O—-17116 N.S.)

§54.0123 Reserved for future use 0 1

DIVISION 2
Weed, Rubbish and Waste Abatement

(AWeed and Rubbish Abatement Progra

(Added 1-28-1980 by O—15174 N.S.)
(Retitled tol Weed, Rubbish and
on 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

§ 54.0201 Declaration of Purpose

(—Pur pos edB-190bd@-tb174N.S.)

(Amended (portions previously contained in former Sec. 44.0115) and retitled 8—10-1993 by O—
17957 N.S.)

§ 54.0202 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i-28+1980 by @-#l587¢ NLS.) 1
(Amended (portions previously contained in former Sec. 44.0116) 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

8 54.0203 Enforcement Authority

(—Dec |l ar at 281980 by®€lbll &4 dN.S.)1

(Repealed 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(—Enf orcement Authorityl added (porti ofhls
1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

Wast e

previ



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 54.0204 Enforcement Remedies

(—Procedure for Aba28-B80bdyOI5IMMNIS) cell added 1

(Repealed 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)
(—Enf orcement RI&HD83by -KIB7NSJded 8

§ 54.0205 Strict Liability Offenses

(—Appeal from Requi r-28nies8aly®-15dMNNot i cel
(Amended 11-16-1981 by O-15614 N.S.)

(Amended 7-14-1986 by O-16685 N.S.)

(Repealed 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(—Strict Liabi |-10+193p0-f765i8.$)sll added 8

§ 54.0206 Administrative Abatement Procedure

(—Abatement Pr-Q81080yO€dl74a.8)ded 1

(Amended 11-16-1981 by 0-15614 N.S.)

(Amended 7-14-1986 by O-16685 N.S.)

(Repealed 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(—Administrative Aba+l@183 hytO-1Ps7NSedur el

§ 54.0207 Abatement Lien
(Added 8-10-1993 by 017957 N.S.)

8 54.0208 Property Maintenance

(Renumbered from Sec. 44.0119, amended and retitled 8—10-1993 by O—17957 N.S.)
§ 54.0209 Illegal Dumping Prohibited

(Renumbered from Sec. 44.0117 and amended 8—-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

§ 54.0210 Littering Prohibited
(Renumbered from Sec. 44.0118 and amended 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

8 54.0211 Transporting Uncovered Waste Prohibited
(Renumbered from Sec. 44.0121 and amended 8—-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

8 54.0212 Abandoned Personal Property
(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

added

added

1

8



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 3
Abatement of Vacant Structures
(—Public Property Nuisance Abat eme
(Added 8-17-1981 by O-15573 N.S.)
(Retitled to —Public Pr—o0pledBly®P-1M57NS)ance Abal

8§ 54.0301 Declaration of Purpose

(—City Property Nui slai08béyOALBSE3tNS.ment I added 8
repealed (incorporated within Chapter 1, Article 2, Division 6) 8—10-1993 by O—17957 N.S.)
(—Decl arati on oc1I0-19%by P-H7858N.S)added 8

(Amended 5-28-1996 by 0O-18301 N.S.)

§ 54.0302 Definitions

(—Def i ni t i-brA%81 by @56878 NLS.; Bepealed (incorporated within Chapter 1,
Article 2, Division 6) 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(—Def i ni t i-10+%3 by @758 NLS.) 8

(Amended 5-28-1996 by O-18301 N.S.; corrected 1-23-1998.)

§ 54.0303 Enforcement Authority

( —I nv e s tdded8a17-1981rby O-1b573 N.S.; repealed (incorporated within Chapter 1,
Article 2, Division 6) 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(—Duty to Clean -1®A393bp@-t7ebTNeSl;, added 8
renumbered, retitled and amended to Sec. 54.0306 on 5—28-1996 by O—18301 N.S.)

(—Enf orcement A28196dyO-1830IINSadded 5

§ 54.0304 Enforcement Remedies

(—Decl arati on 0-417-1981 by©-als6¢3&l.b.; repedled ¢irctorpBrated within
Chapter 1, Article 2, Division 6) 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(—F aei Ituor Cl ean an-€d0-D%oyOr1897NS.dded 8

repealed 5—28-1996 by 0O-18301 N.S.)

(—Enf orcement R@84986cdy -BIPLINSJded 5

§ 54.0305 Strict Liability Offenses

(—Continued Use of NecelddBrbyO-B573NS.;Faciliti esl
repealed (incorporated within Chapter 1, Article 2, Division 6) 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)
(—Administrative Abatement Procedur e®-199%r Vaca
renumbered to Sec. 54.0307 on 5-28-1996 by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Strliicabil ity -810%hbyO«€8HNE)dded 5



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 54.0306 Duty to Clean and Secure or Board

(—City Counci l De c | a FlEa31981dn0-1b573 NNy nepsakech8e18-1993a d d e d
by O-17957 N.S.)

(—Standards f or Ab a tdevithm Ghiapter 1pAdtidlee2dDivicionB)8-40~p or at e
1993 by O-17957 N.S.; renumbered, retitled and amended to Sec. 54.0308 on 5-28-1996 by O—

18301 N.S))

(—Duty to Clean and Secure or Board, Il renumber
28-1996 by O—18301 N.S.)

8 54.0307 Administrative Abatement Procedures for Vacant and Unsecured Structures

(—Ur gency Matlt1881 bylO-126Bd.8.;depeBled 8—10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

( —Posting of Structurel adde dDiJisiom6r8elo—pId3hyat ed v
0-17957 N.S.; repealed 5-28-1996 by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Administrative Abatement Procedures for Vacsa
amended from Sec. 54.0305 on 5-28-1996 by O-18301 N.S.)

§ 54.0308 Standards for Boarding a Vacant Structure

(—Vi ol at i €®1993 bysDd1@d987dN.S.8renumbered, retitled and amended to Sec.

54.0309 by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Standards for Boarding a Vacant Structure,l
54.0306 on 5-28-1996 by 0O—18301 N.S.)

8 54.0309 Entry or Interference with Notice Prohibited

(—Statement 0-10-1993 by®©+ALT957 IN.S.;arepedled 8-2881996 by O-18301 N.S.)
(—Entry or Interference with Notice Prohibitec
54.0308 on 5-28-1996 by 0O-18301 N.S.)

(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18656 N.S.)

§ 54.0310 Continuous Abatement Authority

(—Abat ement -00e1898hyD-17857 N.&;denuBbered to Sec. 54.0311 on 5-28-1996
by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Continuous Abat e nredprdtitledandtamneodedifromySec.lb4.0t12 am 5—mb e
28-1996 by O—18301 N.S.)

8§ 54.0311 Abatement Cost

(—Rei nspect i elf-1983yeQ-1795aNISd rendmbeded to Sec. 54.0314 on 5-28—

1996 by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Abatement Cost, I rldonb+231996 yd-183010l.6) Sec. 54. 03

§ 54.0312 Continuous Public Nuisances

(—Continuous Abat eltr&983tby OOL79%7eNtS.; rénundeded, ectitled &nd
amended to Sec. 54.0310 on 5-28-1996 by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Continuous Publ i dfroMBec. $483130e5-28-1996 by G+-1830DNSK) e

8 54.0313 Duty to File a Statement of Intent

(—Continuous Pub]l 4101998 byiOs129%57 ¢N.8. srdhumbeckditeSdc. 580312
on 5-28-1996 by O-18301 N.S.)

(—Duty to Fil e adde§3-28+1%6bg O-1830b0N.S.; torrected —P3#1998.)

Ch.

L5 IER



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 54.0314 Reinspection Fee
(—Reinspection Fee, I r ena8+#Hd96eby@B30INSOM Sec. 54. C

§ 54.0315 Boarded and Vacant Structure Penalty
(—Boarded and Vacanttd5-3B+18996hy 0180 NPenal tyll adde

8 54.0316 Procedures for Boarded and Vacant Structure Penalty
(Added 5—28-1996 by O—-18301 N.S.)

§ 54.0317 Appeal of Boarded and Vacant Structure Penalty
(Added 5—28-1996 by O—-18301 N.S.)

§ 54.0318 Administrative Enforcement Hearing
(Added 5—28-1996 by O—-18301 N.S.)

§ 54.0319 Failure to Pay Penalties
(Added 5-28-1996 by O—18301 N.S.)

§ 54.0320 Allocation of Vacant Building Penalty
(Added 5-28-1996 by O—-18301 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 4
Graffiti Abatement
(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

§ 54.0401 Declaration of Purpose

(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)

(Amended 6-12-2008 by O-19750 N.S; effective 7-12-2008.)

§ 54.0402 Definitions

(Added 8-10-1993 by O—17957 N.S.)
(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)
(Amended 9-24-2001 by O-18984 N.S.)

§ 54.0403 Authority

(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)
(Amended 6-24-1996 by O-18315 N.S.)
(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)

§ 54.0404 Enforcement Remedies
(Added 8-10-1993 by O—-17957 N.S.)
(Amended 6—24-1996 by O-18315 N.S.)

§ 54.0405 Graffiti Prohibited

(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)

(Amended 6-12-2008 by 0-19750 N.S; effective 7-12-2008.)

§ 54.0406 Abatement Authority and Procedures
(—Abat ement drd8e10-£963by Ce-19967 NeSJ
(Retitled to —Abatement Aut h-26£2000byO-E86NSPr ocedur

§ 54.0407 Removal of Graffiti by City on Private Property

(—Removal b y-10€1b98 hy D-1785F N.&)d 8

(Retitl ed ft oGraRefmotvialbyo Ci ty on PRI6-R000&)OCe Proper
18863 N.S.)

8 54.0408 Private Property Consent Forms
(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)
(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

8 54.0409 Removal by City on Public Property
(—Publird y®Rr a@e993dby B-17957 N.S.)
(Retitled to —Removal by Ci t1¢-20@0hy OPL8863INS.)c Pr oper

§ 54.0410 Cost Recovery

(Added 8-10-1993 by 0O-17957 N.S.)
(Amended 6—24-1996 by O-18315 N.S.)
(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)

§ 54.0411 Parent Responsibility
(Added 8-10-1993 by 017957 N.S.)
(Added 2—13-1995 by O-18163 N.S.)

§ 54.0412 Community Service
(Added 10-11-1993 by 0-17996 N.S.)
(Added 2—13—1995 by 0-18163 N.S.)

§ 54.0413 Reward Authority
(—Rewar d A ud6h241906thyOH-1835dNES ¢
(Amended 10-16-2000 by O-18863 N.S.)

§ 54.0414 Restriction on Display of Graffiti Instruments for Sale
(Added 9-24-2001 by O-18984 N.S.)
(Amended 6-12-2008 by 0-19750 N.S; effective 7-12-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 5
Public Pay Telephone Regulations
(Added 1-3-1994 by O-18019 N.S.)

8 54.0501 Declaration of Public Nuisance

(—Prohibited Locations o+3-194uby 0180619 WS; yepedled1—-e p h 0o n €
29-1996 by O-18254 N.S.)

(—Decl aration of PQ%1P% oy ONM8r34b8.a)ncell added 1

§ 54.0502 Definitions

(Added —Public Pay Tel e319% by©s180WH.S.;Fapdalédil-R9— Nui s ar
1996 by O-18254 N.S.)

(—Def i ni t i-20+%96 by @-i825¢ NiS.) 1

(Amended 9-27-1999 by O-18685 N.S.)

§ 54.0503 Enforcement Remedies
(—Abatement Ge8-#94éuy0H1g009 N&.drepealdd 1-329-1996 by O-18254 N.S.)
(—Enf orcement R6O4b86cy -BIHBA4NSJded 1

8 54.0504 Prohibited Locations of Public Pay Telephone

(—Repl acement P-8-494ibp0-18EANIS.; rapdatbdel1629-1996 by O-18254

N.S.)

(—Prohibited Locations 02919960y D-18254R&A)y Tel ephone

8 54.0505 Approval Process for Public Pay Telephone Installation
(—Exempt i 0634994 byaOd-IBCLIN.S] repealed 1-29-1996 by O-18254 N.S.)
(—Approval Process for Publ i-29-199&by O-TI885Uu p)h one | r

§ 54.0506 Abatement Procedures

(—Li st of Abat e-8-199%bg@18019MSs tepeated 1628-d9961by O-18254
N.S.)

(—Abement Pr oc e281996ds0OH18240NEe d 1

§ 54.0507 Exemptions
(—Busi ness —3FQNM tiy O=1&D1D &l.8.; repealed 1-29-1996 by O-18254 N.S.)
(—Exempt i 04291D96 &y O-d825 N.1)

8§ 54.0508 List of Prohibited Locations
(Added 1-29-1996 by O-18254 N.S.)

§ 54.0509 Business Tax
(Added 1-29-1996 by O-18254 N.S.)

Ch.

B s



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 54.0601 Purpose and Intent
(—Pur pose and-27419%bpri8@B5NSJd d e d 9

8§ 54.0602 Definitions
(—Definit i-27-0989Iby Oal86E5NS.) 9

§ 54.0603 Permit Required to Install or Maintain Public Pay Telephone in the Public Right-

of-Way

(—Permit Required to Install or Maof-Wdyli na ®Pdidd i
9-27-1999 by O-18685 N.S.)

8 54.0604 Location of Public Pay Telephone in Public Right of Way
(—Location of Public Pay Tel @pli®by©-1868BNFPubl i ¢ F

854 . 0605 Permitteeds Duty to Maintain Public
(—Permittee’s Duty to Maint aign AR elall 2Ry De | €
0-18685 N.S.)

8§54 . 0606 Permitteeds Duty to I ndemnify City
(—Permittee’s Duty £26190Dhby0-&8686NS)y Cityl added 9

§ 54.0607 Requirements of Division to be Conditions of Permit
(—Requirements rodi thi ovn s i ®fn -2R-BV911Ot18686HN.8.d e d 9

§ 54.0608 Time for Compliance
(—Time for Co m37-1999ynC:18685NS ded 9

§ 54.0609 Grace Period for Public Pay Telephones Subject to Existing Contracts
(—Gr ace Peri od foonre sP uShulbijce cRa yt oT eEl xelgst®99hy@- Cont r
18685 N.S.)

8 54.0610 Duty to Restore Sidewalk upon Removal of Public Pay Telephone
(—Duty to Restore Sidewal k upon -2RE%byWd86850f Puctk
N.S.)

§ 54.0611 Revocation of Permits

(—Revocati on o#®7-1998by 0ri8685N.S)added 9

§ 54.0612 City Manager to Adopt Implementing Procedures

(—City Manager to Adopt | Avpldoen®-i8685NSY Pr ocedur €

§ 54.0613 Public Pay Telephone as Public Nuisance
(—Public Pay Tel ephone-27d%9bp0-18685NS)Nui sancel adc

8 54.0614 Enforcement Remedies
(—Enforcement ReéINI®OyiO438dNa)dded 9

8 54.0615 Applicability of Other Laws and Ordinances
(—Applicabiiwstgndf OOd h a-87A89%by ©-18685NIS9 d 9

B >



San Diego Municipal C

ode Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 7
Investigation and Cleanup of Contaminated Property
(—I nvestigation and Cleanup of

added 12-9-2002 by O-19130 N.S.)

§ 54.0701 Findings
(—Fi ndi n g £9002bylG16180 NIS.2

§ 54.0702 Purpose

(—Pur pos e-B-2062dydOel @130 N.8.)

§ 54.0703 Definitions
(—Definiti ®-p062IbyOalBal80NS.) 1 2

§ 54.0704 Designation of Local Agency
(—Designation of 19Q02aYO-1A1BENSGY Il added 12

§ 54.0705 Enforcement Authority
(—Enf orcement A%2002by0ila130MNS)added 12

8 54.0706 Geographical Boundaries
(—Geographical B -9-2002dyaOr10180NK.) added 12

8§ 54.0707 Authorized Actions

(—Aut hor i

zed ARUWIbpHIPIBONSYded 12

8 54.0708 Authority to Enter Into Agreement With Oversight Agency

(—Aut hor i

§54.0709 Council
(—Counci |l

ty to Enter | nto Agr-8-20086eyrDt19130N.6.)h

Approval of Remedial Actions
Approtwabnsl -9-882deCd1D180MN.S. A

8§54.0710 Violations

(—Viol at i

0-9 2000 by ©-49430 N.S.)1 2

8§ 54.0711 Enforcement Remedies
(—Enf orcement R220020yi064¥H3ION&)dded 12

8§ 54.0712 Strict Liability Offenses

(—Stri gt

Olf if @ mis lei3-A002 ayDdl ¥ 3D N.3.)2

Cont an

Over s



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 9
Prohibition of Retail Sale, Retail Gift or Distribution of Novelty Lighters
(—Prohibition of Retail Sal e, Ret ail

of Novelty L232008by©-890141MS)ded 4
§ 54.0901 Declaration of Purpose
(—Peclaration of Purposeo added 4-23-2008 by O-19741 N.S; effective 5-23-2008.)

8§ 54.0902 Definition
(—Pefinitionll  dded 4-23-2008 by 0-19741 N.S; effective 5-23-2008.)

§ 54.0903 Prohibition
(P r o hi baddedid-23r2008 by O-19741 N.S; effective 5-23-2008.)

§ 54.0904 Exceptions
(AExceptionso added 4-23-2008 by O-19741 N.S; effective 5-23-2008.)

§ 54.0905 Enforcement Authority
(Enf or c e me n ddded\4428-20@8 byiOt19741 N.S; effective 5-23-2008.)

§54.0906 Enforcement Remedies
(Enf or c e me n addeR426120@B byeOs19741 N.S; effective 5-23-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 10
Lead Hazard Prevention and Control Ordinance
(—Abatement of L eld-@002HnC-HW063NSS) added 5
(Retitled and amendedto—L ead Hazard Prevention and Cor
and added Sections 54.1007 to Sections 54.1015 on 4-8-2008 by O-19732 N.S.)

§54.1001 Findings
(—Findings and Decl a+l42000y@-19968N.Pur posell added E
(Retitl ed t cathendEdi4-8-2008mygOs18732&.8; @ffective 5-8-2008.)

§54.1002 Purpose
(—Def i ni t i-1d-2082lby CalB06E3eNGS.) 5
(Retitled tol Pu-82008ky®©il973 N.8 effectme5r8-2008]) 4

854.1003 Definitions
(—Enf or c e me added 5A4+2002 by 10119068 N.S.)
(Retitled tol Def i-812008 by ©-09330 N.S affettivesb+8-2008d e d 4

§ 54.1004 Lead Hazard Unlawful
(—Enf orcement R&20020yi04¥EBN&)dded 5
( Ret i tLéaceHhzartd Wnlawfull — a n ahdeded+8-2008 by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 54.1005 Lead-Safe Work Practice Standards Required

(—Strict Liabi I-14-2002bydX-10063NSe sl added 5

( Ret i tLdéadeSdfe Work Practice Standards Requiredll a n d a #8-2008thye(C319732
N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8§ 54.1006 Lead Safe Work Practice Standards

(—Lead Hazard L4200 byfOtl9063N.&)d ded 5

( Ret i tLdakSdfe Work Practice Standardsll a n d a 8-8008thyeCGd19732 N.S; effective
5-8-2008.)

§ 54.1007 Lead Hazards in Housing
(Eead Hazar d sdded 48-2098by G-19#3NIS geffective 5-8-2008.)

8 54.1008 Procedures for Occupant Relocation
( Procedures for Occupant Relocationo added 4-8-2008 by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8 54.1009 Visual Lead Inspection and Correction Prior to Re-Occupancy of Rental Housing
( Wasual Lead Inspection and Correction PriortoRe-Oc cupancy of &dedt al Hous

4-8-2008 by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)
Ch.

L5 IER



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 54.1010 Duty to Notify
( ButytoN o t iadded 4-8-2008 by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 54.1011 Child-Care Facility
( Ghild-CareFaci | i t y8#200%by @ B2 NIS; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 54.1012 Enforcement Authority
( Enforcement Authorityo added 4-8-2008 by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8 54.1013 Enforcement Remedies
( Enforcement Remedieso added 4-8-2008 by 0-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 54.1014 Cost Recovery
(60st Readdedv-8-2098lby O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 54.1015 Strict Liability Offenses
( Strict Liability Offenseso added 4-8-2008 by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

APPENDI X AAO
Interior Worksite Preparation Levels (Not Including Windows)
Chapter 5, Article 4, Division 10, of the San Diego Municipal Code

(AppendixA, I nt eri or Worksite Preparat iadidei4-83-2008el s ( Nc
by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

APPENDI X fAAO

Exterior Worksite Preparation Levels (Not Including Windows)
Chapter 5, Article 4, Division 10, of the San Diego Municipal Code

(AppendixA, Ext er i or Wor ksite Preparat iadueu4-82808el s ( Nc
by O-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

APPENDI X fAAO

Window Treatment Or Replacement Worksite Preparation
Chapter 5, Article 4, Division 10, of the San Diego Municipal Code
(AppendixA-Wi ndow Treat ment Or Repl| aaddedd®208 Wor ksi t e
by 0-19732 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

(ARTICLE 5 - Fire Protection and Prevention
55.1 Adoption of the Uniform Fire Code )

(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.; amended 1-9-1975 by 0O-11474 N.S.;
amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.; amended 6—9-1980 by O-15274 N.S.)

(Repealed3-22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§ 55.01 Adoption of the Uniform Fire Code

(—Petrol et-ReBubadue d£2-1b54 y 0046 N.S.1contained in 0O-9382 O.S.

adopted 2—20-1924; repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

(—Adoption of the U~nR-1982rbynO-1B67% NeS.; dhendee2i21-4984dye d

0-16164 N.S.)

(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0101.0001 on 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.01.1 Same d Gasoline d Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.2 Same d Engine Distillate 3 Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.3 Same & Kerosene 8 Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.4 Same d Stove Distillate 8 Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.5 Same & Furnace Distillate Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.6 Same & Signs Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.01.7 Same & Lubricating Oil d Signs Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S.
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

M

adopted 2—20-1924.)

adopted 2—20-1924.)

adopted 2—20-1924.)

adopted 2—20-1924.)

adopted 2—20-1924.)

adopted 2—20-1924.)

adopted 2-20-1924.)

3



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.01.8 Same & Bureau of Standards Circular Adopted
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S. adopted 2—20-1924.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.9 Same & Authority to Take Samples
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 09382 O.S. adopted 2—20-1924.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.01.10 Same & Signs Misrepresenting & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in 0-9382 O.S. adopted 2—20-1924.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.01.16 Sec. 1.16 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6-14-1973 by O-11084 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.01.25 Sec. 1.25 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O-11084 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.01.31 Sec. 1.31 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6-14-1973 by O-11084 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.01.57 Sec. 1.57 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.01.205 Sec. 1.205 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.02.105 on 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.01.207 Sec. 1.207 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0—12419 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.02.107 on 3—-22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.01.215 Sec. 1.215 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 5-5-1976 by O-11837 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O—12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.01.216 Sec. 1.216 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§55.01.302 Sec. 1.302 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11915 N.S.)

§55.01.309 Sale or Delivery without Permit
(Added 1-9-1975 by 0O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)

§55.01.402 Sec. 1.402 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.01.403A Sec. 1.403A of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.01.406D Sec. 1.406D of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.01.408F Sec. 1.408F of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.01.409G Sec. 1.409G of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.01.4111 Sec. 1.4111 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O—12419 N.S.)

§55.01.421S Sec. 1.421S of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.2 Definitions and Explanations

(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.; amended 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by
0O-12419N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.02.04 Section 2.04 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

Ch.

B 2



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.02.105 Sec. 2.105 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.02.107 Sec. 2.107 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§ 55.02.201 Inspection and Plan Checks and Unsafe Buildings Fees

(Added 3—22-1982 by O—15679 N.S.; title added and amended 8—8-1988 by O-17125 N.S.;
amended 4-17-1989 by O-17279 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.02.302 Sec. 55.02.302 of the Uniform Fire Code is Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.; amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.02.303 Sec. 02.303 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§ 55.3 Deletions from the 1973 Uniform Fire Code
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—-9651 N.S.; amended 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.04.101 Sec. 4.101 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.05 Volatile, Inflammable Liquids 6 Regulated
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.05.1 Same d Authority of Fire Marshal
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.2 Same & Abovei Ground Storage Tanks 8 Specifications
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.3 Same & Storage of Oil for Oili Burning Equipment
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.4 Same & Permit Required for Storage Tanks
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.05.5 Same & Storage and Use of Gasoline, Benzene, Benzole, or Other Volatile and
Inflammable Liquids
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.05.6 Same & Permits Required for Storage Tanks
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.7 Same & Storage Tanks d Oil Tight Vents Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.05.8 Same 0 Storage Tanks & Pipes d Air Pressure Prohibited
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.9 Same & Definitions
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.10 Same & Gasoline & Size of Containers for Delivery
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.05.11 Same & Garages & Portable Filling Tanks Permitted
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.05.12 Same & Gasoline Pumps 8 Wire Protectors Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.13 Same & Service Station 8 Coin Operated Dispensers Prohibited
(Amended 4-21-1959 by O-8097 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

8 55.05.14 Same & Gasoline Service Station 8 Smoking Prohibited
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

8§ 55.05.15 Same 8 Gasoline Service Station d Running Engines of Motor Vehicles
Prohibited
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.16 Gasoline Service Station d Signs Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.05.17 Same & Gasoline Service Station 8 Automatic Shut Off Nozzles Required
(Amended 4—21-1959 by O-8097 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

8 55.05.18 Selfi service Gasoline Service Station 8 Adult Male Attendant Required (Repealed

6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
Ch.

B



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.05.19 Same & Gasoline Service Station Fire Extinguisher Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06 Liquefied Petroleum Gas @ Transportation, Storage, Use, and Transfer Regulated
(Amended 12—7-1954 by O—-6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.1 Liquefied Petroleum Gas d Definitions
(Amended 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.2 Storage of Liquefied Petroleum Gas & Permit Required
(Amended 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.3 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Container Filling Plants and Bulk Storage Plants &
Capacity

(Amended 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.4 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Bulk Storage Plants and Container Filling Plants &
Location

(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.5 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Bulk Storage Plant Location 8 Exception
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

8§ 55.06.6 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Containers 8 Minimum Separation

( —L i q u edleumeGds Céhtaibers —Mi ni mum Se p ar ar+1d56 hy 0—6340dNE.¢ d

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.06 Section 6.06 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

8 55.06.7 Liquefied Petroleum Gas d Storage in Buildings
(Added 12—7-1954 by 0—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.8 Vehicles Carrying Liquefied Petroleum Gas & Parking
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

12



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.06.9 Liquefied Petroleum Gas @ Transportation in City
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—-6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.10 Filling of Liquefied Petroleum Gas Containers
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.06.11 Liquefied Petroleum Gas & Permit Application
(Added 12—7-1954 by 0O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.12 Liquefied Petroleum Gas & Issuance of Permit
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.13 Liquefied Petroleum Gas & Revocation of Permit
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.06.14 Liquefied Petroleum Gas & Revocation of Permit 8 Appeal to Council
(Added 12—7-1954 by O—6340 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.07 Trailer Parks 8 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Regulated 8 Permits Required
(Added 5-4-1954 by O—6092 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Definitions
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4-3—-1962 by O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.1 Marine Fuel Facilitiesd Permit Required
(Added 9—6-1955 by 06650 N.S.; amended 4-3—-1962 by O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.2 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Special Permit & Council Authorization Required
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4—-3—-1962 by O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.3 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Application for Permit

(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4—3-1962 by 0-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

M



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.08.4 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Issuance of Permit, Suspension and Revocation
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4—3-1962 by 0O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.5 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Storage and Diking Regulated
(Added 9-6-1955 by O—-6650 N.S.; amended 4-3-1962 by O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.6 Marine Facilities & Installation Regulated
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4—3-1962 by 0O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.7 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Dispensing Methods and Devices Regulated
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4-3—-1962 by O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.8 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Fire Prevention Regulated
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4—3-1962 by 0O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.9 Marine Fuel Facilities 8 Fire Fighting Equipment Required
(Added 9—6-1955 by O—6650 N.S.; amended 4—-3—-1962 by O-8617 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

8 55.08.10 Application to Responsible Officers
(Added 5-24-1962 by O—-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.08.11 Fire Protection of The Vessel
(Added 5-24-1962 by O—-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.12 Security at Marine Fuel Terminals
(Added 5-24-1962 by O-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.13 Marine Terminal Superintendent & Certified
(Added 5-24-1962 by O—-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.08.14 Cargo Pumps and Hose at Marine Terminals
(Added 5—24-1962 by O—-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.15 Inspection Prior to Transfer of Cargo
(Added 5-24-1962 by O—-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

A 55.08.16 iDecbafati dankf Shnppecti on
(Added 5-24-1962 by O—8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.17 Conditions Requiring Summary Action
(Added 5-24-1962 by O-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.18 Overi all Loading
(Added 5-24-1962 by O-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.08.19 Repairs to Vessel or Wharf
(Added 5-24-1962 by O—-8646 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.09.104 Sec. 9.104 of the Uniform Fire Code is Amended
(Added 2—21-1989 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.09.106 Sec. 9.106 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended to Add the Following:
(Added 2—21-1984 by 016164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.09.110 Sec. 9.110 of the Uniform Fire Code is Amended to Add the Following:
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

§55.09.121 Sec. 9.121 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1989 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.09.124 Sec. 9.124 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

(Added 2-21-1984 by O—16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10—1989 by O—17321 N.S.)

M



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

8§ 55.10 Christmas Trees, Fireproofingd Required Where Places of Public Assembly
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(See Sec. 55.27.37 for same subject matter.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.10.1 Definitions

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(See Sec. 55.27.37 for same subject matter.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.10.103 Sec. 10.103 of The 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O—12419 N.S.)

§55.10.104 Sec. 10.104 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.10.105 Sec. 10.105 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 9-14-1977 by O-12152 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.10.106 Sec. 10.106 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.10.113 Sec. 10.113 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.10.114 Sec. 10.114 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0—12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.10.2 Same & Permit Required
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(Repealed (See Sec. 55.27.37) 6—20-1967 by O-9651 N.S.)

§55.10.207 Sec. 10.207 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

(Added 3—-22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.; amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.; amended 1-23-1989
by 0-17224 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.10.208 Sec. 10.208 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.; amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.10.3 Same & Examination of Applicant
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(Repealed (See Sec. 55.27.37) 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.10.301 Sec. 10.301 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O—15679 N.S.; amended 11-7-1988 by O-17172 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.10.305 Sec. 10.305 of the Uniform Fire Code Deleted
(Deleted 2—21-1984 by 0O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.10.306 Sec. 10.306 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

Sec. 10.306 Fire Protection in Recreational Vehicle and Mobile Home Parks
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§ 55.10.307 Sec. 10.307(e) of the Uniform Fire Code is Added
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

§55.10.312 Table 10.312 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.10.314 Sec 10.314 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§55.10.316 Sec. 10.316 of the Uniform Fire Code is Added
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.10.4 Same d Approval of Chemicals Used

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12-9-1947.)
(See Sec. 55.27.37 for same subject matter.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.10.401 Sec. 10.401 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17231 N.S.)

§55.10.5 Same & Label Affixed to Tree

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(See Sec. 55.27.37 for same subject matter.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.10.6 Same d Reports Required

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(See Sec. 55.27.37 for same subject matter.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.10.7 Same 8 Enforcing Official

(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-3609 N.S. adopted 12—9-1947.)
(See Sec. 55.27.37 for same subject matter.)

(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.11.102(a) Sec. 11.102(a) of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8-21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.11.104 Sec. 11.104 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O—12419 N.S.)

§55.11.105 Sec. 11.105 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.11.201 Sec. 11.201 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
Sec. 11.201 Accumulation of Waste Material

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§55.11.204 Sec. 11.204 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.11.207 Sec. 11.207 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

Sec. 11.207 Combustible Materials in Attic Areas

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.) ch



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.11.208 Sec. 11.208 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
Sec. 11.208 Vehicles Leaking Gasoline

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§55.11.210 Sec. 11.210 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.11.412 Sec. 11.412 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Amended 3—21-1988 by O-17042 N.S.)

(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.11.414 Sec. 11.414 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
Sec. 11.414 Vacant Buildings

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)

§55.11.416 Sec 11.416 of the Uniform Fire Code is Added
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.12.03 Sec. 12.03 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.12.103 Sec. 12.103 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.12.104 Sec. 12.104 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.13.29 Section 13.29 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 3—-23-1971 by O-10530 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.13.40 Section 13.40 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.13.208 Sec. 13.208 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.13.301 Sec. 13.301 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.13.302 Sec. 13.302 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.13.306 Sec. 13.306 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

(—Pmit Required for Fr¥O75B80d4MNS;yepebledBr4 added
1976 by O-11815N.S.)

(—Sec. 13.306 of The Uni A9 bfF0-12419NS)de A mendec
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by 0-15679 N.S.)

§55.13.308 Sec. 13.308 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.13.309 Sec. 13.309 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.13.311 Sec. 13.311 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.14.101 Sec. 14.101 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.14.102 Sec. 14.102 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.14.202 Sec. 14.202 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.14.203 Sec. 14.203 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0—12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

8§ 55.14.205 Sec. 14.205 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.14.206 Sec. 14.206 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.14.302 Sec. 14.302 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.14.305 Sec. 14.305 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O—12419 N.S.)

§55.14.308 Sec. 14.308 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§ 55.15 Domestic Stove or Range, Oil Burning Equipment Regulated
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—1035 N.S. adopted 12—1-1936.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.15.1 Same & Enforcing Official
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—1035 N.S. adopted 12—1-1936.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.15.2 Same & Application and Scope
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.15.3 Same & Permit Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.15.4 Same d Reports Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.15.5 Same d Specifications for Testing and Installation
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.15.6 Same & Fuel Oil
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.15.7 Same & Installation
Ch(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O-9651 N.S.)

B s



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.15.8 Same & Supply and Storage Tanks and Connections
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.15.9 Same d City Not Liable
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.15.210 Section 15.210 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended. 8 Bulk Storage Underground
(Added 6—20-1967 by 0—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.15.211 Section 15.211 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.15.213 Section 15.213 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.15.215 Section 15.215 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.15.218 Section 15.218 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.15.503 Section 15.503 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.17.09 Section 17.09 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.17.109 Sec. 17.109 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.18.102 Sec. 18.102 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.19.02 Sec. 19.02 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.) 55



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§55.19.12 Sec. 19.12 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.19.103 Sec. 19.103 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.19.104 Sec. 19.104 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8-21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.19.106 Sec. 19.106 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

8§ 55.20 Garages, Cleaning Establishments 8 Definitions
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.1 Same d Extinguishers Required in Public Garages
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.2 Same d Type of Extinguishers
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.02 Section 20.02 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.20.3 Same & Sand Receptacles Required in Public Garages
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.4 Same d Smoking in Public Garages Prohibited 8 Sign
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.04 Section 20.04 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.20.5 Same & Waste Cans Required in Garages
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.6 Same & Spraying Inflammable Liquids in Garage Prohibited
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.20.7 Same d Inspection by Fire Marshal Authorized
Ch(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O-9651 N.S.)

L5 IEX



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.20.8 Same & Extinguishers in Sponging Establishments Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.9 Same & Extinguishers in Cleaning Establishments Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.10 Same 8 Regulations for Storage of Inflammable Liquids in Sponging
Establishments
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.11 Same 8 Waste Receptacles Required in Cleaning or Sponging Establishments
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.20.13 Section 20.13 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.20.14 Section 20.14 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.20.113 Liquefied Petroleum Gas in Trailer Parks
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)

§55.21.104 Sec. 21.104 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

8 55.25 Fire Alarm Signaling Systems
(Added 5-19-1960 by O—-8296 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(See Code Sec. 13.40.)

§55.25.1 Same & Sale or Solicitation
(Added 5-19-1960 by O—-8296 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.25.2 Same & Approved Systems
(Added 5-19-1960 by O—-8296 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.25.3 Same & Installation Permit Required
(Added 5-19-1960 by O—-8296 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.) 57



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.25.101 Sec. 25.101 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.25.115 Sec. 25.115 of the Uniform Fire Code Deleted
Sec. 25.115 of the Uniform Fire Code is hereby deleted
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Deleted 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§ 55.25.116 Sec. 25.116 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.25.117 Sec. 25.117 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1989 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.25.118 Sec. 25.118 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.25.119 Sec. 25.119 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.26.12 Section 26.12 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.26.14 Section 26.14 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6-14-1973 by O-11084 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.26.16 Section 26.16 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.26.103 Sec. 26.103 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.26.114 Sec. 26.114 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.26.116 Sec. 26.116 of the 1973 Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.26.117 Exhibits, Fairs, Trade Shows, Concerts, Conventions or Vehicle Shows: Permit
Required

(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§ 55.26.118 Requirements for Exhibits, Fairs, Trade Shows or Vehicle Displays (in Buildings)
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(Amended 8-21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§55.27.01 Sec. 27.01 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.27.36 Sec. 27.36 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.27.37 Sec. 27.37 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

(Formerly part of Secs. 55.10.2 through 55.10.6.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.27.38 Sec. 27.38 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.; amended 6—14—-1973 by O-11084 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.27.39 Sec. 27.39 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.27.40 Sec. 27.40 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§55.27.201 Sec. 27.201 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.; amended 8—21-1978 by 0O-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§ 55.27.204 Sec. 27.204 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 8-21-1978 by O—-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§ 55.27.206 Rubbish Dumping Prohibited
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.27.207 Vehicles Leaking Gasoline

(—F I ame pr o eResistivegireatment dFChriset ma s T r e-©-<975 bp @-tl474
N.S.; repealed 8—21-1978 by O—-12419 N.S.)

(—Vehicles Leaki-R1gl1978ly©O-c12419N8)I added 8
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

§ 55.27.208 Vehicles Leaking Gasoline
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.27.501 Prei Fire and Emergency Planning
(Added 2—-11-1980 by O-15185 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)

8 55.30 Regulations for Fire Prevention d Receptacle for Ashes
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.30.1 Same d Combustible Material 8 Disposal
(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.30.01 Sec. 30.01 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.30.2 Same & Waste Accumulation 8 Containers Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.30.02 Sec. 30.02 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

8§ 55.30.3 Same & Combustible, Explosive Materials Near Door, etc., Prohibited
Ch(Repealed 6—20-1967 by O—-9651 N.S.)

Bl 6o



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.30.4 Same & Combustible Material on Roof Prohibited
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.30.5 Same & Dangerous Fire Conditions to be Remedied When Ordered by Fire Marshal
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.30.6 Same & Unoccupied Buildings Required to be Secured
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§855.30.06 Sec. 30.06 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.30.7 Same & Storage of Hay, Straw, Lumber, Shingles, etc. 3 Permit Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.30.8 Same & Burning of Rubbish, etc., Regulated 8 Permit Required
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§55.30.9 Same & Emission of Smoke 8 Nuisance
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.30.10 Same & Combustible Material Near Fences, Buildings, etc., Prohibited
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.30.121 Use Periods

(—Pr emi ses Fr e e-9-d975bp@-8651iN.S.;lrepealed 8-216-1978 by 0O-12419
N.S.)

(—Us é odsil 2181978 by 082419 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—22-1982 by 0-15679 N.S.)

§55.30.122 Use Periods
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.30.123 Usage
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by 0-12419 N.S.)

§55.30.20 Sec. 30.20 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.30.21 Sec. 30.21 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.) 61



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§55.30.22 Sec. 30.22 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.30.23 Sec. 30.23 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.31.16 Sec. 31.16 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.31.114 Permit Required
(Added 1-9-1975 by O—11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8-21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§ 55.31.115 Electric Arc Welding and Cutting
(Added 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—21-1978 by O-12419 N.S.)

§55.32.01 Section 32.01 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.02 Section 32.02 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.32.03 Section 32.03 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.04 Section 32.04 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.32.05 Section 32.05 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

8§ 55.32.06 Section 32.06 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

(5 7N



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

8§ 55.32.07 Section 32.07 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.32.08 Section 32.08 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.09 Section 32.09 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.10 Section 32.10 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.11 Section 32.11 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.12 Section 32.12 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised.
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.13 Section 32.13 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§ 55.32.14 Section 32.14 of the Uniform Fire Code Revised
(Added 6—20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-9-1975 by O-11474 N.S.)

§55.32.110 Sec. 32.110 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1989 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.32.114 Sec. 32.114 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.32.121 Sec. 32.121 of the Uniform Fire Code Added
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

8 55.34.1 Application and Inspection for Verification of Conformance
(Added 6-14-1973 by O-11083 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11915 N.S.)

§ 55.35 Weeds Regulated
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.36 Rubbish Dumping Prohibited
(Repealed 6-20-1967 by O—9651 N.S.)

§ 55.45.202 Sec. 45.202 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
Sec. 45.202 Location of Spray Finishing Operations

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§ 55.45.203 Sec. 45.203 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.45.205 Sec. 45.205 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Repealed 7—-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.45.206 Sec. 45.206 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

Sec. 45.206 Ventilation of Spray Booths and Spray Finishing Areas
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)

§55.61.103 Sec. 61.103 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
Sec. 61.103 Location and Construction

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

§55.61.105 Sec. 61.105 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.74 Article 74 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8§ 55.74.101 Sec. 74.101 Scope
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

Ch.

B 6



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.74.102 Sec. 74.102 Definitions
(Added 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.74.103 Sec. 74.103 Permits
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.104 Sec. 74.104 Storage Containers
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.105 Sec. 74.105 Cylinder Systems for Compressed Gases
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-161641 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

8 55.74.106 Sec. 74.106 Bulk Oxygen Systems at Consumer Sites
(Added 2—21-1989 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.107 Sec. 74.107 Storage and Use of Cylinders
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

8§ 55.74.108 Sec. 74.108 General Safety Regulations
(Added 2—21-1984 by 016164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.74.201 Sec. 74.201 Scope
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8§ 55.74.202 Sec. 74.202 Definitions
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.203 Sec. 74.203 Flammable Anesthetics and Nonflammable Medical Gases
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.204 Sec. 74.204 Nonflammable Medical Gas System
(Added 2—21-1984 by 016164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.205 Sec. 74.205 Pipe Distribution
(Added 2—21-1989 by O-16164 N.S.) 65
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.74.206 Sec. 74.206 Shutoff Valves
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17231 N.S.)

§ 55.74.207 Sec. 74.207 Station Outlets
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.208 Sec. 74.208 Testing of Piping
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.74.209 Sec. 74.209 Crossi Connection Testing
(Added 2—21-1984 by 016164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.210 Sec. 74.210 Purging
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.74.211 Sec. 74.211 Warning Systems
(Added 1-21-1984 by 016164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.77.102 Sec. 77.102 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)

(Amended 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.77.105 Sec. 77.105 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.78.103 Sec. 78.103 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.79.111 Sec. 79.111 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.79.213 Sec. 79.213 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended

(Added 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(5 TN



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

8§ 55.79.508 Sec. 79.508 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.79.601 Sec. 79.601 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8§ 55.79.604 Sec. 79.604 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.79.708 Sec. 79.708 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.79.804 Sec. 79.804 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.79.806 Sec. 79.806 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

8 55.79.807 (a) Sec. 79.807 (a) of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.79.902 Sec. 79.902 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 17321 N.S.)

§55.79.1007 Sec. 79.1007 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.79 Division X1V Sec. 79 of the Uniform Fire Code is Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.80.103 Sec. 80.103 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—-21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.80.109 Sec. 80.109 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.) _
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.) 67



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§55.81.000 Article 81 of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.81.101 Sec. 81.101 Scope
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.81.102 Sec. 81.102 Definitions
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.81.103 Sec. 81.103 Permits

(Clerks note added 8-9-1988; See Appendix in SAN DIEGO Fire Code.)
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.81.104 Sec. 81.104 Classification of Contents
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.81.105 Sec. 81.105 Fire Protection

(Old Title Sec. 81.105 Automatic Fire—Extinguishing Systems added 3—22—-1982 by O-15679 N.S.;
repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(New Title Sec. 81.105 Fire Protection added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.81.106 Sec. 81.106 Automatic Firei Extinguishing Systems Design

(—S mo ke Re mae32d982by @-tba7eNlS.; Bpealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(—Sec. 81. 10€xAdtnagma tsihd nki rSey s21-&984dby BEIHANSH I add
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.81.107

(—Sec. 81.107 Roof Ven t22-1982rhydO-MB67NNLS); nmpgaledRa2li— o s I ¢
1984 by O-16164 N.S.)

(—Sec. 81.107 Smoke Ve2it198hbgO-6i6dN.SHBe moval I addec
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.81.108 Sec. 81.108 Aisles
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.81.109 Sec. 81.109 Access to Building

(Added 2-21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10—1989 by O—17321 N.S.)

(5 TN



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§55.81.110 Sec. 81.110 Hand Hose Connections
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.81.111 Sec. 81.111 Highi Rack Storage Systems
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.87.000 Article 87 of the Uniform Fire Code is Added
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.87.101 Sec. 87.101 Scope
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.87.102 Sec. 87.102 Approval of Plans
(Added 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.87.103 Sec. 87.103 Buildings under Construction
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.87.104 Sec. 87.104 Remodeling of Buildings
(Added 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.87.105 Sec. 105 Demolition
(Added 2-21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

APPENDIX |
Stairway lIdentification of
Chapter 5, Article 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code
(Added 8-21-1978 by O—-12419 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Editors note added to title 8—9-1988.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

APPENDIX ITA
Appendix it A of the Uniform Fire Code Amended
of Chapter 5, Article 5 of San Diego Municipal Code
(Added 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Amended 5-18-1987 by O-16864 N.S.)
(Editors note added to title 8-9-1988.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

APPENDIX J
Standards for Development of
Prei Fire and Emergency Plans of
Chapter 5, Article 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code
(Added 2—-11-1980 by O-15185 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Editors note added to title 8-9-1988.)

APPENDIX K
Standards of Development of
Preil Fire and Emergency Plans of
Chapter 5, Article 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code
(Added 3—-22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Editors note added to title 8-9-1988.)

APPENDIX L
Existing Buildings
(Added 3—-22-1982 by O-15679 N.S.)
(Repealed 2—21-1984 by 0-16164 N.S.)
(Editors note added to title 8—9-1988.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

SEC. 55.APPENDIX Vi A
Appendix VT A of the Uniform Fire Code Amended of
Chapter 5, Article 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code
(Added 2—-21-1984 by O-16164 N.S.)
(Editors note added to title 8—9-1988.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.88.101 Legislative Declaration and Findings
(Added 6-10-1985 by O-16443 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.88.102 Purpose
(Added 6-10—1985 by O—16443 N.S.)
(Repealed 7—10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.88.103 Inspections
(Added 6-10-1985 by O—16443 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§55.88.104 Fees

(Added 6-10-1985 by O—16443 N.S.)
(Amended 6—20-1988 by O-17107 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.88.105 Nonpublic Record Status and Disclosure Requirements
(Added 6-10-1985 by O-16443 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by 0-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.88.106
(Added 6-10-1985 by O-16443 N.S.)
(Repealed 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

ARTICLES
Fire Protection and Prevention

DIVISION 1
Adoption of the 2007 California Fire Code

(—Fi r e Co €16-1989dyd0d1§321 NAS.; repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)
(—Adoption of the Uni f or m38F996byOC8a4aM8S)( 1994 E

(Retitled to —Adoption of t h-29-10%bly O-1865INSi) a Fi r e
(Retitled to —Adopti on2 0c0fl tEhd2H-20020)rD)TID3IBS)) a Fi r e
(Retitled to —Adopti on 0-8-2008hyO-12Z/88N.8.) Cal i f or r

8 55.0101 Adoption of the 2007 California Fire Code Purpose and Intent, and Administrative

Provisions

(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.; amended 10-3-1994

by O-18101 N.S.)

(Sec. 55.0101.0001, —Adoption of the Uniform F
Admini strative P8996ibysO-18242NIS) r epeal ed 1

( Sec. 5 5optrlodtie UniferrARdre Code (1994 Edition) Purpose and Intent, and

Admini strative -81986W0)i0OslB2d2NS) added 1

(Retitled to —Adoption of the California Fire
Admini strative Ped?5l®-1999bypoOa18669N&N d amend

( Ret i tAdlogtian oftthe Cahfernia Fire Code (2001 Edition) Purpose and Intent, and

Admi ni st r at iand emended ©&24-2062ibyo0a18103 N.S.)
(Retittedto—Adopti on of the 2007 Ca lentfand Adminisratiei r e Cod
Provi si amedd 4-820@B by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.0101.0103 Applicability
(—Applicabi FH109% iy O+1&428l.8) ed 1

8 55.0102 Modifications to the 2007 California Fire Code Adopted by the City of San Diego
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.0102.0101 Enforcement Authority and Remedies
(Added 8-10-1993 by O-17957 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0102.0105 Authority of Fire Personnel to Exercise Powers of Peace Officers
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-92 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
Ch.

| 5 A



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.0102.0201 Inspection and Plan Checks and Unsafe Buildings

(Added 7-10-1989 by O—17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-92 by O-17787 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by
O-17787 N.S.; amended 8-10-1993 by O-17959 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O—18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0102.0303 Board of Appeals

(Added 7-10-1989 by O—-17321 N.S.; amended 10—-8-1990 by O-17535 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992
by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0103 Adoption of Appendices to the 2007 California Fire Code

(—Gener al8-19% by ©€1842 N.S.)

(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)

(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)

(Reti tl ed f ri@doptienGfdppendices! It ot ¢ he 2007 Cal i fornia
4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8 55.0104 2007 California Fire Code, Chapter 1 - General Code Provisions
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8§ 55.0104.0107 Revocation of Permits
(Added 6-29-1996 by O—17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1986 by O—18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0104.0108 Permit Required
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-92 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code

Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 2
Definitions

( Befinitionsand Ab b r e v iaddédilOs19-4989)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

(—Def

§55.0201 Definitions

I added 4-82008 Hiy O-19728 N.S.)

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8§ 55.0209.0108 Fabrication Area
(Added 7—-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.;

amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0209.0114 Labeled
(Added 6-29-1996 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0209.0121 Safe Dispersal Area

(Added 6-29-1996 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

DIVISION 3

General Precautions Against Fire

(Gener a

I Provi si added 10-H%-1989)Fi r e Safetyl

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0O-18242 N.S.)

(—Gener al

Pr e c a u tdded 438200by @-19T28N.S.) Fi r e |l

§ 55.0301 General Precautions Against Fire
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.0304 Combustible Waste Material
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.0310.0201 General
(Added 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0203 Required Access
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0204 Specifications
(Added 6-29-1992 by 0-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0205 Obstruction
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Amended 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0206 Marking
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0207 Procedure

(—Fire Lanes or Fire Apf0alp8aly 0-4732AN.8;eepesled R20a d s Il ¢
1992byO-17787 N. S.; —PrRHOPOVUyOrle787NSXd ded 6

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0208 Premises ldentification
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0310.030 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0301 Premises Identification

(—I nst al | a0+168aHy O-d7321 H.8l; antended 12-9-1991 by O-17722 N.S.;

renumbered to Sec. 55.0310.0501 on 6-29-1992byO0-1 7787 N. S.; —Premi ses | «
renumbered from Sec. 55.0310.0208 and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0306 Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0310.0507 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0309 Standpipes
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0310.0510 on 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.0310.0316 Prei Fire and Emergency Planning (New)
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0310.0514 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0401 Water Supplies For Fire Protection

(—F-Resi st i ve Con slo4989dytO0-13321IN.Sardpdaked6—29-1992 by O—

17787 N.S.; —Water Suppl +1€93bf04792FN.S)e Pr ot ect i C
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0404 Fire Hydrant Markers
(Added 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0501 Installation of Fire Protection and Lifei Saving Systems
(Added (formerly Sec. 55.0310.0301) and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0507 Required Installations of Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems
(Added (formerly Sec. 55.0310.0306) and amended 6—29-1992 N.S. by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0508 Sprinkler System Supervision Alarms
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0510 Standpipes
(Added (formerly Sec. 55.0310.0309) and amended 6—29-1992 by O—17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0310.0514 Prei Fire and Emergency Planning
(Added (formerly Sec. 55.0310.0316) and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§55.0311.0204 Flammable Decorative Materials
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.;)
(Repealed 6—29—-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0311.0210 Vehicles Leaking Gasoline
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0311.0305 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0311.0303 Storage, Use and Handling of Miscellaneous Combustible Materials
(Added 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

Ch.

L5 A



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.0311.0305 Vehicles Leaking Gasoline
(Added (formerly Sec. 55.0311.0210) and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0311.0412 Vacant and Unsecured Structures

(Added 7-10-1989 by O—17321 N.S.; amended 1-8-1990 by O—-17408 N.S.; amended 10-8-1990 by
O-17535N.S.)

(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0311.0601 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0311.0601 Vacant and Unsecured Structures

(Added (formerly Sec. 55.0311.0412) and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.; amended 8-10—
1993 by O-17957 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0312.0106 Stairways and Ramps
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0312.0109 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0312.0109 Stairways and Ramps
(Added (formerly 55.0312.0106) and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0314.0104 Required Installations
(Added 7-10-1989 by O—17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

8 55.0314.0108 Administrative Penalty For False Fire Alarm
(Added 6-1-1993 by O-17927 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 4
Emergency Planning and Preparedness

(Speci al O c caddedalO-t9y198%)s e s |l
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

( Emergency Planning and Prep a r e d ad@eds4s842008 by O-19728 N.S.)

8 55.0401 Emergency Planning and Preparedness
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

[Editiorés Note Incorporated from former Division 25, Section 55.2501, Subsection 2501.18.]

§ 55.0403 Standby Fire Department Personnel
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.0425.0108 Seat Spacing
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0425.0117 Standby Fire Personnel
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0425.0118 Exhibits, Fairs, Trade Shows, Concerts, Convention or Vehicle Show; Permit
Required

(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0425.0119 Requirements for Exhibits, Fairs, Trade Shows or Vehicle Displays (in
Buildings)

(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0425.0502 Displays
(Added 6-1-1993 by O-17927 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

8 55.0432.0110 Standby Fire Personnel for Tents, Canopies and Temporary Membrane
Structures

(Added and amended (Formerly Sec. 55.0432.1100) 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

Ch.

.5 IER



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 55.0432.1100 Standby Fire Personnel
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0432.0110 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

DIVISION 5
Fire Service Features
(Speci al &dded t0e19-%9899 Il
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

(FH r e Ser viadded 4-B-20@8 ylOr12723IN.S.)

§ 55.0501 Fire Service Features
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

[Editiorés Note: Incorporated from former Division 9, Section 55.0901, Subsection 901.4.3 and
Section 55.0903, Subsection 903.2.]

§ 55.0545.0203 Spray Booths
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0545.0209 Fire Protection Equipment
(Added 6—29-1996 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

8 55.0551.0108 Handling of Hazardous Production Materials Within Exit Corridors
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 6
Building Services and Systems
(Speci al Bdfed 10p163-£989t) —
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

(Buil di ng Ser v addee48-2@08bg O-BFPEN.Se ms |l

§ 55.0601 Building Services and Systems
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.0661.0104 Fuel Oil
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S., formerly Sec. 55.0661.0105.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0661.0105 Portable Unvented Oili Burning Heating Appliances

(—Fuel O i—10-4#198%by @-&7821 N.S.; renumbered to Sec. 55.0661.0104 on 6—29-1992

byO-1 7787 N.S.; —Po#BuahbhlaegUmeant edg @iplpl i ancesl
55.0661.0106 and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

8 55.0661.0106 Portable Unvented Oili Burning Heating Appliances
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0661.0105 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

DIVISION 7
Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction
(Speci al akledh0-168—-29899 Il
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

( FHe-Resistance-Rated Constructiono added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

8§ 55.0701 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction
Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.0774.0204 Nonflammable Medical Gas System
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.0777.0101 Explosives and Blasting Agents 8 Exceptions
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S., renumbered from Sec. 55.0777.0102.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0777.0102 Explosives and Blasting Agents 8 Exceptions
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0777.010 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0777.0104 Bond
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S., renumbered from Sec. 55.0777.0105.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0777.0105 Bond Required
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0777.0104 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0778.0103 Policy of Insurance for Fireworks Display Required
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0778.0203 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0778.0203 Policy of Insurance for Fireworks Display Required
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S., renumbered from Sec. 55.0778.0103.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.0201 Storage Cabinets 8 Quantities
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0779.0202 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

8 55.0779.0202 Quantity Limits, Manner of Storage and Storage Cabinets
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S., renumbered from Sec. 55.0779.0201.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.0203 Liquid Storage Rooms
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.0403 Locations on Property
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.0601 Tank Storage Underground, Outside or Under Buildings
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

8 55.0779.0702 Protection Against Corrosion and Galvanic Action
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 55.0779.0903 Dispensing Services
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17321 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.2001 CEDMAT Program & Legislative Declaration and Findings
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.2002 Purpose of CEDMAT Program
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.2003 CEDMAT Inspections
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

8 55.0779.2004 CEDMAT Fees
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0779.2005 Nonpublic Record Status and Disclosure Requirements Concerning CEDMAT
Inspections

(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0101 Scope
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-29-1992 by O—17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0103 Permits
(Added 6-1-1993 by O-17927 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0104 General Requirements
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

8 55.0780.0109 Retail Sales Occupancy Quantity Limits
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0301 Storage Cabinets for Hazardous Materials

(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242)

(5 I



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

8 55.0780.0303 Toxic and Highly Toxic Compressed Gases
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0306 Liquid and Solid Oxidizers

(—Liquid and Sol i d -OkbleB0.396eA s aEdxdetd8%0y 182U Nt s

N.S.; repealed 6-29-1992byO-1 7787 N. S.; —Li qui d a20€l998p0—- d OXx i
17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0309 Unstable (Reactive) Materials
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0310 Water Reactive Solids and Liquids
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0312 Highly Toxic Solids and Liquids
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

8§ 55.0780.0313 Radioactive Materials
(Added 7-10-1989 by O—17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0314 Corrosives
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0315 Carcinogens, Irritants, Sensitizers and Health Hazard Solids, Liquids and
Gases

(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0780.0401 Dispensing, Use and Handling of Hazardous Materials
(Added 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

8 55.0780.0402 Dispensing and Use
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0781.0106 Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems
(Added 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.) ch



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

8 55.0781.0107 Smoke Venting, Smoke Removal Systems and Curtain Boards
(Added 1-9-1995 by O-18144 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0787.0101 Scope
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0787.0102 Approval of Plans
(Added 7-10-1989 by O—17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0787.0103 Fire Safety During Construction
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—10-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0787.0104 Alterations of Buildings
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

8§ 55.0788.0101 Aerosol Products
(Added 6-29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

APPENDIX ITA
Appendix I7 A of Division | of the Uniform Fire Code
And Chapter 5 Article 5 of San Diego Municipal Code
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 8
Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings
( Ap p e n dadded 0s-19-1989.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0889.0101 on 6—29-1992 by O-17321 N.S.)

(Frterior Finish, De c or aaddedv-8-2008ayt CelB7R8NIS. s a n d

§ 55.0801 Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

8 55.0888.0101 Life Safety Requirements for Existing Buildings Other Than Highi Rise
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0889.0101 on 6—29-1992 by O-17321 N.S.)

APPENDIX 1T A
Appendix 117 A of Division Il of the Uniform Fire Code
And Chapter 5 Article 5 of San Diego Municipal Code
Suppression and Control of Hazardous Fire Areas
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0888.0201 Environmental Hazard Controls
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.; amended 10-16-1989 by O-17362 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0889.0201 on 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

APPENDIX THTA
Appendix I11T A of Division 111 of the Uniform Fire Code
And Chapter 5 Article 5 of San Diego Municipal Code
Firei flow Requirements for Buildings
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0888.0301 Fire Protection
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0889.0301 on 6—29 1992 by O-17787 N.S.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

APPENDIX 11T C
Appendix 1117 C of Division 111 of the Uniform Fire Code
And Chapter 5 Article 5 of San Diego Municipal Code
Testing Fire Extinguishing Systems,
Standpipes and Combination Systems
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Repealed 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)

§ 55.0888.0302 Testing Procedures
(Added 7-10-1989 by O-17321 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 55.0889.0302 on 6—29-1992 by O—-17787 N.S.)

8 55.0889.0101 L.ife Safety Requirements for Existing Buildings Other Than Highi Rise
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787; renumbered from Sec. 55.0888.0101.)
(Repealed 10-3-1994 by O-18101 N.S.)

§ 55.0889.0201 Special Hazardsd Suppression and Control of Hazardous Fire Areas

(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.; renumbered from Sec. 55.0888.0201; amended
8-10-1993 by 017956 N.S.; amended 7-25-1994 by O-18088 N.S.)

(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0889.0206 Aboveground Storage of Motor Vehicle Fuel
(—Aboveground Storage o0+49-1M2by®OF17787&K) cl e Fuel
(Repealed 1-8—-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0889.0301 Fire Protectioni Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.; renumbered from Sec. 55.0888.0301.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0889.0302 Testing Automatic Sprinkler and Standpipe Systems
(Added and amended 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.; renumbered from Sec. 55.0888.0302.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

§ 55.0889.0601 Hazardous Materials Classifications
(Added 6—29-1992 by O-17787 N.S.)
(Repealed 1-8-1996 by 0-18242 N.S.)

c



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 9
Fire Protection Systems
(FH re Department Ac added1s8-1896 oy OME428l.6.)) Suppl y
(Retitled to —Fire Pr o4-2008thy0alf728Blg.st ems |l anc

§ 55.0901 Fire Department Access and Water Supply

(—Gener al8H19% by ©€l842 N.S.)

(Reti tFliegdk the part ment Ac aneanendeh7Ale1998/byt0€8659 8.8 )p p | vy |l
(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)

(Retitled to —Fire Pr o-82008byi0Od97288.y)st emslland amer

§ 55.0902 Fire Department Access
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Amended 7-19-1999 by 0O-18659 N.S.)
(Amended 9-24-2002 by O-19103 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S)

§ 55.0903 Automatic Sprinkler Systems i Existing High-Rise Buildings

( A d dWatkr Supplies and Fire Hydr a n 1-&-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)

(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)

(Retitled to —Aut eniatingiHgh-RBipgd nEd ielrd iS§-@88le msme n d e
by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

[Editiorés Note: Incorporated from former Division 10, Section 55.1003, Subsection 1003.2.11 ;
Subsection 1003.2.11.1; Subsection 1003.2.11.2; Subsection 1003.2.11.3; Subsection 1003.2.11.4;
Subsection 1003.2.11.5; Subsection 1003.2.11.6; and Subsection 1003.2.11.8.)

(Amended 3-20-2009 by 0O-19838 N.S; effective 4-19-2009.)
(Amended 3-18-2010 by 0-19936 N.S; effective 4-17-2010.)
(Amended 3-11-2011 by 0-20026 N.S; effective 4-10-2011.)



San Diego Municipal Code

Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 10

Fire Protection Systems and Equipment

(—Fire Protecguompméwyn

§ 55.1001 Means of Egress

(—Gener al24-20@G2 8ydDel9l103M9.S.)
(Retitled from —Generall
effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.1003 Fire Extinguishing Systems

$ 481986y @-H8A42 NES.)

t e8-2009vbg @-1IDE28NSf Egr es s |

(—Fire Extingui s++l9gby 3¢8242NSNsll added 1

(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)

(Amended 6-5-2001 by O-18946 N.S.)

(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)

(Amended 1-18-2008 by 0-19696 N.S.; effective 2-17-2008)

[Editorés Note: Section 55.1003, has been incorporated into Division 9, Section 55.0903.]

DIVISION 11
Aviation Facilities

(Avi at i on added 4-8-2008 Ity O-€9328 N.S.)

§55.1101 Aviation Facilities
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 12
Dry Cleaning

(B y Cl edded #-812908 by 0-19728 N.S.)

855.1201 Dry Cleaning
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 13
Combustible Dust-Producing Operations
( €embustible Dust-Producing Ope r a t adaech4s8€008 by O-19728 N.S.)

855.1301 Combustible Dust-Producing Operations
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 14
Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition
( F#e Safety During Construction and Demolition lladded 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

855.1401 Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 15
Flammable Finishes
(FH ammab | e adfed 482608 by Q-19728 N.S.)

§55.1501 Flammable Finishes
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 16
Fruit and Crop Ripening
(Fruit and Caddegp4-8-R0080er19728NIS.)

§55.1601 Fruit and Crop Ripening
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code

Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

(Fumi gati on

DIVISION 17
Fumigation and Thermal Insecticidal Fogging

and

T h e r naddéd 4-8-20G8 by®©t19728 N.8.)a | Foggi

855.1701 Fumigation and Thermal Insecticidal Fogging
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 18
Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities
(Semiconduct or F addded4e82008 bpOr19R2&NcS) | i t i e s |

855.1801 Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 19
Lumber Yards and Woodworking Facilities
(ALumber Yards

and Wadoed 4v83200R by O-3972BMX)i | i t i e s |

855.1901 Lumber Yards and Woodworking Facilities
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 20
Manufacture of Organic Coatings
(Manufacture

of aledd-82008 by OQW28N.5.)n g s |

855.2001 Manufacture of Organic Coatings
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 21
Industrial Ovens
(—I ndustlr iaade-A0H8 byrDs19728 N.S.)

§55.2101 Industrial Ovens
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 22
Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages
( Metor Fuel-Di spensing Faci |l i tadded4-8-2008by RIO7@8NIS) Gar ag

855.2201 Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 23
High-Piled Combustible Storage
( —H iPidechCombustible Storagell a d d-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§55.2301 High-Piled Combustible Storage
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 24
Tents, Canopies and Other Membrane Structures
(Fents, Canopies and tdede-8-2008by0OL1I9728MNS.) St ruct u

855.2401 Tents, Canopies and Other Membrane Structures
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code

Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

(—PIl aces

—Ti

r e

(Reti
Rebu

DIVISION 25
Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage

of

t
[

| e
| d

855.2501 Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage

(—Gener al-8-19% by ©€l8P42 N.S.)
(Retitled and amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)
(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)

(Retitl ed

from

by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

(—Wel di ng

§55.2601 Welding and Other Hot Work

A-B-5986 ytOH1g2H2aNS.H e d 1

d
[

—P1l aces

from —Pl aces of Assembl
n ¢g-8-2808 Iy O-I9%728 B.S.)St or ag e | 4

of Assamblly Antd8-2008€ ndedF

DIVISION 26
Welding and Other Hot Work

a n dll addedm-8-2008 HydOt197380.6.K

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 27
Hazardous Materials-General Provisions
(—Hazar douGe Marn &Ir i Rl &V 48-8008dyn0s19728NS. 0 e d 4

855.2701 Hazardous Materials-General Provisions
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

[Editorés Noe: Incorporated from former Division 91, Sections 55.9102; 55.9103; 55.9104, and

55.9105.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 28
Aerosols
(Aer osol 832008 by©®-d9728 N.S.)

§55.2801 Aerosols
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 29
Combustible Fibers
(Gombust i bddded 482008y Gs1B728 N.S.)

§55.2901 Combustible Fibers
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 30
Compressed Gases
(6o mpr e s s eadded G-820@8 byllO-19728 N.S.)

8§55.3001 Compressed Gases
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 31
Corrosive Materials
(—Cor r osi \ &dedteB2088 by @x19728 N.S.)

855.3101 Corrosive Materials
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 32
Cryogenic Fluids
(&+ yogeni added4+812008hy 19728 N.S.)

§55.3201 Cryogenic Fluids
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 33
Explosives and Fireworks
(—Expl osi v e d added 418-2608 hy ©-19028 Nk Ss)

855.3301 Explosives and Fireworks
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

[Editioré Note: Incorporated from former Division 77, Section 55.7701.]

DIVISION 34
Flammable and Combustible Liquids
( Flammable and Combust i bl e L i d¢-8-2008dyi0ala7a8&Ng.)

855.3401 Flammable and Combustible Liquids
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 35
Flammable Gases
( —F 1 a mma li hdded 4B2@0&bg O-19728 N.S.)

8§ 55.3501 Flammable Gases
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 36
Flammable Solids
( Flammable Solidsll added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.3601 Flammable Solids
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 37
Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials
(HKH ghly Toxi ¢ a radded#-&2008 by OMIY28 N.8.)i al s |

§ 55.3701 Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 38
Liquefied Petroleum Gases
( HguefiedPet r o | e u adde®48s2@08 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.3801 Liquefied Petroleum Gases
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 39
Organic Peroxides
( ©ganic Peroxidesll added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.3901 Organic Peroxides
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 40
Oxidizers
( ©x i d i addedr4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.4001 Oxidizers
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 41
Pyrophoric Materials
( Pyropho r i ¢ M aatldedrd-8-2008 HyllO-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.4101 Pyrophoric Materials

(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 42
Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics

(—Pyroxylin (Cel Il adde4s3-€008\by Q-19728NeS))

8 55.4201 Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 43
Unstable (Reactive) Materials

(—Unstabl e ( R#&added4i82008by OAAM8ENS) a |l s

8 55.4301 Unstable (Reactive) Materials
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

Pl asti

CcCsS



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 44
Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids
( —WaReaztive Solids and Liquidsll added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.4401 Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 45
Referenced Standards
( AReferenced Standardsll added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.4501 Referenced Standards
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 46
Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound Stages,
Approved Production Facilities, and Production Locations
(—Motion Picture and Television Productic
Production Facilities an8R00PhyO-tPIL&ENS)on Locat

§ 55.4601 Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound Stages, Approved
Production Facilities, and Production Locations
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 47
Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas
(—Requi r e me n-Urban interface fre Aredsll addeal4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.4701 Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 48
Administration
( —A d mitioni 48t200&added by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.4801 Administration
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

§ 55.4808 Board of Building Appeals and Advisors
(Added 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 49
Special Detailed Requirements Based on Used and Occupancy
( Special Detailed Requirements Based on Used and
Occupancyll added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

8 55.4901 Special Detailed Requirements Based on Used and Occupancy
(Added 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S; effective 5-8-2008.)

DIVISION 50
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Established.

(Very High Fire Hazard Se28-2000btOs19824dNIS.r Est abl

§ 55.5001 Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone

(Very High Fire Haz a28-@0099e0r16884iNtS.yeffeZtioe8-2712008)d d e d

7



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 51
Fire and Harmful Gas Emergency Alarms
( F#e and Harmful Gas Emergency Alarmsll  a d d-&2011 By @-20097 N.S.)

855.5101 Purpose and Intent
( Parpose and Intentl a d d-&2011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

§55.5102 Definitions
( Befinitions— a d d-22011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5103 Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Business Requirements and Responsibilities
( Fe-Harmful Gas Alarm Business Requirements and Responsibilities— a d16-22911 by
0-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5104 Alarm Agent Responsibilities
( Alarm Agent Responsibilities — a d d-22011 By ©-20097 N.S.; effective
11-2-2011.)

855.5105 Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Conversion
( Fe-Harmful Gas Alarm System Conversion — a d d-22011 Ay @-20097 N.S.; effective
11-2-2011.)

855.5106 Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Takeover
( FHe-Harmful Gas Alarm System Takeover— a d d-22011 Ay @-20097 N.S.; effective
11-2-2011.)

855.5107 Alarm User Permit Required; Violation
( Alarm User Permit Required; Violation— a d d-22011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective
11-2-2011.)

855.5108 Application for Alarm User Permit
( Application for Alarm User Permit— a d d-&2011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5109 Expiration of Alarm User Permits
( Bxpiration of Alarm User Permits — a d d-22011 Ay @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5110 Alarm User Permits Not Transferable
( Atarm User Permits Not Transferable— a d d-22011 dy @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5111 Fees and Penalties for Alarm User Permit
( Fees and Penalties for Alarm User Permit— a d d-22911 By @-20097 N.S.; effective
11-2-2011.)



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

855.5112 Responsibility for Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Systems in Apartments
( Responsibility for Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Systems in Apartments— a d16-22911 by O-20097
N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5113 Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Direct Dial Prohibition
( Fe-Harmful Gas Alarm System Direct Dial Prohibition— a d d-&2011 By @-20097 N.S.;
effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5114 Procedures for Alarm Verification
( Procedures for Alarm Verification— a d d-&2011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

§55.5115 Revocation of an Alarm User Permit
( Revocation of an Alarm User Permit— a d d-22011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5116 Penalties for Alarm User Permit Revocations
( Penalties for Alarm User Permit Revocations— a d d-22011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective
11-2-2011.)

855.5117 Reinstatement of Revoked Permit; Alarm User Permit Appeal
( Reinstatement of Revoked Permit; Alarm User Permit Appeal— a d d-&2011 By @-20097 N.S.;
effective 11-2-2011.)

855.5118 Use of Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System after Permit Revocation as Public Nuisance
( Yse of Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System after Permit Revocation as Public Nuisance— a d d e d
10-3-2011 by O-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

§55.5119 Posting a Fire Watch
(—Posting a Fi f32011WnQ-20097N.S.aeffedtieed 1-212011.)

§55.5120 Exceptions
( BExceptions— a d d-22011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

§55.5121 Confidentiality of Records
( Senfidentiality of Records— a d d-22911 Ay @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

§55.5122 Enforcement Authority
( Enforcement Authority— a d d-22011 By @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

§55.5123 Enforcement Remedies
( Enforcement Remedies— a d d-22011 Ay @-20097 N.S.; effective 11-2-2011.)

Ch.

100 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

DIVISION 77
Explosive Materials
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.7701 General

(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)
(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

DIVISION 78
Fireworks and Pyrotechnic Special Effects Material
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.7802 Fireworks

(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Amended 7-19-1999 by 0O-18659 N.S.)
(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

DIVISION 81
Highi Piled Combustible Storage
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

8 55.8102 General Firei Protection and Lifei Safety Features
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

(Amended 7-19-1999 by 0-18659 N.S.)

(Amended 9-24-2002 by O-19103 N.S.)

(Repealed 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 91
Combustible, Explosive and Dangerous Materialsd6 CEDMAT Program
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.9101 Legislative Declaration and Findings

(—Legislative D&96ayOalB2i2dNr.) added 1
(Retitled and amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)

(Amended 9-24-2002 by 0-19103 N.S.)

(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.9102 Purpose of CEDMAT Program
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Amended 7-19-1999 by 0-18659 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.9103 CEDMAT Inspections
(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

§55.9104 CEDMAT Fees

(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)
(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)
(Repealed 4-8-2008 by O-19728 N.S.)

§ 55.9105 Public Record Status and Disclosure Requirements Concerning CEDMAT
Inspections

(Added 1-8-1996 by O-18242 N.S.)

(Amended 7-19-1999 by O-18659 N.S.)

(Repealed 4-8-2008 by 0-19728 N.S.)

Ch.

102 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

ARTICLE 6
Disorderly Conduct, Places
and Publications 8 Gambling

8 56.01 Obscene, Indecent, Immoral Books, Photographs, Writings, Figures, etc. 0
Prohibited.

(Amended 10-13-1960 by O—-8374 N.S.)

(Repealed 5-1-1973 by O—-11047 N.S.; preempted by State Legislation.)

§56.01.1 Same & Seizure and Destruction.
(Repealed 5-1-1973 by O-11047 N.S., preempted by State Legislation.)

8 56.02 Prostitution, Fornication, Other Lewd or Indecent Acts, etc. 8 Prohibited
(Repealed 5-1-1973 by O—-11047 N.S.; preempted by State Legislation.)

§ 56.03 Gambling Implements in Barricaded Premises 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.04 Visiting Gambling Premises 8 Prohibited
(Amended 5-17—1966 by 0-9427 N.S.)

§ 56.05 Betting at Games with Money, Credit, Representative of Money 8 Prohibited o
Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.06 Solicitation for the Purpose of Gambling & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.07 Coin Operated Contrivance, Gambling Devices, Etc., Delivering Money or Tokens,
Etc., Exchangeable for Money 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§56.07.1 Same d Confiscation and Destruction
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§56.07.2 Same 0 Scope of Section d Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§56.07.3 Same & Possession or Control Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8 56.08 Punchboard, Similar Gambling Device 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§56.09 Lottery Ticket & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§56.10 Lottery Device 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8§ 56.11 Possession of Records of Lottery, Etc., Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.12 Manufacturing, Writing, Etc. of Lottery Ticket Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.13 Disseminating Information Regarding Lottery 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§56.14 Lottery & Proof Required for Violation of Sections
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.15 Gambling Devices, Etc. 8 Declared Nuisance
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.16 Visiting at Premises where Lottery Contrived, Conducted, Etc. 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§56.17 Tipsters & Business Prohibited
(Added 7-15-1954 by O—6199 N.S.)

8§ 56.19 Appearance in Apparel Customarily Worn by the Opposite Sex Prohibited
(—Appearance in Apparel Customar i | y-26MM866by by t h
0O-9439 N.S.)

(Repealed 8—3-1998 by O—-18554 N.S.)

§ 56.20 Certain Types of Coin Games and Similar Contrivances & Definitions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2429 N.S. adopted 4-28-1942.)

§56.20.1 Slot Machines, Marble Machines, Pin Ball Machines, Etc. 8 Use Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2359 N.S. adopted 1-27-1942.)

§56.20.2 Same & Possession Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2429 N.S. adopted 4-28-1942.)

§ 56.20.3 Same & Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2429 N.S. adopted 4-28-1942.)

§ 56.20.4 Same 6 Adapted to Gambling
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2429 N.S. adopted 4-28-1942.)

Ch.

104 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§56.20.5 Same & Unlawful Possession & Declared to Be a Nuisance
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2429 N.S. adopted 4—28-1942.)

8§ 56.24.1 Definition of Model Glue
(Added 7-18-1967 by O—9670 N.S.)

§56.24.2 Inhalation of Fumes Prohibited
(Added 7-18-1967 by O—9670 N.S.)

8 56.25 Intoxication in Public Place 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-567 N.S. adopted 12—-12-1934.)
(Repealed 8-3-1977 by O-12121 N.S.)

§ 56.26 Intoxication on Private Premises 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-567 N.S. adopted 12—-12-1934.)
(Repealed 8-3-1977 by O-12121 N.S.)

§ 56.27 Disorderly or Offensive Conduct in Public Places 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-567 N.S. adopted 12—-12-1934.)

§ 56.28 Intoxication & Release of Violator Upon Recognizance Authorized
(Repealed 8-3-1977 by O-12122 N.S.)

8 56.29 Possession of Intoxicating Liquor Prohibited on Mission Beach Amusement Center
(Incorp. —Possession of Intoxicating Liquor Prohibited on Mission Beach Amusement Center — 1—
22-1952 by 05046 N.S., contained in 0—2912 N.S. adopted 12-5-1944.)

(Repealed 3—18-1991 by O-17609 N.S.)

(Reinstated 5-28-1991 by O-17649 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-15-1991 by O-17663 N.S.)

§56.29.1 Same & Prohibited on Santa Clara Point in Mission Bay Park

(Incorp. — Same— Prohibited on Santa Clara Point in Mission Bay Park —1-22-1952 by O-5046
N.S., contained in 0—4018 N.S. adopted 4-5-1949.)

(Repealed 3—18-1991 by O-17609 N.S.)

(Reinstated 5-28-1991 by O-17649 N.S.)

(Repealed 9—9-1991 by O-17677 N.S.)

§ 56.30 Seditious Language & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—7357 O.S. adopted 4—22-1918.)

§ 56.35 Loud, Unusual Noises 8 Prohibited 8 Exceptions
(Repealed 9—18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

§ 56.35.1 Loud, Unusual Noises d Declaration of Certain Acts Constituting
(Amended 10-6-1966 by O—9519 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

8 56.36 Hospital Quiet Zones 8 Established
(Repealed 5—26-1966 by O—9446 N.S.)

8 56.37 Hospital Quiet Zone d Loud Noises Prohibited
(Repealed 5—26-1966 by O—9446 N.S.)

8§ 56.40 Mar, Deface Windows & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.42 Tampering with or Removal of City Refuse & Prohibited
(Amended 11-1-1973 by 0O-11155 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—6—-1989 by O-17258 N.S.)

§ 56.45 Marathon Contest 8 Prohibited 8 Defined
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)
(Repealed 8—3-1998 by O—-18554 N.S.)

8§ 56.50 Loud Noises or Disturbances as Threats 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.51 Picketing for Purpose of Intimidation & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.52 Causing Breach of Peace by Picketing 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 56.53 Nudity on Public Lands
(Added 4-18-1974 by O-11307 N.S.)
(Amended 10-19-1977 by 0-12190 N.S.)
(Amended 11-19-1979 by O-15083 N.S.)

8 56.54 Alcoholic Beverage Consumption Prohibited in Certain Areas

(—AH cloi ¢ Beverage Consumption and Pos$8#%sion P
by O-12009 N.S.; amended 9-27-1982 by O-15822 N.S.;

amended 9-9-1986 by O-16711 N.S., effective immediately until 10-30-1986;

amended 9-22-1986 by O-16712 N.S.; amended 6—22-1987 by O-16877 N.S.;

amended 2—-8-1988 by O-17021 N.S.; amended 7—2-1990 by O-17477 N.S.;

renumbered to Sec. 56.57 on 3—18-1991 by O-17609 N.S.; reinstated on 5—28-1991 by O-17649
N.S.; amended 6-10-1991 by O-17655 N.S.; amended 7-15-1991 by O-17663 N.S.; amended
9-9-1991 by O-17677 N.S.; amended 12—8-1992 by O-17878 N.S.;

amended 3-29-1993 by O-17902 N.S.; amended 3—21-1994 by O-18051 N.S.;

amended 9-12-1994 by O-18096 N.S.; amended 11-14-1994 by O-18107 N.S.;

amended 5-30-1995 by O-18180 N.S.; amended 8-14-1995 by O-18201 N.S.)

(Amended 2—20-1996 by O-18265 N.S.)

(Amended 9-8-1998 by 018582 N.S.)

Ch.

106 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

(Amended 6-21-2004 by 0-19290 N.S.)
(Amended 11-8-2004 by 0-19323 N.S.)
(Amended 12-5-2007 by O-19690 N.S. effective 1-14-2008)

(Amendments to Sections 56.54 and 56.71 amended 12-5-2007 by O-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008
shall remain in effect for one year until January 14, 2009, unless extended by the City Council. If
the amendments to Sections 56.54 and 56.71 are not extended by the City Council, the amendments
to Sections 56.54 and 56.71 shall be automatically repealed and removed from the San Diego
Municipal Code and the provisions of Sections 56.54 and 56.71 that were in effect prior to final
passage of this ordinance shall return to full force and effect.)

[Editiors Note: Amendments as Adopted by 0-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008 which remained in
effect for one year until January 14, 2009, were not extended by the City Council, therefore, they
have been automatically repealed and removed from the San Diego Municipal Code and the
provisions of Sections 56.54 that were in effect prior to the final passage of this ordinance again
became effective.]

[Editiors Note: Amendments as Adopted by 0-19779 N.S.; effective 1-15-2009 amended Section
56.54 except for paragraphs (b), (c), (d), and Appendixes 56.54A, 56.54B,. 56.54C.)

(Amended 7-15-2008 by O-19779 N.S.; effective 1-15-2009.)
(Amended 7-26-2010 by Emergency Ordinance 0-19977 N.S; effective 7-26-2010; replaced
9-14-2010 by O-19989 N.S.; effective 10-14-2010.)

APPENDIX 56.54A
24 HOUR BAN of
Chapter 5, Article 6, Division 0 of San Diego Municipal Code

(Amended 12-5-2007 by O-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008)

(Amended 7-31-2009 by 0-19892 N.S; effective 8-30-2009.)

(Amended 6-21-2010 by 0-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)

(Amended 12-7-2010 by Emergency Ordinance 0-20012 N.S.; effective 12-7-2010; replaced
1-18-2011 by O-20016 N.S.; effective 2-17-2011.)

APPENDIX 56.54B
12 HOUR BAN T 8:00 P.M. i 8:00 A.M. of
Chapter 5, Article 6, Division 00 of San Diego Municipal Code

(Amended 12-5-2007 by 0-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008.)

(Amended 6-21-2010 by 0-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)

(Amended 12-7-2010 by Emergency Ordinance O-20012 N.S.; effective 12-7-2010; replaced
1-18-2011 by O-20016 N.S.; effective 2-17-2011.) Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

APPENDIX 56.54C
16 HOUR BAN 1 8:00 P.M. T NOON of
Chapter 5, Article 6, Division 0 of San Diego Municipal Code

(Amended 12-5-2007 by 0-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008)
(Amended 6-21-2010 by 0O-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)

Map 56.54C-A
Balboa Park Designated Lawn Ares
(—Map RAd. 24@1e@0 bgO0-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)

§ 56.55 Urinating/Defecating in Public Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)
(Amended 6-21-2004 by 0-19290 N.S.)

8 56.56 Open Alcoholic Beverage Containers Prohibited on Posted Premises.
(Added 9—26-1983 by O-16046 N.S.)
(Amended 6-21-2004 by 0-19290 N.S.)

§ 56.57 Alcoholic Beverage Consumption and Possession Prohibited in Certain Areas

(—Al cohol i c Btivem agrd CBassenpsi on Prohibited in
Sec. 56.54 and amended 3—-18-1991 by O-17609 N.S.)

(Repealed 5—28-1991 by O-17649 N.S.)

§ 56.58 Possession and Consumption of Open Containers of Alcohol Prohibited in Certain

City Parks, Beaches, and Public Rightsi ofi Way

(—Possession and Consumption of Open Container
Beaches, and Public Rights—o—Wa y I a-d&-% by3-17609 N.S.)

(Repealed 5-28-1991 by O-17649 N.S.)

§ 56.60 Definitions
(—Det i ons 6-2@08bg @-IP17BHN.S.)
(Amended 4-26-2006 by 0-19482 N.S.; effective 5-26-2006.)

8 56.61 Consumption of Alcohol by Minor Prohibited in Public Place, Place Open to Public, or
Place Not Open to Public

(—Consumption of AiteddandPhbbclPlack, PlacdMipan o Publie, ord°llace Not
Open t o Puki200b O-1®1F2INeSY 5

Ch.

108 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

8 56.62 Hosting, Allowing a Party, Gathering, or Event Where Minors Consuming Alcoholic
Beverages Prohibited

(—Hosting, Al | eringi onEyentavheR Minarsyonsundreg Al¢oholic Beverages
Prohi bi t e6e2003 by @-t0&72N.SH

(Amended 4-26-2006 by 0-19482 N.S.; effective 5-26-2006.)

8§ 56.63 Mandatory Minimum Fines
(—Reservation of -62@ayl0-1E@NE)onsll added 5

(—Mandatory Mini mum Fi 2@€2006byO482MN.3;ed and amende

effective 5-26-2006.)

8 56.64 Reservation of Legal Options
(Added 4-26-2006 by 0-19482 N.S.; effective 5-26-2006.)

§ 56.65 Local Authority
(Added 4-26-2006 by 0-19482 N.S.; effective 5-26-2006.)

§ 56.70 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i-320608 by O-a9ti8A NS 6
(Repealed 6-21-2010 by 0-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)

8 56.71 Kegs at Designated Areas Prohibited

(—Kegs at Designat ed-3-2003dpa0s19182NS.hi bi t edll added

(Amended 12-5-2007 by 0-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008)

(Amendments to Sections 56.54 and 56.71 amended 12-5-2007 by O-19690N.S.; effective 1-14-2008
shall remain in effect for one year until January 14, 2009, unless extended by the City Council. If
the amendments to Sections 56.54 and 56.71 are not extended by the City Council, the amendments
to Sections 56.54 and 56.71 shall be automatically repealed and removed from the San Diego
Municipal Code and the provisions of Sections 56.54 and 56.71 that were in effect prior to final
passage of this ordinance shall return to full force and effect.)

[Editiors Note: Amendments as Adopted by O-19690 N.S.; effective 1-14-2008 which remained in
effect for one year until January 14, 2009, were not extended by the City Council, therefore, they
have been automatically repealed and removed from the San Diego Municipal Code and the
provisions of Sections 56.71 that were in effect prior to the final passage of this ordinance again
became effective.]

(Repealed 6-21-2010 by 0-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)

8 56.72 Reservation of Legal Options
(—Reservation of 138003y O-1QB2tNIS.p n s |l added 6

(Repealed 6-21-2010 by 0-19962 N.S.; effective 7-21-2010.)
Ch.

€



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 1
0 1 Reserved for future use 8 1

Ch.

BEN 110



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

ARTICLE 7
Soliciting & Begging 0 Charitable Solicitations

§ 57.01 Public Charitable Solicitations 8 Policy and Definitions
(Amended 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)
(Amended 9-12-1967 by O—-9692 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§ 57.01.1 Public Charitable Solicitations 8 Permit Necessary 8 Procedure
(Renumbered to Secs. 57.01.10, 57.01.11, 57.01.1

2,57.01.13,57.01.14, 57.01.15, 57.01.16 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Secs. 57.01.2 and 57.01.3) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

8§ 57.01.2 Public Charitable Solicitations 8 Investigation by Chief of Police 8 Powers
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.1 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.4) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 9-6-1962 by 0-8722 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.3 Same & Standards for Granting or Denying Permits
(Renumbered as part of Sec. 57.01.1 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.5) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.4 Same d Fee Paid to City Treasurer

(Renumbered Sec. 57.01.2 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.6) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

8 57.01.5 Public Charitable Solicitations 8 Content and Duration of Permit
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.3 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.7) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 9—6-1962 by O-8722 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

Ch.

111



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§57.01.6 Same & Grounds for Suspension or Revocation
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.4 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.9) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.7 Same & Public Hearing upon Denial, Suspension, Revocation 8 Appeal
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.5 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.8) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O—-9114 N.S.)

(Amended 1-19-1977 by O-11998 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.8 Same & Permit Noni Transferrable

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.7 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.;
amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.10) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.9 Same & Reports Required

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.6 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Amended (formerly Secs. 57.01.11 and 57.01.12) 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.10 Same & Solicitors 8 Information Card Necessary
(Renumbered Sec. 57.01.8 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.11 Same d Soliciting by Printed Matter or Telegraph Restricted
(Renumbered portion of Sec. 57.01.9 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.12 Same & Soliciting by Mail Restricted

(Renumbered as portion of Sec. 57.01.9 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly portion of Sec. 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.13 Same d Soliciting by Radio Restricted
ch(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

| 5(i8ER|ed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)




San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§57.01.14 Same & Soliciting by Television Restricted
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.18 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§ 57.01.15 Same & Soliciting by Telephoned il nf or mati on Car do Requi r e
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.19 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

( —S anSeliciting by Telephone——I nf orQGmartdllonRequi red upon Reque
(formerly 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by 0O-8691 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.16 Same & Soliciting by Telephone 8 Compensation to Solicitor Prohibited
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.20 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.1) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.17 Same & Soliciting by Minors Restricted

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.21 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(—Song chy iMi nor s RB8Is1962by©O+8691UNIS)added 7
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.18 Same & Permission to Solicit for Another
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.22 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.14) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.19 Same & Written Receipt

(Renumbered to Secs. 57.01.23, 57.01.24, 57.01.25 and 57.01.33 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.15) 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.20 Same & Box or Receptacle

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.34 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.17) 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.21 Same & Accounting System

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.36 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Added and amended (formerly Sec. 57.01.17) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§57.01.22 Same & Exceptions

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.37 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Added and amended (formerly 57.01.18) 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§ 57.01.23 Religious Solicitations & Registration and Certificate Required
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.38 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Added and amended (formerly portion of Sec. 57.01.19) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.24 Same & Issuance of Certificate of Registration d Content and Duration
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.39 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Added and amended (formerly portion of Sec. 57.01.19) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.25 Same & Solicitors d Information Card Necessary

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.40 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Added and amended (formerly portion of Sec. 57.01.19) 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.26 Same & Soliciting by Telephoned fil nf or mati on Car do Requi r e
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.41 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

( —S a—+n8Seliciting by Telephone——I nf or mat i on Car dll Red#i-red up
1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.27 Same & Soliciting by Telephone 8 Compensation to Solicitor Prohibited
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.42 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Added 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.28 Same & Soliciting by Minors Restricted
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.43 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Added 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.29 Same & Permission to Solicit for Another
(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.44 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Added 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

Ch.

BEN 114



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§57.01.30 Same & Written Receipt

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.45 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(—Sanvr i tten RecH+1962b)O-86eldN8.)d 7
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.31 Same 8 Box or Receptacle

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.46 on 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)
(Added 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.)

(Amended 11-5-1964 by O—-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.32 Same & Accounting System

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.47 on 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S.)
(—Sameccounti ng S$1s106e bpD-86RXWNISg d 7
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.33 Same 0 Exceptions

(Renumbered to Sec. 57.01.48 on 7-31-1962 by O-8671 N.S.)

(—Sanexceptionsll renumbered f F3-#062De@869151.3) 01. 19
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.34 Same & Investigation by Chief of Police 8 Powers
(Added 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.20.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.35 Same & Reports Required
(Added 7-31-1962 by 0—8691 N.S.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.36 Same & Promoters d License Required

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.21.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.37 Same & Promoters & Applications

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.22.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

Ch.

115



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§57.01.38 Same & Promoters & Bond

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.23.; amended 11-5—
1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Amended 10-14-1965 by O—9303 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.39 Same d Promoters d Investigation

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.24.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O—-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.40 Same & Promoters & Fee Paid to City Treasurer

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.25.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.41 Same & Promoters & License Revocation

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.26.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§ 57.01.42 Public Charitable Solicitations 8 Promoters d License Termination
(Amended 11-6-1958 by O-8004 N.S.)

(Renumbered 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.; formerly Sec. 57.01.27.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.43 Same d Promoters &8 Funds
(Renumbered 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.; formerly Sec. 57.01.28.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§ 57.01.44 Same & Solicitors & Certificate Required

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O—-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.29.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.45 Same 8 Promoters & Application & Investigation d Bond
(Amended 11-6-1958 by O—-8004 N.S.)

(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.30.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

(Repealed 6-07-2006 by 0-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.46 Same & Solicitors 8 Revocation 8 Appeals
(Renumbered and amended 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S. —formerly Sec. 57.01.31.)
(Amended 11-5-1964 by O-9114 N.S.)

Ch|Reieled 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)
5 Ny



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§57.01.47 Same 8 Fraudulent Misrepresentation
(Renumbered 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.; formerly Sec. 57.01.32.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§57.01.48 Same & Penalty
(Renumbered 7-31-1962 by O-8691 N.S.; formerly Sec. 57.01.33.)
(Repealed 6-07-2006 by O-19497 N.S.)

§ 57.05 Soliciting Patronage on Railroad Trains for Transportation Firms, Hotels,
Restaurants, Etc. 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8 57.06 Soliciting Patronage for Hotel, Boarding House, Lodging House d Prohibited o
Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 57.07 Procurement or Sale of Transportation Tickets on Behalf of Another 8 Regulated &
Fees Chargeable
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§57.07.1 Same & Proof of Intent
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8§ 57.07.2 Same & Sales in Excess of Specified Amounts 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§57.07.3 Same & Proof of Intent
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

§57.07.4 Same & Definitions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S.)

8§ 57.07.5 Same & Posting Notices
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2846 N.S. adopted 3-31-1944.)

§57.07.6 Same 0 Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—2846 N.S. adopted 3-31-1944.)

§ 57.08 Sale of Transportation by Public Outcry in Public Places 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—6857 O.S. adopted 1-3-1917.)

§ 57.08.1 Directing Attention to Places where Transportation Tickets are Sold 8 Public
Outcry Prohibited
(Incorp. 11221 1952 by O15046 N.S., contained in O1 6857 O.S. adopted 17 31 1917.)

Ch.

117



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§57.08.2 Same & Definitions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—6857 O.S. adopted 1-3-1917.)

§ 57.10 Fortune Telling, Etc., Advertising 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-574 N.S. adopted 12—28-1934.)

§57.10.1 Same & Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O-574 N.S. adopted 12—-18-1934.)

8 57.14 Selling of Tickets of Admission to Places of Public Assemblage in Public Places and
Places Open to The Public Prohibited 8 Exceptions
(Added 10-13-1970 by O-10430 N.S.)

§ 57.15 Distribution of Newspapers, etc., upon Roadways & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—897 N.S. 5-6-1936.)

§ 57.16 Handbillsd Definedd Distribution Regulated
(Added 8-5-1952 by O-5287 N.S.)
(Amended 5-2-1994 by O-18068 N.S.)

8 57.17 Handbill Requirements On Hotel or Motel Property
(Added 5-2-1994 by O-18068 N.S.)

8 57.20 Civic Center Building 6 Soliciting, Peddling, Vending & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4123 N.S. adopted 7-12—-1949.)
(Repealed 4—29-1965 by O—-9027 N.S.)

§57.20.1 Same & Distribution of Literature, Advertising Matter 8 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4123 N.S. adopted 7-12-1949.)
(Repealed 4—29-1965 by O—-9207 N.S.)

§57.20.2 Same 0 Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4123 N.S. adopted 7-12—-1949.)
(Repealed 4—29-1965 by O—-9207 N.S.)

§57.20.3 Same d Solicitation for Approved Funds 8 Permitted
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4123 N.S. adopted 7-12-1949.)
(Repealed 4—29-1965 by O—-9207 N.S.)

§57.20.4 Same & Exceptions d Where One Party is Agent of Either City or County
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—4123 N.S. adopted 7-12—-1949.)
(Repealed 4—29-1965 by O—-9207 N.S.)

Ch.

BEN 118



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

ARTICLE 8

Minors

§ 58.01 Curfew for Minors & Exceptions

(—Cur few +Bxcép tnioao rs28-1952 byadOe5046 N.S., dontained in O—-3454 N.S.
adopted 6-24-1947; repealed 6—18—1997 by Emergency Ordinance O—18415 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-1-1997 by O-18416 N.S.)

8 58.01.1 Same Parent or Guardian Prohibited from Permitting Minor to Violate Curfew
(—Sanrear ent or Guardian Prohibited from2Per mit
1952 by O-5046 N.S., contained in O—-3454 N.S. adopted 6-24-1947;

repealed 6—18—-1997 by Emergency Ordinance O—18415 N.S.)

(Repealed 7-1-1997 by O-18416 N.S.)

§58.01.2 Penalty

(—Penal t y22H1932 by ©-b04pN.S., cbntained in 0-3454 N.S., adopted 6-24-1947;
renumbered to Section 58.0103 on 6—18-1997 by Emergency Ordinance O—18415 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Section 58.0103 on 7-1-1997 by O-18416 N.S.)

§ 58.02 Letting Hotel Room, etc., to Minor & Prohibited 8 Exceptions
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046, N.S., contained in O—2730 N.S. adopted 10-13-1943.)

§ 58.04 Minor Possessing Tobacco for Use & Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 contained in O—764 O.S. adopted 6-19-1900 by O-5046 N.S.)

§ 58.05 Daytime Loitering of Juveniles In Any Public Place On School Days

(—Mi nor Loi tering —Pr oBiilbliited-d-1932 bycRBe046IN.S. Ha | |
contained in 01729 O.S. adopted 9-23-1904; repealed 11-14-1963 by O—8925 N.S.; now under

Sec. 33.1610.2; —Minor Loitering 46A99@y0O-l i ar d ¢
18296 N.S.)

(—Daytime Loisetnndgn@®@f PlibVveosi Péace On S6hool L
1996 by O-18296 N.S.)

§ 58.06 Proprietor Permitting Minors Loitering in Billiard or Pool Hall 3 Prohibited
(Incorp. 1-22-1952 by O-5046, N.S., contained in O-1729 O.S. adopted 9-23-1904.)
(Repealed 11-14-1963 by O—-8925 N.S.; now under Sec. 33.1610.3.)

8§ 58.07 Distribution of Harmful Material to Minors
(Added 9-14-1965 by 0—9280 N.S.)
(Amended 3—-20-1989 by O-17265 N.S.)

8 58.07.1 Prohibition of Sale of Aerosol Paint to Minors

(Added 4-14-1980 by O—15237 N.S.) o



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 1
Curfew Regulations
( —Cur f e w -1B-197dhydEmergen8y Ordinance O-18415 N.S.)
(—Cur f e w;-1H99 Iy @-€18416 K.S.)
(Repealed former Division 1—Curfew
added new Di vi si on -22-2018Ky Emefgency OrRargauO-18982ING. N s I 2

§ 58.0101 Definitions for Curfew Regulations

(—Definitions for C+18-199% by ERergency OrdinameOs-184IL5NEY d ed 6
(Amended 7-1-1997 by 018416 N.S.)

(RepealediDe f i ni ti ons f orand@u d ew +hriadaviiosnisonfsolr Cur f e\
2-22-2010 by O-19932 N.S.; effective 2-22-2010.)

§ 58.0102 Curfew Regulations

(—Cur f ew Rest FLiB-4997 bpEmargenty Oedohashoe @—18815 N.S.)

(Amended 7-1-1997 by 018416 N.S.)

(Repealed iiCurfewRe s t r i a b d o a GuiffevdReguationsll 2-22-2010 by 0O-19932 N.S.;
effective 2-22-2010.)

§ 58.0103 Penalty

(—Penalty, Il renumber et8-1997 by Bmer§escg Qrdinance OEL&150 1. 2 o
N.S.)

(Renumbered from Section 58.01.2 on 7-1-1997 by O-18416 N.S.)

(Repealed former Section 58. 0103 —Pela2-20191l and
by O-19932 N.S.; effective 2-22-2010.)

Ch.

120 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 2
Limits on Use and Possession of Glass Etching Products
(Added 9-24-2001 by O—18984 N.S.)

8 58.0201 Declaration of Purpose
(Added 9-24-2001 by O-18984 N.S.)

§58.0202 Limitations on the Sale of Glass Etching Products to Minors
(Added 9-24-2001 by O-18984 N.S.)

§ 58.0203 Prohibition on Possession of Glass Etching Products by Minors
(Added 9-24-2001 by O-18984 N.S.)

§ 58.0204 Enforcement Authority
(Added 9-24-2001 by 0-18984 N.S.)

8§ 58.0205 Enforcement Remedies
(Added 9-24-2001 by 0-18984 N.S)

DIVISION 3
Restricting the Sale, Advertising and Promotion of Tobacco Products to Minors
(Restrici ng t he Sale, Advertising and Promoti or

added 10-20-1998 by O-18597 N.S.)

8§ 58.0301 Definitions
(—Def i ni t i @189 by @-ti8E9&NS.)1 O

§ 58.0302 Measure of Distance
(—Measure of D-R20s199by ©0-88897MSJded 10

§ 58.0303 Advertising Restrictions
(—Advertising ReG1MIBDyOUIHBINS)I added 10

§ 58.0304 Exceptions to Advertising Restrictions
(—Exceptions to Adver-20198byQ-18®WeNSt)r i cti onsll adde

8 58.0305 Location of Tobacco Products and Advertising Inside Retail Establishments
(—Location of Tobacco Products and AQWw1®8 1t i si ng
by O-18597 N.S.)

Ch.

121



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

8 58.0306 Exceptions to Location of Tobacco Products and Advertising Inside Retail

Establishments

(—Exceptions to Location of Tobacco Products ¢
10-20-1998 by 0O-18597 N.S.)

8 58.0307 ldentification Required for Purchase of Tobacco Products
(—l denti ficati on Roebgaucicroe dP rfoodru20FP1988 by Gakgiseedl.dg f1 OT

§ 58.0308 Sale and Distribution of Tobacco Products
(—Sal e and Distributi on20d998by@IBENS) Pr oduct sl &

8 58.0309 Distribution of Tobacco Samples or Promotional Items
(—Diwttirom of Tobacco Sampl e s-20el998 by ©O-1B5OON.Si) o n a | |t

8 58.0310 Posting of Signs Regarding Sales to Minors
(—Posting of Signs Rega+#0@R9%8y O-53897.SE) t o Mi nor sl

§ 58.0311 Extensions for Compliance
(—€E&nsions for Co2hpo98ibyaOnl858/INSrdded 10

§ 58.0312 Enforcement
(—Enf or c e me-2041908 bp@18597dN.S.) O

Ch.

122 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 4
Safe School Buffer Zone
(—Safe School B uld-1939 by OA8Y368.8) added 12

§ 58.0401 Purpose
(—Pposel amd®dy G13736 N.S.)

8§ 58.0402 Definitions
(—Definiti-b4i%99bg@IBESEN.S) 2

§ 58.0403 Minimum Penalties for Violations Occurring in a School Safety Zone
(—Mi ni mum Penalties for Viol atliadud®4dl@®@aur ri ng i
0O-18736 N.S.)

DIVISION 5
Restricting the Advertising of Alcoholic Beverages to Youth
(—Restricting the Advertising of Al coh
added 11-14-2000 by O-18879 N.S.)

8§ 58.0501 Definitions
(—Definit i-bs2000ba@B8YUN.S) 1
(Amended 5-6-2003 by 0-19173 N.S.)

§ 58.0502 Measure of Distance
(—Measure of D142000byn&x183r%BNEd ed 11
(Amended 5-6-2003 by O-19173 N.S.)

§ 58.0503 Advertising Restrictions
(—Advertising R-44s2000hyO-18879MS)Il added 11
(Amended 5-6-2003 by O-19173 N.S.)

§ 58.0504 Enforcement
(—Enf or c e meld-2000dydOel @@ N.5.)1
(Amended 5-6-2003 by O-19173 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 6:
Child Protection Act
(&hi | d Pr o tdded3/14/2008 byAQ:19724 N.S.; effective 4/13/2008.)

§58.0601 Purpose
(—P u r p adede3iL4/2@08 by O-19724 N.S.; effective 4/13/2008.)
(Amended 7-19-2011 by O-20069 N.S.; effective 8-18-2011.)

§58.0602 Definitions
(—De f i n idded 30412608 by &-19724 N.S.; effective 4/13/2008.)
(Amended 7-19-2011 by O-20069 N.S.; effective 8-18-2011.)

858.0603 Restricted Areas for Sex Offenders-Residency

(—Restricted Areas for Sex Offenders-P r e s eadded &/14/2008 by O-19724 N.S.; effective
4/13/2008.)

(Renumbered from former Section 58.0604, fiRestricted Areas for Sex Offenders-R e s i dandh c y |l
amended 7-19-2011 by O-20069 N.S.; effective 8-18-2011. Former Section 58.0603 repealed.)

§58.0604 Measure of Distance

(—Restricted Areas for Sex Offenders-R e s i d eddea3y14/2008 by O-19724 N.S.; effective
4/13/2008.)

(Renumbered from f Memesmur 2e othnddnendd &18-@0@100p , —
0-20069 N.S.; effective 8-18-2011.)

§58.0605 Exemptions

(Measur e o fadded 3/14/2088 hycOel 8724 N.S.; effective 4/13/2008.)

(Renumbered from former Section 58.0607, fiE x e mp t, ancbamended 7-19-2011 by O-20069
N.S.; effective 8-18-2011.)

858.0606 Effective Date for Residency Requirements

(©t her Establishment R eddddB/14/2008bp0119724fNG.[ effeBlieex Of f e
4/13/2008.)

(Renumbered from f E&frherct$Seect iDan e58 00 GREsi denc)
amended 7-19-2011 by O-20069 N.S.; effective 8-18-2011. Former Section 58.0606 repealed.)

858.0607 Sentencing, Probation, and Parole

(—Exemp t i odded 3114/2908 by O-19724 N.S.; effective 4/13/2008.)

(Sentencing, P r oduded 74132011 by 820469 R.3; effective 8+18-2011.

Former Section 58.0607 —Exemptionsll renumber ec

Ch.

124



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§58.0608 Defenses
(—Pefens e sdiiled 314/2008 by 0-19724 N.S.; effective 4/13/2008.)
(Repealed 719-2011 by G20069 N.S.; effective-88-2011 )

§58.0609 Effective Date for Residency Requirements

(Ef fective Date for dke3I14/2008 by©OVMI7R N.§;effective ment sl a
4/13/2008.)

(Renumbered to Section 58.0606, and amended 7-19-2011 by O-20069 N.S.; effective 8-18-2011.)

Ch.

125



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

ARTICLE 9
City Sports Facility
(—San Diego Jack Murphy Stadi uml
amended with title change 7-9-1984 by 0-16234 N.S.)
(Retitled t oaédQUAAIL-BAOINNMTCE18440 N.S.)
(—Reti tl ed to Ci t-9%2008hyo0-19%268N.FHaci |l i tiesl o

DIVISION 1
Definitions
(Division added 7-9-1968 by O—9838 N.S.)
(Editors note: Title —St a®l988m and Par ki |
(Ret i t | eidt itoon-9-2WédfynD-H2262 N.S.)

§ 59.0101 Purpose of Definitions

(—Pur pose an d-9-1968thy0+3a838 N.& ;cmerdet 6-18—-1979 by O-12682 N.S.;
amended 7-9-1983 by 0-16234 N.S.)

(Amended 11-18-1997 by O-18440 N.S.)

(—Reti tl ed Deof i-—nH utripoonssel-9-280a iy O-a9a62 M) e d 2

§ 59.0102 Definitions

(—Def i ni t i-»-1983 by Oa9838 .S, aniénded 6-18—-1979 by 012682 N.S.; amended
7-9-1984 by 0-16234 N.S.; amended 3-3-1986 by O-16604 N.S.;

amended 9-28-1987 by O—16943 N.S.; amended 2—24-1992 by O-17740 N.S.;

amended 5-26-1992 by O-17772 N.S.)

(Amended 11-18-1997 by O-18440 N.S.)

(Amended 12-6-1999 by 0-18729 N.S.)

(Amended 2-9-2004 by O-19262 N.S.)

8 59.0103 Activities Prohibited within QUALCOMM Stadium

(—Cans aRdoBbbtted at the San Diego -Si9680byi um ar
0O-9838 N.S.)

(Retitled to —Cans and Bottles Prohibited at t
9-1984 by O-16234 N.S.; amended 3—3-1986 by O-16604 N.S.)

(Reti tliewi ttioes—ARrtohi bited Wi thin San DBl4ego Jac
1992 by 017740 N.S.)

(Retitled to —Activities Prohibitel819897byG+i n QUA
18440 N.S.)

(Repealed 2-9-2004 by O-19262 N.S.)

Ch.

126 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

8 59.0104 Activities Prohibited within the QUALCOMM Stadium Parking Facility

(—Stadi um Pa#81979 bylD-126828.8)d 6

(Retitled to —Activities Prohibited within the
amended 3—-3—-1986 by O-16604 N.S.; amended 9-28-1987 by 0O-16943 N.S.;

amended 9-10-1990 by O-17519 N.S.; amended 4-16-1991 by O-17630 N.S.)

(Retitled to —Activities Prohibited within the
11-18-1997 by O-18440 N.S.)

(Amended 12-6-1999 by O-18729 N.S.)

(Repealed 2-9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0105 Towing
(Added 6-18-1979 by 012682 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—3-1986 by O-16604 N.S.)

8 59.0106 Restroom Facilities at San Diego Jack Murphy Stadium
(Added 7-9-1984 by 0-16234 N.S.)
(Repealed 3—3-1986 by O-16604 N.S.)

§ 59.0107 Food and Beverage Catering in the San Diego Jack Murphy Stadium Parking
Facility

(Added 9-9-1985 by O-16504 N.S.)

(Repealed 3—3-1986 by O-16604 N.S.)

Ch.

127



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 2
Prohibited Activities within City Sports Facilities
(Added 2—9-2004 by 0O-19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0201 Purpose and Intent
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

8 59.0202 Activities Prohibited within City Sports Facilities
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0O-19262 N.S.)
(Amended 9-19-2006 by O-19536 N.S.; effective 10-19-2006.)

DIVISION 3
Ballpark District
(Added 2—9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0301 Purpose and Intent
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0—19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0302 Designation of the Ballpark District
(Added 2—9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0303 Activities Prohibited within the Ballpark District
(Added 2—9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)
(Amended 10-14-2009 by 0-19900 N.S; effective 11-13-2009.)

§59.0304 Activities Prohibited on PETCO Park Perimeter Sidewalk
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

Ch.

128 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 4
Outfield Park
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0401 Outfield Park
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0—19262 N.S.)

DIVISION 5
Prohibited Activities in QUALCOMM Stadium Parking Facility
(Added 2—9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0501 Purpose and Intent
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0—19262 N.S.)

§ 59.0502 Activities Prohibited within the QUALCOMM Stadium Parking Facility
(Added 2—9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)
(Amended 9-19-2006 by 0-19535 N.S.; effective 10-19-2006.)

8 59.0503 Applicability of the California VVehicle Code
(Added 2-9-2004 by 0-19262 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

ARTICLE 9.5
Noise Abatement and Control
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

DIVISION 1
General
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0101 Purpose and Intent
(Added 9-18-1973 by 0-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0102 Definitions
(Added 9-18-1973 by O—11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0103 Sound Level Measurement
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§59.5.0104 Severability
(Added 9-18-1973 by 011122 N.S.)
(Renumbered 9-22-1976 by O-11916 N.S. now Sec. 59.5.0607.)

DIVISION 2
Administration
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

§59.5.0201 Establishment of Noise Abatement and Control Administrator
(Added 9-18-1973 by O—11122 N.S.; amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)
(Amended 7-25-1994 by O-18088 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0202 Duties and Responsibilities of the Administrator Noise Abatement

(—Duties and Responsi bi | i-i841%3by ®-11122 MSe améndechi ni st r
9-22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.; amended 1-3-1984 by O-16100 N.S.;

amended 11-16-1987 by O-16978 N.S.; amended 4-1-1996 by O-18281 N.S.)

(—Duties and Responsibilities of the A€d8i nistr
1997 by O-18439 N.S.)

8 59.5.0203 Issuance of Permits or Variances by Administrator
(Added 9-18-1973 by O—11122 N.S.)

(Amended 9-22-1976 by O—11916 N.S.)
Ch.

130 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare

(10-2011)

§ 59.5.0204 Appeals

(Added 9-18-1973 by O—11122 N.S.; amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.; amended 1-3—-1984 by
0O-16100 N.S.)

(Amended 4-1-1996 by O-18281 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0205 Inspection by Administrator
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0206 The San Diego City Noise Map

(—Admini strat or ' =s18-1918bydelllP2MN&.srdpealad®-22-1976 By O—
11916 N.S.)

(—The San Diego Ci-22y¥197&Nby ©—41816 WiSa; pniendea 8-8-E98P bydD—
15796 N.S.)

(Amended 7-25-1994 by O-18088 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0207 Board for Abatement and Control of Noise

(—Amendment to Ot hel8-1@3bg0-1EINSe epealech9d2d-&9d6 by

0O-11916 N.S.)

(—Board for Abatement (farmeatly S&cba50208) D—22619760M0+ s ell ac
11916 N.S.; amended 2—2-1977 by O-12003 N.S.; amended 7-25-1994 by O-18088 N.S.)

(Repealed 4—1-1996 by O-18281 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0208 Board of Noise Abatement and Control
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Renumbered to Sec. 59.5.0207 on 9-22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

DIVISION 3
Noise Abatement Contract Compliance
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0301 Contract Provisions
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 4
Limits
(Noi se Level Li mits, St18049%93y@KI128NSd Cont r ol
(Retitl ed t—22-19by @L1916N.S)on 9

§ 59.5.0401 Sound Level Limits

(—Fi xed and Nonst at-18€%aby 9-1182 NIS;; cepeadell 9-22-3¥6by 9
O-11916 N.S.)

(—Sound Level-22E1076bhyO-<d1D16H.8)ded 9

(Amended 1-3-1984 by O-16100 N.S.)

(Amended 10-28-1985 by O-16531 N.S.)

(Amended 9-11-1989 by O-17337 N.S.)

(Amended 11-28-2006 by O-19446 N.S.; effective 2-9-2006.)

§ 59.5.0402 Motor Vehicles

(—Vehicle and Nonstat i elB-a973ypy OS1d122NcSerepRakedOa22—r s I a c
1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

—Mot or Vehiclesl added22{1976by OrEI9I6NS)Sec. 59. 5. 040C

§ 59.5.0403 Watercraft

(—Mot or Ve h H18H9%3bHO-1d122INeSY 9

(Renumbered to Sec. 59.5.0402 on 9-22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

(—Watercraftl added (for me22+l976 b @¢1916%9). 5. 040 7)

8 59.5.0404 Construction Noise

(—Ur ban Tr ans i-18-18B3byg @-51122 NMaSd cbpeaded 9922-1976 by O-11916

N.S.)

(—Construction Noisel added (2191byrO+1$9168&8 . 59.
(Amended 1-3-1984 by O-16100 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0405 Construction Activities

(—Power ed Model -18~89T3ibycOH1&122IIN.S.arepebledd®—23-1976 by 0-11916

N.S.)

(—Construction Activitiesl adde22-19/6bp0-Melé | v Sec
N.S.)

(Repealed 1-3-1984 by O-16100 N.S.)

8 59.5.0406 Refuse Vehicles and Parking Lot Sweepers
(—Ref use Ve Ri8d973bg A-11HR2NISe amenfled 9-22—-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)
(Amended 6-9-2010 by O-19960 N.S.; effective 7-9-2010.)

§ 59.5.0407 Watercraft
(Added 9-18-1973 by 011122 N.S.)

(Renumbered (now Sec. 59.5.0403) 9-22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)
Ch.

132 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

§ 59.5.0408 Construction Noise
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Renumbered (now Sec. 59.5.0404) 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0409 Construction Equipment
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Renumbered (now Sec. 59.5.0405) 9-22—-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§59.5.0410 Containers and Construction Material
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§59.5.0411 Exterior Noise Isolation Standards
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§59.5.0412 Train Horns and Whistles 8 Excessive Sound Prohibited
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0413 Signal Device for Food Trucks
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by 0-11916 N.S.)

Ch.



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 5
Public Nuisance Noise
(—Gener aed g uNoa tsieo RRS8-973by Q-ELIP2 NBS.)
(Retitled to —Pub#22-t976MWOH14946MINcSe Noi sell on

§59.5.0501 General Prohibitions
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)
(Amended 1-3-1984 by O-16100 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0502 Disturbing, Excessive, Offensive Noises & Declaration of Certain Acts

Constituting

(—Loud Unushedl| aroatsiesn of Cert ai nl8+tl%w3bfp0+t s Cons
11122 N.S.)

(Retitled to —Distur bi—-nbpclaraEixcessi vEer OaifenACWVE
and amended 9-22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

(Amended 1-3-1983 by O-15876 N.S.)

(Amended 1-3-1984 by 0-16100 N.S)

(Amended 10-30-1989 by O-17380 N.S.)

(Amended 9-9-1991 by O-17676 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0503 Burglar Alarms

(Added 9-18-1973 by 0-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)
(Amended 1-3-1984 by O—16100 N.S.)

Ch.

134 |



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 6
Violations And Enforcement
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0601 Violations: Misdemeanors
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 10-30-1989 by O-17380 N.S.)

§59.5.0602 Violations: Additional Remedies: Injunctions
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

8§ 59.5.0603 Enforcement
(Added 9-18-1973 by O-11122 N.S.)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0604 Manner of Enforcement
(Added 9-18-1973 by 0-11122 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0605 Display of Permits and Other Notices
(Added 9-18-1973 by 0-11122 N.S.)

8 59.5.0606 False and Misleading Statement: Unlawful Reproduction or Alteration of
Documents

(Added 9-18-1973 by 011122 N.S.)

(Amended 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0607 Severability
(Added 9-22-1976 by O—11916 N.S.)

DIVISION 7
Noise Insulation In Buildings
(—Exempt i o8s1B73 &y @-d2P N.9)
(Repealed 9—22-1976 by 0-11916 N.S.)
(—Noi s e | nusi ulda tnigosoitlesamy 6815798 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0701 Noise Insulation In Residential Buildings
(—Nonappl i caig1973 by pH1112°2 N.96.;aepeald 9—22-1976 by O-11916 N.S.)

(—Noi se I nsul ation | n -RBOVibydDelh706iNS) Bui | di ngsl

Ch.

c



San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5: Public Safety, Morals and Welfare
(10-2011)

DIVISION 8
Sound Trucks & Loud Speakers 8 Sound Amplifiers
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§59.5.0801 Sound Trucks & Loud Speakers 8 Sound Amplifiers Defined
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0802 Noncommercial Use of Sound Trucks 8 Registration Required
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0803 Endorsement of Registration Statement of Noncommercial Sound Trucks
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0804 Registration Statement Amendment
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0805 Registration and Identification
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0806 Regulations for Use
(Added 2-23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0807 Commercial Use Sound Truck Regulated 8 License Required
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0808 Application for License
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§59.5.0809 Issuance of License
(Added 2—23-1987 by O—16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0810 Possession and Display of License
(Added 2—23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

§ 59.5.0811 Regulations for Use
(Added 2-23-1987 by O-16813 N.S.)

Ch.

136 |



