STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE Attachment 1

OLD LANGUAGE: Strikeout
NEW LANGUAGE: Underline
(SO-2003-)

ORDINANCE NUMBER O-

ADOPTED ON

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIEGO
AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 2, OF THE SAN DIEGO
MUNICIPAL CODE BY AMENDING SECTION 111.0207; AMENDING
ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 2, BY ADDING SECTIONS 112.0204, 112.0205,
112.0206, 112.0207, 112.0208, AND 112.0209; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1, BY AMENDING SECTION 129.0113;
DIVISION 2, BY AMENDING SECTIONS 129.0203 AND 129.0214; DIVISION
5, BY AMENDING SECTION 129.0503; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 1, BY AMENDING SECTIONS 145.0101, 145.0103,
145.0104, 145.0105, 145.0106, AND 145.0107; DIVISION 2, BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 145.0201, 145.0202, 145.0203, 145.0204, 145.0205, AND 145.0207,
DIVISION 4, BY AMENDING SECTIONS 145.0404, 145.0405, 145.0406,
145.0407, 145.0408, 145.0409, 145.0410, 145.0411, 145.0412, 145.0415, AND
145.0426, ALL PERTAINING TO BUILDING REGULATIONS.

§111.0207 Board of Building Appeals and Advisors
(a) [No change.]
(b) Appointment and Terms
(1) [No change.]
(2) Members shall have experience and training in matters of design
and construction of buildings, fire prevention, and fire protection.

At least two members shall be licensed by the State of California as

Civil Engineers, one of whom is duly authorized to use the title

-PAGE 1 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§112.0204

“Structural Engineer,” and one member each shall be from the

electrical and mechanical industries or professions. At least two

members shall be licensed by the State of California as Fire

Protection Engineers. At least one member shall be licensed by the

State of California as an Architect. At least one member shall

represent the disabled community.

3) [No change.]

(©) [No change.]

(d) Powers and Duties. The powers and duties of the Board of Building
Appeals and Advisors are as follows:
(1) The Board of Building Appeals and Advisors shall investigate and

advise the Building Official on the suitability of alternate-matertats

and-typesof construction-any alternate material, design, or

construction method. This action may be taken on the Board's own

motion, at the request of a permit applicant, or as requested by the
City Manager, the Building Official, the Fire Chief, or the
Historical Resources Board.

(2) through (4) [No change.]

Construction Permit Fees

A fee for each construction permit shall be paid in accordance with the fee

schedule established by resolution of the City Council and filed in the office of the

City Clerk.

-PAGE 2 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§112.0205

The Building Official shall compute the building permit and building plan

review fees based on the nature of all construction work for which the

permit is issued, including all finish work, painting, roofing, electrical,
plumbing, heating, air conditioning, elevators, fire-extinguishing systems
and any other permanent work or permanent equipment installed or
constructed.

Where work for which a permit is required by the building regulations is

started or completed prior to obtaining the required permit, a penalty fee as

established by the City Council and filed in the office of the City Clerk

shall also be paid. The payment of the penalty fee shall not relieve any

person from fully complying with the requirement of the building

regulations in the execution of the work or from any other penal-ties

prescribed in this Section.

If a permit has been canceled or has expired and no work was commenced

and no required inspections have been made, a portion of the permit fee

paid may be refunded by the Building Official upon application for refund

by the permittee within one (1) vear from the date of permit issuance.

Plan Review Fees for Compliance with the Building Regulations

When a plan or other data is required to be submitted by the building regulations,

a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications

for review. Said plan review fee shall be determined in accordance with the fee

schedule established by resolution of the City Council and filed in the office of the

-PAGE 3 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



City Clerk.

(a) The plan review fees specified in Section 112.0205 are separate fees from

the permit fees specified in Section 112.0204.

(b) Where plans are incomplete, or changed so as to require additional plan

review, an additional plan review fee shall be charged in accordance with

the fee schedule established by the City Council and filed in the office of

the City Clerk.

§112.0206 Construction Permit Reinspection Fee

The fee for each reinspection shall be determined in accordance with the fee

schedule established by resolution of the City Council and filed in the office of the

City Clerk.

§112.0207  Energy Conservation Fee
In addition to any other applicable fees, an energy conservation fee shall be paid
for each building permit which authorizes the construction of a new building or

the addition to or alteration of an existing building, if such building or addition or

alteration is subject to the provisions of Chapter 2-53, Part 2. Title 24, of the

California Code of Regulations. The energy conservation fee shall be determined

in accordance with the fee schedule established by the City Council and filed in

the office of the City Clerk. The energy conservation fee shall be paid at the time

the building permit is issued.

§112.0208 Investigation for Work Without a Construction Permit

Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this code has

- PAGE 4 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



been commenced without first obtaining said permit, a special investigation shall

be made before a permit may be issued for such work.

§112.0209 Investigation Fee

An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or

not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be equal to
the amount of the permit fee required by this code. The minimum investigation

fee shall be the same as the minimum fee set forth in approved schedule of fees.

The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from

compliance with all other provisions of these building regulations nor from any

penalty prescribed by law.

§129.0113 When a Certificate of Occupancy Is Required
(a) [No change.]
(b) Changes in the character or use of a building shall not be made except as
specified in the 1998 2001 California Building Code Section 3405.
§129.0203  Exemptions from a Building Permit
(a) A Building Permit is not required for the following structures and
activities::
(1) through (3) [No change.]
4) €ases;counters;andpPartitions that are 6972 inches high or less,

cases and counters.

(5) through (18) [No change.]

(19)  Hospital Buildings as defined in California Health and Safety

- PAGE 5 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



(20)

2

Code, Section 15626129725.

particutar-andjustifrabtereasom:Structures placed in public streets,

alleys and sidewalks. except those regulated by Chapter 32 of the

California Building Code.

Work done by emplovees of the City on City-owned or leased

(22)

(23)

A temporary shed, office or storage building and other structure

incidental to and for work authorized by a valid grading or building

permit. Such structures must be removed upon expiration of the

permit or completion of work covered by the permit.

Installing replacement windows in existing window openings

where all of the following conditions apply:

(A)  The “replacement windows” are installed in a single family

residence or a duplex:

(B)  The proposed window replacement shall not require any

modifications to the weather resistive exterior wall

envelope protecting the structure or the interior of the

structure.

(C)  The existing windows to be replaced are not required to be

fire resistive.

(D)  The proposed work shall not require modifications to the

- PAGE 6 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



existing rough openings.

(E)  Exemption from a building permit shall not exempt

compliance with the emergency escape requirements of

Section 310.4 of the 2001 California Building Code and the

provision of smoke detectors per the requirements of

Section 310.9 of said code.

(24) Specific structures as determined by the Building Official for a

particular and justifiable reason.

(b) through (d) [No change.]
§129.0214  Requirements for Approved Plans
(a) and (b) [No change.]

(c)

of comptetionofthe-workauthorized-by thoseptans. Except as required by

Section 19850 and 19851 of the Health and Safety Code, the building
official shall retain one set of approved plans, specification and
computations for a period of not less than 90 calendar days from the date

of completion of the work authorized by those plans, after which time the

building official may. at his or her discretion, either dispose of the copies

or retain them as a part of the permanent files of the Development Services

Department.

§129.0503  Exemptions from a Demolition/Removal Permit

-PAGE 7 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



(a) A Demolition/Removal Permit is not required to demolish or remove any
structure that is exempt from a Building Permit in accordance with Sectron

125-6263 Section 129.0203.

(b) and (c) [No change.]
§145.0101  Purpose of the Building Regulations
a The purpose of the Building Regulationsis to provide minimum standards
to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating
and controlling the design, construction methods, and type and quality of
materials, use and occupancy, location, and maintenance for new
construction or for construction involving existing buildings or structures

and certain, specifically regulated, equipment.

(S

The purpose of this section is not to create or otherwise establish or

designate any particular class or group of persons who will or should be

especially protected or benefitted by the terms of this section.

§145.0103  Adoption of the 1998 2001 California Building Code
(a) The 1998 2001 California Building Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission, as amended by the State Department of
Housing and Community Development [HCD]; the Division of the State
Architect/Access and Compliance [DSA/ACT]; the State Office of
Statewide Health Planning and Development [OSHPD3]; and the State
Fire Marshal [SFM] (1998 2001 California Building Code) is adopted by

reference, except as otherwise provided in Sections 145.0104, 145.0105,

- PAGE 8 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



(b)

(c)

(d)

145.0106, and 145.0107. A copy of the 1998 2001 California Building
Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as Document No. OO-
769840.

Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 1998
2001 California Building Code is made a part of this article as if fully set
forth in this article except as otherwise provided in Sections 145.0104,
145.0105, 145.0106, and 145.0107.

Numbering of sub-sections in Division 2 of this Article is cross-
referenced to sections in the $998 2001 California Building Code.

The adoption of the 1998 2001 California Building Code, shall in no way
limit, prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council from adopting
ordinances limiting or preventing the issuance of any type, number, or
geographical distribution of permits for construction or demolition of any
facility for which a permit is required.

Application. The amendments made by the state agencies to the model

code and incorporated into the California Building Code are applicable

only to those occupancies or uses which the state agency making the

amendments is authorized to regulate, as listed in Section 101.17 of the

2001 edition of the California Building Code. The Building Official shall

only enforce those amendments made by the following state agencies:

@8] The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD).

2) Division of the State Architect, Access Compliance (DSA/AC).

-PAGE 9 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§145.0104

§145.0105

§145.0106

§145.0107

3) Office of the State Fire Marshal (SEM).

4) Office of Statewide Health, Planning and Development
(OSHPD3).
%) California Energy Commission (CEC).

(6) Department of Water Resources (DWR).

Portions of the 1998 2001 California Building Code Not Adopted by the City
of San Diego

The following portions of the 998 2001 California Building Code are not
adopted by the City of San Diego:

(a) through (c) [No change.]

Modifications to the 1998 2001 California Building Code Adopted by the
City of San Diego

The following sections or sub-sections of the +998 2001 California Building Code
have been modified by the City of San Diego:

(a) and (b) [No change.]

Additions to the 1998 2001 California Building Code Adopted by Tthe City
of San Diego

The following sections or sub-sections have been added to the +998 2001
California Building Code regulations by Fthe City of San Diego::

(a) through (e) [No change.]

Adoption of Appendices to 1998 2001 California Building Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the $998 2001 California Building Code are

- PAGE 10 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



adopted by Fthe City of San Diego::

CHAPTER 3, Division I AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS
CHAPTER S BASEMENTPHPERNEETS

CHAPTER 18 WATERPROOFING AND DAMP PROOFING FOUNDATIONS
CHAPTER 31, Division Il MEMBRANE STRUCTURES

CHAPTER 31, Division IIIl PATIO COVERS

Division 2: Text of Modifications and Additions to the 1998 2001 California

§145.0201

§145.0202

Building Code for City of San Diego
Purpose of City Modifications or Additions to the 1998 2001 California
Building Code
[No change to text.]
Local Modifications to Roofing Requirements of the 1998 2001 California
Building Code
Section 1503 ROOFING REQUIREMENTS of the 1998 2001 California Building
Code is adopted with modifications, as follows pursuant to Section 145.0105 of
the Land Development Code:
The roof covering or roofing assembly on any structure regulated by this Code
shall be as specified in Table 15-A of the 1998 2001 California Building Code and
as classified in Section 1504 of the 1998 2001 California Building Code.
Noncombustible roof covering as defined in Section 1504.2 may be applied in
accordance with the manufacturer’s requirements in lieu of a fire-retardant roofing

assembly.

- PAGE 11 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



[No change to remainder of section. ]
§145.0203  Local Modifications and Additions to Foundations and Retaining Walls
Requirements of the 1998 2001 California Building Code

(CBC Chapter 18-Foundations and Retaining Walls, Section 1804-Foundation

investigation)

- PAGE 12 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



) Sub-section 1804.10 Required Geologic Investigation has been added as
follows pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(1) 1804.10.1 A geologic investigation shall be submitted when
required by Table 145-02A or the Building Official, for all new
structures, non-exempt additions to existing structures or whenever
the occupancy classification of a building changes to a higher
relative hazard category (refer to Table 5-E of the current edition of

the Uniform Code for Building Conservation) as a result of the

proposed work;untessexempted-by-Sectron 1864103 of the
~HformiaBuitdimeCode.

(2) through (4) [No change.]
Table 145-02A

Required Geologic Investigation (5)

- PAGE 13 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



Hazard Category Geologic Renaissance Geologic Investigation (1)

[No change in Table.]

Footnotes for Table 145-02A

Hazard category. The Hazard Category describes the geologic feature or condition suspected at the 1 site. The

Hazard Category is determined by reference to the current City of San Diego Seismic Safety Study (SDSSS) maps.

Building, structure, and facility classes A, B, C and D. 2

A.

Class A includes the following:

1) Essential Facilities as defined in Section 1627 of the +998 2001 California Building Code.

2) [No change.]

Class B includes the following developments, occupancy groups, and structures provided they are not

included in Class A:

1) through 4) [No change.]

5) All buildings with an occupant load of more than 300 persons as determined by Section 6=
22;1003.2.2 and Table 10-A of the +998 2001 California Building Code.

6) through 8) [No change.]

9) Retaining walls (height is measured from the top of the footing to the top of the wall):

a. and b. [No change.]

[No change.]

Class D includes the following occupancy group and structures provided they are not

included in Classes A, B, or C:

1) All buildings containing the following occupancies (refer to 998 2001 California
Building Code, Table 3-A):

a. Group R, Division 3.

Note: No geologic investigations are required for occupancy Group U, Division 1, or any other

structures of a similar minor nature.

- PAGE 14 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



Faults and Fault Zones--Hazard Category 11, 12, and 13. 3
Active and potentially active faults are defined in the most recent edition of "Fault-Rupture Hazard Zones
in California," Special Publication 42, California Department of Conservation, Division of Mines and
Geology, a copy of which is on file at the office of the City Clerk as Document No. 00-17773-4.
Fault zones define the limits within which faults are suspected. Fault zones include the Alquist-Priolo
Earthquake Fault Zones, The Downtown Special Fault Zone, as well as the area 100 feet on both sides of
the fault lines indicated on the current San Diego Seismic Safety Study (SDSSS) maps. Refer to SDSSS
maps for location of faults and fault zones.

Liquefaction Potential--Hazard Category 31 and 32. 4
When an investigation is required, adhere to Section 1804.5 of the +998 2001 California Building Code for
minimum requirements.
Geologic Investigation. An investigation of the geologic condition is required for sites where geologic 5
hazards are suspected, prior to obtaining a Building Permit. The investigation will either consist of a
preliminary study, a geologic reconnaissance, or an in-depth study including field work and analysis, a
geologic investigation. The geologic reconnaissance report and the geologic investigation report shall
include all pertinent requirements as established by the Building Official. All reports shall be prepared in
accordance with the most recent edition of the City of San Diego "Technical Guidelines for Geotechnical
Reports," on file with the City Clerk as Document No. 00-17773-5. These minimum requirements shall be
augmented by geologic evaluations pertinent to the type of proposed project and anticipated method of
construction, which should be described in the report. For buildings located in both a fault zone and a
hazard category zone, the most restrictive requirement shall govern. Notwithstanding Table +8=1=E 145-
02A, the Building Official may require a geologic reconnaissance report or a geologic investigation report

for any site if the Building Official has reason to believe that a geologic hazard may exist at the site.

§145.0204  Local Additions to the Plumbing Systems Requirements of the 1998 2001
California Building Code

(CBC Chapter 29-Plumbing Systems, Section 2902-Number of Fixtures)

- PAGE 15 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§145.0205

Sub-sections 2902.1 General through 2902.6 Group R Occupancies of the 1998
2001 California Building Code have been adopted without change pursuant to
Section 145.0103 of the Land Development Code.

Local Additions to the Construction in the Public Right-of-Way
Requirements of the 1998 2001 California Building Code

(CBC Chapter 32-Construction in the Public Right-of-way, Section 3208-
Entrance Canopies)

Section 3208 ENTRANCE CANOPIES has been added as follows pursuant to
Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code:

3208.1 Definition. [No change.]

3208.2 Encroachment on public property.

No entrance canopy shall be located upon or over public property or rights-of-way
unless approved by the City Engineer.

An entrance canopy over public property shall be removed by the owner within 30
calendar days following notice directing its removal issued by the City.

An entrance canopy shall not extend closer than 2 feet to the curb adjacent to the
building entrance.

The width of an entrance canopy shall not exceed the width of the entrance to a

building by more than 2 feet. The entrance can include the entry door(s) as well as

any window (sidelight) immediately adjacent to the door. However the entrance

canopy shall have a maximum width that does not exceed 12 feet.

[No change to remainder of section. ]

- PAGE 16 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§145.0207

Local Deletions and Additions to the Existing Structures Requirements in the

1998 2001 California Building Code

(CBC Chapter 34-Existing Structures, Section 3403-Additions, Alterations or

Repairs)

(a) Sub-sections 3403.1 General through 3403.4 Glass Replacement of the
1998 2001 California Building Code have been adopted without change
pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land Development Code.

(b) Sub-section 3403.5 Historic Buildings of the 1998 2001 California
Building Code has not been adopted pursuant to Section 145.0104 of the
Land Development Code. Title 24, Part 8, California Code of Regulations
governs restoration of historical buildings.

() [No change.]

3403.6.1 [No change.]

3403.6.2.1 Alternative regulations for "live/work quarters". The conversion of a

building or portion thereof, to live/work quarters shall be considered a

“temporary” use of the building. Only buildings which were originally designed
for industrial or non-residential commercial use may be converted to live/work
quarters. The original occupancy and type of construction designations of the

building shall remain the same as before the conversion. The existing building

need not be brought up to fire resistive standards resulting from the temporary

residential use. However, the use of the building is being changed and for the

safety and convenience of the occupants, residential standards shall be applied as

- PAGE 17 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



stated herein.

The living portion of the live/work gquarters units must meet all the fire and

life-safety requirements of the 2001 California Building Code Building for Group

R Division 1. occupancies.

Conversions work may comply with alternative building regulations approved by

the Building Official. The Building Official shall publish a policy pursuant to the

authority granted in Section 17958.11 of the State Health and Safety Code which

allows the City of San Diego to adopt alternative building regulations in certain

areas of the city for the conversion of commercial or industrial buildings, or

portions thereof, to joint live/work quarters. These provisions shall not be applied

to any building whose original building permit application was filed after January

1. 1983.

3403.6.2.2 ErverWork: Additions to Live/work quarters. The addition of floors in existing

buildings may be permitted if all of the following conditions are met to the satisfaction of the

Building Official:
(1) through (5) [No change.]
§145.0404  Definitions for this Division Only

The following definitions apply to this division:

“Building” through “Date of Service” [No change.]

"Essential Facility" means any building or structure classified in Occupancy

- PAGE 18 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§145.0405

Category I of Table 16-K of the +998 2001 California Building Code adopted by

the City.

“Existing Use or Occupancy” through “Hazard Category” [No change.]

"Hazardous Facility" means any building or structure classified in Occupancy

Category II of Table 16-K of the 1998 California Building Code adopted by the

City.

[No change to remainder of definitions.]

General Regulations for Archaic Materials and Methods of Construction

(a)
(b)

(c)
(d)

(e)

[No change.]

In addition to the requirements set forth in this division, the provisions of
the 1998 2001 California Building Code, Chapter 34, shall also apply to
alterations or additions made to buildings within the scope of this division.
[No change.]

Except as specifically provided for by 1998 2001 California Building
Code, Chapter 34, alterations performed solely to achieve compliance with
the requirements of this division, or the value of such alterations, or both,
shall not subject the owner to compliance with other provisions of the San
Diego Municipal Code, such as Section 142.0610.

For techntcal; matertal;and-destgnrequirementsarchaic material design

values, refer to Sections A103 through A6 A113.6 of the UCBC

- PAGE 19 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



Appendix Chapter I, including all tables and figures.

) [No change.]

(2) Methods of analysis and design, the design values themselves, and the
materials and methods of construction must be in accordance with the
1998 2001 California Building Code as adopted by the City, except as
modified by this division.

(h) [No change.]

§145.0406  Regulations for Essential or Hazardous Facilities

(a) The regulations of this section apply to essential or hazardous facilities,
described as any building or structure within the scope of this division and
classified in Occupancy Category 1 or 2 of Table 16-K of the 1998 2001
California Building Code adopted by the City.

(b) and (c) [No change.]

(d) If the Structural Survey and Engineering Report shows that the building
meets the requirements of the State Historical Building Code, if
applicable, or the 1998 2001 California Building Code as adopted by the
City for new buildings of the same occupancy category, no further action
is required.

(e) and (f) [No change.]

§145.0407  Regulations for Remodels Exceeding 100 Percent of Valuation
(a) The regulations of this section apply to buildings within the scope of this

division that meet the following conditions:

- PAGE 20 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§145.0408

(1) The buildings are not classified in Occupancy Category 1 or 2 of
Table 16-k of the 1998 2001 California Building Code; and

2) [No change.]
(A) through (C) [No change.]

(b) and (c) [No change.]

(d) If the Structural Survey and Engineering Report shows that the building
meets the requirements of the State Historical Building Code, if
applicable, or the 1998 2001 California Building Code as adopted by the
City for new buildings of the same occupancy category, no further action
is required.

(e) and (f) [No change.]

Regulations for Change to a Higher Hazard Category

(a) The regulations of this section apply to buildings within the scope of this
division that (1) are not classified in Occupancy Category 1 or 2 of Table
16-k of the 1998 2001 California Building Code, and (2) if more than 33
percent of the total floor area of the building changes from an Existing Use
or Occupancy to a Higher Hazard category use or occupancy as determined
by Table 145-05A of Section 145.0427, except as provided in
145.0408(b).

(b) through (e) [No change.]

6] If the Structural Survey and Engineering Report shows that the building

meets the requirements of the State Historical Building Code, if

- PAGE 21 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



applicable, or the 1998 2001 California Building Code as adopted by the
City for new buildings of the same occupancy category, no further action
is required.

(g)and (h)  [No change.]

§145.0409  Regulations for Unsafe Buildings Within the Scope of this Division

(a) through (c) [No change.]

(d) If the Structural Survey and Engineering Report shows that the building
meets the requirements of the State Historical Building Code, if
applicable, or the 1998 2001 California Building Code as adopted by the
City for new buildings of the same occupancy category, no further action
is required.

(e) [No change.]

§145.0410  Regulations for Buildings Not Classified as Essential or Hazardous Facilities

(a) The regulations of this section apply to buildings that are within the scope
of this division and are not classified in Occupancy Category 1 or 2 of
Table 16-K of the 1998 2001 California Building Code, and that contain
any parapets and other exterior wall or roof appendages or objects attached
to or located on the roof structure or forming the exterior facade of a
building that meet both of the following criteria:

(1) and (2) [No change.]

(b) through (f) [No change.]

§145.0411  Regulations for Remodels over 50 Percent of Building Value

- PAGE 22 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



§145.0412

§145.0415

§145.0426

(a) The regulations of this section apply to buildings within the scope of this
division that meet the following conditions:

(1) The buildings are not classified in Occupancy Category I or II of
Table 16-k of the 1998 2001 California Building Code; and
2) [No change.]

(b) through (d) [No change.]

Regulations for Historical Buildings Within the Scope of this Division

(a) [No change.]

(b) Allowable stresses for archaic materials not specified in the +998 2001
California Building Code or Table No. A=+=€-A-1-E of the UCBC
Appendix Chapter 1 may be based on substantiating research data or
engineering judgement subject to the Building Official's satisfaction.

(c) and (d) [No change.]

Contents of Order to Comply

The order shall reference this division which references Sections A103 - AH6

A113.6 of Chapter 1 of the UCBC, which set forth the owner's alternatives and

time limits for compliance. The order shall specify that the Building Official has

determined that the building is within the scope of this division and one of the
following conditions applies:

(a) through (d) [No change.]

Alternate Materials, Designs, and Methods of Construction

(a) Methods of analysis and design, the design values themselves, and the

- PAGE 23 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



materials and methods of construction must be in accordance with the
1998 2001 California Building Code, as adopted by the City, except as

modified by this division.

(b) through (d) [No change.]
WWW:cdk
07/22/02
Or.Dept:Dev.Svcs.
0-2003-

- PAGE 24 OF 24 - DRAFT 7/22/02



