
390 í 9 -3-é

(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

ORDINANCE NUMBER 0-

 

2

1

9

8

9

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE JUL 232025

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 113.0103; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 125.0431

AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY

AMENDING SECTION 131.0322; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY RETITLING AND AMENDING

SECTION 141.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 8 BY AMENDING SECTION 143,0815; AND

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 5 BY

AMENDING SECTION 144.0501, RELATING TO THE

AMENDMENT TO THE ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT AND

JUNIOR ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT REGULATIONS.

RECITALS

The Council of the City of San Diego (Council) adopts this Ordinance based on the following:

A. California Government Code sections 66310 through 66342 (State ADU Law)

require a local agency to either adopt an ordinance that permits state-required Accessory

Dwelling Units (ADU) and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units (JADU) by ministerial approval in

accordance with specified standards and conditions or approve applications for state-required

ADUs ministerially if a local ordinance is not adopted.

B. By Ordinance 0-21254, the Council adopted an Accessory Dwelling Unit (ADU)

Bonus Program, establishing a program to incentivize and promote the creation of accessory

dwelling units that can be offered at affordable rent for very, low-, or moderate-income

households.

C. On October 11,2023, the California Governor approved Assembly Bill 434

(Grayson, 2023), which modified Government Code section 65585 to require enforcement of

-PAGE 1 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

State ADU Law in local agency regulations by California Department of Housing and

Community Development (HCD).

E. On October 30,2024, the City received comments from HCD, which included

revisions to the City's ADU regulations needed to align with State ADU Law. The

comments addressed maximum ADU size, applicable zones, fire sprinklers, ADU

conversions, number of ADUs allowed on a lot, landscaping, floor area ratios, side yard

setbacks, replacement parking and JADU owner-occupancy requirements.

F. On March 4,2025, the Council requested that the City Planning Department

return to Council within 90 days with an ordinance to remove the applicability of RS-1-1,

RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-1-9, RS-1-10, and RS-1-11 base zones from the ADU

Density Bonus Program and bring forward additional revisions to the ADU Density Bonus

Program outlined in the City Planning Department's February 28,2025, memorandum to the

Land Use and Housing Committee.

G. The City Planning Department has prepared the ADU and JADU Regulation

Amendments to the San Diego Municipal Code and Local Coastal Program Amendment,

which proposes to comprehensively address concerns raised with respect to the ADU Home

Density Bonus Program, as well as to make other revisions to the City's ADU regulations

necessary to address HCD comments and align with State ADU Law, as well as to allow for

the separate sale of ADU homes as allowed by Assembly Bill 1033.

H. The California Building Standards Code (Title 24) authorizes local agencies to

enforce fire and life safety requirements where necessary to protect public health and safety,

including requirements related to fire separation, defensible space, and structure placement,

particularly in areas with elevated wildfire risk. This Ordinance requires ADU homes located

within High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to maintain a minimum four-foot interior

-PAGE 2 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(CO

R. COPY)

side and rear yard setback to provide adequate defensible space between all structures on the

premises and adjacent native or naturalized vegetation, and ensures authority for the Fire Code

Official to require greater interior side or rear yard setbacks when necessary to ensure

compliance with the California Fir Code and to address specific site conditions related to fire

safety. This change is also intended to provide certainty for applicants at the beginning ofthe

development process.

I. 

Government Code section 51182 requires the creation of an ember-resistant zone

within five feet of a structure located in Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, recognizing that

combustible materials within the immediate five feet of a structure contribute to the greatest risk

of embers directly or indirectly igniting the home. In addition, Assembly Bill 3074, approved by

the Governor in 2020, directs the State Board of Forestry to adopt regulations known as

"Zone 0", which will require an ember-resistance zone within five feet of structures in

California's highest fire severity zones.

J. 

The ADU Home Density Bonus Program currently applies in all zones that allow

residential uses, which ca result in ADU developments constructed through this program that

can be out of scale with the surrounding neighborhood. This Ordinance prohibits the application

ofthe ADU Home Density Bonus Program in the following residential zones

: RS1-1, RS1-2,

RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-1-9, RS-1-10, and RS-1-11, unless the portion of the premises

proposed for development is located in an area identified as a High or Highest High or Highest

California Tax Credit Allocation Committee (CTCAC) Opportunity Area at the time the

development application is deemed complete and is in an area identified as residential in a land

use plan. These zones have a minimum lot size requirement of 10,000 square feet or greater with

the purpose ofproviding development regulations to implement land use plan designations with

very low densities and were not intended to be developed with significant new densities absent

-PAGE 3 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

further rezoning actions. In addition, this provision affirmatively furthers fair housing by

ensuring that neighborhoods with the greatest access to economic opportunity remain eligible for

the ADU Home Density Bonus Program.

K. The ADU Bonus Program does not currently include requirements related to

emergency evacuation in High and Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones. This Ordinance

requires lots otherwise eligible for the ADU Home Density Bonus Program in High or Very

High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to be on an improved public street with at least two evacuation

routes, and prohibits the program on lots in High and Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones that

front a cul-de-sac or have only one point of ingress or egress in order to better ensure adequate

emergency access and evacuation safety for ADU homes permitted under the Program.

L. The ADU Bonus Program does not have requirements to determine the

developable area on single family zoned lots to ensure the development is appropriately scaled to

the surrounding area, and there are instances where larger developable lots or lots that contain

undevelopable environmentally sensitive lands can lead to development that was not consistent

with the purpose of the lower density zones under the existing program. This Ordinance requires

ADU Home Density Bonus Program projects on lots that only permit single family homes and

exceed the minimum base zone lot size to have their floor area ratio (FAR) capped at 8,000

square feet, and if the lot contains environmentally sensitive lands, the FAR would be calculated

using only the portion ofthe lot that does not contain environmentally sensitive lands, using a

maximum lot area of 8,000 square feet. In addition, this Ordinance sets a maximum ADU cap

based on the lot square footage. This requirement is intended to ensure ADU development is

similar in scale to the surrounding neighborhood.

M. This Ordinance increases the penalty for violations of the deed restriction on

affordable ADU homes permitted under the ADU Home Density Bonus Program to ensure the

-PAGE 4 OF 38-



-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

homes remain available to qualifying households, aligning with the program's intent of

increasing affordable housing opportunities.

N. ADUs permitted through the ADU Home Density Bonus Program should-in

exchange for the allowance of additional ADUs - contribute toward neighborhood

enhancements. This Ordinance requires applicants opting into the ADU Home Density Bonus

Program to pay an ADU Home Density Bonus Program Community Enhancement Fee for all

affordable and bonus ADUs under 750 square feet to be eligible for this opt-in bonus program.

O. 

The Office of the City Attorney prepared this Ordinance based on the information

provided by City staff (including information provided by affected third parties and verified by

City staff), with the understanding that this information is complete and accurate.

ACTION ITEMS

Be it ordained by the Council of the City of Sar Diego:

Section 1.

 

Chapter 11, Article 3, Division 1 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 113.0103, to read as follows:

§113.0103

 

Definitions

Abuttingproperty through Accesso building [No change in text,]

Accessoy Dweling Unit (AD) means an attached or detached residential

dweing unit that provides complete independent living facilities for one or more

persons including permanent provisions for living, sleeping, eating, cooking, and

sanitation, and is located on the samepremises as the proposed or existing single

dwelling unit or multiple dwelling unit.

Accessoy structure through Suce Mining [No change in text.]

Sustainable Development Area means the area within a defined walking distance

along a pedestrian path of travel using sidewalks from a mior transit stop that is

-PAGE 5 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

existing or planned, if the planned major transit stop is included in a

transportation improvement program or applicable regional transportation plan, as

follows:

(a) 

[N

o change in text.I

(b) Within Mobility Zone 4, as defined in Section 143.1103, the defined

walking distance is 0.75 mile.

e) [No change in text.]

In addition, an adopted specific plan prepared in accordance with Section

122.0107(a), shall be within the Sustainable Deveopment rea if the Sustainable

Development Area is within a portion of the adopted specific plan.

Targetpopulation through Yard [No change in text.I

Section 2. 

Chapter 12, Article 5, Division 4 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 125.0431, to read as follows:

§125.0431

 

Additional Notice for a Condominium Conversion Map

(a) For a tentative map for a condominium conversion project, the subdivider

shall provide the following notices in addition to the notice provided for in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice):

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Notice to each person applying for the rental of a dwelling unit or

Accessory Dweling Unit in the proposed project required in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice) and Subdivision Map Act

section 66452.17;

(3) through (5) [No change in text.]

(b) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 6 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Section 3.

 

Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 3 ofthe San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 131.0322, to read as follows:

§131.0322

 

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

The uses allowed in the agricultural zones are shown in Table 131.03B.

Legend for Table 131-03B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-03B

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

[See Section 131.0112 for an explanation and

descriptions of the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and Separately Regulated

Uses]

Zone 

Zones

Designator

1 st & 2nd AG

 AR

>>

3rd >> 1- 1-

4th» 1 2 1 2

Open Space through Residential, Separately Regulated

Residential Uses, Interim Ground Floor Residential [No

change in text.]

Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

[No change in text.]

L 

[N

o change

in text.]

Residential, Separately Regulated Residential Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately Regulated

Signs Use, Theater Marquees [No change in text._1

[No change in text..1

Footnotes for Table 131-03B

 through 13 [No change in text.]

Section 4.

 

Chapter 14, Article 1, Division 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 141.0302, to read as follows:

§141.0302

 

Accessory Dwelling Units (ADUs) and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

(JADUs)

Accessory Dwelling Units (DUs and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units (ADUs

are permitted as a limited use decided in accordance with Process One, indicated

-PAGE 7 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

with an"L" in the Use Regulations Tables in Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones),

subject to the following regulations.

(a) Regulations for ADUs and ADUs.

(1) Guest Quarters. Guest quarters and non-habitable accesso

structures shall be permitted in addition to ADUs and JADUs, if

permitted by the base zone.

(2) Development Impact Fees. Development Impact Fees for ADUs

and JDUs shall be paid in accordance with Section 142,0640(b),

(3) Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Regulations. An ADUor

JDUshall not be permitted to be constructed on anypremises

that has utilized the provisions of Chapter 14, Article 3, Division

13, Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban.Lot Split Regulations for

Single Family Zones, except as provided in Section

143.1305(c)(1).

(4) Previously Conforming. Construction of an ADU or JAD U shall

not require correction ofpreviously conforming conditions on the

p

rem

ises.

(5) Conversion. An ADUor JADUthat is converted from an existing

dweing unit or accesso structure, or is constructed in the same

location and within the same building envelope as an existing

dweüing unit or accesso structure, may continue to observe the

same setbacks as the xistig dwelling unit or accessory structure

and they shall not be subject to the setback requirements in Section

141.0302(b)(9).

-PAGE 8 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(6) 

Fire Sprinklers.

(A) 

An AD Uor JD U shall not be required to provide

automatic fire sprinklers if they are not required for the

primary dwelling unit.

(B) An ADUor JADU shall be required to provide an automatic

fire sprinkler system when located on apremises where the

primary dwelling unit is protected with an automatic fire

sprinkler system in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

(C) The construction of a detached AD U shall not trigger a

requirement for automatic fire sprinklers to be installed in

the existing primary dweling unit or mutpe dweing unit

unless required in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

(7) 

Within the Coastal Overlay Zone.

(A) An existing strucmre may only be converted or

reconstructed as an ADUor JADUifthe structure

conforms to all the following regulations:

(i) The wetland regulations in Section 143.0141(b);

(ii) The sensitive coastal blu regulations in Section

143.0143;

(iii)

 

The coastal beaches regulations in Section

143.0144; and

-PAGE 9 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(iv) The Supplemental Regulations ofthe Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

(B) ADUs or JADUs constructed within areas of future sea

level rise shall comply with the regulations in Section

132.0404.

(C) ADUs or JDUs shall comply with all the following

regulations:

(i) The wetland regulations in Section 143.0141(b);

(ii) The sensitive coastal bl regulations in Section

143.0143;

(iii)

 

The coastal beaches regulations in Section

143.0144; and

(iv) The Supplemental Regulations ofthe Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

(8) 

An DUshall notbeused for a rental term of less than 31

consecutive days. JADUs are not subject to rental term limitations.

(b) 

DUDevelopment Regulations.

(1) On apremises with an existing or proposed single dweling unit,

the following is permitted:

(A) One AD Uthat is within an existing or proposed single

dwelling unit or within an existing accessory structure,

subject to the following:

(i) 

Construction of the ADUmay expand the gross

floor area of an existing accessory structure up to

-PAGE 10 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

150 square feet to only allow for ingress and egress;

and

(ii) The AD Ushall have a separate exterior entry from

the single dwelling unit.

(B) One attached or detached ADU

(2) The maximum number ofADUs on apremises with a proposed

multle dwelling unit structure shall not exceed two detached

ADUs.

(3) On apremises with an existing multple dweUing unit structure, the

following applies:

(A) The maximum number ofADUs that may be permitted

within the existing non-livable space of an existing multiple

dweUing unit structure shall not exceed 25 percent of the

total number of multple dwelling units in the structure. The

minimum number ofADUs that may be permitted within the

non-livable space ofthe existing structure is one. For

example, non-livable space includes, but is not limited to,

storage rooms, boiler rooms, passageways, atties, basements,

or garages; and

(B) A maximum of eight detached ADUs maybe permitted on

thepremises, provided that the number of detached ADUs

shall not exceed the number of existing multipe dwelling

units in the multiple dweting unit structure.

-PAGE 11 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(4) In accordance with Government Code section 66321(b)(3), one

attached or detached D U with a grossßoor area of 800 square

feet or less may be permitted in accordance with Sections

141.0302(a)(1)-(a)(3), provided that the development results in no

more than one attached or detached ADUon thepremises. The

ADU shall not be subject to maximum lot coverage, maximum

floor area ratio, a front yard setback, and minimum open. space

requirements of the underlying base zone.

(5) Lot Size. A minimum lot size is not required for the construction

of an ADU.

(6) Density. ADU arenotsubjecttothedensitylimitations ofthebase

zone for thepremises.

(7 Gross Floor Area.

(A) The grossfloor area of an ADU shall not be less than 150

square feet.

(B) The grossßoor area of an attached or detached ADU shall

not exceed 1,200 square feet.

(C) An ADUconstructed within an existing or proposed single

dwelling unit structure shall not have a maximum gross

floor area requirement.

(D) An AD U constructed within an existing accessory structure

on a single dweing unit lot shall not have a maximum

gross#oor area requirement and may construct an

-PAGE 12 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

additional 150 square feet to only allow for ingress and

egress.

(E) ADUs constructed within an existing multiple dwelling unit

structure shll notbve a maximum gross floor area

requirement.

) 

e gross oor area of an ADUshall be included in the

floor area ratio for the premises.

(8) 

Height.

(A) On lots that permit single dwelling unit development but

not multiple dwelling unit development, detahed ADU

structures shll not exceed wo stories.

(B) On lots that permit single dwelling unit development but not

multiple dweling unit development, ADUs attached to an'

existing accessory structure shall not exceed two stories.

(C) ADUs shall comply with the overall maximum structure

height of the underlying base zone and overlay zone.

(9) Setbacks.

(A) The frontyard setback of an AD U shall be consistent with

the base zone.

(B) The minimum street side yard setback of an ADU shall be

4 feet or the minimum street sideyard setback of the base

zone, whichever is less.

-PAGE 13 OF 38-



-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(Ç) Inteñor side yard and rear yard setbacks for ADU

structures with a structure height of 16 feet or less shall be

provided as follows:

(i) For AD U structures located on apremises outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone,

there is no minimum interior side yard and rear

yard setbacb, except that the Fire Code Official

may require a greater setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01, and

the International Fire Code (IFC), including section

504.1.

(ii) For AD U structures located on apremises within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side yard and rear yard setbacks

shall be 4 feet to provide defensible space between

all structures on thepremises and contiguous areas

of native or naturalized vegetation, except that the

Fire Code Official may require a greater setback to

ensure compliance with the California Fire Code,

California Code of Regulations (CCR), Title 14,

Section 1276.01, and the International Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

-PAGE 14 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV,)

(COR. COPY)

(D) Inteñor side yard and rear yard setbacks for ADU

structures with a structure height that exceeds 16 feet shall

be provided as follows:

(i) 

For ADUstructures located on apremises outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone,

there is no minimum interior side yard and rear

yard setbacks, except that the Fire Code Official

may require a greater setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code. However, if the side

or eø property line abuts nother premises thalis

residentially zoned or developed with exclusively

residential uses, the minimum interior side yard and

rear yard setbacks shall be 4 feet or the minimum

setback of the applicable base zone, whichever is

less, except that the Fire Code Official may require

a greater setback to ensure compliance with the

California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01, and

the International Fire Code (IFC), including section

504.1.

(ii) 

For ADUstructures located on apremises within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side yard and rear yard setbacks

shall be 4 feet to provide defensible space between

-PAGE 15 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

all structures on the premises and any contiguous

areas of native or naturalized vegetation or as

otherwise required, except that the Fire Code

Official may require a greater setback to ensure

compliance with the California Fire Code,

California Code of Regulations (CCR), Title 14,

Section 1276.01, and the International Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

(10)

 

Parking.

(A) No on-street parking spaces or oßstreetparking spaces are

required forADUs, except as specified in Section

141.0302(b)(10)(B).

(B) When an ADUis proposed on apremises located both

within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking Impact

Overlay Zone and outside of a transitpriori area, one

ý-streetparking space located consistent with Section

141.0302(b)(10)(D) shall be required per ADU, unless any

of the following apply:

(i) The ADUis 500 square feet or less;

\ Th premises is locate wiimahistorical district

tha is a designated historical resource·,

(iii)

 

The ADU is attached to the proposed or existing

primary dwelling unit or accessory structre,·

-PAGE 16 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(iv)

 

The premises is located within a residential permit

parking district; or

(v) 

There is a car share vehicle located within one

block 

oftñepremises.

(C) When a garage, carport, or covered parking structure is

demolished in conjunction with the construction of an

DU, or converted to an AD replacement of those o-

street parking spaces is not requireåunless the premises s

located within the Beach Impact Area ofthe Parking

Impact Overlay Zone and outside of the transitpriority

area, in which case parking shall be replaced in a location

consistent with Section 141.0302(b)(10)(D).

(D) When an uncovered parking space is demolished in

conjunction with the construction of an ADU, or converted

to an ADU, replacement of those off-street parking

spaces is not required.

(E) Ifoý-streetparking spaces are required in accordance with

Section 141.0302(b)(10)(B) or 141.0302(b)(10)(C), or if

the applicant hooses to provide ojf-street parking spaces

for ADUs located on thepremises, the following applies:

(i) *streetparking spaces may be located within the

setback areas, and may include tandem spaces or

mechanical lifts; and

-PAGE 17 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(ii) 

street parking spaces shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the

minimum standards and guidelines to provide safe

and efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

ýstreetparking spaces may not encroach into the

pubic right-of-way.

(F) Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4), if the construction

of an D U causes an existing driveway curb cut to no

longer comply with the minimum ostreetparking spaces

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(11) The record owner is not required to live on the samepremises of

anADU.

(c) Development Regulations for JADUs.

(1) On apremises with an existing or proposed single dwelling unit,

one JADUis permitted, subject to the following:

(A) The JAD U shall be within an existing or proposed single

dweüing unit or attached garage;

(B) Construction of the JAD U may expand the floor area ofthe

existing single dweling unit up to 150 square feet to only

allow for ingress and egress;

(C) The JAD U shall have a separate exterior entry from the

existing or proposed single dweling unit;

-PAGE 18 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(D) The JADUmay not be sold or conveyed separately from

the primary dwelling unit;

(E) The record owner of the primary dwelling unit shall reside

in the single dwelling unit or JADU·, and

(F) Before a Building Permit may be issued for a JAD U the

record ownr shall enter into an agreement with the City in

a form that is approved by the City Attorney that includes

the following provisions:

(i) The.LDUmay not be soldor conveyed separately

from the primary dweüing unit;

(ii) The agreement may be enforced against future

purchasers;

(iii)

 

The record owner shall reside on thepremises;

(iv) The agreement shall be recorded in the Office ofthe

County Recorder of San Diego County; and

(v) The agreement shall run with the land for the life of

the JAD U.

(G) Government agencies, land trusts, and qualified housing

organizations are exempt from Section 141.0302(c)(1)(E)

and Section 141.0302(e)(1)(F).

(2) Lot Size. JDUs are not subject to a minimum lot size,

(3) Densip. JADUs are not subject to the densi limitations for the

premises.

ð Gross Floor Area.

-PAGE 19 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) The grossfloor area of a JADU shall not be included in the

foor area ratio for the premises.

(B) A JAD U shall not be less than 150 square feet and shall not

exceed 500 square feet within an existing or proposed

single dwelling unit.

(5) Exterior Entry. A JADU shall have a separate exterior entry from

the primary dweing unit.

(6) Kitchen. A JDU shall include the following:

(A) A cooking facility with appliances;

(B) A food preparation counter of a reasonable size in relation

to the size of the JADU; and

(C) Storage cabinets that are of a reasonable size in relation to

the size of the JADU.

(7) Parking,

 No on-seet parkìng spaces or ff-street parking spaces e

required for a JADU

(B) When an attached garage is converted to a JADU,

replacement of those ý-streetparking spaces is not

required unless thepremises is located within the Beach

Impact Area of the Parking Impact Overlay Zone and

outside of a transitpríority area, in which case parking

shall be replaced in a location consistent with Section

141.0302(c)(7)(C).

-PAGE 20 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(C) 

If oý-street parking spaces are required in accordance with

Section 141.0302(c)(7)(B) or if the applicant chooses to

provide off-street parking spaces for JADUs loced on the

premises, the following applies:

(i) Oýstreetparking spaces may be located within the

setback areas, and may include tandem spaces or

mechanical lifts; and

(ii) 

éT-streetparking spaces shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the

minimum standards and guidelines to provide safe

and efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

Ojf-street parking spaces may not enroañ into the

public right-°f-way.

(D) Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4), ifthe construction

of a JDU causes an existing driveway curb cut to no

longer comply with the minimum street parking space

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(d) ADUHome Density Bonus. In addition to the AD Us and JAD Us permitted

under Sections 141.0302(b) and 141.0302(c), additional bonus ADUs and

affordable ADUs shall be permitted subject to the following:

(1) Location Requirements.

-PAGE 21 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) The portion of thepremises proposed for development may

not be within the following base zones: RS-1-1, RS-1-2,

RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8, RS-1-9, RS-1-10, or RS-1-11,

unless the following apply:

(i) Thepremises is in an area identified as a High or

Highest California Tax Credit Allocation

Committee (CTCAC) Opportunity Area when the

development application is deemed complete; and

(ii) Thepremises is identified as Residential in a land

use plan.

( n a premises withn the Sustainable Development Area,

one additional bonus D U shall be permitted for every

additional affordable ADU

(C) On apremises outside of the Sustainable Development

Area, a maximum of one bonus DU and one affordable

AD U shall be permitted.

(D) When apremises is located in more than one base zone,

only the portion of thepremises that meets the

requirements of Section 141.0302(d)(1)(A) shall be eligible

for bonus ADUs and affordableADUs as specified in

Sections 141.0302(d)(1)(B) or 141.0302(d)(1)(C).

(2) Lot Requirements.

(A) Within High and Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones,

the applicant shall demonstrate that the lot fronts an

-PAGE 22 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

improved public street with at least two evacuation routes

to the satisfaction of the Fire Code Official; and

(B) Within High and Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones,

the lot shall not front a cul-de-sac or be located on a

premises that only has one point ofingress or egress.

(3 

Floor Area Ratio.

(A) Within a base zone that permits single dweUing unit

developments but ot multiple dwelling unit developments,

the maximumfloor area ratio shall be determined as

follows.·

ì) Where the lot contains environmentally sensitive

lands, the maximum permittedßoor area ratio shall

be determined using only the area of the lot that

does not contain environmentay sensitive lands;

(ii) In no case shall the maximum permitted#oor area

ratio be determined using more than 8,000 square

feet for the lot area; and

(iii)

 

For the RS-1-1, RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-5,

RS-1-6, RS-1-7 base zones, the applicableßoor

area ratio shall be determined in accordance with

Table 131-04J using the adjusted lot area as

described in Sections 141.0302(d)(3)(A)(i) and

141.0302(d)(3)(A)(ii).

-PAGE 23 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(B) Within a base zone that permits mutiple dweling unit

developments here the lot contains environmentally

sensitive lands, the maximum permittedßoor area ratio

shall be determined by using the area of the lot that does

ot contain environmentally sensitive lands.

(4)

 

Total Maximum number of permitted DUs and JADUs on single

dweing unit lots. The total maximum number ofADUs and

JADUs that may be permitted on a lot within a base zone that

permits single dwelling unit developmentbut not multiple dwelling

unit development, shall be based on the lot area in accordance with

Table 141-03A. If the lot contains environmentally sensitive lands,

the lot area shall be determined using the area of the lot that does

not contain environmentay sensitive lands.

Table 141-03A

Maximum Number of Permitted DUs and JDUs on Single

Dwe!!ing Unit Lots

Lot Area

 

Maximum Number ofDUs

(square feet)

 and JD Us

8,000 or less 4

8,001 to 10,000 

5

10,001 or greater 6

1 The maximum number ofADUs and JADUs is inclusive of the total

number ofADUs and JADUs that are permitted in accordance with

Section 141.0302.

(5) Fire Sprinklers. All affordable DUs and bonus ADUs in the

development shall include an automatic fire sprinkler system in

accordance with the California Building Standards Code.

-PAGE 24 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(6) Minimum Required O

treet Parking paces. One Oýstreet

parking space shall be required for each affordable ADUand

bonus ADU located outside of a transitpriority area.

(7) Landscape Requirements. Two trees shall be provided on the

premises for every 5,000 square feet of lot area, with a minimum

of one tree per premises. Ifplanting of a new tree is required to

comply with this Section, the tree shall be selected in accordance

with the Landscape Standards of the Land Development Manual

and the City's Street Tree Selection Guide. If thepremises is

located in the OR Zone, the lot area used to determine the tree

requirement shall be based on the allowable development area as

described in Section 131.0250. If thepremises contains

environmentaüy sensitive lands, the lot area used to determine the

tree requirement shall be based on the allowable development area

as described in Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 1.

(8) ADUHome Density Bonus Agreement. The affordable AD Us shall

be guaranteed through a written agreement and a deed of trust

securing the agreement, entered into by the applicant and President

and Chief Executive Officer of the San Diego Housing

Commission, or their designee, prior to the issuance of 

a Building

Permit for the first affordable ADU or bonus ADU, whichever

occurs first, that meets the following requirements:

(A) A rental affordable ADUhome density bonus

agreement shall utilize the following qualifying criteria:

-PAGE 25 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV,)

(COR. COPY)

(i) 

e Low Income ADU Home Densi Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable AD Uon thepremises that is set aside as

affordable to very low income households for a

period ofnot less than 10 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percent of 50 percent of the area

median income as adjusted for household size;

(ii) Low Income ADUHome Density Bonus. One

additional bous ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable DUon thepremises that is set aside as

affordable to ow income households for a period of

not less than 10 years at a rent that does not exceed

30 percent of 60 percent of the area median income

as adjusted for household size;

(

i

i

i

)

 

Moderate Income ADU Home Densi Bonus. One

additional bonus ADU shall be permitted for every

affordable ADUon thepremises that is set aside as

affordable to moderate income households for a

period of not less than 15 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percent of 110 percent of the area

median income as adjusted for household size; and

(iv)

 

The very low income, low income, nd moderate

income affordable ADUs shall be comparable in

-PAGE 26 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

bedroom mix and amenities to the bonus ADUs in

the development.

(B) 

Violations. If the terms ofthe rental affordable ADUhome

density bonus agreement are violated by the appicant the

applicant shall be liable for a minimum penalty of $10,000

per ADUper month, in addition to any fines outlined in the

rental affordable ADUhome density bonus agreement with

the San Diego Housing Commission.

(9) ADUHome Density Bonus Program Community Enhancement

Fee. The applicant shall pay an ADUHome Density Bonus

Program Community Enhancement Fee as established by San

Diego Resolution, calculated based on the grossßoor area of the

affordable ADUs and bonus ADUs, except that the grossßoor area

of any affordable DU that meet all the following shall not be

included in the calculation:

(A) The affordable ADUis deed restricted to vey low income

or low income households in accordance with Section

141.0302(d)(8)(A)(i) or 141.0302(d)(8)(A)(ii); and

(B) Thepremises is located in an area identified as a High or

Very High Resource California Tax Credit Allocation

Committee (CTCAC) Opportunity Area when the

development application is deemed complete.

(e) 

DUBonus for Accessible ADUs. For development utilizing the ADU

Home Density Bonus Program in accordance with Section 141.0302(d), a

-PAGE 27 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

maximum of one additional accessible ADU shall be permitted if the

development includes:

(1) Atleast two ADUs that are affordable to very low income, low

income, or moderate income households; and

(2) The accessible ADUmeets the following:

(A) Accessibility requirements in Chapter 11A of the California

Building Code, including at least one accessible bathroom,

one accessible kitchen, and one accessible bedroom;

(B) The accessible DU shall be located on an accessible route,

as defined by the California Building Code; and

(C) The accessible D U shall be comparable in bedroom mix

and amenities to the bonus ADUs in the development.

(f) Sale or Conveyance ofADUs. New or existing DUs may be converted

into condominiums and shall be sold or otherwise conveyed separately

from the primary residence in accordance with this Section or pursuant to

Section 141.0302(g) and subject to all the following:

(1) Allstructures and buildings included as part of a condominium

development shall conform to the requirements applicable to the

base zone or planned district in which the development is located.

Designation of individual condominium units shall not be deemed

to reduce or eliminate any of the base zone or planned district

requirements applicable to the buildings or structures. Unless

otherwise allowed for ADUs pursuant to Section 141.0302(b);

-PAGE 28 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(A) 

The condominium subdívision shall be created pursuant to

the Davis-Stirling Common Interest Development Act

(Part 5 (commencing with section 4000) of Division 4 of

the California Civil Code);

(B) The condominium subdivision shall be created in

conformance with the Subdivision Map Act (Division 2

(commencing with California Government Code section

66410));

(C) Neither a subdivision map nor a condominium plan shall be

recorded without each lienholder's written consent, The

following shall apply to the consent of a lienholder:

(i) A lienholder may refuse to give written consent; or

(ii) A lienholder may consent provided that any terms

and conditions required by the lienholder are

satisfied;

(D) Prior to recordation of the initial or any subsequent

modifications to the condominium plan, written evidence of

the lienholder's consent shall be provided to the Office of

the County Recorder of San Diego County along with a

signed statement from each lienholder that states the

following: "(Name of lienholder) hereby consents to the

recording of this condominium plan in their sole and

absolute discretion and the borrower has or will satisfy any

additional terms and conditions the lienholder may have.";

-PAGE 29 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(E) The lienholder' s written consent shall be included on the

condominium plan, or attached to the condominium plan

that includes the following information:

(i) The lienholder' s signature;

(ii) 

The name of the record owner or ground lessee;

(iii)

 

The legal description ofthe real property;

(iv) The identities of all parties with an interest in the

real property as reflected in the real property

records; and

v) The lienholder's written consent shall be recorded

in the Office of the County Recorder of San Diego

County.

(2) The condominium development shall be subject to the Subdivision

requirements in Chapter 12, Article 5.

(3) The condominium development shall be subject to the

Condominium Conversion Regulations in Chapter 14, Article 4,

Division 5 if any of the DUs in the development were occupied.

(4) If an ADUis established as a condominium, the appicant shall

notify providers of utilities, including water, sewer, gas, and

electricity, of the condominium creation and separate conveyance.

(5) The condominium deveopment shall be located on a single parcel

or lot that was previously mapped and monumented in a manner

satisfactory to the City Engineer in accordance with Subdivision

Map Act Section 66428(b).

-PAGE 30 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(6) For a minimum period of 30 days from the date anADU that is

established as a condominium is first listed for sale, the record

owner shall offer theDUthrough at least two publicly accessible

real estate websites or databases with a disclosure stating that the

ADUis being offered for at least 30 days to buyers intending to use

the ADU as their primary residence.

(7) AD Us that have received financing or other forms of assistance

from the San Diego Housing Commission shall not be converted

into condominiums and shall not be sold or otherwise conveyed

separately from the primary residence during the term specified in

the deed restriction agreement.

(8) Rental DUs that are rent restricted by law or covenant to

persons and families of ve low income, low income, or

moderate income shall not be converted into condominiums and

shall not be sold or otherwise conveyed separately from the

primary residence for the duration of the deed restriction or

affordability covenant term.

(g) Sale or Conveyance of an ADUby a nonprofit corporation.

(1) An ADUmay be sold or conveyed separately from the primary

dwelüng unit by a qualified nonprofit corporation.

(2) For the purpose of Section 141.0302(g), a qualified nonprofit

corporation means a nonprofit corporation organized pursuant to

Section 501(«3) of the Internal Revenue Code that has received a

welfare exemption under the California Revenue and Taxation

-PAGE 31 OF 38-



-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

Code section 214.15 for properties intended to be sold to

low-income families who participate in a special no-interest loan

program.

(3) 

For an ADU tobesold or conveyed separately from the primary

dweUing unit by a qualified nonprofit corporation, the following

shall apply:

(A) There is an enforceable restriction on the use of the

premises on which theADUis located pursuant to a

recorded agreement between the qualified buyer and the

qualified nonprofit corporation. For the purposes of Section

141.0302(g)(3)(A), a qualified buyer means very low

income, low income, median income, or moderate income

households, as specified below:

(i) 

Fep low income ADUs shall be affordable to very

low income households at an affordable housing

cost that does not exceed 3 0 percent of 50 percent

of the area median income, as adjusted for

household size, appropriate for the ADM;

(i Low income DUs shall be affordable to low

income households at an affordable housing cost

that does not exceed 30 percent of 70 percent of the

area median income, as adjusted for household size,

appropriate for the AD;

-PAGE 32 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(

i

i

i

)

 

Moderate income DUs shall be affordable to

moderate income households at a housing cost that

does not exceed 35 oflr percent of the area

median income, as adjusted for household size,

appropriate for the ADU

(B) The lot where the ADUis located is held pursuant to a

recorded tenancy in common agreement that includes:

(i) An allocation to each qualified buyer of an

undivided, unequal interest in the lot based on the

size of theD Ueach qualified buyer occupies;

(ii) A repurchase option that requires the qualified

buyer to first offer the qualified nonprofit

corporation to buy the property if the buyer desires

to sell or convey the property;

(iii)

 

A requirement that the qualified buyer occupy the

property as the qualified buyer's principal

residence; and

(iv) Affordability restrictions on the sale and

conveyance ofthe property that ensure the property

will be preserved for very low income, low income,

median income, or moderate income households for

45 years for owner-occupied housing and will be

sold or resold to a qualified buyer.

-PAGE 33 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

(C) A grant deed naming the grantor, grantee, and describing

the property interests being transferred shall be recorded in

the Office of the Recorder in San Diego County.

(D) A Preliminary Change of Ownership Report shall be filed

concurrently with the grant deed pursuant to the California

Revenue and Taxation Code section 480.3,

(E) If requested by a utility providing service to the primary

residence, the ADUhas a separate water, sewer, or

electrical connection to that utility.

Section 5.

 

Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 8 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 143.0815, to read as follows:

§143.0815

 

When Coastal Overlay Zone Affordable Housing Replacement Regulations

Apply

(a) [No change in text.

(b) The following development types shall be reviewed for compliance with

the regulations in this Division:

(1) Conversion from rental units or Accessoy Dwellíng Units to

condominium units (cooperative or similar form of ownership);

(2) through (3) [No change in text.]

(c) 

[No change in text.]

Section 6.

 

Chapter 14, Article 4, Division 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 144.0501, to read as follows:

§144.0501

 

Purpose of Condominium Conversion Regulations

-PAGE 34 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR

. COPY

)

The purpose of the Condominium Conversion Regulations is to allow the

conversion of apartments and Accessory Dwelling Units to condominiums while

protecting the interests o f tenants by requiring that tenants receive adequate notice

of proposed condominium conversions, are advised of their rights with respect to

the conversion of their apartment or Accessory Dweling Unit to a condominium,

and are afforded reasonable relocation assistance. It is also the intent of these

regulations to protect the interests of the community and prospective purchasers

by requiring the applicant to provide certain information regarding the condition

of the structure and to require reasonable improvements for the health, safety, and

general welfare of the public.

Section 7.

 

The Council dispenses with a full reading ofthis Ordinance before its

passage because a written copy of this Ordinance was made available to the Council and the

public before the date of its passage.

Section 8.

 

Ordinances O-21758 (Jan. 16,2024) and O-21836 (July 22,2024)

were considered by the Council and may amend San Diego Municipal Code sections also

amended by this Ordinance. Ordinances O-21758 and O-21836 also require California Coastal

Commission certification prior to becoming effective in the Coastal Overlay Zone. The

California Coastal Commission may propose modifications to San Diego Municipal Code

sections also amended by this Ordinance. The City Clerk, with the written approval and

concurrence of the City Attorney, is authorized to reconcile the numbering of sections and

placement of text upon the final passage of the Ordinances, without further action by the

Council, pursuant to San Diego Charter section 275.

Section 9. 

Before becoming effective, this Ordinance will be submitted to the San

Diego County Regional Airport Authority (SDCRAA) acting as the Airport Land Use

-PAGE 35 OF 38-



(

O

-2

0

2

5-

136 

R

E

V

.)

(COR. COPY)

Commission LUC) for a consistency finding with the Airport Land Use Compatibility Plan

(ALUCP) for the San International Airport, Marine Corps Air Station Miramar, Gillespie Field,

Montgomery Field, and Brown Field Airports (ëollectively, Airports). If the ALUC determines

this Ordinance is consistent with the ALUCP for the Airports, this Ordinance shall take effect

and be in force on the date of the finding of consistency, provided that at least 30 days have

passed from the date of final passage, except that provisions of this Ordinance inside the Coastal

Overlay Zone, which are subject to California Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San

Diego Local Coastal Program amendment, will not take effect until the date the California

Coastal Commission unconditionally certifies those provisions as a local coastal program

amendment.

If the ALUC determines this Ordinance is inconsistent or conditionally consistent, subject

to proposed modifications, with the ALUCP, this Ordinance will be submitted to the Council for

reconsideration. If the ALUC determines this Ordinance is conditionally consistent with the

ALUCP for the Airports, but consistency is subject to the proposed modifications, the Council

may amend this Ordinance to accept the proposed modifications, and this Ordinance as amended

will take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day from and after its final passage, except that

provisions of this Ordinance inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, which are subject to California

Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program amendment, will

not take effect until the date the California Coastal Commission unconditionally certifies those

provisions as a local coastal program amendment. A proposed decision by the Council to

overrule a determination or inconsistency, or to reject the proposed modifications for a finding of

conditional consistency, will include the findings required pursuant to California Public Utilities

Code section 21670 and require a two-thirds vote. The proposed decision and findings will be

forwarded to the ALUC, the California Department of Transportation, Division ofAeronautics,

-PAGE 36 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

and the airport operators for the applicable airports; and the Council will hold a second hearing

not less than forty-five days from the date the proposed decision and findings were provided. At

the hearing, any comments submitted by the public agencies will be considered and a final

decision to overrule a detennination of inconsistency will require a two-thirds vote.

If the Council makes a final decision to overrule a determination of inconsistency, this

Ordinance will take effect on the thirtieth day after that final decision, except that provisions of

this Ordinance inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, subject to California Coastal Commission

jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program amendment will not take effect until

the date the California Coastal Commission unconditionally certifies those provisions as a local

coastal program amendment.

Section 10, That no permits shall be issued for development that is inconsistent with the

provisions of this Ordinance unless deemed complete applications for such permits are submitted

to the City prior to the date on which the applicable provisions of this Ordinance become

effective.

APPROVED: HEATHER FERBERT, City Attorney

By í  ' ñ/- -

 y A  

Corrine L. Neuffer

Senior Chief Deputy City Attorney

CLN:cm:jn2:amt:cm:jn2

April 24,2025

June 13, 2025 COR. COPY

June 17, 2025 REV.

Or.Dept: City Planning

Doc. No. 4082424 3

-PAGE 37 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY)

I certify that the ouncil of the City of San Diego adopted tis Ordinance at a meeting held on

JUL 2

2 2

025

DIANA J.S. FUENTES

City Clerk

By éí

2/

ž

L 

2€

L

Deputy Ci  Ólerk

Approved:

Ù

(date)

Vetoed:

(date)

TODD GÉ*ÍA, Mayor

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

(NOTE: The date of final passage is July 23, 2025, which represents the day

this ordinance was returned to the Office of the City Clerk with the Mayor's

signature of approval.)

-PAGE 38 OF 38-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: **ele-O

NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER O-

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 113.0103; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 125,0431;

AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY

AMENDING SECTION 131.0322; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY RETITLING AND AMENDING

SECTION 141.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3,

DIVISION 8 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0815; AND

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 5 BY

AMENDING SECTION 144.0501, RELATING TO THE

AMENDMENT TO THE ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT AND

JUNIOR ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT REGULATIONS.

§113.0103

 Definitions

Abuttingproperty through Accessory building [No change in text.I

Accessory Dwelling Unit (ADU) means an attached or detached residential

dwelling unit that is 1,200 sqae fet in size or less, provides complete

independent living facilities for one or more persons including permanent

provisions for living, sleeping, eating, cooking, and sanitation, and is located on e

e+with-a-the same premises as the proposed or existing single dwelling unit or

multiple dwelling unit.

Accessory structure through Suce Mining [No change in text.I

Sustainable Development Area means the area within a defined walking distance

along a pedestrian path of travel using sidewalks from a mjor transit stop that is

-PAGE 1 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

existing or planned, if the planned mjor transit stop is included in a

transportation improvement program or applicable regional transportation plan, as

follows:

(a) 

[No change in text.I

(b) Within Mobility Zone 4, as defined in Section 143.1103, the defined

walking distance is 0.75 mile.

(c) [No change in text.]

In addition, an adopted specific plan prepared in accordance with eetie-Section

122.0107(a),shall be within the Sustainable Development Area if the Sustainable

Development

 

Area is within a portion of the adopted specific plan.

Targetpopulation through Yard [No change in text.]

§125.0431

 

Additional Notice for a Condominium Conversion Map

(a) For a tentative map for a condominium conversion project the subdivider

shall provide the following notices in addition to the notice provided for in

Chapter 11, Article 2, Division 3 (Notice):

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Notice to each person applying for the rental of a i-dwelling unit

or Accessory Dwelling Unit in the proposed project required in

Chapter 1  Article 2, Division 3 (Notice) and Subdivision Map Act

section 66452.17;

(3) through (5) [No change in text.]

(b) through (c) [No change in text.I

-PAGE 2 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

§131.0322

 

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

The uses allowed in the agricultural zones are shown in Table 131.03B.

Legend for Table 131-03B

[No change in text.I

Table 131-03B

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

[See Section 131.0112 for an explanation and

descriptions of the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and Separately Regulated

Uses]

Zone 

Zones

Designator

1 st & 2nd AG

 AR

>>

3rd >> 1- 1-

4th » 1 2 1 2

Open Space through Residential, Separately Regulated

Residential Uses, Interim Ground Floor Residential [No

change in text.I

Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

[No change in text.]

4L

=

:

= 

[N

o c

h

an

g

e

in

 tex

t.]

Residential, Separately Regulated Residential Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately Regulated

Signs Use, Theater Marquees [No change in text.]

[No change in tex

t.I

Footnotes for Table 131-03B

 through  [No change in text.]

§141.0302

 

Accessory Dwelling Units (ADUs and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

íJ

A

D

IJsì

eetien 11.0302 provides for the construction ofAccessory Dweling Units

(ADUs) and Junior Accessory Dwellng Units (JADUs), consistent with the

requirements of state law, and is intended to-encourage the construction ofADUs

and JDUs through several local regulatory provision, incldig eliiating

parking reirements-for-DUs and -LDUs,- and-providing an üfferdable housing

bonus of one additional ADUfor every deed restricted affordable DU

-PAGE 3 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

costrcted e te premises, as specified in the regulatiøs belew. AD are

permitted in all zones alowing residential uses, and JDUs are permitted 4-

14

Singe Dwelling Unit Zones by right as a limited use decided in accordance with

Process One, indicated with an "L" in the Use Regulations Tables in Chapter 13,

Article 1 (Base Zones), subject to the following regulations.

(a) The followig definitions apply tothi sectin:Reulations for DUs and

JADs.

(1) Sigle Dwelling Unit Zone means a zone that permits ingle

dwellng units but does not permit multiple dwelling units_est

Quarters. Guest quarters and non-habitable accessorv structures

shall be permitted in addition to ADUs and DUs, if permitted by

the base zone.

2) ÆI1

 

e Dwelng Unit Zone means a zene that permits muliple

dwolling-nitDevelopment Impact Fees. Development Impact

Fees for DUs and JADUs

 

shall be paid in accordance with

Section 142.0640(b).

íll Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Regulations, An ADUor

JDUshall not be permitted to be constructed on any premises

that has utilized the provisions of Chapter 14, Article 3, Division

13, Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Regulations for

Single Family Zones, except as provided in Section

143.13056{1).

-PAGE 4 OF 46-



O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR, COPY 2)

££ Preiously Conforming. Construction

 

of an ADU or JADU

 shall

not require correction ofprevioustv confrming conditions on the

premises.

í Conversion. An ADUor JDUthatis converted from an existing

dwelling unit or accessorv structure. or is constructed in the sanie

location and within the same building envelope as an existing

dwelling unit or accessory structure, may continue to observe the

samç setbacks as the existing dwelling unit or accessory structure

and they shall not bo subject to the setback requirements in Section

141.0302(b)(9).

íá Fire Sprinklers.

A An ADUor 14DU shall not be required to provide

automatic fire sprinklers if they are not required for the

primary dwellin unit.

(Bì An ADUor JADU sha[1 be requird to provide an automatic

fire sprinkler system when located on a premises where the

primary dwelling unit is protected with an automatic fire

sprinkler system in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

O Theconstruction ofadetached ADU shall not trigger a

requirement for automatic fire sprinklers to be installed in

the existing primary dwelling unit or multiple dwelling unit

-PAGE 5 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR, COPY 2)

unless required in accordance with the California Building

Standards Code.

í 

Within the Coastal Overlay Zone.

(A) An existing structure may only be converted or

reconstructed as an ADUor JADU ifthe structure

conforms to all the following regulations:

íi The wetland regulations in Section 143.0141(b);

íiü The sensitive coastal bluýs regulations in Section

143.0143:

(iìi

 

The coastal beaches regulations in Section

143,0144; and

íb

 

The Supplemental Regulations ofthe Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

Bì DUs or 14DUs constructed within areas of future sea

level rise shall comply with the regulations in Section

132.0404.

Cì ADUs or JADUs shall comply with all the following

regulations:

íil The wetlandregulations in Sectio

n 143.0141(b)

íiü The sensitive coastal blfý regulations in Section

143.0143:

(iìiì The coastal beaches regulations in Section

143.0144; and

-PAGE 6 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

íi

 

The Supplemental Reglations ofthe Coastal

Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

íß An ADU shall not be used for a rental term of less than 31

consecutive days. JADUs are not subieçtto rntal term limitations.

(b) The folewing regulations are applicable to both DUs and JDUs: U

Development Regulations.

(1)

 

Use Re  lat - sOn a premises with an existing or proposed single

dwellin unit. the following is permitted:

(A) OneDU and one JDUare permitte-on apremiscs

located within a Single Dwelling Unit Zone with an

exi:ting or-prposed single dwelliguit.One DUthat is

within an existing or proposed single dwelin unit or

within an existing accesory structure, subiect to the

following:

íiì Construction ofthe ADUmay expand the ross

floorarea of an existing accessoy structure up to

150 square feet to only allow for ingress and egress

nd

The ADU shall have a separate exterior entry from

the sin

le dwellin unit.

(B) An DUor JDUshall not be used for a rental term ofless

than 31 osecutive day One attached or detached ADU

-PAGE 7 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR, COP

Y 2)

 

Guest quarters ad non haitable accessory structures

shall be permitted in addition to ADUs and JDUs.

3 Ån Accessory welling Uit r Junior Accessory

Dwllig Unit shall not be permitted to be costructed o

ny preises that hûs utilized the previsions of Chapter

14, Article 3, Division 13, Multi Dweling Unit and Urban

Lot Split Regulations for Singl Family Zones, except as

provided in Section 113.1305(c)(l).

(2) Development Regulatio.sThe maximum number ofADUs on a

premises with a proposed multple dwellin unit structure shall not

exceed two detached ADUs.

 A minimum lot size is not requiped for the construcen of

a

n A

D

U

o

r

 JADU.

 DU and líDUs ae ot subject to the density limitations

for the premises.

 The grossfloor area of an.ÍDU nd iDU shall be

inluded in the foor aea rao for theprmiscs.

(D An ADUor.JADUthat s converted *em an existing

dweing-unit-or-accessry structure or is onstructed in the

ame kation and within the same buiding envelope as an

existing dweing unit or accessory structure may continue

to observe th sme setbaeks as the eisting dwling uni

or ccessory-sructure. An existig structurc may not be

-PAGE 8 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

converted-or recøntructed as an ADUorjDUifthe

structur-doeot ønferm to the wetlands regations in

Section 113.0111(b), the sete eeastal bluffs regulations

in Section 113.0143, the oastal beaches regulations in

Section 113.0111, or the Supplemental Regulations of the

Coastal Overlay Zone in Section 132.0103.

f The following landscpe regulatiens shall apply to the

construction of an ADU or JÝDU:

 

Ifthe construction of an ADUor JDU brings the

number of ADUs and any JDU on theprcmiscs to

a total of two or more, two trees shall be provided

on thepremies for every 5,0 square feet eflot

rea, with a minimum of one tree perpremises. If

planting of a now too is required to comply with

this Section, the tree shall be seleted in accordance

with the Landscape Standards of the Land

Development=Maal aRd the City's Street Tree

Selection Guide. If the premise is located in the

OR Zone, the lot area used to determine the tree

requirement sha-be based on the allowable

irlopment area as descried in Section 131.0250.

If the premises containvinmny sensitive

ds=the-lot area used-to determinehe-tee

-PAGE 9 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

requiremont shall be based on the aewale

development area as decred in Chapter 11,

Article 3, Division 1.

0 DUs constructed i accordanoe with Section

111.0302(c)(2(C

)

 shall comply with the street tree

requirements in Secion 42.0109(a).

9 

ADUs and ADU sha not be required to provide fire

prinklers if they are not required for the primary dwelling

.'.4.

 

:m

a

r

y

trWhen located on a premises where te pr

d'elg unit is proteotdwith ün-autømatic fire-sprinkler

system in accordance with Section R313 of the California

Residential Code, an ADUor JDUshall be protected with

1 U IÅi i  ii  / .

 -

L 1 11/Ll

 

uiri ef a ßÈ>(Ýør.íl)Lí shall-nt require the

correction ofprvio* corming conditions on the

emmeó:

, DUs -an JÍDU constructed withinAreas of Future Sco

Level Rise must cemply with the regulations in

Section 132.0101.

Witnin th

o Coastal Overlay Zone, DUs and JADUs shaU

comply with the wetlnd regul·atien in-Sectio

113.0111(b), the sositve· cøastal-bluffs regulations- in

Section 113.0113, the costal beahes regulations in

-PAGE 10 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

Setion 113.0111, and the Supplemetal Reglaties of tho

Coastal Overlay Zone in Section 132.0403.

(3) Parkin ReulationsOn a premises with an existing multiple

dwelling unit structure. the following applies:

(A) No on street parking spaces or ýstreetparking spaces are

required for DUs and,MDUs except as specified i Section

141.03 02(b)(3)(B).The maximum number ofDUs that may

be permitted within the existing non-livable space of an

existing multiple dwelling unit structure shall not exceed

25 percent ofthe total number of multiple dwelling units in

the structure. The minimum number ofDUs that may be

ermitted within the non-livable space of the existing

structure is one. For example, non-livable space includes, but

is not limited to, storage rooms, boiler rooms. passageways,

attics, basements, or garages: and

(B) When an 1DU or 1DU is proposed on apremies located

both withi the Beach Impaet·Area of the Parking mpae

Overlay Zene and outside of a trnitprierity arca, one

off street-parking-spce eke- eenisnt-A*Seetion

111.0302(b)(3)(D) shall be required

 

per ADU or JADU,

unless any-ofthe føllwing-pply:A maximum of eight

detached ADUs may be permitted on the premises. provided

that the number of detached ADUs shall not exceed the

-PAGE 11 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

number of existing multiple dwellig UnitS in the multiple

dwellin unit structure.

0 The ADUor LADUis 500 square feet or less;

0 Thepremises E leeated-within-a histericadistric

thatisa designated historical resource·,

iii The-AD U or JD U is attached to the proposed o

existing-primary elk-mit-er accessory

 Thepremises is-located-wih residen-tia-l-permit

parking district;

6 There is a car share vehicle located within one block

ofthe 

premises.

 When a garage, earport-r covered parking structure is

demolished in cenjuntion with the constrctiøn of an.íDU

or.UD U. or converted to an 

j øi·.116 replacement of

theseq#streeparkg-spaceiŸ-is-not requied uness th

premises is locted both within the Beah Impact Area of

the Papking Impact Overlay Zone and outside of a transit

priorityara,- in which ease te parkng-shall be repaced in

a løeatiøn-conistent-with Section 141.030*b(3)(D).

(I Ifrstrectpapking-paccýare-required-in-aecordance-with

Section 111.0302(b)(3XB) or 111.0302(b)(3)(C), or if the

pplioûnt choses to provide qf, tpect-parking spaces for

-PAGE 12 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR, COPY 2)

Us-d/or JDUs located OR the premises, those space

shall-comply-with the feUowing:

(Ø ýstrect parking spaces may be located in ay

configuration, may be within the setack areas, and

may include tandem spaces er mechanical lifts.

0 

ýstrectparking spaces shallbe located within

hrdscap areas ancl shall omply with the minimum

standards and guidelines to provide safe and

efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

 Notwithstandig-444.0302(1(2H), ifthe construction of

an DU or 11DU causes an existing driveway ub cut to

no longer comply-with theimensiøns-required in Table

112 05K of Section 142.0560 for an q# streetparking

paccíthe·riveway-shall beclosed to the satisfaction of the

City Engieer.

Deepment-mpact-Fees- foíl)Us-nd-JDUs-shall-eømply with

Sectio 112.0610(b). In accordance with Government Code section

66321(b)(3).one attached or detached ADU with a gross floor area

of 800 square feet or less may be permitted in accordance with

Sections 141.0302(a(1)-(a)(3), provided that the

 

development

results in no more than one attached or detached ADU on the

premises. The D U shall not be subject to maximum lot coverage,

-PAGE 13 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

maximum foor area ratio. a front vardsetback, and minimum

open space requirements of the underlying base zone.

íá Lot Size. A minimum lot size is not required for the construction

of ø

n ADU.

íl Density. ADUsarenotsubiectto the density limitations ofthe base

zone for the premises.

1 

Gross Floor Area.

A) Theossfloorarea ofan DU shall not be less than 150

square feet,

í

 

T

h

e

 

gross loor area of an

 attached or detached ADUshall

not exceed 1,200 square feet.

Cì An DUconstructed within an existing or proposed sinle

dwein unit structure shall not have a maximum oss

floor area requirement.

(D) An ADUconstructed within an existing accessorv structure

on a sinle dwelling unit lot shall not have a maximum

gross floor area requirement and may construct an

additional 150 square feet to only allow for ingress and

eress.

E) 

ADUs constructed within an existing multiple dwe#ing unit

structure shall not have a maximum gross oor area

requirement.

-PAGE 14 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

í The oss oor area ofan AD U shall be included in the

floor area ratio for the premises.

í

å

 

H

e

i

g

h

t

(Å On lots that prmt single dwelling unit development but

not multiple dwelling unit development, detached ADU

structures shall not exceed two stories.

(Bì On lots that permit single dwelling unit deveopment but

not multiple dwelling unit development. ADUs attache to

an existing accessory structure shall not exceed two stories.

C) ADUs shall comply with the overall maximum structure

height of the underlying base zone and overlay zone.

 Setbacks.

(A) The front pardsetback of an ADU shall be consistent with

the base zone.

(Bì The minimum street side yard setback of an DU shall be

4 feet or the minimum street side vard setback of the base

zone, whichever is less.

(Cì Interiorsidevardandrearyardsetbacks for ADU

structures with a structure heiht of 16 feet or less shall be

provided as follows:

 

For ADUstructures located on apremises outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone,

there is no minimum interior side yard and rear

-PAGE 15 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY

 2)

yardsetbacks, except that the Fire Cde Official

may require a greater setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code. California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01, and

the International Fire Code (IFC), including section

504.1.

íi For ADUstructures located ona premises within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side yard and rear vardsetbacks

shall be 4 feet to provide defensible space between

all structures on the premises and contiguous areas

of native or naturalized vegetation, except that the

Fire Code Official may require a greater setback to

ensure compliance with the California Fire Code,

California Code of Regulations (CCR), Title 14.

Section 1276.01, and the International Fire Code

(IFC), including section 504.1.

D 

Interior side yardand rear vardsetbacks for DU

structures with a structure height that exceeds 16 feet shall

be provided as follows:

í 

For ADUstructures located on a premises outside

of a High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone,

there is no minimum interior side yard and rear

-PAGE 16 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

-yardsetbacks, except that the Fire Code Official

may require a greater setback to ensure compliance

with the California Fire Code. However, if the side

or rear propert line abuts another premises that is

residentially zoned or developed with exclusively

residential uses, the minimum interior side yard and

rear yard setbacks shall be 4 feet or the minimum

setback of the applicable base zone, whichever is

less, except that the Fire Code Official may require

a greater setback to ensure compliance with the

California Fire Code, California Code of

Regulations (CCR), Title 14, Section 1276.01. and

the International Fire Code (IFC). including section

504.1.

íi For ADU structures ocated on a premises within a

High or Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the

minimum interior side ard and rearyard setbacks

shall be 4 feet to provide defensible space between

all structures on the premises and any contiguous

areas of native or naturalized vegetation or as

otherwise required, except that the Fire Code

Official may require a greater setback to ensure

compliance with the California Fire Code

-PAGE 17 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

Caifornia Code ofRegulations (CCR), Title 14.

Section 1276,01, and the International Fire Code

([FC), including section 504.1.

 

Parking.

(A No on-street parking spaces or ofstreet parkn spaces are

required for ADUs, except as specified in Section

141.0302(b)(10B).

í When an ADUis proposed on a premises located both

within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking Impact

Overlay Zone and outside of a transit priority area, one

oýstreet parking space located consistent with Section

141.0302(b)(10)D) shall be required per DU unless any

ofthe following apply:

íil 

TheADUis 5

00 sq

uare

 fee

t or

 less

;

íiü The premises is located within a historical district

th \s a designated historical resource·

fiìi) The ADUis attached to the proposed or existing

pñmary dwellin unit or accessory structure

·

,

íixl

 

The premises is located within a residential permit

parking district; or

íy There is a car share vehicle located within one

block of the premises.

-PAGE 18 OF 46-



-917 dO 6 I HÐVd-

70 1 Ol SS3 o!OAJO SUILI lu!O!1 pIm

Oj

 Op!Ao

.Id 01 su

p!

 p Sp

pl U

IU

  Áduoo líqs pu seo.ï advospvq

u!11! poo oq Ils aodó Žíu,¥d ja0 ï

p

t :sU!

1 I

!I

q

U[

o so

ds uiopu

 øpnou! Á

uì pu 'SOU ¥OOq

941 u!4 powool øq Áu sad ugdiø.-* 

:so

dd 

u0110 4

 'a.tuía.

d oq uo p

llOO 

o

aods upld 1.{1-#ö p\ojd ol ssooo uoldd u

J!  'O

)(0

1)(q)ZOEOI  ()(OI)(I)zoo'Iti UO!OOS

41 oou

p.IO0

 U! P

nbø. ø

 ao

ds Žíu,

¥.md a.

so JI 

Ë

po,nb ou s! sd

íu¥.m

d l

-

 øso

ll Jo

 W

old@

 '

 Gp u ot

p@AIO JO 'l(IF ul? j Un.Iu tïl 11!M UO!unoo

u! pø

slu

p s! 

ds u

pd p

oou

n ue u

M 

t[J

)(0

1)®

EO

O

' 

 I uo!0

S 41!

 

u

šsuoo

uowool  u! pood q s u!'d oso  u 'a.m

á,

O

.td

 

su

. O

ll

 Jó 

øp!

s

lo p

 uoz ÁB

AO 1013d

I

u

Bd 

41

 Jo 

I¥

 o

du

I 

o 

41 u

41!

 P

t

s! a,ud @4 sslu plnb. lou s! 

ds u,¥.md ý

0 0

041

 jO l@U[

@011CI '

r u

 1 p

uAUO

 JO y

7F

u

 jo 

UO

nJ

su

o 

4 41!M

 UO

10

I!-U

o

 u! P

I!

10

U

p

s! mni U*I pAOO o 'odo 'i B uq 3

(E ÅdOOO)

(A[ 9£ 1-ŠZOZ-0)



(O-2025-136 REV,)

(COR. COPY 2)

Oý-street parking spaces may not encroach into the

pblic right-of-way.

£ Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4), ifthe construction

of an ADU causes an existing driveway curb cut to no

longer comply with the minimum oýstreet parking spaces

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560, the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(11 The record owner is not required to live on the same premises of

an ADU.

(c) k addition to the reqireets in Section 111.0302),the followig

additienal regulations are appliable to D:Development Regulations

for JAD Us.

(1) U»RegieOn a premises with an existing or proposed single

dwellin unit. one 14DU is permitted, subieet to the following:

(A) The rccordowneris not required to lve o the same

premiseü .  .ÍDU.The

 JADU

 

shall be within an existing

or proposed single dwelling unit or attached garage·

3) The ADUmay notbc sold or onveyed separately from the

primary dwelling unit unless all of the following

applyConstruction of the JDU may expand the floor area

of the existing single dwelling unit up to 150 square feet to

only allow for ingress and egress·

-PAGE 20 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(CO

R. COPY 2)

* The DUwas-built or developed qu

Ul llvu

nonprofit corporation. For the purposes-of

Section 111.0302(b)(1(B)(i), a qualified noprofit

corporation means a nonprofit corportion

organized pursuant to Section 501(3) of the

internl Revenue Code that has received a-welfare

exemption under Section 214.15 ethe Caiforni

Revenue ancl Taxation Code for properties intended

to be sold e low inome-falies-who-participate in

a special no interest 1a-pregram.

0 There is an enforoeabe restriction on the use ofthe

premises on which he DU is located pursant to a

recorded ontract between the qualfied buyer and

the qualified nonprofit corporation. Fortho

purposes of Sction 111.0302(b)(1)(Bxii), a

€ía*fied-buyer means very low income, low

incomemein neome, o-moderat icome

househøldsras-specified in Table- 41- 03A.

ñi The lot where the ADU is located is hold pursuant to

eeeledterany in common agreement that

includes an allocation to each qualified buyer of o

undivided, uncqual interest in the lot based on the

ie-ehe-ADUeachqualified buyer occupies; 

-PAGE 21 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

repurchase option-hat equires the qualified buyeF

to first offer the qualified nonprofit corporation to

buy the property ifthe buyer desires to sell or

convey the -pøperty; a-requirement thatthe

qualified buyer ocupy the property as the qualified

+buyer's principal residence-and affoFdability

restrictons on the sale and conveyanee efthe

pøperty that ensupe the property will be preserved

for very low icome, low income, median income or

moderate icome

 

households for 15 years fep

owner occupied housing and will be sold or resold

to a quaified buyer.

 A grant deed naming the grantor, grantee, and

describing the property iterests being-ransfed

shall be recordedwith the County. A Preliminary

Ghage of Ownership Report shall be filed

con·cretly with this grant deed pursuût to

Section 180.3 of the Reenue and Taxation Code

. .

 frequested by -utity prviding-service to the

primary residence, the DU has a separate water,

sewer, or lectrical coection to that utiity.

O The 14DUshall have a separate exterior entry from the

existing or proposed singe dweing unit;

-PAGE 22 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

(D 

The JDUmay not be sold or conveyed separately from

the primary dwelling unt:

E The record owner of the primary dwelling unit shall reside

in the single dwelling unit or JADU; and

 Before a Building Permit may be issued for a JADU, the

record owner shall enter into an agreement with the City in

a form that is approved by the City Attorney that includes

the following provisions:

 

The JADUmay not be sold or conveyed separately

from the primary dweing unit:

íiü The agreement may be enforced against future

purchasers:

(iiìì The record owner shall reside on the premise·

ix

 

The agreement shall be recorded in the Office of the

County Recorder of San Diego County

: and

££ The agreement shall run with the land for the life of

the JDU.

íG) Government agencies, land trusts. and qualified housing

organizations are exempt from Section 141.0302(c)(1)(E)

and Section 141.0302(c)(1)(F).

(2) Deveopment·Reguot- s . rí)íçLot Size. 14DUs arenot

subiect to a minimum lot size.

-PAGE 23 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

 ADUs shall be porntted in all zones allowing residentiü

useì,-conistent with the Use Table ofthe applicable baso

 One ADU shall be permitted in a Single Dwelling Unit

Zone on apremises with an existing or proposed sigle

welling unit.

* On aprcmises loated in a Single Dweiing-Uit Zone-with

an existing mult* dwelling unit or apremiscs located in

a Mtiple Dwelling Unit Zone with an existing o

proposed dwelling unit, DUs shall be permitted as

fellew

 

Two AD Us that are attached to and/or detached

from an exising or propesed structure are

peritted; and

0 

The number ofDUs permitted within the habitable

rea ofan existing d.peling uni structure is limited

to 25 percet of the total numer of existing

dwellig unis-in=the s#uctp, but in no case sha[ it

bc less than one ADU; and

 There is no limit o the number ofLDUs permitted

within

 

the-portin:-of-existing-dwlling um

structures-and-aeccs-soy ructurcs -that -re-ot used

as livable space, including storage rooms, boiler

-PAGE 24 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

r

o

o

m

s

,

-p

assagewy atties, basements, or-garages,

if each DU complies with state bilig stadard

for dwlling units.

6 A maximum efone ADU with a grosßoor area of 800

square feet or less shall be permitted on apremiss with an

existing or proposed dwlling Ut regardless of maximum

ot coverage, maxúum floor area ratio, front yard

:ctback, and minim

-open space requirements. The

development shall comply with the foor area ratie of the

underlying base zone unless the development incorporates

an e*itig sucturc that eceeds the allowable foor ara

ratio or is under the allowable,ßoor area ratio by less tha

800 sqare feet, in which case an ADUthat does not exceed

800 square feet shall be permitted.

 An D U may be attached to, located within, or detached

fom a exiting or proposed pFimry dweig unit

including gûages ad habitable or non habitable accessory

Pump:

 The minimum grossßoor area-of an ADU shall not be les

than 150 square feet.-The mximum-gresš#oer rea of an

DUshall not eceed 1,200 square fect. An DU

constructed within a existig 'cUing unit· or accs.ery

tructurc does nothave a maximm grossfoor ara and

-PAGE 25 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(C

OR. C

OPY

 2)

may costrta additieal 150 square feet fer ingress and

66-

14

G ADU-stetures-shaoomply á the frer yard-ad-stree

sideyard setbacks of the base zone. Interior side yardand

=-yard setbacksor new-ADU strctures shal be

poided as follows:

 

One story ADU structucs*Wñ ù srcture height

16 feet or less may observe a zero foot sebck t

the interior side>urd and rear yard.

ii One story DUs with a structure height that

exceeds 16-feet and multi story ÍDUstructures

may observe zero foot ierior side yrd and rea 

yard-e#bcks, unless the side or rearproperty line

bts anotherpremi.es that-is pesidentially

 zøned-op

developed with exclusively residential ues, in

which-case a l feet setbaek-ørthemnimum setback

of the applicable bse zone, whichever is less, shall

pp

 

>UBnu-for Afferdable4DUs, ne additienal DU

shall-be permitted-forevry-DUen the premises that is set

aside-as affordablo to-very-lo-income-anctew eeme

househ ods for a perid - of- net es s- than 0 y

 ar :, or as

affordable to moderate-inceme households-for a-period of

-PAGE 26 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR, COPY 2)

not less than 15 yrs, guaranteed thøgh a written

agrement-and a deed-of trust

 

securing-the greement,

entered into bhe pplicnt and th President and Chief

Executive Offoer of the-San Diego Housing Commission.

 

There is no limit on the nmber of bonus DUs

wihin a Sustainable evelopmnt Area.

0 One bonus ADUis permitted outside o Sutainabe

Development Area.

Ø For.íDU to be ceunte-as affordable and meet the

reqirements ofthis Section, the qualifying criteria

in Table 111 03A shall be met.

Table ll (B

Qulifying Criteria for Affordable.íDU Bonus

Rena14# 

¥¥-e-ADUÝ

h

-be-ffø

abe

 

le-t-n

ineuding--løwee 

ffe*ae-høsing-ees

for utilities, at a rent that ht-ees-øteeeed

docs not exceed:

-

ew

neeme

ø

eh

ø

ld

s

30 percentof 50 percentef 30 pereent-of 50-perent-of

the area median inome, as the area mediün income, as

adjusted for family size

 

adjusted for family size

ppropriate for the unit.

 

appropriate for te unit.

ew-neeme

øuseløIds

30 percent of 60 perent of 30 percent of 70 percent of

he area median income, as the area median income, as

adjusted for family size

 

adjusted for family size

ppropriate for the unit.

 

ppropriate for the nit.

M

dF

erne

ø.ehøld

30 percent of 110 percent

 

35 percent of 110 percent

of the area median inome, of the area median income,

as adjusd for family siz as adjuted-for family size

appropriate for the unit.

 

appropr

iate for the uit.

-PAGE 27 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

Footnotes for Table 141 -03A

1) 

For sal DUs are subject to the reuiroments ef Section 141.03021*B.

 DU Bonus for Accssible ADUs. For development

utilizing he DUBonus for Affordble DUs in

accerdance with Section 41.0302(2*H),-a maximum-of

enc additional accessible ADUshall be permitted if the

avclopmcnt includes:

* 

At-least two DUs shüll be affopdabe to cy low

income, low income, or moderate income

households; and

 The accessible ADUshll compy with the

feewig

Ø 

·

Accessibility requiremets in Chapter 1

 lA of

the Cali fornia Buikling Code, incding at

J..t ,

 nic aeoessìble

1 uu

 one access' : : - -

kitchen, and one accessible bedroom; and

0 Th accessible.11)Ushall be looated on an

accessible route, as- defined by tc Californi

Building Code.

£ Density. ./ADU are not subect to the density limitations for the

premises.

l 

Gross Floor Area.

A) The ross foor area of a JDU shall not be included in the

floor area ratio for the premises.

-PAGE 28 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

(B) A JADU shall not be less than 150 square feet and shall not

exceed 500 square feet within an existing or proposed

single dwelling unit.

£ Exterior Entry. A JADU shall have a separate exterior entry from

the primary dwelling unit.

íá Kitchen. A JADU shall include the following:

(A A cooking facility with aoliances

3) A food preparation counter of a reasonable size in relation

to the size of the JDU; and

(Cì Storage cabinets that are of a reasonable size in relation to

the size of the JAD U

í

 

P

ar

k

in

g

.

íA No on-street parking spaces or 0street parking spaces are

required for a 14DU.

(Bì When an attached garage is converted to a JADU

replacement of those offstreet parking spaces is not

required unless the premises is located within the Beach

Impact Area ofthe Parking Impact Overlay Zone and

outside of a transit priority area, in which case parking

shall be replaced in a location consistent with Section

141.0302(c)(7)(C),

(C If oýstreet parking spaces are required in accordance with

Section 141.0302)(7)(13) or if the applicant chooses to

-PAGE 29 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

provide off-street parking spaces for JADUs located on the

premises, the following applies:

 Of-street parkin spaces may be located within the

setback areas. and may include tandem spaces or

mechanical lifts; and

 0-street parking spaces shall be located within

hardscape areas and shall comply with the

minimum standards and guidelines to provide safe

and efficient means of vehicular access to the lot.

0/street parking spaces may not encroach into the

public right-of-way.

D Notwithstanding Section 141.0302(a)(4), ifthe construction

of a JAD U causes an existing driveway curb out to no

longer comply with the minimum off-street parking space

dimensions required in Table 142-05K of Section

142.0560. the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of

the City Engineer.

(d) In addition to the requirements in Section444.0302(b), 11Us-ae subject

to the felewing additional regulatios ADUHome Density Bonus. In

addition to the DUs and 14DUs permitted under Sections 141.0302(b)

and 141.0302(c), additional bonus ADUs and affordable ADUs shall be

permitted subject to all of the following:

(1) U»Regul - Location Requirements.

-PAGE 30 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

(A) One-./D-U-i pittd-onaprmises leeated within a

Single Dwelling Unit Zoe with an existing or proposed

primary single dvcüing nThe portion of the premises

proposed for development may not be within the following

base zones: RS-1-1, RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4, RS-1-8. RS-

1-9, RS-1-10. or RS-1-11, unless the following apply:

íi The premises is in an area identified as a High or

Highest California Tax Credit Allocation Committee

(CTCAC) Opportunity Area when the development

application is deemed complete; and

íiü The premises is identified as Residential in a land

use plan.

(B) The,JDUmy not be sold or conveyed separately from the

primary ·e#ig uni:On a premises within the Sustainable

Development Area, one additional bonus DU shall be

permitted for every additional affordable DU

(C) Before a Biiking Permit may be-issed for a lDU, the

record one-shall-enter-into an-reement with the City in

a form that is approved by the City Attorney. The

agreement shall include the following provisions: the

íDU may not be sold or conveyed separately from tho

prmardweA'ing unit; the agreement-may be-enforced

gainst-futurepurehasers-andthe· record owner shall rese

-PAGE 31 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV,)

(COR. COPY 2)

.n +1

 .eprmises. The-City shall sbmit th agreement to tho

Conty Recorder for recordation. The agreemeí-hal1

with the land for th e of the JDOn a premises outside

ofthe

 

Sustainable Development

 

Area, a maximum of one

bonus DUand one affordable DUshall be permitted,

(D When a premises is located in more than one base zone,

only the portion of the premises that meets the

requirements of Section 141.0302(d)(1)(A) shall be eligible

for bonus ADUs and affordable ADUs as specified in

Sections 141.0302(d)(1)(B) or 141.0302(d)(1)(C).

(2) Development RegulationsLot Requirements.

(A) One JADU is permitted on apremis located wihin a

Single Dwelling Unit Zone with an existing or proposed

primary single dilling unit.Within High and Very High

Fire Hazard Severity Zones, the applicant shall

demonstrate that the lot fronts an improved public street

with at least two evacuation routes to the satis faction of the

Fire Code Official: and

(B) A JADUof not less thon 150 squarefeetand ot more than

500 square feet i permitted-within-an existing-er preposed

single dwetling it, or an attache gorageWithin Hih and

Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, the lot shall not

-PAGE 32 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

front a cut-de-sac or be located on a premises that only has

one point of ingress or egress.

f A JADU shall have -searate exterior entry fFem the

primary dwelling unit.

 The 1DU shall include the following:

 A ooking facility with appliaces;

0 A food preparation øunterofa reasonale size in

relation to the size of the JADU; and

fiii Storage eabinets thatarc ofareasonable size in

relation to the size of the

 JADU.

1 

Floor Area Ratio.

(Aì Within a base zone that permits sinle dwellin unit

developments, butnot multiple dwelling unit developments

the maximum foor area ratio shall be determine as

follows

íi Where the lot contains environmentav sensitive

lands, the maximum permitted loor area ratio shall

be determined using only the area of the lot that

does not contain environmentay sensitive land·

íi In no case shall the maximum permitted oor area

ratio be determined using more than 8,000 square

feet for the lot area; and

-PAGE 33 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

íii i

 

For the RS-1-1, RS-1-2, RS-1-3, RS-1-4_RS-1-5,

RS-1-6, RS-1-7 base zones, the applicable loor

area ratio shall be determined in accordance with

Table 131-04J using the adjusted lot area as

described in Sections 141.0302(d)(3)(AXi) and

141,0302(d)(3)(A)(ii).

(Bì Within a base zone that permits multiple dwellin unit

development where the lot contains environmentally

sensitive lands. the maximum permitted floor area ratio

shall be determined by using the area of the lot that does

not conain environmentaly sensitive lands.

2 Total Maximum number of permitted ADUs and JADUs on single

dwellin unit lots. The total maximum number ofADUs and

JADUs that may be permitted on a lot within a base zone that

ermìts single dwelling unit development but not multiple dwellin

unit developmen4 shall be based on the lot area in accordance with

Table 141-03A. If the lot contains environmentallv sensitive lands,

the lot area shall be determined using the area of the lot that does

not contain environmentallv sensitive land,

T

a

b

l

e 

1

4

1

-0

3

A

Maximum Number of Permitted AD U an JAD Us on Single

Dweling Uni Lts

Lot Area

 Maximum Number

 

o

 A

D

U

(square feet

 

and JADUs

8,000 or less 4

-PAGE 34 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

L

o

t A

r

e

a

 

Maximum Number of ADUs

(sq

u

a

re feet)

 

and JAD Us

8,001 to 10,000 

10,001 or greater á

1 The maximum number of DUs nd JDUs is inclusive ofthe total

number ofADUs and JADUs that are permitted in accordance with

Section 141.0302.

íál Fire Sprinklers. All affordable

 ADUs an

 bonus

 ADUs

 in the

development shall include an automatic fire sprinkler system in

accordance with the California Building Standards Code.

{1 MinimumRquired Off-Street Parkin Spaces. One off-street

parking space shall be required for each affordabl ADUand

bonus ÅDU located outside of a transit priorit area.

í Landscape Requirements. Two trees shall be provided on the

premises for every 5,000 square feet of lot area, with a minimum

of one tree per premises. If planting of a new tree is required to

comply with this Section, the tree shall be selected in accordance

with the Landscape Standards of the Land Development Manual

and the City's Street Tree Selection Guide. If the premises is

located in the OR Zone, the lot area used to determine the tree

requirement shall be based on the allowable development area as

described in Section 131.0250. If the premises contains

environmentally sensitive lands, the lot area used to determine the

tree requirement shall be based on the allowable development area

as described in Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 1.

-PAGE 35 OF 46-



-91 10 9£ 3{)Vd-

s PO40

O[ 0 p

tn!P s

uoou uv

pøu ol 1[1 J

 ood 

  uo

d O£

pXØ I SOP 41 .101  1 1@Á 01 u41 søl lou

o 

u

d 

 Jo

J 

sp

o

osn

oq

 

OOU, 

i

l 01 

q

p

1 1)!

SE l

 S! 

1 s

tuad 4

 uo

a 

qPIOJJ

ÁI

 j p

luuød 

q Iq

 /r nu

oq 

O!1!ppl

oü

 sn

uo

 

stí

ü 

UIOH

 GF au

oou

oI

 

!7

ozs p[O

 JOJ posn[p su umu upau

 o lud OÇ Jo uùod O£ pøoxo lou

soo

p ?

.  

 SIBOÁ O

I u

lll s

so] l

ou j

 p

!d

3 10 Sppq ØtU, l . 01 1[poug

s op!

 os ! 14 

a/

d 0

1 uo fl

 Oq

plJJ

ÁJOAO JO puud Oq is  snuoq uopp

uo

 ·sn

uo

[ 

,u

aé

 U

H 

(Ip

 u

J

I 

O

 

 

!·11! u!Á!nb u!01 

1 oz!1!n gs

lu

uooi

ís

nuo

q Ái

!S

]p 0U

IO 

F 

p,

1

 

1

 1 

J

SWunnb[ uñooj  61UI 4 1 61000

A!i 7F nuq  f [pl ls.Iu 4 1Oj !UIJð

un  

ó oounss! 

 01 0!d '

oui!sp @4 o 'o!ss

u[Iuo

u!sno

[ 

! US @1,

 0!JJO

 A!n

oXE[ J

 pu

up

 pu 

oddv 

 Áq 

ou! p

u 'luu

ïoot 

g u

os

1S.11 Jo p

p  pu

 uo

=Î B uo

!AA 13 4

noí

 po

üt

 q

11 s

 qp

oJJ 

1 'lu

uøanív snu

oH ÁGua ouo

 

 

(

E Ã

dO

'

[0

0)

(AH 9£-0-0)



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR, COPY 2)

íiiiì Moderate Income ADUHome Density Bonus. One

additional bonus DUshall be permitted for every

affordable ADU on the premises that is set aside as

affordable to 

moderate income

 households for a

period of not less than 15 years at a rent that does

not exceed 30 percnt of 110 percent of the area

median income as adjusted for household size; and

íix

 

The very low income, low income, and moderate

income affordable ADUs shall be comparable in

bedroom mix and amenities to the bonus ADUs in

the development.

(Bì Violations. If the terms of the rental affordable ADUhome

density bonus agreement are violated by the applicant, the

applicant

 

shall be liable for a minimum penalty of $10,000

er ADUper month, in addition to any fines outlined in the

rental affordable ADUhome density bonus agreement with

the San Diego Housing Commission.

21 ADUHome Density Bonus Program Community Enhancement

Fee. The applicant shall pay an ADUHome Density Bonus

Program Community Enhancement Fee as established by San

Diego Resolution. calculated based on the m·oss floor area of the

affordable ADUs and bonus ADUs. except that the gross floor area

-PAGE 37 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

of any affordable ADUs that meet all the following shall not be

included in the calculation:

A) The affordable ADUis deed restricted to very low income

or low income households in accordance with Section

141.0302d)(8(A)(iì or 141.0302(d(8)A)iiì: and

(13 The premises is located in an area identified as a High or

Very High Resource California Tax Credit Allocation

Committee (CTCAC) Opportunity Area when the

development application is deemed complete.

í ADUBonus for Accessible

 

ADUs. For development

 

utilizing the ADU

Home Density Bonus Program in accordance with Section 141.0302(d). a

maximum of one additional accessible ADU shall be permitted if the

development includes:

£11 At least two ADUs that are affordable to very low income, low

income, or moderate income households: and

 The accessible ADUmeets the following:

(Aì Accessibility requirements in Chapter 1 lA of the California

Building Code, including at least one accessible bathroom.

one accessible kitchen, and one accessible bedroom·

(Bì The accessible DU shall be located on an accessible route

as defined by the California Building Code; and

Cì The accessible DU shall be comparable in bedroom mix

and amenities to the bonus DUs in the deveopment.

-PAGE 38 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

í Sale or Conveyance of ADUs. New or existing ADUs may be converted

into condominiums and shall be sold or otherwise conveyed separately

from the primary residence in accordance with this Section or pursuant to

Section 141.0302(g) and subject to all the following:

£1 All structures and buildings included as part of a condominium

development shall conform to the requirements applicable to the

base zone or planned district in which the develoment is located.

Designation of individual condominium units shall not be deemed

to reduce or eliminate any of the base zone or Danned district

requirements applicable to the buildings or structures, Unless

otherwise allowed for ADUs pursuant to Section 141.0302(b)·

A The condominium subdivision shall be created pursuant to

the Davis-Stirling Common Interest Development Act Part

5 (commencing with section 4000) of Division 4 of the

California Civil Code);

B The condominium subdivision shall be created in

conformance with the Subdivision Map Act (Division 2

(commencing with California Government Code section

66410

( Neither a subdivision map nor a condominium plan shal be

recorded without each lienholder' s written consent. The

following shall apply to the consent of a lienholder:

 

A lienholder may refuse to give written consent; or

-PAGE 39 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

íül 

A lienholder may consnt provided that any terms

and conditions required by the lienholder are

satisfied;

(Dì Prior to recordation of the initial or any subsequent

modifications to the condominium plan. written evidence of

the lienholder' s consent shall be provided to the Office of

the County Recorder of San Diego County along with a

signed statement from each lienholder that states the

following

: "(Name of lienholder) hereby consents to the

recording of this condominium plan in their sole and

absolute discretion and the borrower has or will satisfy any

additional terms and conditions the lienholder may have."·

íliì The lienholder's written consent shall be included on the

condominium plan, or attached to the condominium plan

that includes the following information:

íi 

The lienholder's signature·

íiü The name of the record owner or ground lessee;

(iiñ

 

The legal description of the real property;

íi

 

The identities of all parties with an interest in the

real property as reflected in the real property

records; and

-PAGE 40 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

íl The linholder's written consent shall be recorded

in the Office of the County Recorder of San Diego

County,

£2 The condominium deveopment shall be subiect to the Subdivision

requirements in Chapter 12, Article 5.

 The condominium development shall be subject to the

Condominium Conversion Regulations in Chapter 14, Article 4,

Division 5 if any of the ADUs in the development were occupied,

íá If an ADUis established as a condominium, the applicant shall

notify providers of utilities, including water, sewer, gas, and

electricity, of the condominium creation and separate conveyance.

íál The condominium development shall be located on a single parcel

or lot that was previously mapped and monumented in a manner

satisfactory to the City Engineer in accordance with Subdivision

Map Act Section 66428(b).

íál For a minimum period of 30 days from the date an DUthat is

established as a condominium is first listed for sale, the record

owner shall offer theADUthrough at least two publicly accessible

real estate websites or databases with a disclosure stating that the

ADUis being offered for at least 30 days to buyers intending to use

the ADUas their primary residence.

í ADUsthat have received financing or other forms of assistance

from the San Diego Housing Commission shall not be converted

-PAGE 41 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

into condominiums and shall not be sold or otherwise conveyed

separately from the primary residence during the term specified in

the deed restriction agreement.

£1 Rental DUs that are rent restricted by law or covenant to persons

and families of very low income, low income, or moderate income

shall not be converted into condominiums and shall not be sold or

otherwise conveyed separately from the primary residence for the

duration of the deed restriction or affordability covenant term.

íg Sale or Conveyance of an ADU by a nonprofit corporation.

£1 An DUmay be sold or conveyed separately from the primary

dwellin unit by a qualified nonprofit cororation.

 For the purpose of Section 141.0302(g). a qualified nonprofit

corporation means a nonprofit corporation organized pursuant to

Section 501(«3) of the Internal Revenue Code that has received a

welfare exemption under the California Revenue and Taxation

Code section 214.15 for properties intended to be sold to

ow-income families who participate in a special no-interest loan

program.

íll Foran AD Uto be sold or conveyed separately from the primary

dwelin unit by a qualified nonprofit corporation, the following

shall appl:

(A There is an enforceable restriction on the use of the

premises on which the D U is located pursuant to a

-PAGE 42 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

recorded agreement between the qualified buyer and the

qualified nonprofit corporation. For the purposes of Section

141.0302(g)(3)(A), a_qualified buyer means very low

income, low income, median income. or moderate income

households, as specified below:

0 Ferv low income ADUs shall be affordable to very

low income households at an affordable housing

cost that does not exceed 30 percent of 50 percent

of the area median income. as adjusted for

household size, appropriate for the ADU

il Low income ADUs shall be affordable to low

income households at an affordable housing cost

that does not exceed 30 percent of 70 percent of the

area median income, as adiusted for household size,

appropriate for the ADU

(iìi Moderate income ADUs shall be affordable to

moderate income households at a housing cost that

does not exceed 35 of 110 percent of the area

median income. as adiusted for household size

appropriate for the ADU.

(B The lot where the ADUis located is held pursuant to a

recorded tenancy in common agreement that includes:

-PAGE 43 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

íil An allocation to 

each qualifie

d buyer o

f an

undivided, unequal interest in the lot based on the

size of the AD U each qualified buyer occupies:

íi A repurchase option that requires the qualified

buyer to first offer the qualified nonprofit

corporation to buy the property if the buyer desires

to sell or convey the property·

(ii i)

 

A requirement that the qualified buyer occupy the

roperty as the qualified buyer's principal

residence; and

íi

 

Affordability restrictions on the sale and

conveyance of the property that ensure the property

will be preserved for very low income. low income

median income. or moderate income households for

45 years for owner-occupied housing and will be

sold or resold to a qualified buyer.

(Cì A grant deed naming the grantor, grantee, and describing

the property interests being transferred shall be recorded in

the Office of the Recorder in San Diego County.

(Dì A Preliminary Change of Ownership Report shall be filed

concurrently with the grant deed pursuant to the California

Revenue and Taxation Code section 480.3.

-PAGE 44 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

E Ifrequested by a utility providing service to the primary

residence. the ADU has a separate water, sewer, or

electrical connection to that utility,

§143.0815

 

When Coastal Overlay Zone Affordable Housing Replacement Reglations

Apply

(a) No change in text]

(b) The following development types shall be reviewed for compliance with

the regulations in this Division:

(1) Conversion from rental units or Accessor Dwelling Units to

condominium units (cooperative or similar form of ownership);

(2) through (3) [No change in text.I

(c) 

[No change in text.]

§144.0501

 

Purpose of Condominium Conversion Reglations

The purpose of the Condominium Conversion Regulations is to allow the

conversion of apartments and Accessorv Dwellin Units to condominiums while

protecting the interests o f tenants by requiring that tenants receive adequate notice

of proposed condominium conversions, are advised of their rights with respect to

the conversion of their apartment or Accessory Dweling Unit to a condominium,

and are afforded reasonable relocation assistance. It is also the intent of these

regulations to protect the interests of the community and prospective purchasers

by requiring the applicant to provide certain information regarding the condition

of the structure and to require reasonable improvements for the health, safety, and

general welfare of the public.

-PAGE 45 OF 46-



(O-2025-136 REV.)

(COR. COPY 2)

CLN:cm:jn2:amt:cm:jn2

March 12,2025

June 13,2025 COR. COPY

June 17,2025 REV.

August 21, 2025 REV. COR. COPY 2

Or.Dept: City Planning

Doc. No. 4082425_4

-PAGE 46 OF 46-



Passed bythe Council of The City of San Diego on

 

JUL 2  2025 ,

 

by the following vote:

Councilmembers

 

Yeas

 

Nays

 

Not Present 

Recused

Joe La

ava 

/L-1

Jennifer Campbell 

1

21 

 

 

/U

Stephen Whìtburn  E 1 

.?4.

Henry L. Fo

sr 111 

IŽ 

 

 

IMarni von Wìlpert    

Kent Lee  E Ø 

Raul A. Campllo 

r 

 

l 

Vivian Moreno 

 

Sean Elo-Rivera 

 

 

 

Date of final passage

 

JUL 2 3 225

AUTHENTICATED BY:

TODD GLORIA

Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

(Seal)

DIANA I.S. FUENTES

City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

By 7 4

L

,

.

L

 

,

 D

e

p

u

t

y

1 HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar

days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

JUN 1 0 2025 ,

 and on

 

JUL 2 3 2025

1 FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read In full prior to passage or that such

reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of

the ordinance was made availableto each member of the Council and the public priortothe day

of its passage.

(Seal)

DIANAJ.S. FUENTES

City Clerk of The City f San Diego, California.

By

, 

U

Ý

/, 

De

puty

Office ofthe City Clerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number O-

 

21989


